
CHECK # CHECK AMT CHECK DATE

DIST AMT
009640 $82.80 4/2/2020

$29.04 2/18-3/17 - WW LIFT STATION 3A

$29.04 2/18-3/17 - WW LIFT STATION 3

$24.72 2/18-3/17 - 62 BUCKSKIN RD

009641 $24,082.53 4/2/2020

MAR 20 - CONSULTING SERVICES

009642 $5,100.00 4/2/2020

MAR 20 - CONSULTING SERVICES

009643 $169.24 4/2/2020

APR 20 - WASTE MGMT SERVICE

009644 $110.95 4/9/2020

APR 20 - UVERSE TWSD PW OPS

009645 $350.00 4/9/2020

ENCROACHMENT PERMIT PE20-0177

009646 $75.00 4/9/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009647 $53.06 4/9/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009648 $49.90 4/9/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009649 $35.10 4/9/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009650 $5.34 4/9/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009651 $191.70 4/16/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009652 $181.65 4/16/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009653 $243.97 4/16/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

TRIUNFO WATER & SANITATION DISTRICT
DISBURSEMENTS
4/1/20-4/30/20

VENDOR NAME

DESCRIPTION

WM CORPORATE SERVICES, INC.

COUNTY OF VENTURA

AT&T

NRT RELOCATION, LLC

SNIR WARSHAVIAK

PAM PULLMAN

AEREE YOO

MARK NORRIS CONSULTING, LLC

VICKIE DRAGAN

COUNTY OF VENTURA

CATAMOUNT PROPERTIES 2018 LLC

KATHRYN D THORPE

RANDY LAI

MEGAN A MORROW
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CHECK # CHECK AMT CHECK DATE

DIST AMT

TRIUNFO WATER & SANITATION DISTRICT
DISBURSEMENTS
4/1/20-4/30/20

VENDOR NAME

DESCRIPTION
009654 $152.52 4/16/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

009655 $450.69 4/23/2020

$212.44 4/7-5/6 - 56K NETWORK SCADA OP

$56.44 4/7-5/6 - LAKE SHERWOOD STAFFORD

$56.44 4/7-5/6 - 654 LAKE SHERWOOD DR

$61.33 4/7-5/6 - N RANCH PUMP STATION

$64.04 4/7-5/6 - THOUS OAKS TELE/MAINT

009656 $124.85 4/23/2020

MAR 20 - 800# FOR TWSD CUSTOMERS

009657 $880.04 4/23/2020

Utility Account: S03631.01

009658 $880.04 4/23/2020

Utility Account: S11423.01

009659 $162.48 4/30/2020

$84.98 APR - MASTER BILL

$21.29 APR 20 - 63 BUCKSKIN RD LD

$56.21 APR 20 - OAK CANYON PROJECT HL

009660 $77.13 4/30/2020

$29.04 3/17-4/14 - WW LIFT STATION 3

$19.05 3/17-4/14 - 62 BUCKSKIN RD

$29.04 3/17-4/14 - WW LIFT STATION 3A

009661 $454,658.87 4/30/2020

MAR 20 - JPA & RW

009662 $1,517.78 4/30/2020

Utility Account: S03411.01

009663 $299.90 4/30/2020

Utility Account: S06394.01

ACH TXF $321.42 4/30/2020

4/30/20 - DEFERRED COMP

EFT00000000000000873 $9,310.00 4/2/2020

MAR 20 - CONSULTING SERVICES

RUKMANI S VASAN SURV TR

CHI HERMANN

LAS VIRGENES MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

REGENCY CENTERS LESSOR

J & D ENTERPRISES LLC

LINCOLN NATIONAL

JOHN MCBRIDE

FRONTIER COMMUNICATIONS

MCI

SGM LAKE SHERWOOD II LLC

COUNTY OF VENTURA

AT&T
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CHECK # CHECK AMT CHECK DATE

DIST AMT

TRIUNFO WATER & SANITATION DISTRICT
DISBURSEMENTS
4/1/20-4/30/20

VENDOR NAME

DESCRIPTION

EFT00000000000000874 $16,660.00 4/2/2020

MAR 20 - CONSULTING SERVICES

EFT00000000000000875 $10,880.55 4/16/2020

MAR 20 - MASTER BILL

EFT00000000000000876 $400,459.96 4/16/2020

VRSD CONTRACT SVCS - MAR 20

EFT00000000000000877 $3,036.00 4/23/2020

CENTRAL ADMIN, PW, & WW

EFT00000000000000878 $207,646.48 4/23/2020

MAR 20 - POTABLE WATER

EFT00000000000000879 $1,660.11 4/30/2020

REFUND TWSD CREDIT BALANCE

TOTAL $1,139,910.06

NAOMI PAZ

ARNOLD BLEUEL LAROCHELLE MATHEWS & ZIRBEL LLP.

CALLEGUAS MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

DOYLE CONSULTING SERVICES

VENTURA REGIONAL SANITATION DISTRICT

SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON
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APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

   FUND          DEPT           EXPENSE        WORK ORDER
EXPENSE CODE VERIFICATION                                 ACCT USE ONLY

AUTHORIZATION FOR PAYMENT
SIGNATURE & DATE

SIGNATURE & DATE

           JocelynAdlao

(Attached)

           EAZ

Item # 14



Item # 14



Item # 14



Item # 14



Item # 14



Item # 14



From: Mark Norris
To: Jocelyn Adlao; Yagnesh Prajapati; Regina Williams
Subject: Fwd: Mark Norris- March TWSD Invoice
Date: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 2:25:07 PM

All,
Please see attached Invoice approval.

Thanks, Mark

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: James Wall <jlwall2016@gmail.com>
Date: April 1, 2020 at 2:22:26 PM PDT
To: Mark Norris <marksnorris@hotmail.com>
Subject: Re:  Mark Norris- March TWSD Invoice

Mark,

Your March invoice is approved.

James Wall

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 2:19 PM Mark Norris <marksnorris@hotmail.com>
wrote:

Item # 14

mailto:marksnorris@hotmail.com
mailto:JocelynAdlao@vrsd.com
mailto:YagneshPrajapati@vrsd.com
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Mark Norris Invoice ‐ TSD

121701 121101 123100 123100 121101

121100 122100 123100 121101 121109 121106 123101 123103 121108 122710 122501 121104 121105 Total

Date CA

Potable 

Water

Recycled 

Water Wastewater

Name 

Change

Lakeside 

Lft RW CIP

RW 

Regency CIP

NS Gravity 

Vacuum[VG

GSS]

Woolsey 

Fire

Water 

Conserve JPA‐IPR

Trentham 

Levan Hours

03/02/20 11.00           11.00          

9.50             9.50            

9.00             9.00            

8.50             8.50            

6.50             6.50            

8.00             8.00            

9.00             9.00            

9.00             9.00            

8.00             8.00            

7.00             7.00            

9.00             9.00            

9.00             9.00            

9.00             9.00            

9.00             9.00            

8.00             8.00            

9.75             9.75            

1.25             1.25            

8.50             8.50            

8.00             8.00            

8.50             8.50            

8.00             8.00            

03/31/20 8.50             8.50            

8.00             8.00            

‐               ‐              

‐               ‐              

190.00        ‐               ‐             ‐                ‐                ‐           ‐             ‐             ‐             ‐             ‐            ‐             ‐          190.00        

24,082.50   ‐               ‐             ‐                ‐                ‐           ‐             ‐             ‐             ‐             ‐            ‐             ‐          24,082.50  

126.75$      126.75$   24,082.53  

PO#114 OH Charge (0.03)           

45‐100‐52080‐121100 16,255.71   2,438.36       121100 67.5%

45‐370‐52080‐122100 2,348.05     352.21          122100 9.8%

45‐470‐52080‐123100 1,444.95     216.74          123100 6.0% FY20 Budget‐TWSD Norris Budget

45‐270‐52080‐121101 1,866.40     279.96          121101 7.8%

45‐270‐52080‐121104 2,167.43     325.11          121104 9.0%

45‐100‐52080‐121100 rounding ‐                121100

24,082.53   3,612.38$     100%

0.03            

M:\New Finance\A‐Accounts Payable\AP Worksheets\TWSD\Mark Norris Invoice\Mark Norris Invoice FY 20TSD‐033120
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APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

   FUND          DEPT           EXPENSE        WORK ORDER
EXPENSE CODE VERIFICATION                                 ACCT USE ONLY

AUTHORIZATION FOR PAYMENT
SIGNATURE & DATE

SIGNATURE & DATE

           JocelynAdlao

45-270-52080  121101  $4,189.50 
45-370-52080  122100  $4,189.50 
45-470-52080  123100  $   931.00 

PO# 120

           MSN
           EAZ
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Doyle Consulting Services INVOICE

Engineering and Construction Services

1046 Heron Dr. DATE: March 31, 2020

Vista, CA  92081 INVOICE #: DCS_TWSD-103

Phone 760 599-0935                                                         

License # BL-00019215

FOR: Project Management 

Services

Bill To:

Triunfo Water & Sanitation District

Accounts Payable

1001 Partridge Drive, Suite 150

Ventura, CA 93003

Phone: 805 658-4619

AMOUNT

16,660.00$                  

General Admin - $6,640

WW Admin - $4,980

PW Admin - $3,380

RW Admin - $1,660

TOTAL  16,660.00$                  

Make checks payable to: Doyle Consulting Services

Please direct questions about this invoice to Tim Doyle at 760 599-0935

Reference: TWSD Contract No. T19-008

DESCRIPTION

140 hours of contract services @ $119.00/hr for Triunfo Water & Sanitation District's 

projects as follows:

Tasks worked on during the 3/1/20 to 3/31/20 period include:

Provided project management coordination with various TWSD project components.  

Drafted Board documentation for the March meeting and teleconferenced into same; 

reviewed and organized water billing complaints and requests for special considerations, 

drafted response forms to address said correspondence; coordinated WW/PW/RW 

responses for proposed projects from other Agency requests, including intertie between 

CMWD and LV and subsequent new TWSD meter station, coordinating final documents; 

coordinated RA with City of TO for manhole raising and organizing final version; coordinated 

with Legal Counsel for lease amendment with AT&T at Kilburn, Prop 218 process/notices, 

and Ordinance edits; provided plan checks and other reviews for District Will Serve process 

for TO and Bell Canyon; worked with staff on Ordinance updates and scheduled 3 public 

hearings for 3 Ordinances based on completed rate studies, coordinated mailing of notices 

to affected customers; worked on various meter issues with PW and RW customers; 

continued coordination with Verizon at Kilburn for tower expansion project and customer 

issues with COLT, County approved process and COLT was relocated; worked with staff on 

lift station portion of LS VGGSS project; continued effort with Hidden Valley and Bridgegate 

DB for easement transfer with document review for signatures, final documents are pending; 

coordinated with LDC for easement deeds for Tract 4192; continued coordination with Legal 

Counsel and Developer for Saddlebow Road main line sewer extension; coordinated 

preliminary documents for HOA requested use of District lift station power for security 

purposes (Westlake Village and North Ranch); participate in numerous teleconferences with 

staff, contractors, and outside agencies (no in-person meetings due to the COVID-19 

pandemic); worked on organizational issues for District; assisted GM with other 

administrative requests and directives from the TWSD Board

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS! 

APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

   FUND          DEPT           EXPENSE        WORK ORDER
EXPENSE CODE VERIFICATION                                 ACCT USE ONLY

AUTHORIZATION FOR PAYMENT
SIGNATURE & DATE

SIGNATURE & DATE

(See below)

           JocelynAdlao

45-100-52080   121100  $6,640 
45-270-52080   121101  $4,980 
45-370-52080   122100  $3,380 
45-470-52080  123100  $1,660

           MSN

           EAZ
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VICKIE DRAGAN 

P.O. BOX 5789 

VENTURA, CA 93003 

(805) 407-2268 

E-mail: troli40@yahoo.com 

 

 From the ashes we rise 

 

 

Make checks payable to:  Vickie Dragan 

Payment Due Upon Receipt 

 

INVOICE NO.  006 APRIL 1, 2020 

BILL TO 

Triunfo Water & Sanitation District 

1190 S. Victoria Avenue, Suite 200 

Ventura, CA. 93003 

QTY DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE TOTAL 

1 Professional Finance Consulting Services for the month of March 2020 
    

42.50 $120.00 $5,100.00 

 Attended various meetings and teleconferences with core management 
staff and general manager.  Attended the TWSD Regular Board meeting 
via teleconference.   

   

 Worked with FTI to setup laptop for remote access and to open and 
retrieve files on the server in response to the COVID 19 protocol.  
Reviewed Board letters and Raftelis PW, RW, & SS rates. 

   

 Teleconference with Koff & Associates for the initial meeting and 
discussion of the Class & Comp study.  Responded to various emails, 
calls, and questions. 

   

 Reviewed the various financial information provided by VRSD staff.  
Started initial review of various job descriptions for the C&C study. 

   

     

     

SUBTOTAL $5,100.00 

SALES TAX 0 

TOTAL DUE BY 
DATE 

$5,100.00 

Thank you for your business!  

 

APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

   FUND          DEPT           EXPENSE        WORK ORDER
EXPENSE CODE VERIFICATION                                 ACCT USE ONLY

AUTHORIZATION FOR PAYMENT
SIGNATURE & DATE

SIGNATURE & DATE

           JocelynAdlao

45 100     52080        121100

           MSN

           EAZ

Item # 14
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