
Weight:
3.6 lbs| 1.6 kg

Length:
9" | 22.9 cm

Width:
 2.5" | 6.4 cm

Height:
9.5 " | 24.1 cm

Material:

#13545

Large Animal Anesthesia 
Impedance/PEEP Valve
An effective solution to low blood oxygen 
(hypoxemia) in horses under general anesthesia 

SPECIFICATIONS
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PVC
Steel

Stainless Steel

Side ViewFront View

Features: Facts:

Easy to Use

Non-Disposable (Reusable)

Durable with Only a Single Moving 
Internal Part

Providing an Adjustable Airway 
Pressure (0- > 50 cm H O) Using a 
Rotary Dial

Precision in Determining Airway 
Pressure using a Downstream 
Manometer

Fits all Large Animal Anesthesia 
Machines

Hypoxemia (low blood oxygen) is 
an important complication in horses 
under general anesthesia.

Hypoxemia can have a detrimental 
effect on the outcome in sick 
animals (colic horses).

Lung (atelectasis) collapse is the 
primary cause of hypoxemia in 
anesthetized animals.  

Impedance/PEEP valves have been 
used in people and small animals to 
overcome lung collapse under 
general anesthesia for years!

This is the first and only stand-alone 
impedance valve designed to be 
used for  large animals. 
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