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Preschool

Jesus teaches me important things.

Week One
Prodigal Son
Luke 15:11-24

A father welcomes his son with love
when the son returns from wasting
all of his inheritance.

 

Week Two
The Lost Sheep
Luke 15:3-7

A shepherd leaves his flock of 99
sheep to go looking for his one lost
sheep.
 

Week Three
Bigger Barns
Acts 2:45; Luke 12:16-21

A man decides to build bigger barns
to store his extra food instead of
sharing it with others.
 

Week Four
Good Samaritan
Luke 10:25-37

A Samaritan stops and helps a man
who has been beaten and robbed,
after two other men passed him by.

 

Week Five
House on a Rock
Matthew 7:24-27

Jesus tells a story about what
happens when you build a house on
sand and a house on rock.

MEMORY VERSE

"The crowds were amazed at His teaching."

Matthew 7:28, NIV

E N G A G E  I N  E V E R Y D A Y  M O M E N T S  T O G E T H E R

Morning Time

When you go into your child’s room,
say: "Good morning! God loves you—
and I do too!"
 

Drive Time

While on the go, ask your child:
"What are some things you have
learned how to do?" (Let them name
some, and if needed, help them out
with somethings you’ve seen them
learn.)

Cuddle Time

Cuddle with your child and pray:
"Jesus, thank You for teaching us
that God loves us no matter what."
 

Bath Time

During bath time, add some toy
friends for them to play with. Ask
your child to name their toy friends.
Talk about how Jesus wants to be
our friend forever!

Visit ParentCue.org for more resources

and follow @parentcue on Instagram.
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