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Walking the block, delivering the newsletter, you can’t help noticing that the neighborhood is 

looking wonderful just now, with summer and sun and plenty of rain.  Also it’s been breezing up in 

the afternoon, and that makes for good walking.  Folks tell us they enjoy reading the newsletter, 

but no more than we enjoy writing it.  And we enjoy running into you on the driveway from time to 

time.   

Spending time in the neighborhood, I’m reminded of how effortless shared kindness can be, what 

it means to work hard and steadfastly, to stand fast on one more ordinary day, to reach out to a 

neighbor.  Good neighbors and a pleasant community are what it’s all about.  Stoneridge folks are 

some of the nicest around and we thank you for welcoming us into the neighborhood. 



What’s Cookin’ 

Even if you are a simple little salsa, you have to have an endorsement to get into this Almanac.  It also 
impresses the judges (Guess who?) if your dish is fun and easy to fix, and versatile.  And it’s got to be 
good for you.  This salsa qualifies!  I can tell you right now this dish will go into the front of your card 
catalog: a bright alternative to the standard tomato salsas we love and serve all the time.   
 

Strawberry Salsa 

Juice and zest from 1 medium-sized lime 

1 1/2 tsp honey 

Pinch of fine sea salt 

1 pint strawberries, hulled & diced 

1 jalapeño pepper, seeded and diced 
(leave some seeds for more heat) 

1/2 small red onion, diced 

1/2 cup minced cilantro 

Freshly ground black pepper 

Chips for serving 

 

In a large bowl, whisk together the lime juice, honey, and salt.  Stir in the strawberries, jalapeño, onion, 

cilantro, and pepper to taste, and mix well.  Taste and adjust the seasonings if need be.  Serve with 

chips and enjoy! 

What’s Happening in Stoneridge... 

Easter Egg Hunt—It was a perfect day for the Easter Egg Hunt!  Brisk and sunny and just right for egg 

hunting.  In years past, our neighborhood response has been wonderful… this year may be the best yet!   

Neighborhood Aeration Project—Congratulations Stoneridge homeowners!  20 homeowners 

participated in the project.  That means a cool $200 goes directly from you to the Centennial Elementary 

Parent Teacher Association—a very big deal and we know they’ll put the funds to good use.  Thanks to 

your neighbor, Chris Vanheesch, who manned the aerator single handedly!  He’s been your crew for the 

last few years and, without him, the program can’t succeed.  Nice work everyone! 



Denia’s Stoneridge Real Estate Desk. 

About the Market… 
The sales data you find in this newsletter could perhaps miss a home or two just listed.  We take a 

week or two to write the newsletter, send it to the printer, and wait for the turn around.  We don’t mail 

the newsletter or email it.  We have always hand-delivered the Keeper, walking the neighborhood and 

talking to the people we meet.  What an old fashioned idea, don’t you think?  And besides, you can call 

us anytime for an instant update! 

The Keeper is about you, about the neighborhood, and about what’s happening in the real estate 

market--not the wide market, but the market on the street where you live.  It’s fun being the editor in 

chief and delivery girl. I know I make an error now and then, but so what?  This is a small town paper 

and we’re realtors, not writers. We’ve been working in the neighborhood for a while now.  We know 

these homes and their values, and we know how to sell them.  We hope to go on having a chance to 

earn your business. 

We aren’t long on words like “service,” “experience,” or “expert knowledge.”  Watch what we do: we are 

at work every day in the neighborhood, one way of another.  By giving back to the community as best 

we can, we have been rewarded with a place of work--and a working life.  That’s enough.   It doesn’t 

get any better than that.  

Eight homes are currently on market for sale in Stoneridge…  
maybe more by the time this newsletter hits your front door... 

Six are under contract waiting to close 

Eleven homes have sold and closed since the first of the year… 

Address Model Beds/Baths Garage Fin Sq Ft Sale Price 

5291 Buttesfield 4 Level California 5/4 2 2468 $365,000 

5281 Roadrunner Ave Jackson Ranch 5/3 2 2581 $355,000 

5305 Remington Ave 4 Level Kentucky 3/3 3 1839 $356,000 

5186 Roadrunner Ave 4 Level Kentucky 3/3 3 1839 $350,000 

9771 Cascade St 4 Level Laramie 4/4 3 2539 $355,000 

5297 Buttesfield St 4 Level Montana 4/3 2 2162 $324,900 

9608 Bountiful St 2 Story Palmer 4/3 5 2068 $438,000 

9922 Buffalo St 2 Story Saratoga 3/3 2 1823 $353,900 

9696 Roadrunner Ave 4 Level Washington 3/3 3 1809 $370,000 

9759 Cascade St 4 Level Tennessee 4/3 3 2120 $379,900 

5209 Bowersox Pkwy Utah Ranch 4/3 3 2935 $325,000 



STONERIDGE CLASSIFIEDS 

BABYSITTING 
720-402-1404 

Babysitting offered by Jordyn and 
Jayden.  They are 16, have taken 
a CPR class and a babysitting 
class, love kids, and are honest 
and dependable.  Call their mom, 
Bethany, for more information. 
 

CAKES, COOKIES, PIES & 
MORE! 

720-771-4674 
melapry@msn.com  

If you need a dessert for a party, 
holiday, or simply want to satisfy a 
sweet tooth, let me know!  I am 
happy to deliver to your home. If 
emailing, please put “Order” in the 
subject line. 
 

JEWELRY IN CANDLES 
www.facebook.com/cscandleshop 

Looking for an awesome gift that 
she will love? Jewelry in Candles 
is here to help! Choose from 17 
scents & 7 seasonal scents all 
made from 100% pure soy wax. 
You can choose from candles and 
tarts and even pick your own 
jewelry surprise! 
 

QUALITY VINYL DECALS 
303-378-9147 

www.performancedecal.com 
Do you need professional, high 
quality vinyl decals on your vehicle 
or storefront?  We do windows, 
doors, magnetic signs, banners 
and more.  Call now or email us at 
performancedecal@gmail.com. 
 

Advanced Roofing Technologies 
970-566-0887 

www.advancedroofingtech.com 
Advanced Roofing Technologies 
has been the leader in residential 
& commercial roofing in No. Colo 
and Wyoming since its founding in 
1993. We are dedicated to 
providing exceptional customer 
service at a competitive price. Visit 
us on-line or call Gary. 
 
 

Edin Cordon Lawn Services 
720-404-8708 

We do it all! Spring clean-up, 
aeration, power raking, planting, 
trimming, plant and debris removal 
and sprinkler repair and pressure 
up. Edin works for me and does 
wonderful work! 
 

MASSAGE THERAPY 
303-485-1922; Cell 719-688-8243 
My name is Krissy & I am a 
licensed massage therapist 
offering safe, comforting & a very 
pleasant experience. Comfort is 
my first priority. Professional 
services at affordable prices. 
Massages, hot stone with rose 
petal foot & paraffin wax. First time 
clients enjoy a 60 min Swedish 
massage for $25.00. Located 
inside Firestone Chiropractic. 
 

Demarle at Home 
720-290-8456 

fourftzero@yahoo.com 
www.mydemarleathome.com/US12408/ 

Bring the WOW! Back in your 
kitchen. Demarle, makes cooking 
easy and makes you look like a 
pro in the kitchen. Check out my 
website. Earn Free Product!! Or 
Become your own Boss! 
 
Cornerstone Painting Company 

303-667-4698 
cornerstonepaintco@gmail.com 
Cornerstone Painting Co offers 
high quality painting at affordable 
prices. Interior & exterior. Free 
estimates. I’m new to the 
neighborhood & would love to 
meet you & earn your business. 
Call or email me now! 
 
 

 

PANDORA JEWELRY 
www.TheGoldMarketJewelers.com 

303-834-8981 
Gold, silver, diamond, gemstones, 
custom design. Perfect for 
eng age me n t ,  ann i ve r sa r y , 
birthday, valentines, mothers day. 
We repair watches & jewelry. 
Authorized Pandora, Seiko, 
Bulova, Lashbrook, Rhythm 
Clocks. 
 

AFFORDABLE WINDOWS 
720-205-2206 

Encore Home Improvement 
Do you have leaky-broken-drafty 
windows? We can replace them 
with brand name energy efficient 
windows at an affordable price.  
We are an A+ BBB company with 
22 years experience in Longmont! 
 

NEW SALON 
OAK ST. HAIR STUDIO 

539 Oak Street, Frederick 
720-428-8067 

Bethanywellbrock@yahoo.com 
Bethany Wellbrock—owner stylist. 
23 years experience. Call and ask 
for Bethany! 
 
Scoopy Doo’s Poop Scooping! 

720-273-5924 
scoopydoos@gmail.com 

Poop Scooping!  Love your dog 
but tired of all their crap!  Weekly 
service. Convenient flat monthly 
fee—1 dog $35, 2 dogs $45 per 
month. 22 years of service! Sign 
up online at www.scoopydoos.net 
or call Deb now! 
 
C. MARIE BEAUTY & MAKEUP 

CONSULTANT 
720-357-8559 

foreignbeauty.03@gmail.com 
I offer beauty and makeup artist 
services for all different occasions! 
Whether it be a wedding, high 
schoo l  prom, or  even a 
photoshoot, I’m experienced in all 
styles! I  also do fashion 
consultations when needed.  Call 
or email me for a quote! 

PET RN PET-SITTING/ 
PET-CARE / WALKING 

970-418-5114 
amymw58@hotmail.com 

For daily needs or vacations.  Call 
Amy—lover of pets, human RN! 
 

MOVING? 
720-340-8004 

info@copromovers.com 
Looking for local professional 
movers? We have a small team of 
people who know how to load a 
truck symmetrically & treat your 
furniture with kid gloves.  NO 
cancellations GUARANTEED!! 
You rent the truck. We provide 
labor & all move equipment at no 
extra charge & will dissemble/
reassemble. We do not start 
charging until we arrive and end 
when you say we are done.  Call 
Rick now! 
 

Accounting and Tax Services 
720-330-2290 

lisa@trustedaccountingandtax.com 
CPA with accounting and tax 
business looking for new clients. 
Qu ickBooks  Pro  Adv iso r , 
accounting, payroll, tax planning, 
preparation and consulting. Please 
call me for a free consultation. 
 

Two Cool Dudes Yardwork 
303-378-9147 

Careful, conscientious, capable 
leaf cleanup. Also, count on us for 
snow removal  th is winter 
season…$5 for sidewalks and 
walkways, $15 per driveway.  
Weekly, one time, or on demand.  
Call Brayden and Benjamin. 

 

When you’re ready, we’d like a chance to earn your business! 

303-918-5050 
www.hannonteam.com  

Thinking of Buying or Selling? 
Call Denia at 303-918-5050 or 

Email Denia at 
hannonteam@gmail.com  

To place a free ad, go to 
www.hannonteam.com and 

Click on Submit a 
Classified Ad Or call us at 

303-827-7059. 


