
C U I S I N E
�e menu specializes in house-made 
gnocchi and ravioli, hand-stretched 
brick oven pizzas and house-made 
gelato. Signature items include the 
Whipped Ricotta with black tru�e 
honey, Chicken Chopped Salad, 
Charred Pepperoni brick oven pizza, 
Spicy Rigatoni Alla Vodka, Gnocchi 
Bolognese and Chicken Raguso.
 

B E V E R AG E
Our wine list features over 50 wines 
available by the bottle and the glass. 
�e wines range from Spumati and 
Rosatos to Biancos and Rossos, with 
a wide variety of Italian options, in 
addition to select options from 
California and Washington.

E X P E R I E N C E
Antico Posto is a cozy Italian 
restaurant and wine bar tucked away 
in Oakbrook Center. �e intimate 
dining room, wine bar and outdoor 
Terrace are open every day for lunch, 
dinner and carryout. �e Genevieve 
Room, our private dining space, 
accommodates up to 42 guests and is 
the ideal venue for your next special 
event. Guests may also enjoy our full 
menu in the comfort of their home or 
o�ce with our catering packages.

118 OAKBROOK CENTER
OAK BROOK, IL 60523
630-586-9200
ANTICO-POSTO.COM


