
CUISINE
Perfect for sharing, Happy Camper’s menu 
includes “Happytizer” apps like Queso Elote 
Dip, Mozzarella Breadsticks, Chicken Nachos, 
Whipped Feta dip, and more. Known for 
signature pizzas made on crispy and chewy 
dough or crispy and thin tavern-styled pizza, 
there are a dozen options to choose from. Try 
classics like cheese and pepperoni or specialty 
toppings like Prosciutto & Spinach or Roasted 
Street Corn ‘za. Menu items exclusive to 
Happy Camper in Las Vegas include Baja 
Fish Tacos, Tuna Poke Bowl, and Double 
Smashburger. Weekend Brunch is dubbed the 
“Struggle Bus Brunch,” and is packed with 
specialties like Chicken and Waffles, Tavern 
Breakfast ‘Za, Avocado Toast, and more.

BEVERAGE
Sip on signature cocktails like the Big A$$ 
Lemonade, a 32oz of pink lemonade and 
vodka, the Paradise Spritz, Trashy Tea sweet 
tea with lemon vodka, and classics like the 
Espresso Martini and Aperol Spritz, served in 
an oversized chalice. During brunch, enjoy 
the Hangover Iced Coffee, Brunch Bloody 
Mary, and Bottomless Mimosas. Happy 
Camper offers Happy Hour every Monday to 
Thursday from 3:00 PM to 6:00 PM,
featuring $8 select wine, $9 select cocktails, 
and $5 select bites. 

EXPERIENCE
Located in Fashion Show Vegas, Happy 
Camper is a lively and playful space, decked 
out in signature decor from disco balls, to 
neon lights, a vintage camper, and more. 
Perfect for large groups, the space offers 
indoor/outdoor dining options with a large 
patio, bar, and dining room accommodating 
200 guests. The retractable roof allows for 
prime patio seating all year round complete 
with fire pits, cabanas, and communal 
seating ideal for partying with friends.
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