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Learn how to draw Whisper the Dragon!

You will need: 

- A sheet of paper or sketchbook page

- A graphite pencil

- A black pen

- Some colouring pencils/pens/paints

Start with your graphite pencil, 
and draw a circle slightly to the 
right and up from the centre of 
your page. This will be Whisper’s 
head! it does not have to be a 
perfect circle.

Next, add a little nose (a bit like a 
duckbill but shorter).
2. Add a little nose to the bottom
right of the circle (a bit like a 
duckbill but shorter).
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3. Draw a line sloping down, then
to the left, then gently down and
swoop up and around, with a 
flick at the end.

4. Draw another line, following 
the other but widening out, in 
order to make a body and tail.



 

 

6. Draw an additional line for 
each arm and leg, filling them 
out.

5. Draw four soft zig-zags coming 
out of the bottom of the  body-
shape. The top two are arms and
are shaped like S’s, while the 
bottom two are legs and shaped
like Z’s.



7. Draw six little triangles for 
Whisper’s horns, spikes, and at 
the end of his tail.

8. Add Whisper’s ears and wings.
These are bat-wing shaped, with
three spikes.



 

 

9. Now you have the basic 
shapes and frames down, you 
can draw over the top in pen, 
adding details like eyes, nostrils, 
mouth, fingers and toes!

10. To finish him off, colour 
Whisper with a green/blue body, 
and pink ears and wings! Or you 
could choose your own colours. 

Find out all about Whisper’s adventures in: 
“Whisper to the Rescue” by Rose Robbins.


