
I Do With LSU Engagement Ring Giveaway 

OFFICIAL RULES  

CONTEST IS OPEN TO LEGAL RESIDENTS OF THE UNITED STATES WHO ARE 20 YEARS OF AGE OR 
OLDER AT THE TIME OF ENTRY AND SHALL BE CONSTRUED AND EVALUATED ACCORDING TO U.S. LAW.  

NO PURCHASE NECESSARY TO ENTER OR WIN. A PURCHASE OR PAYMENT OF ANY KIND WILL NOT 
INCREASE YOUR CHANCES OF WINNING.  

ADMINISTRATOR: LSU Sports Properties ("Administrator").  

By entering, each entrant grants Diamonds Direct (“Sponsor”) and Administrator permission to use his/her information 
(name, email, phones, etc.) for future contact, except where prohibited by law. No information collected from the 
Contest will be sent or sold to third parties.  

1. PROMOTION DESCRIPTION AND PERIOD: Contest begins at 12:00:00 am CT on 10/14/22 and ends at 
11:59:59 pm CT on 11/11/22. Entrants are asked to enter the Contest via the submission form available at 
https://lsusports.net/idowithlsu. All eligible entries will be included in a Contest for the chance to win the prize 
described in Section 5 below.  

2. TO ENTER: Entrants are asked to enter the Contest by completing a three to five sentence essay explaining why 
the entrant should be the Diamonds Direct Dream proposal winner.  

3. ELIGIBILITY: Contest is open to legal residents of the United States, who are 20 years of age and older at time of 
entry, except for employees of and immediate family members or persons living in the same household of 
Administrator, Sponsor, and each of their respective affiliates, subsidiaries, franchisees and agencies; high school 
students and their parents and coaches; and individuals engaged in the development, production, printing, or 
distribution of Contest materials and members of their immediate family or persons living in the same household. 
Contest is subject to all applicable federal, state and local laws.  

4. CONTEST FINALISTS AND WINNER SELECTION: Sponsor will choose one (1) winner from all eligible entrants. 
Winner will be notified via phone or e-mail no later than November 12, 2022 and will be required to respond to the 
notification within twenty-four (24) hours indicating whether he/she can accept the prize. Odds of winning will depend 
upon the number of entrants. Administrator reserves the right to reject any entrant for any reason in its sole 
discretion.  

5. PRIZES:  

One (1) winner will receive (a) one (1) diamond engagement ring provided by Diamonds Direct; (b) two (2) tickets to 
LSU.vs UAB football game at Tiger Stadium on 11/19/22 (c) opportunity to propose during (c) feature on video boards 
during LSU.vs UAB football game at Tiger Stadium on 11/19/22.  

Prize fair market value: $10,000. No substitutions or transfers of prize(s) are permitted by the winner, except at the 
Administrator's sole discretion. If winner cannot accept the prize as specified, prize will be forfeited and will be 
awarded to an alternate winner (time permitting). All taxes and all other costs associated with acceptance or use of 
the above prize(s) are the sole responsibility of the winner.  

6. RELEASE OF LIABILITY AND PUBLICITY: By entering, all entrants agree to be contacted by the Administrator 
regarding upcoming promotions. All entrants and prize winner and their respective families consent to the use of their 
names, photographs, likenesses and limited biographical information for publicity or advertising purposes without 
further compensation, where permitted by law. All entrants release Administrator, Sponsor and each of their 
respective affiliates, subsidiaries, franchisees, officers, directors, partners, equity holders, agents, employees, and all 
others associated with the development and execution of this Contest (collectively, the "Released Parties"), from any 
and all liability with respect to, or in any way arising from, this Contest and/or acceptance or use of the prize, 
including liability for personal injury, damages, death or monetary loss. Administrator assumes no responsibility for 
any injury, loss or  



damage to entrants' or to any other person's computer relating to, or resulting from, entering or downloading any 
information or software in connection with this Contest. Administrator and its agents are not responsible for technical, 
hardware, software or telephone malfunctions of any kind, lost or unavailable network connections, or late, failed, 
incorrect, incomplete, inaccurate, garbled or delayed electronic communications caused by the user, or by any of the 
equipment or programming associated with or utilized in this Contest, or by any human or other errors that may occur 
in connection with this Contest.  

Entrants give the Released Parties permission to use their name, likeness, image, voice, and/or appearance as such 
may be embodied in any pictures, photos, video recordings, audiotapes, digital images, and the like (collectively, 
"Images"), taken or made in connection with entrants' participation in the Contest, and to modify, reproduce, display 
or otherwise disseminate such Images, in whole or in part. Entrants agree that the Released Parties have complete 
ownership of such Images including the entire copyright therein, and may use such Images for any and all purposes, 
including but not limited to using the Images in illustrations, bulletins, videotapes, reprints, reproductions, 
publications, advertisements, and any promotional materials in any medium now known or later developed, including 
the Internet, and entrants will take no action to challenge or object to the validity of such ownership. Entrants 
acknowledge that they will not receive any compensation for the use of such Images and hereby release and 
discharge the Released Parties from any and all claims which arise out of or are in any way connected with the use, 
display, dissemination or exploitation of the Images, including but not limited to any claims for defamation, violation of 
moral or artistic rights and/or any right of privacy or publicity.  

7. GENERAL RULES: The Released Parties are not responsible for lost, illegible, late, delayed or misdirected mail or 
email or other communications, or for any error in the printing or interpretation of the offer, the administration of the 
Contest, or in any announcement of the winner or prizes. In no event will Administrator be liable for more than the 
stated number of prizes in Section 5. No cash substitutions for prizes will be permitted and prizes are non-refundable 
and non-transferable except at sole discretion of Administrator. Administrator reserves the right, in its sole discretion, 
to cancel or suspend this Contest, in its entirety or in part, should tampering, unauthorized intervention, 
counterfeiting, fraud, technical failures, or other causes beyond Administrator's control corrupt the administration, 
security, fairness, integrity or proper play of the Contest. Administrator reserves the right at its sole discretion to 
disqualify any individual it finds to be tampering with the entry process or the operation of the Contest, to be acting in 
violation of the Rules or any laws, or to be attempting to undermine the legitimate operation of the Contest, by 
cheating, hacking, deception, misappropriation, infringement, or any other unfair playing practices, poor 
sportsmanship, or intending to annoy, abuse, threaten, or harass any other entrants or Administrator representatives. 
CAUTION: ANY ATTEMPT TO DELIBERATELY DAMAGE OR UNDERMINE THE LEGITIMATE OPERATION OF 
THE CONTEST MAY BE IN VIOLATION OF CRIMINAL AND CIVIL LAWS AND WILL RESULT IN 
DISQUALIFICATION FROM PARTICIPATION IN THE CONTEST. SHOULD SUCH AN ATTEMPT BE MADE, 
ADMINISTRATOR RESERVES THE RIGHT TO SEEK REMEDIES AND DAMAGES (INCLUDING ATTORNEYS’ 
FEES) TO THE FULLEST EXTENT OF THE LAW, INCLUDING CRIMINAL PROSECUTION.  

8. INDEMNIFICATION: By entering this Contest, you as entrant also agree to release, hold harmless and indemnify 
Administrator and Sponsor from and against any and all claims arising directly or indirectly from or in connection with 
entrant's participation in the Contest.  

9. APPLICABLE LAWS AND JURISDICTION: Issues concerning the construction, validity, interpretation and 
enforceability of these Official Rules shall be governed by the laws of the State of Texas. All disputes arising out of or 
connected with this Contest will be resolved individually, and without resort to class action, exclusively by a state or 
federal court located in the State of Texas. Should there be a conflict between the laws of the State of Texas and any 
other laws, the conflict will be resolved in favor of the laws of the State of Texas. All judgments or awards shall be 
limited to actual out-of-pocket damages (excluding attorneys' fees) associated with participation in this Contest and 
shall not include any indirect, punitive, incidental and/or consequential damages.  

10. ABBREVIATED RULES: Contest open to legal residents of the United States 20 years of age & older at time of 
entry. Promotion begins at 12:00:00 am CT on 10/14/22 and ends at 11:59:59 pm CT on 11/11/22. No purchase 
necessary. Void where prohibited.  

 


