
Spring Primary Election

The Spring Primary will be held on
February 21, 2023. Polls will be open from
7am to 8pm. The Village of Bayside has
one polling location, Bayside Village Hall
(9075 N Regent Rd).

Visit MyVote Wisconsin to register to vote,
update your voter information, request an
absentee ballot, view a sample ballot, and
more.

MyVote Wisconsin

Spring Primary Absentee Voting

In-person absentee voting is taking place at
Village Hall:

Thursday, February 16 | 8am-4pm
Friday, February 17 | 8am-5pm

Voting absentee by mail? Ballots must be
returned to Village Hall by 8pm on
Tuesday, February 21.

Visit MyVote Wisconsin to register to vote,
update your voter information, view a
sample ballot, and more.

MyVote Wisconsin

Mount Bayside Parking

The snow is falling! Two parking lots are
available for residents visiting Mount
Bayside. Residents should only park in the
sled hill parking located to the west of the
hill or in the Village Hall parking lot, located

https://myvote.wi.gov/en-us/
https://myvote.wi.gov/en-us/


south of the building.

Please do not park on the street as this
causes hazards for emergency vehicles
and winter operations.

National Battery Day

National Battery Day is celebrated annually
on February 18. This year, ensure you are
properly recycling your batteries. Batteries
should not be placed in your curbside
recycling containers to avoid truck and
facility fires.

Click the link below to find battery recycling
locations near you!

Where To Recycle

Open Monday

All Village Departments will be open on
Monday, February 20 for Presidents Day.

Garbage and recycling collection will be
completed as normal.

No Mow May

No Mow May is a conservation initiative
that encourages people to stop mowing or
mow less often for the month of May to
create habitat and provide resources for
bees and other early-season pollinators.
The Village of Bayside is proud to join a
number of other municipalities in the No
Mow May initiative.  

During the month of May, Bayside will
suspend enforcement of long-grass rules,
allowing property owners to delay or
reduce lawn cutting to promote pollinator-
friendly habitat early in the growing season.

https://www.uwgb.edu/solid-hazardous-waste-education-center/


Participating residents must register their
properties.

To become a 2023 No Mow May
participant, Bayside residents must register
through Access bayside no later than May
7, 2023.

Register Your Property

Final Winter Beer Garden

The last Winter Beer Garden of the season
will take place this Sunday, February 19.

Join us at Mount Bayside from 12-4pm for
beverages served by 1840 Brewing
Company!

The summer Beer Garden Series will begin
on May 20 at Ellsworth Park!

1840 Brewing Co.

Will You Be Our Tweetheart?

Did you know, Bayside has been a Bird
City since 2010?

You can do your part by mitigating for bird
collisions in your home and places of
business. There are four ways you can
keep birds from striking windows: 

1. Installing barriers between birds and
the window exterior

2. Breaking up reflections that birds see
in windows

3. Removing the illusion of a clear
passageway

4. Turning off or down-shielding
outdoor lighting

https://www.baysidewi.gov/services/#/city/report/embed/no-mow-may
https://www.1840brewing.com/events/
https://www.1840brewing.com/


Download our Tweetheart Printables and
hang them in your windows to spread the
love to our feathered friends!

Tweetheart Printables

Did You Know?

The Police Department collected 487 pounds of prescription drugs in 2022. The
Prescription Drug Drop Box is available 24/7/365 in the Police Department Lobby to
dispose of unused and unwanted prescription drugs.

Accepted Items

Access Bayside

CodeRED Emergency Notifications

Meetings and Events

myBlue

Paperless Permitting

2023 Collection Guide

Collection Guide
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