AGENDA
REGULAR MEETING
CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

Colma Town Hall
1198 El Camino Real
Colma, CA 94014

Wednesday, December 11, 2019
7:00 PM

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND ROLL CALL
ADOPTION OF AGENDA
PRESENTATION

Proclamation in honor of Choco, retiring U.S. Parks Police K9

PUBLIC COMMENTS

Comments on the Consent Calendar and Non-Agenda Items will be heard at this time. Comments
on Agenda Items will be heard when the item is called.

CONSENT CALENDAR

A WD

Motion to Accept the Minutes from the November 26, 2019 Special Meeting.
Motion to Accept the Minutes from the December 3, 2019 Special Meeting.
Motion to Accept the Report of Checks Paid for November 2019.

Motion to Introduce the following ordinance by title only with direction to staff to include all noticed
publication dates and January 8, 2020 as the public hearing date in Article 1, Sections (j) and (k):
an Ordinance Amending Chapter 5, Subchapter 4 of the Town of Colma Municipal Code, Adopting
by Reference the 2019 Edition of the California Building Standards Code (California Code of
Regulations, Title 24), Consisting of the 2019 California Building Code, the 2019 California
Residential Code, the 2019 California Electrical Code, the 2019 California Mechanical Code, the 2019
California Plumbing Code, the 2019 California Fire Code, the 2019 California Energy Code, the 2019
California Green Building Standards Code, the 2019 California Historical Building Code, the 2019
California Existing Building Code and the 2019 California Referenced Standards Code; the 1997
Edition of the Uniform Housing Code; and the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code,
Together With Certain Additions, Amendments, and Deletions; Waive a further reading of the
ordinance; and schedule a public hearing for January 8, 2020.

Page 1 of 2




5. Motion to Adopt a Resolution to Accept Work Performed by Community Playgrounds, Inc., for the
Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project and Authorize the Director of Public Works to File a
Notice of Completion with the County Recorder’s Office and Make the Final Payment to Community
Playgrounds, Inc., in Accordance with State Prompt Payment Laws.

PUBLIC HEARING
6. WILD BIRD AND WILD ANIMAL FEEDING ORDINANCE

Consider: Motion to Introduce an Ordinance Amending Colma Municipal Code Subchapter 8.01
Prohibiting the Feeding of Wild Birds or Wild Animals on Public and Private Property Pursuant to
CEQA Guideline 15061(b)(3), and Waive a Further Reading of the Ordinance.

NEW BUSINESS
7. COUNCIL COMMITTEE ASSIGNMENTS 2020

Consider: Motion Approving Committee Assignments for 2020 and Granting to the Appointee
Discretion in Voting on Matters Brought Before the Committee.

8. COUNCIL OF CITIES AND CITY SELECTION COMMITTEE

Consider: Motion Confirming Designation of the Mayor as the Voting Member for the Council of
Cities, Designating an Alternate Voting Member, and Giving the Voting Member Discretion on any
and all Matters to be Considered.

9. FIFTH AMENDMENT TO EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

Consider: Motion to Adopt a Resolution Approving Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with
Kirk Stratton.

10. THIRD AMENDMENT TO EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY
Consider: Motion to Adopt a Resolution Approving Third Amendment to Employment Contract with
Brian Dossey.

REPORTS

Mayor/City Council
City Manager

ADJOURNMENT
The City Council Meeting Agenda Packet and supporting documents are available for review at the Colma Town Hall, 1198 El

Camino Real, Colma, CA during normal business hours (Mon — Fri 8am-5pm). Persons interested in obtaining an agenda via e-mail
should call Caitlin Corley at 650-997-8300 or email a request to ccorley@colma.ca.gov.

Reasonable Accommodation

Upon request, this publication will be made available in appropriate alternative formats to persons with disabilities, as required by
the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. Any person with a disability, who requires a modification or accommodation to view
the agenda, should direct such a request to Pak Lin, ADA Coordinator, at 650-997-8300 or pak.lin@colma.ca.gov. Please allow
two business days for your request to be processed.

Page 2 of 2



mailto:ccorley@colma.ca.gov
mailto:pak.lin@colma.ca.gov

Item #1

MINUTES
SPECIAL MEETING
City Council of the Town of Colma
Town Hall Council Chamber, 1198 ElI Camino Real
Colma, CA 94014
Tuesday, November 26, 2019
6:00 PM

CALL TO ORDER
Mayor Joanne F. del Rosario called the meeting to order at 6:01 p.m.

Council Present — Mayor Joanne F. del Rosario, Vice Mayor John Irish Goodwin, Council
Members Diana Colvin, Helen Fisicaro and Raquel Gonzalez were all present.

Staff Present — City Manager Brian Dossey, City Attorney Christopher Diaz, Chief of Police
Kirk Stratton, Administrative Services Director Pak Lin, Director of Public Works Brad
Donohue, City Planner Michael Laughlin, Human Resources Manager Letty Juarez, and City
Clerk Caitlin Corley were in attendance.

ADOPTION OF THE AGENDA

Mayor del Rosario asked if there were any changes to the agenda; none were requested.
She asked for a motion to adopt the agenda.

Action: Council Member Colvin moved to adopt the agenda; the motion was seconded by
Council Member Gonzalez and carried by the following vote:

Name Votin Present, Not Voting Absent
Aye | No Abstain | Not Participating
Joanne F. del Rosario, Mayor | v
John Irish Goodwin v
Diana Colvin v
Helen Fisicaro v
Raguel Gonzalez v
5 0
CONSENT CALENDAR
1. Motion to Accept the Minutes from the November 8, 2019 Special Meeting.
2. Motion to Accept the Minutes from the November 13, 2019 Regular Meeting.
3. Motion to Adopt a Resolution of the City Council Granting the City Manager Authorization to

Execute All Certificates or Documents Required on Certifying Rights of Way for Federal
and/or State Funded Projects.

Action: Vice Mayor Goodwin moved to approve the Consent Calendar items #1 through
#3; the motion was seconded by Council Member Colvin and carried by the following vote:

Minutes — Special Meeting 11.26.19 Page 1 of 3



Name Votin Present, Not Voting Absent
No | Abstain | Not Participating

Joanne F. del Rosario, Mayor
John Irish Goodwin

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

>
CEENENENANANF

NEW BUSINESS
4. SERRAMONTE COLLINS MASTER PLAN DRAFT REVIEW

The Mayor encouraged the members of the public present to ask questions of make
comments throughout the presentation. City Planner Michael Laughlin presented the staff
report. Resident Dennis Fisicaro and business owner Victor Hung made comments. Council

discussion followed.

Action: Vice Mayor Goodwin moved to Accept the Staff Report Updating the City Council on
the Serramonte Collins Master Plan; the motion was seconded by Council Member Colvin
and carried by the following vote:

Name Votin Present, Not Voting Absent
Aye | No Abstain | Not Participating

Joanne F. del Rosario, Mayor
John Irish Goodwin

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

SEENENENENAN

COUNCIL CALENDARING
The next Regular Council Meeting on Wednesday, November 27, 2019 has been cancelled.

The City Council Reorganization Meeting will be on Tuesday, December 3 at 6:30pm at
Town Hall.

REPORTS
There were no Council reports.
City Manager Brian Dossey gave a report on the following topics:

Honey Baked Ham has had a line out the door for the last few days due to the holiday.
¢ Ashely HomeStore will have a grand opening ribbon cutting on Wednesday, November
27, 2019 at 9am.
e The Holiday Tree Lighting Celebration will be on Monday, December 2, 2019.
Breakfast with Santa will be on Saturday, December 7, 2019

Minutes — Special Meeting 11.26.19 Page 2 of 3



ADJOURNMENT

Mayor del Rosario adjourned the meeting at 7:16 p.m. in memory of Jesus Benito Falcon,
father of resident Anton Falcon.

Respectfully submitted,

Caitlin Corley
City Clerk

Minutes — Special Meeting 11.26.19 Page 3 of 3






Ttem #2

MINUTES
SPECIAL MEETING
City Council of the Town of Colma
Colma Town Hall, 1198 El Camino Real
Colma, CA 94014
Tuesday, December 3, 2019
6:30 p.m.

CALL TO ORDER
Mayor del Rosario called the Special Meeting of the City Council to order at 6:35 p.m.

Council Present —Mayor Joanne F. del Rosario, Vice Mayor John Irish Goodwin, Council Members
Diana Colvin, Helen Fisicaro and Raquel “Rae” Gonzalez were all present.

INTRODUCTIONS

Mayor del Rosario welcomed the audience and acknowledged local dignitaries and elected officials
in attendance:

Mary Brodzon, Former Council Member

Supervisor David Canepa

Maureen O’Connor, President of the Colma Historical Association

Richard Rochetta, Secretary of the Colma Historical Association

Mayor del Rosario introduced the following Town of Colma Staff members:
Brian Dossey, City Manager
Kirk Stratton, Police Chief
Pak Lin, Administrative Services Director
Brad Donohue, Director of Planning and Public Works
Michael Laughlin, City Planner
Liz Tapia, Recreation Manager
Caitlin Corley, City Clerk
Letty Juarez, Human Resources Manager

REMARKS BY OUT-GOING MAYOR

Mayor del Rosario made remarks as the out-going Mayor. The City Council presented her with a
gavel, proclamation, flowers and a donation to the ALLICE (Alliance for Community Empowerment)
“Kumares and Kumpares,” whose purpose is to educate and bring awareness to the community on
issues regarding all forms of domestic violence.

NOMINATION AND APPOINTMENT OF MAYOR

The Mayor called upon the Council for nominations for Mayor. Council Member Fisicaro nominated

John Irish Goodwin for Mayor, and the nomination was seconded by Council Member Colvin. There
were no other nominations, and Mayor del Rosario closed the nominations for Mayor and called for
a vote.

Action: Council Member Fisicaro moved to select John Irish Goodwin as Mayor, and the motion
was seconded by Council Member Colvin and carried by the following vote:

Minutes — Special Meeting — 02.06.19 Page 1 of 3



Name Votin Present, Not Voting Absent
No | Abstain | Not Participating

Joanne F. del Rosario, Mayor
John lIrish Goodwin

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raqguel Gonzalez

>
SEENENENANEN=

ADMINISTRATION OF THE OATH OF OFFICE TO NEW MAYOR
Sean Goodwin came to the podium to administer the Oath of Office to the new Mayor. After
receiving the Oath of Office, Mayor Goodwin introduced his guests and gave his remarks as the in-
coming Mayor.

NOMINATION AND APPOINTMENT OF VICE MAYOR

Mayor Goodwin called upon the Council to make nominations for Vice Mayor. Council Member
Fisicaro nominated Diana Colvin for Vice Mayor, and the nomination was seconded by Council
Member del Rosario. There were no other nominations, and Mayor Goodwin closed the
nominations for Vice Mayor and called for a vote.

Action: Council Member Fisicaro moved to select Diana Colvin as Vice Mayor, and the motion was
seconded by Council Member del Rosario and carried by the following vote:

Name Votin Present, Not Voting Absent
Aye | No | Abstain | Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor
Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

SHENENENENAN

ADMINISTRATION OF THE OATH OF OFFICE TO VICE MAYOR

Chief Kirk Stratton came to the podium to administer the Oath of Office to the new Vice Mayor.
After receiving the Oath of Office, Vice Mayor Colvin introduced her guests and gave her remarks

as the in-coming Vice Mayor.

SIGNING OF THE VALUES BASED CODE OF CONDUCT

Mayor Goodwin announced, “In 2009, the City Council adopted the Values Based Code of Conduct
to promote and maintain the highest standards of personal and professional conduct in the Town'’s
government. This summer, Council and staff participated in a team building exercise and worked
together to revise and update the pledge. The newly updated Code of Conduct includes the
longstanding values of fairness, honesty and integrity, responsibility, vision and respect, and
focuses on practical ways to live up to these values while highlighting the importance of trust,
communication, collaboration and compassion.

Council will now sign this pledge; Town Staff will sign after the meeting. It will be posted on our
website as a reminder of our commitment to the public and to each other.”

Minutes — Special Meeting — 02.06.19 Page 2 of 3



The Mayor and each member of Council signed the pledge.
ADJOURNMENT

Mayor Goodwin adjourned the Special Meeting at 7:21 p.m. and invited everyone to join the
Council in the reception that followed.

Respectfully submitted,

Caitlin Corley
City Clerk

Minutes — Special Meeting — 02.06.19 Page 3 of 3






Item #3

| :obed

00°GSS'L 00°GGS'L 58NS ¥VIA L I01N0d LINV1d  6L0Z/L/LL  $9L¥000-ISHITLYHOLSHOINI 140SYNOVY vL0E0 6102/S/LL $8.0S
00°000°GS 00°000'6S OIY3LX3 SYTTIA 3AISHIATHD 610Z/2L/0L 780761 "ONI ONILNIVd VT13LS 2000 610T/5/LL £820S
06822 05822 SA¥vO SSANISNG 6L0Z/0L/0L LTLYed9 3 ONILNIM JAILONAONd 0./620 6L02/S/LL 28105
zL'28e 21'Z8e 791 SYVITD 6102 '52-1.2 10O 61L02/8Z/01 iUluell SYYI1D VANVIAY ‘ZINOSY13IA 9v620 6L02/S/LL 18205
0005 0005 ANN43Y 11ISOd3a 61'82°0L 6102/82/0L  €00°€ZLL00T VLY 'IONOd 0€620 6102/5/LL 0805
00°GLL'PEL 00°GLL'PEL NOILNEIMLINOD 9340  6102/v/LL 93d0 6L0Z AON S ‘LINNOJIV SHV MNVE 'S'N 6820 6102/G/LL 6./0G
vrvic vrvle IVLNIY ANIHOVIN AJOD O3 61L02/8L/01 167878201  NOILVIWHOANI TVLIdVYD 3D 6620 6L02/S/LL 81205
16°€CL 8L9¢ INTYA TIVE O€-AGd L 6L0T/€2/0L 80NN .
6.8 TO9'L L IV TvOIY  61L02/8/01L O 1ddNS DONIGINNTd AYVANVLS L0€20 610T/S/LL 22205
00'660'9 00°660'9 ONIMOLNL 6L0Z/L/LL 6102190000 HILNID NOWNM ALID ATVd 28120 610T/G/LL 91105
00622 00622 aNN43Y 1ISOd3A 61'82°0L 6L0Z/82/0L  £00°522L00T NI4T ‘'SONVY ZLl20 610T/S/LL S//0S
000Gl 00°0vG'L ANNOYDMIVE INOOHAHYD 610Z/0€/01 0€0L-61 1IN 'FLSTTID G66L0 6L0T/G/LL /0
00°09L 0009} NITMVd 02°0€'LL OL6L°L0CL 6L0Z/9L/6 00€S¥10 440 JONVNI4 LNIWNHIAOD 62810 610T/S/LL €110
00096 00'096 SASSY10 IONVA  6L0Z/L/LL 610z 1des AWIAVYOV JONVA ond 19€10 610T/S/LL 21208
00°00% 00°00¥ ATIVHO VIAIML 6102 ‘GL AON  6L02/p/LL 1AL [enuuy Ui/ ZyvS HLY¥ON - avId 103royd vveL0 6102/S/LL 12208
00°6GS 00655 I4® INFJNTLVEIY OLINDSOW  6L0Z/L/LL B 1SL 020Z-6L02 ALNNOD OF1VIN NVS L6ZL0 6L0T/S/LL 02205
8L°/8S 7601 1IH 0251 0422000 220 02 S8 6L02/LL/0L 114X 92/LL-22/01
z'882 - JouelU] LG0Z600 220 02 GGL8  6L0Z/L/LL 181U] ¥2/LL-GZ/0L
: 2882 LS 4 /2t 820,600 220 0Z G518 61L02/02/0L LZ¥ ¥2/LL-GZ/0L 319V 1SYOINOD /€0L0 610Z/S/LL 69205
Gz'€28'9 gz'10Z'L LNOD 40 SS30X3 NI SHNOH 6102/02/01 0Z61061
00CZ9's YHLINOD IDINYIS ATHLNOW 610Z/02Z/0L ¥961061 "ONI ‘04044318 0€0L0 6L0Z/S/LL 89205
00°000°'L 00°000'L S3ANA TYNNNY  6102Z/L/0L 10-0202 VSOdONS 91200 610T/S/LL 2908
00°008't 00°008'v 1 133¥LS O 40 MD019 00v 6L0Z/1.2/01 998ZLL¥L6vdINOD 1H3dX3 3341 AIAVA 6¥900 61L0T/S/LL 99105
8Lv10'L 8L 0L 3N1d 334 dIHSYIININ 6102 6102/6L/L 61028229./11TV ADIAYIS ANNOYOHIANN Z2h00 6102/S/LL G908
65729 6509 00EPATLYIN WNNOVA YILLIT 6L0Z/8L/0L vL¥S59916
00795 (HAIY "¥3gaNYDS/4IdIIMS 61L02/8L/01 €L¥57991L6 INVNN3L ¥6€00 61L0Z/S/LL 9205
00°0£9°0L 000/9'0L LSNI NOSY3S AVAITOH 6102  61L0Z/22/8 zeove "ONI ‘AV1dSIA vHuIIS 1500 6102/S/LL €905
eLv9e'e 6126 I99d 610Z/LZ/0L 6102/L2/01
Ly'LGe I%9d 6L0Z/72/0L 6L0Z/vT/0L
€5°6L0'C a99d 6102/42/0L 6L02/¥2/0L  ORHL1O3T3 8 SVO 2I4I0vd L0€00 610Z/S/LL 29.0S
00209 00209 1OVHLINOD AONVNILNIVIN  6L02/L/LL €LLL6LVYOINNINNOD JTIOW O LI ¥5200 6102/S/LL 1908
00°0S 0005 JISIAIQ VTYNSNINS 61/8L/0L 61L0Z/8L/0L LGSL S3ILIO VD 40 INOVAT TT200 6L0Z/S/LL 09206
[ej0] }ooyo pled junowy T uonduossg ayeq Auj 9210AU| lopuap ajeq #994D
YNVE SILLNNOD YL Isiy :)jueg
BW[OD JO UMO] INVZ0:9t:0L 610Z/SO0/LL
| :obed IsI1 399y |euty

IsTiyode



¢ obed

LL'96€'TST YNVE S3LLNNOD L 10§ [e30) gqng
G/°080°G G2°080°g JONVHNSNITVOIQIW  6102/L/LL [¥9€85L000000L AOTdINT O119Nd VINHOAITYD ¢8¢00 610¢/s/LL 610CS0LI
00°00¢ 00'00¢ aNN4d3d 11SOd3d 61°82°0L 61L02/8¢/01 €00°92/.100¢ VI314gv9 'F1LYVONY1d LLEEO 610C/S/LL €6.0G
0L°69%°L 0L'69%'L \NI NO NOLLNI LI ISV 6102/22/01 ¢i3dOT9A3A Y3LT3HS HLYVYE €0€c0 610¢/9/LL T6L0G
Le'80v'L Legov'L A3V ANIM34IT HO314d143d 6102/1¢/01 G0690SLNS d3avVvad 0711 '00L 43IV ¢6¢c0 6L0¢/S/LL 16208
00°008°L 00°008°} YSLCh# d3AHO0 MHOM 6102/12/01 868CLLANVNYIN IdVISANYTVYNIHOVD L8¢E0 610¢/5/LL 06105
68°86 68'86 ISVHOUNd AdVO 11a34D 6102/L1/01 €60/69/19 0Odd 10430 INCH FHL €.¢€0 610¢/S/LL 68.05
90°¢s 007<clL 1VH 404 INJWISHNEGNIZY 6102/0L/0L 1quisy 61//0/01

90'Ly JIAID O INTFNISHNEGNITY 61L02/62/0L quiidy 61/22/0L ALLFT Z3¥vNr Lvce0 61L0¢/S/LL 88.0G
68°96€°C 68°96€'C 24 SHIVHO Sl 3NA JONV1IVE 6102/8¢2/01 1 8dueled 0160£4N0STY ‘SASIMLYILINT X3dl 00ce0 610c/s/LL 28106
L0leL'e €L'ELo ANV NOLLNG OINVd TIVLSNI 610¢/¢L/6 LvE6L

v6'06L°L TVYH NMOL 1V VHIINYO MAN  6102/2L/6 8Yc6l

oo'eze’L 01 @07.02 XO9M 'HONI XO9 6102/9L/6 CSe611 NOILVHOILNI HLYOMIDA3 ¥9LE0 610¢/S/LL 98208
4AT A lvoll ASVHOUNd QO LIa3dD 610¢/2e/0l urt 6L/ec/oL

06°.8¢ JSVHOUNd VO LIA3YO 6102/¢e/0L 119109 61/22/0L

12'600°C ISVHOHNd AdvO 11a34D 6102/¢2/0L 09712 61/22/01L

29'896'¢ dSVHOHNd VO LIA3HO 6102/22/0L UBlSAY 61/22/0L LINd ILVHOLHOD MNVE 'S'N GL0€0 610¢/8/LL 810G
[ejo] Mo9yH pied junowy uonduosaq  ajeq AUj 9010AU] iopusp  9jeq  #ooyo

(penuiuo) MNVE SIILNNOD {1 Isiy :jueg
BW]OD jO umoj INVZ0:9:0L 61L02/S0/LL
¢ eb 18I o7

[eury

IsPiyode



¢ :obed

11°96€'C5C 1SR29YD IV [ejol puels) ._ “Jodai siy3 ul syo29yd G¢

BW[0Y JO UMO] INVZ0:9%:0L 6102/50/1L
¢ :ab’ IS Y97 feuld IsTiyode



| :abeyd

0Z'SvL 061 HNVA SAILNNOD RIL 10§ [ejo) qng
12009 L2009 /d ‘SHADIHA40 IOVAd YINTOOD  610¢/8/LL 7/0d 94 61L0280LL SHFDI440 IDVId VINTOD 89000 6102/8/LL 0.L0V6
80°/€6'Y 80°/€6'Y INAYC ‘NOILNAIEINOD VINDI  6L0¢/8/LL INDI g 61028011 LNTIDY HIJASNVH L OVINVA 09€L0 610¢/8/LL 6906
€6°/8L'cY €6°/el'ey ININAVd MOVEANG - SH3d  610¢/8/L1 318d 9 6108011 SHdd L€900 610¢/8/LL 89016
91°66£29 91°66€29 VAV “TYNOILLIAVY L INIHLINY 610¢/8/L1L 1B8Hd 610¢80LL AOTdINE O1dNd VINYHOLITVD ¢3¢00 610¢/8/LL L90¥6
GE'9/9'6Y GE'9/9'6Y ININAVC XYL Ivd3d3d 6102/8/LL Ped d 61L0280LL AUNSYAYL S31VIS AALINN L¢S00 6L0c/8/LL 990v6
06°2eT'Cl 06°¢eC'el AVd XVL J1VIS VINJOLITVYO 610¢/8/LL ) INed 61028011 NINJOTIAIA LNIJNAOTIING 0cL00 6102/8/LL SG90v6
88’ ¥88ve'L VAV “TYNOILIAVYL INIFHLINVY  61L0¢/8/LL 29H-IN 61028011 AOTdINA J119Nd VINHO4ITVO ¢8¢00 6102/8/LL ¥90v6
12099 L2099 INAVd XVL-NON OSIIN SH3d  61L0¢/8/LL od-IN610¢80LL SHAd L€200 6L0¢/8/LL £9016
(44517 [AA2ti% INAVYC -NOILNEIILNOD YINOI  6L02/8/LL TNDI N6L0Z80LL LNIOV dIASNYH.L DVINVA 09¢cL0 610¢2/8/LL 9016
88°Ll6 88°'LL6 INIWAVC XVL Tvd3Aa3d 610¢/8/11L P4 IN6L0OCB0LL AHNSYIHL SALIVLIS d3LINN L2600 6L0C/8/LL L90V6
8e’L.8 8¢'1.8 WAV "LNIJWHSINYYO IADOVYM  610¢/8/LL Bm -9 610280L1ISHNESIA ILVLS VINHOLITVO 12.€¢0 610¢/8/LL 96.0S
00°00.'S 00056 INIJNAVC ‘FAIMNOILYN 6102/8/LL 18P IN6L0Z80LL

00°0G.'Y ININAVL FAIMNOILYN 6L0¢/8/LL 28p g 6102801L1'S INIJNIHI1LTYH FAIMNOILYN G/clL0 610¢/8/LL 66.08
#8809 ¥8'809 ININAYC ‘NV1d GZL X314  61L02/8/LL 1IN'89 61028011 SNOILNTOS LI43AN3F VIAYN ovel0 610¢2/8/LL ¥6.0G
IR k) pied junowy uonduosag ejeq Auj 90I0AU]| Iopuap ~ ojed  #o9yo

MNVE SAILNNOD I-FLisil :jueg
BW[OD JO UMO] INVES:LZ:0L 6102/20/11
} :obF - 3sI 392U [euly

IsPyode



¢ abey

0T’SvL 061 $SYI9YQ Iy [ej0] puelo “Jodai siy3 ul sy29yd ¢}

BWIOD 1O UMO) WVES:LZ:0" 6L0Z/20/LL
rA:1513 IS0 Jeuly IsPlyode



| obed

00°00¥ 00°00¥ 4SS/M LINYTLNI SWIY 610Z/0€/0L 9000-L0ESY2E01L IAVM 66220 6L0Z/ZL/LL £280S
00°SY 00°G¥ WYYTV IYId 61021711 £Z¥0T "ONI ‘SINILSAS 093V /8120 610Z/ZL/LL 22808
29'825'vS 00°062' IT102 8 AAT9 ILNOWVHYIS 6102/92/0} 61-265-L1

29'8€2'05 1702 '® AATE ILNOWVYNIS 6102/92/0L ATJH 81-255-ZLINY NYEHN ‘VILVYHE 8 11IAC 9920 6L02/ZL/LL 12805
€9°LES €9°LES HO4 SNOIS 1IFHIS :HOVA Z 6L0T/S/L) £60€ "ONI ONIYNLOVANNYIN 'd'V'Z L£9Z0 610Z/ZL/LL 02805
00°008 00°008 SIASSYT1D ONIMOOD  61L0Z/L/LL 0T ‘L JoquisnoN VIHLNAD ‘WNvg3019 £2920 61L02/ZL/LL 61805
00°00€ 00°00€ ANN43Y LISOdIA 6LP0°LL 6L0Z/W/LL €00°SELL00Z I1LOLSIHY ‘NOI1ad 60520 6L0Z/ZL/LL 81805
18°'698'S 99'81 iNd ANITOSYD NOILYINOIY 6102/02/0L 167199

Ly9/8°L I SASYHOMNA INITOSVYD Ad 6102/02/0} 1£0199

ve6.8°L I SASYHOHNC ANITOSYD Ad 6102/01/01 S0G659

0'690°C Z SASYHOMNA ANITOSYO Ad 610Z/LE/0L 909299 "ONI 0D 110 SONYY 91220 6102/ZL/LL L180S
00002 00°00. O NOMM 3VL 610Z/9/LL  610Z 49901901 YAd YIINT Id "V JININOG v120 610Z/ZL/LL 91805
00°0S 00°0S ANN43Y LISOd3A 6Lv0'LL  6L0Z/W/LL €00°€ELL00Z 4 INNVOF ‘Ol¥vYSOY 13a LE8LO 6L0Z/ZL/LL G805
¥z 091 ¥Z 091 IS ¥VINO3IY ANV QYVANVYLS 6L02/LE/0L  8€TS6E6-VLL 40 SIDIAYIAS TLIS AILINN /8910 610Z/ZL/LL V1805
00°08. 00°08. SISSVIO AONVA 6L0Z/L/LL 6102 4990100 AWIAVOV IONVA ONd L9€10 6LOT/ZL/LL €1.80S
00°06 00°06 8 LNVdIDILYVd GZL NOILD3S 610Z/LE/01 /€19L20L SNOILNTOS LI43N39 VIAYN 0v€L0 6L0Z/ZL/LL 2L80S
L0°6G6 10656 SINYOALINN 6L0Z/LE/0L  6L0Z 1990190103 8 SINYOHINN VINSNINId ¥81L0 6L0Z/ZL/LL 1LL80S
Z8'158'SlL AR YA INYILNI 6902600 220 0Z G518 6L02/.2/0L L/LO/ZL-6L/20/LL

oV L9S'SL D NMOLL 692600 220 0Z 5518 6L02/92/0L 6107 JoquianoN 319vD LSYONOD /€010 6L0Z/ZL/LL 0L80S
0.8/ 0L°/8. S3ddNS 301440 6102/52/01 20/6629291 11d3¥D SSANISNG ST1dVLS 0£800 61L0Z/ZL/LL 60805
00°0S6'L 00°0S6°L NINNYd ITHL SNITIOD 0051 6102/82/01 BECECLYLBYANOD L¥IdXT IIYL AIAVA 6900 6L0Z/ZL/LL 80805
#9295 oV ocl TNINOD S31TddNS alv LSHId 6L02/LE/0L L £8560098

vz eV ADIANYTS INYOLINN 6L02/LE/01 6L0Z 190 MHVNYYY £2900 610Z/ZL/LL L080S
00'6.2 00°0. 1S 4 109 6L02/2L/LL 12//60L6E

00°602 TOYLNOD 1S3d 6L02/ZL/LL 02//6016£71 TYNOILYNYILNI XANINYT L vL¥00 610Z/ZL/LL 90805
08°€G¢ 08°€s¢ ONISSIOONd NOILVYLID 6L0Z/LE/0L ovzLe SINILSAS V.LVa 09yl LL¥00 6L0Z/CL/LL S080S
18°60L°L 186011 ONIYOLINON ATHLNOW 6L0Z/L/LL gzLeEvEL TOYLINOS 88€00 610Z/ZL/LL Y0805
00°080°L 00°080°} S334dv1 6L0Z/0€/6 69LE0LANI-Sd 301440 S.A414IHS JINS ¥9€00 6L02/ZL/LL £080S
10081 10°081 I99d 6L0Z/0S/0L  L-69€/¥L29G50  OIYLOITI % SYO DidIDvd L0S00 610Z/ZL/LL Z080S
€0°08L°L €008L°'L S3ASYHOMNd A1ddNS Md 6102/0€/0L  6L0Z '62-1 PONAYIS 11ATYD 1043d INOH ¥/100 6L0Z/ZL/LL LOSOS
00°000°S 00°000°S '60) ASYITIY ALIHNS 91921  6L02/9/LL 3¢ A1BINS 91921)HD INTWIOVYNYIN dOH/I0H ¢/100 610Z/ZL/LL 0080G
62°660°L 62°660°L 1718 YILVM 6L02/SZ/01 6102/52/01IDIAYAS YIALYM VINHOLITYD LG000 6L02/ZL/LL 660G
08Z88'L 08°288°L JOINY3S IHIL 6102/LE/0L  6L0Z4200100  STAMIL ® STITHM SAANY €1000 610Z/ZL/LL 86205
00°G¥S'Z 00°S¥5'C ANV 370d M3N TIV.LSNI gST 6102/LE/0L 9z08 JIMIDI1T 4SSV €0000 610Z/ZL/LL L610G
[ejo] 329ysn pied junouwy uonduosag ajeq Auj 9310AU] lopuap ~  ajeq #3294y

MNVE SIILNNOD RiL Isiy :)uegq
BW|OD JO UMO] NdEY:eS:ZL 6L0Z/CLILL
| abed ¥sI jo9yo[euly

IsPiyode



Z ebey

LLges'LLL MNVd S3LINNOD YL 10§ [ej0) gng
00°006 00°006 4d "DISNIN 8 rd 6L0Z ‘?L O3A 6L0Z/9/LL  6102-100-SHD SOTYVYD ‘ONVZY010S ¥1€C0 6L0¢/ZL/LL 0€80G
00°000°L 00°000°L gv.iIvH014 §2 6102 ‘vL O3A 6102/L/1L 610¢rlelOL N3IANH ‘WVHd €1Lec0 6102/ZL/L1L 6280G
00005’ 00005 J1HVd AVAITOH 6102 ‘v1 03A 6102/0¢/0L B4 6102 ‘vI 920 SIHHOL ISSAC 'ZIaNoIHaoy ZLee0 610¢/2L/LL 82806
00'666 00666 - SINIVIO 6102/9/LL 62€-6102-NV1d Ydl Nv'1d £L1€0 61L0T/CL/LL 12806G
00°6.1L 00°GLL S334 ONISSID0Hd X374 6102/L€/0L L0/SG11 JOVLINVAQY X314 ¥€0c0 61L0Z/CL/LL 92806
8.°8¢Cl 8/.°8¢Cl dNIFY 139YVL 6102 ‘ST 100 610Z/L/LL ‘v AON 8 GZ 100 H139vZi13 'Vidvl 60620 610Z/CL/LL 92806
00°0S 000G aNN43Y LISOd3a 6L v0'LL  6L0g/Y/LL €00'¥eL1002 J3INYA 'SYLYINH 9v820 610Z/CL/LL ¥280G
jejol ¥oayo pled junowy uonduasaqg ajeq Auj 9D10AU]| lopusap  aje(q #99Y9H
(penupuon) MNVE SALLNNOD 41 1sily Hjueg
BWioH Jo umol INdEP-€SCL 6L02/2LILL
Z :obe - 1S joar~jeulq

Isplyode



¢ abed

LL'ZE8'LLL $S$MI8YD |1V [ejoL puel “Hodaa s1y3 us syo9Yyd pg

| BW]OD JO UMO] INdEV-€SCL 6L0C/2LILL
¢ :obe." ISI Y99 " [euly , Ispyode



| obed

0goce 0€°0ce TN 8 TVAIN 6102 'G2-02 1LOO 61L0Z/2L/LL 6102 'G2-0Z 190 INVS ‘oYIUHIND 81120 6102/6L/LL V58086
00°000'G1L 00°000°GlL LONAOdd OAAIA AL3TdINOCD 6L0T/EL/LL 86¢l VIA3N NOLSONIM ¥.9¢0 610¢/6L/L1 €580S
G189 G.'8/9'1 1 NOISSIN VINT0D 6102 1Ld3S 610¢/5L/0L /2801900 OIN ¢6€¢0 6102/6L/11 €S80S
05°099 0¢09¢ S1ININT JONVHNSNI 61L0T/5L/0L 61027 1deg

0g°06¢ SIN3IAT AONVHNSNI 6102/4/11 610¢ 1240100 VO 40 TYNOILVYNYILNI gnH 6,120 6102/6L/LL 156805
£6°€99°01L €6°€99'01 S3OINYES TVIHOLINYT 6L02/0L/LL 6102 JOqQWSAONINYNILINIVIN LOVHINOD Avd G9G1L0 610¢/6L/L1 0G805
00°0S 00°0s ANN43d LIsOdAa 6L'cl'LL 61L02/cL/LL £00°9¢.1002 vavadvd ‘YNIY31vd LS¥10 6L0¢/6L/1L 6¥780G
§.¢/8 GLel8 ADld 0 NOISSIHN 6L0¢ LdIS  6102/6/01 190891 "ONI ‘STLVIOOSSY VS 0evL0 61L0¢/6L/L1 8780G
00°0ce 00°0ce LYIOOSSY SHIANMO ONVHIA 6L02/8L/LL CLSSY SHANMOINOH ONVHIA vL¥L0 6102/6L/L1 Y806
G6°LL G6°L1L HSVM UvO dd 610¢/L/L1 610¢ 429010010N0L 140S 023 IIVILSIM 66€L0 610¢/6L/LL 9¥809
06/vE'Le 0,26 SNOILVOINNWINCDOATEL 61L02/CL/LL 60££98

0c9lc 4S8 WVIOIdS AINYUOLLY ALID 6L02/2L/LL 10€€98

06°€CL'L XVL/S1I4AN3d IFAOTHINT 6L02/2L/LL 80€€£98

00°GLE'6L SADINGAS AINHOLLV ALID 6L02Z/CL/LL 90€€98 dT11 UIDIIEM ® 1839 1839 €8LL0 6L0T/BL/LL S80S
852/6'8 8G7/6'8 'H NMOL ‘SH31LNdINOD M3AN 6102/02/01 G6/.1061 "ONI ‘¥044d31s 0£0L0 6L0¢/6L/LL ¥¥80S
c9'/G1 C9'LS1 WILLTN SANVYH MOV (IX2) ¥ 6L0Z/2L/LL 168 AdIAIOYgING SIHYEINOOD ¥6.00 61L0¢/6L/LL £780G
00°00S'9 00°00L'C - AYUVIO 067 ONINNYd IIHL  6L0Z/L/LL GoL6YLlvLe

0000Vt JNVHYAS 66 ONINNYd I3H L 61L02/€2/8 OvvriV6ClevdINOD LH3dX3 3341 AIAVA 6¥900 6102/6L/LL ¢¥80S
¢6'9¢e 0¢'59 ad S3INddNs div LSHid 61L0¢2/1.€/0L 828560098

0C's9 IITH3LS SANddNS aiv LSHId 61L02/LE/01 6285960098

0259 A dd0O0 S3ANddNS aiv 1SYId 6102/1€/01 0£8560098

ceoel 1 NMOL S31TddNsS aiv 1S¥Id 6L0¢/1L€/01 2128560098 HHVNVHY €2900 610¢/6L/L1 L1805
¢L° 199 ¢L /99 SEANIT 8 TINNVYHD OHOJIN 6102/ZL/LL OL6LLTOALFDINGES NOILYIWHOANI DINS #€G00 6102/61/1L O¥80S
0z98v'L 0C98Y'L 1d ONDIIVYd 40 NOILVOOTIVY  6102/9/L1L 6102 1240100 ADIH40 SHIATIOHINOD JINS 00G00 610Z/61/L1 6£80S
00'8ze’L 00'82¢’L oueusiUlelN @ JWDN senioed 6L0Z/0L/LL L9297 ONT SNOILVOINNNINODIT1EL ¢l00 61L0¢/6L/LL 8€80G
00'6.¢ 00'G.¢c 1D OAVOYH3N 6102 ‘TL-6 D3A 610Z/8L/LL 1 6L0T ‘CL-6 92Q 301440 S dd4I-d3HS DINS G¥c00 61L0c¢/6L/LL 2€80S
11252 11°T52'S I89d 6L02/L/1L1 6102/L0/1LL O[d103713 % SVD O1410vd £0€00 61L0¢/6L/71L 9€80G
.£°60) l€6 S3ArddNS 301440 61L0¢/L/LL L00GZ08EZ.L6E

90001 S3ANAdNS AD1440 61L02/€L/LL L009.¥SL0.L6€ "ONI "10d3d 321440 08200 610¢/6L/LL GE80S
00°697°L 00°697'L -TNSNOD SNOLLY13Y H049v1 610¢/L/LL 69/¢¢ vadl 18100 610¢/6L/1L1L €805
00'6Y 00'edy LEBSYL#E INNODJDV HMH 61L02/5/LL 8GEGLYy  IDILSNI 40 ININLYVL3a C¢LL00 6L02/6L/LL €£€805
8/°89¥% 8.°89v -1V S1VIN JAISNI % 3AISLNO 61L02/8L/LL 6L0C0  T# NOILYHOdHOD SYLINID 15000 610¢/6L/1L 2€80S
006y 006 [eD G 1olep bulds  6102/L/LL ovrOLL6LL

00 0¥ IVANIA 6102/L/LL LY¥0LL6LL ONI SFOINGDS 3 1VIO0SSY 02000 61L0c/6L/LL LE€80S
[e3ol yoey) pied Junowy uondidsag ajeq Auj 92I0AU| IOpuap -~ a3eq  #yoeyo

MNVE SALLNNOD WL 1sil :iueg
BUW[OD JO UMO] INVLL0G:6 6L0C/6LILE
| :obey 117 %08y |eul

IsPiyode



Z :abed

GG'908'G6 MNVE SALLNNOD WL 10} [ej0o) qng
00°00¢C 00'00¢ aNN43d LiIsOdaa 6ty LL 6L0g/vL/LL £00°0v.1002 IAEVYA 1HSYDIH 9L€C0 610¢/6L/LL 980G
00°06¢ 00°0s¢ 7 NOILVOOHENS 40 d3AIVM  6102/L/LL vee-6l "ONI HILVYAMDIO0HY GlLee0 6102Z/61/LL £9806G
£6'86£°Cl €6°86c'cl 1OVHINOD JONVNILNIVIN  6L0C/L/LL L8ECLLDHVNVYIN IdVOSANVYT VYNIHOVD 182¢0 610¢/6L/L1 29809
18°6G/L 186G/ S10NA0dd ¥3advd 610¢//11 8€¢yo0Lcs Odd 10d3a 3NWOH JHL €42¢20 610¢/61/LL 1980G
¢5'L01 ¢5°L01 IVHRATVH ‘AYIVA "HINWVYIHD 6102/8/LL 0-¥6v0LLCll ® SAITddNS SSANISNG VYV 8020 6102/6L/LL 0980G
8E' Ly 8C'Lvy SASYHIOHNd SVD Md 6102/L€/01 L18960¢C NNIT0Y1L3d Avd HIHON LO0E0 61L02/6L/LL 65806
00°0G 0005 aNNd=™ LiIsOdda sl'el’LL 6L0g/EL/LL £00°2£.100¢ H3AIAVE ‘NVNY G00€0 610¢/6L/LL 8G80G
00°Zee'e 00cee'e s OLVINTIOO ¢-L snd 6L/ivL/icl 6L02/LLI6 AMPLL9L SYNOL HOVOD d31INN 8¥8¢0 61L0¢/6L/L1L LS80S
L¥'eg Ly'eG HIAMIA/dNADId IDOVHOLS 61L0Z/LE/01L 9/¢2ZLESH ONI 'ONIAAIYHS VIVAOH0D 1¢8¢0 610¢/6L/LL 9580G
00°08L 00°06 ANI LOOHS 319N0OY L ¥ LINN 61L02/0¢/01 £8.9¢1S .

0006 INI LOOHS 318N04YL € LINN 6L02/0€/0L 6./9¢€1S HH31v4d "ONI TANNOLS G9/70 61L0¢/6L/LL GGBOS
1eiol yoeyH pred junouuy uonauosaq ejeq AU| 9210AU]| IOpUsp ~ 9jeq  #Mo9yo

(penuguo)) MNVE S3ALLNNOD 141 1si1} :yueg |
BW]OJ JO UMOo] INVLL:05:6 6102/6L/LL
Z :obe: IS o9 N jeuly

IsPyode



¢ :abed

GG'008'G6 SYI3YD 1V [ejo] puelD) ’ . “Hodal siy3 ul sHoaYo g

| BWI[OD JO UMO] INVLLI0G:6  6L0Z/6LILL
¢ :obe | ISIT Y091~ [eury 1Isjyode



| :obey

G2 08.'vy NVE SIILNNOD AL 104 [ejo) gng
ST 08. vy G2 08.L vy IV INIFWISHNGNIFE H1Tv3H 6102/02/11 610cC 92Q AOVINVAAY X314 €020 6102/61/11 G980S
[ejoL yoeyo piEg Junowy uondudsaqg ~ ayeq Au| SOI0AU] Iopusp - ajed  #yoeyo

MNVE STALLINNOD Y.L ISy :ueg

BW[OD JO UMO] INvev-6v:LL 61L02/02/LL
| :abed IsIT %9y jeuty IsPplyode



Z obey

GC08.L'vy :S¥2I9Y |iy [ejo) pueln "Hodau siy3 ug syoayo |

mE_ooonso._. Wvev:6v:LL 6L02/0Z/LL
Z :obe- IsI7 99 v euly . «w._v_:on



| :obed

90CsTeLl MNVE S3LLNNOD 1YL 10§ |[ejo} gng

L2009 L2009 /d -S¥301440 30VId YINTOD 6102/22/LL 310 96102221 S:¥3DI440 IDVad VINTOD 89000 610¢/¢2/LL LL0V6
142514°37 YL 9v6'y . INAVd ‘NOLLNEIILINOD VINDI 6102/22/LL DI 9 61022211 LNIDV HI4ISNYHL IOVINVA 09¢€10 6L0¢/Cc/LL 8.0v6
LY'6E6'Sy LP'6E6°ey ININAYL HOVEANG - SH3d 6102/22/LL 43d 9 61022211 sHdd L€900 610¢/CT/LL GL0V6
66°/2. ') 66°LCL VY LNIFNAVd XVL TVHIAI 61L02/CT/LL 1P} 96102221 AYNSYIYL SILVIS A3ILINN L 2S00 6L0¢C/CC/LL v.0¥6
609/€LL 60°9/€°LL AVd XV1 A1VIS VINHOLITYD 61L02/2Z/LL 18D g 61022211 NIWJOT1IAIA ININAOTAINT 0€L00 6L0Z/2e/LL £10Vv6
8¢'1/8 8¢°L/8 WAV " LNJWHSINYVYO IOVM 610Z/22/LL  Bm g 6L02ZZLLISHNESIA T1VLS VINYOHITYD 12220 6102/2¢/LL 080G
05°290°L 06°290'1L ININAVC ‘FONVHNSNI 3417 61L02/2Z/LL @41 9 610222LLINOD IONVHNSNI AYVYANYLS ¥Zcc0 6102/22/11 69805
00058V 00058y LNZINAVA :FAIMNOILYN 6102/22/LL 242p 9 610Z22L1'S ININIHILIY JAIMNOILLYN G/e10 6102/C2/LL 89805
¥8°809 ¥8°809 ANINAVA ‘NV1d GZL X314 6102/22/LL - Bs} 9 61L0222LL SNOLLNTOS 1I43aINTIE VIAYN 0vEL0 610¢/22/L1 19806
058°69¢ 05'69¢ ININAVC V3O 6102/22/LL B2d g 61L0222LL VITo Ly000 610¢/cZ/LL 99806
€301 yoayn pied junowy uonduoasag  ajeq Au| 9910AU| ‘ Iopusp -~ 9jeg  #yo9y)

MNVE S3LLNNOD YL Isiy :Hueg

BUWOY JO UMO] INdSe:ZLZL 610Z/LZ/LL
| :aBeyg IsIT ¥99yo[eutd IsTHyode



¢ ‘ebed

90'CsCeLL $Y09YQ IV [ejol pueln

*Hodal s1y3 ui sy2eyd gL

BUW|OD JO UMO] INdSZ:TLZL 6L0Zile/iL
2 :obe, ISI)9e euld 1ISTiyode



| :abegd

00¥28'L 0028, VISHIOM N4 LISOd3A %05 6102/Ch/LL 30d8Q %0G 0e¥) D711 SNOILNTOSL1O3Aroddl Z1€€0 6L0¢/9¢/LL 00609
00°0G¢ 00°05¢ IS3¥Ud ¥NOH 2 610Z ‘61 AON 6L0Z/6L/LL 6102C ‘61 AON VdaNv1 ‘NYIWAYM 282¢€0 6102/9¢/LL 66805
£eGly €eGLy J H3TIOYLNOD NOLLYDIYYI 61L02/1L€/01 9¢9CLLDYNVIN dVOSANYTVYNIHOVD 182€0 6102/9¢/L1 8680S
. ¥rvse'se vy 66°Ge AHL ASTIVH d1H14 aH 0202 61.02/12/LL LL00LONVYQ-ATTHVH OOSIONVYYHd NVS 86¢2€0 6L0¢/9¢/LL L680G
00°6eL'S 00°GEL'S SADIAYES ONILNNODDV 6102/1LE/0L 19/¢€¢€ SALVIOOSSY ® AZVIN L61€0 6L02/9T/L1 96805
00°0GL°L 00°05L°L VOOA 6102/02/LL ‘ZL AON-0I 3dos VNOI4 ‘NNATd 7810 6L0¢/9¢/LL G680G
00°00¢ 00°00¢ aNN43d 11sOd3da 64°8L°LL 61L02/8L/LL €00'v¥.100¢C INIY 'VAvHvd L0LE0 6102/92/11 #6808
000L¢ 000L¢ 331 HOLVAZTT HLIM LSISSY 6102/LL/1L Shyes "ONI 'SIW3LSAS 003V 18120 610¢/9¢/LL €6806
10'260°L 10'260°L WWC YILSIML OHAAH ‘VCINY 6L0T/SL/LL LP0LE FHSYM FHNSSTHd VO HON 6€9¢0 610¢/9¢/L1 26805
Gy 188'L 8G6°CLG LNIY INIHOVIN AdOD NINQY 6102/7L/LL 2¢£0g96201
18'89¢'L ENZY INIHOVIN AJOD NINQY 6102/7L/LL G/2¢96201 NOILVIWHOAN] TVLIdVYD 39 66¥¢0 6102/9¢/LL 16805
00'vre'e 00vve's SNOSS3T JISNIN 610Z/6L/L1L 2 ‘0¢ Bny-1 sunp TOOHOS JISNIN OdINA 98€20 610¢/92/L1 06805
00°0¢e 00°0¢e JONVHNASNI 3417 6L02/7L/LL 6102 92QINOD FONVHNSNI AHVYANVYLS yccco 6102/9¢/11 68806
VA AVASS) L7 l€9 HITTOHLINOD-VLS v 6L0C/EL/LL 29€7698.0NA0Xd NOILYODIHMYI ONIMI €8120 610¢/eT/LL 8880S
00°0s 00°05 'HIFNGIN SINA IAILOY 0202 6102/0L/01L UsIsquBiy 0Z02)SSY LNIWIDHOANT MY1VD 8¢120 6102/9¢/LL /880G
00091 00091 60€16100€# 02/0¢/LL-61/10/2) 6102/6Z/0L 00€5¥1L0 440 IONVNIL LNIWNYUIAOD 6¢810 6102/9¢/LL 9880G
o0o'cec oo'ce JDINGIS dVHL 610¢/82/6 GG1G/901 “"ONI SLNIIQILYONI ONITHVA 69610 610¢/9T/L1 S880G
00°09¢ 00°09¢ HSVM SSY19 JAISTH 0251 6102/vL/LL CBCEOINYNILNIVIN LOVHINOD Avd GOSL0 6102/9¢2/LL ¥880G
£€8°G29'L €8'629'L ADINYES INOHJ 1130 6102/GL/LL 106902CY86IDINYAS SSATIHIM NOZIYIA 0.€10 6L02/9¢/LL £880%
00'6l¢e 00'6.¢ aNN43Y L1ISOdAA 6L°8L°LL 6L02/8L/LL €00'Ck.1002C VLIV ‘VOIA 8ECL0 6L02/9Z/LL 28805
cleol 0L'vS 1041 AH 6928810 ¢20 0T G518 6102/CL/LL LISLIZL-6L/LLILL
[A710]" LS 4109 G1/9600 220 0C G518 6102/L/LL LO9 OL/ZL-LL/LL A19vO LSYONOD 2€010 6102/9¢/LL 18806
0c'66 0c'66 Ydd JONVLSISSY IIAOTdINT 6102/9L/L1 99¢9r0-NHdIHOMLAN HLTVIH AIOVYNYIN 9c0L0 6L0¢/9¢/LL 08805
000G 00°0G aNN43Y LISOd3A 6L'8L°LL 6102/8L/LL €00°ILv.L1002Z VAVH Z3d01 99800 610¢/9¢/L)L 6/806
6€901L°}L 6€90L°L NYid JOINLES NOISIA 6102/6L/LL 668056.08 NV1d FDIAYES NOISIA ¢ey00 61L02/9¢/LL 81806
9/°9¢v'e 9/.°9¢v'e NINVO 13 8611 ¢-L9€0528L6L 6L0Z/SL/LL  T-/980G28L6L  DIYLD313 % SVYO DI4I0vd £0€00 6102/92/1L £/80G
09'tv00°L 09'+00°L ADVIG/M LSIA VE-ZOXS-VES 61L02/6L/LL 91Z¥0¥1 ‘A1ddNS I0IT0d NOILIV O 02200 6102/92/L1 91805
00viL'El 00viL'elL JONVHNSNITVINIA 6102/L/2L  927299S003aNHOL1TVD 40 TVINIA V113d L1100 610¢2/9¢/LL 280G
zeoseeel zeoszeel OS8D 6102/SL/LL 1/ST/0L-61/82/60 "ONI 'SLNVLINSNOD 982 12000 610¢2/9¢/LL ¥/80G
8 v6e’l 8 v6e’L A¥Vd ONITHILS 6102 100 6L0Z/LE/0L  6L0Z 4990100  Z# NOILYHOLHOD SYLINID £G000 6102/9¢/LL €805
L1681 L1681 Y44 SSOYOV 8Sr ¢0.250.2.1  6102/8/LL ¢0/2S0L2/.LIDINYIS HIALVYM VINHOLITYD LG000 610¢2/92/1L1L ¢/80S
0 Ly9°L WAL RE L0-SL-01-Cl-9/v-€D 6L0C/CL/LL  Z8/006€L0000 181V #0000 6L0¢/92/1L 12806
{ejol yo9ynH pled Junouwy uondiLidosag  ojeq Auj 9J10AU] Jopusp - 9jeq  #yo9ys
MNVE STILNNOD YL Is1y : jueg
BUWI[OD JO UMOL Nver:-LL:0L 610Z/S¢Z/LL
| :abed IS Y29y euld

IsTiyode



- g abed

167250912 - “MNVd S3ILNNOD YL 104 [ejo) qng

BW]OD JO UMO] iNvev-LL:0L 6102/5Z/LL
Z :obe-r . 117 3991 [eul g - IsPiyode



¢ :obed

1625091 Y03y jIv [ejol pueio

‘wodail siy3 ul o0y g¢

‘ ewjopjoumol NV6Y:LL:0L 6102/SZ/LL
¢ :obp- IsIT Y0911 Jeury 1IsPiyode



Item #4

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Brad Donahue, Director of Public Works
Chai Lor, Building Official
Christopher J. Diaz, City Attorney

VIA: Brian Dossey, City Manager
MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019
SUBJECT: Colma Building Codes

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council take the following actions:

(1) Introduce the following ordinance by title only with direction to staff to include all
noticed publication dates and January 8, 2020 as the public hearing date in Article I,
Sections (j) and (k):

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 5, SUBCHAPTER 4 OF THE TOWN OF COLMA
MUNICIPAL CODE, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24),
CONSISTING OF THE 2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, THE 2019
CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE AND THE 2019 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED
STANDARDS CODE; THE 1997 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM HOUSING CODE; AND THE 2018
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN ADDITIONS,
AMENDMENTS, AND DELETIONS;

(2) Waive a further reading of the ordinance; and
3) Schedule a public hearing for January 8, 2020.
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The State mandates that the building and construction codes are updated every three years
in all cities and counties throughout the state. The State published the 2019 California

Staff Report - 2019 Colma Building Code Page 1 of 4



Building Standards Code on July 1, 2019, which will become effective statewide on January
1, 2020.

The proposed ordinance would adopt the following model codes as the Colma Building
Codes:

2019 California Building Code

2019 California Electrical Code

2019 California Mechanical Code

2019 California Plumbing Code

2019 California Energy Code

2019 California Residential Code

2019 California Green Building Standards Code
2019 California Fire Code

2019 California Referenced Standards Code
2019 California Existing Building Code

2019 California Historical Building Code

= 1997 Uniform Housing Code, and

= 2018 International Property Maintenance Code

The new codes will make buildings safer, more energy efficient and more sustainable.
FISCAL IMPACT

Adoption of this ordinance has no fiscal impact on the Town’s finances.
BACKGROUND

The California Health and Safety Code requires local governments to adopt the most recent
editions of the model codes related to construction. Alternatively, if a local government chooses
not to adopt the most recent model code, the codes adopted by the California Building
Standards Commission become applicable to the local jurisdiction. The Town last adopted the
model codes in 2013. Meanwhile, the Town’s Building Official has been applying the model
codes to all construction activities requiring any type of building permit.

The California Building Standards Commission adopts and amends the model codes every
three years and then publishes them as the California Building Standards Code (Title 24
California Code of Regulations). The 2019 Edition of the California Code of Regulations, Title
24, should now be adopted by the Town:

2019 California Building Code

2019 California Electrical Code

2019 California Mechanical Code

2019 California Plumbing Code

2019 California Energy Code

2019 California Residential Code

2019 California Green Building Standards Code
2019 California Fire Code

2019 California Referenced Standards Code
2019 California Existing Building Code

2019 California Historical Building Code

Staff Report - 2019 Colma Building Code Page 2 of 4



In addition to the California Building Standards Code, cities and towns can adopt other model
codes not included within the California Building Standards Code to assist in its implementation.
For example, staff recommends that the Town adopt the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Housing
Code and the 2018 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code.

The Town may adopt amendments to the state-approved codes. However, any changes to the
State amended code must be more restrictive than the state codes, filed with and approved by
the California Building Standards Commission, and must be necessary because of local
climatic, geographic or topographical conditions.

ANALYSIS

The new 2019 state codes will make buildings and structures safer, more efficient and
sustainable. The proposed ordinance will adopt the State-amended codes with amendments
based on local conditions.

Staff have also been working on reach codes that will amend parts of the 2019 California
Building Standards Code along with Peninsula Clean Energy. The Town held a presentation
and study session, and the City Council directed staff to explore the reach codes further.
Staff will be coming back with a proposed reach code ordinance in early 2020.

Amendment to California Fire Code

The Town is adopting the 2019 California Fire Code with the same amendments adopted by
the Colma Fire Protection District. The amendments include requirements that all premises
must have identification numbers that meet specified size requirements and all new
buildings that meet certain specified criteria must be equipped with automatic sprinkler
systems.

SPECIAL PROCEDURE

Government Code Section 50022.3 established the following procedure for adopting another
code by reference, which is different from the usual procedure in adopting ordinances. At
the first meeting to consider the ordinance, the Council should introduce the ordinance,
waive a further reading, and order a public hearing to be conducted. Notice of the public
hearing must be published twice in a local newspaper at least 14 days before the public
hearing. The Ordinance may be adopted at the conclusion of the public hearing. Staff
suggests that the public hearing and adoption be scheduled for the January 8, 2020 regular
meeting.

Values

Acting to protect the health and safety of building occupants is the best indicator of a
responsible action by the Council. Adopting the 2019 state codes as the Colma Building
Codes, with the proposed local amendments, will make buildings safer, more efficient and
will help to preserve the Town'’s resources.

Staff Report - 2019 Colma Building Code Page 3 of 4



Sustainability Impact

Adoption of the new codes, which include the 2019 California Energy Code and the 2019
California Green Building Standards Code, is consistent with the Town’s sustainability goals.

Alternatives

An alternative would be to not adopt the ordinance. In that case, the codes adopted by the
California Building Standards Commission would become applicable to all construction in the
Town without local amendments.

CONCLUSION

The Council should introduce and read the title of the ordinance, waive a further reading of
the ordinance, and order a public hearing on the ordinance for January 8, 2019.

ATTACHMENTS:

A. Ordinance

Staff Report - 2019 Colma Building Code Page 4 of 4



Attachment A

ORDINANCE NO.
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 5, SUBCHAPTER 4 OF THE TOWN OF COLMA
MUNICIPAL CODE, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2019 EDITION OF THE
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS,
TITLE 24), CONSISTING OF THE 2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, THE 2019
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE
2019 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE,
THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, THE 2019
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, THE 2019 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
AND THE 2019 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE; THE 1997 EDITION
OF THE UNIFORM HOUSING CODE; AND THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN ADDITIONS, AMENDMENTS, AND
DELETIONS

The City Council of the Town of Colma does ordain as follows:

ARTICLE 1. FINDINGS, PURPOSE AND AUTHORITY
The City Council of the Town of Colma finds:

(a) Pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq., the Town may adopt by
reference the California Building Standards Code, 2019 Edition as provided in Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, and other codes, including, without limitation, the 1997 Uniform
Housing Code and the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code.

(b) The California Building Standards Commission ("Commission™) recently adopted the
2019 Edition of the California Building Standards Code.

© California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 authorize cities to
adopt the California Building Standards Code with modifications determined to be reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions.

(d) Title 25, section 52 of the California Code of Regulations empowers the Town to use its
own abatement procedures so long as these procedures are equivalent to the procedures
contained in Title 25 sections 48 through 70 of the California Code of Regulations, and provided
such procedures provide an efficient and effective procedure for the abatement of substandard
conditions with fairness to both owners and residents.

(e) The 1997 Uniform Housing Code and the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code
provide efficient and effective procedures for the abatement of substandard buildings,
structures and nuisances that are fair and equitable to both owners and residents and are
equivalent to the procedures contained in Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations to serve
the purpose intended therein.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 1 of 22



® The City Council desires to adopt the 2019 edition of the California Building Standards
Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, consisting of the 2019 California Building
Code (incorporating and amending the 2018 International Building Code), the 2019 California
Residential Code (incorporating and amending the 2018 International Residential Code), the
2019 California Electrical Code (incorporating and amending the 2017 National Electrical Code),
the 2019 California Mechanical Code (incorporating and amending the 2018 Uniform Mechanical
Code), the 2019 California Plumbing Code (incorporating and amending the 2018 Uniform
Plumbing Code), the 2019 California Fire Code (incorporating and amending the 2018
International Fire Code), the 2019 California Energy Code, the 2019 California Green Building
Standards Code, the 2019 California Historical Building Code, the 2019 California Existing
Building Code, and the 2019 California Referenced Standards Code; the 1997 Edition of the
Uniform Housing Code; and the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code for safety,
health and welfare relating to property maintenance within the Town of Colma, (collectively, the
“Codes”); together with the necessary amendments to assure the Codes are tailored to the
particular safety needs of the Town as required by its unique climatic, geological and
topographical conditions.

(9) The following local climatic, geographic or topographical conditions make it necessary to
amend the Codes:

(D Topography. A large portion of the Town'’s residential community is built on hills,
with roadways less than the required width which tend to slow response times for fire
apparatus, and this same terrain complicates firefighter access to those buildings. Numerous
areas are heavily treed with thick vegetative undergrowth, creating increased fuel loading
during the summer months.

2) Geography. Colma is located in Seismic Zone D and within two (2) miles of the
San Andreas fault. There are two large underground tunnels that run the full length of the
Town for the Bay Area Rapid Transit System (BART) as well as two underground sixty (60) inch
diameter forced water mains that run parallel to the Bart tunnels. These two features are
separated by a regional state thoroughfare, EI Camino Real. Failure of either underground
system will disrupt traffic flow through the town and further hamper First Responder efforts.

3) Climate. Colma is subject to frequent periods of heavy fog, limiting visibility.
This same fog contains salt which has a deleterious effect on metals including exterior electrical
service cabinets and conduits.

(€)) Amendments.

The below table provides the express findings and determinations (where necessary
pursuant to California Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.7 and/or 18941.5)
justifying the Town of Colma’s amendments to the 2019 California Building Standards Code as
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geologic or topographic conditions.

Section Caption Finding
California Building | Emergency Power for Illumination Topography
Code Section 1008.3 and Geography

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 2 of 22



California Residential
Code Section R313

Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems

Topography
and Geography

California Fire Code | Address ldentification Topography
Section 505.1 and Climate
California Fire Code | Fire Hydrant Standards Topography
Section 507.5.7

California Fire Code | Identification of Hydrants Topography
Section 507.5.8 and Climate
California Fire Code | Where Required Topography

Section 903.2

and Geography

California Fire Code
Section 903.2.11.7

Fire Walls

Topography
and Geography

California Fire Code
Section 903.3.1.3.1

Installation Requirements

Administrative

California Fire Code
Section 903.4.2

Alarms

Topography
and Geography

California Fire Code
Section 903.4.3

Floor Control Valves

Topography
and Geography

California Fire Code
Section 907

Fire Alarm and Detection Systems

Topography
and Geography

California Fire Code
1008.3

Emergency Power for lllumination

Topography
and Geography

The changes and modifications made to the Codes not listed in the table are necessary

for administrative clarification and to establish administrative standards for the effective
enforcement of the building standards of the Town of Colma and do not modify a building
standard pursuant to California Health & Safety Code Section 17958, 17958.7, and/or 18941.5.

) The Town published notice of a public hearing pursuant to California Government Code
Section 6066 on , and

k) The Town held a public hearing on , at which time all interested
persons had the opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of adopting the Codes as
amended herein.

0] At least one copy of each of the Codes adopted by reference by this ordinance were
available for public inspection at the office of the City Clerk fifteen (15) days preceding the
public hearing pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.6.

(m) Any and all other legal prerequisites relating to the adoption of this ordinance have
occurred.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 3 of 22



ARTICLE 2. SUBCHAPTER 5.04 AMENDED

Sections 5.04.010 to 5.04.250 of subchapter 5.04 of the Colma Municipal Code are hereby
repealed and restated in its entirety to read as provided herein. Sections 5.04.260 to 5.04.350
remain unchanged.

ARTICLE 3. SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 1 - GENERAL

The following sections are added to subchapter 5.04, Building and Construction Regulations, of
the Colma Municipal Code as “Division 1 — General.”

Subchapter 5.04 - Building and Construction Regulations
Division 1: General
5.04.010 Application.

(a) The provisions of this subchapter shall hereafter apply to the construction, alteration,
moving, repair and use or maintenance of any building or structure, site, and the equipment
therein, within the Town of Colma, and shall be known as the “Colma Building Codes”.

(b) The Colma Building Codes shall be the primary source of regulations for the
construction, addition to, alteration, repairs, relocations, or reconstruction of any building or any
portion thereof including any electrical, mechanical, gas, plumbing, or fire protection equipment
installed on any property or used on or within any building, and for the maintenance of existing
buildings. It shall be unlawful for any person to perform any of the above in conflict with the
provisions of this subchapter and the codes referred to in herein.

5.04.020 Conflicts with Other Laws, Rules, etc.

In the event of any conflict between the Colma Building Codes and any law, rule or regulation
of the State of California, that requirement which establishes the higher standard of safety shall
govern.

5.04.030 Titles.

The term, “Colma Building Codes,” means the collection of laws and regulations described in
this subchapter, while the term, “Colma Building Code,” refers to the particular code adopted by
section 5.04.050 of this subchapter.

5.04.040 [Reserved].

ARTICLE 4. SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 2 — COLMA BUILDING CODES

The following sections are added to subchapter 5.04 of the Colma Municipal Code as “Division 2
— Colma Building Codes.”

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 4 of 22



Division 2: Colma Building Codes
5.04.050 Colma Building Code Adopted

The 2019 Edition of the California Building Code, contained in Part 2 of Title 24 of the California
Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2018 Edition of the International
Building Code published by the International Code Council, together with Chapter 1, and with
the changes, additions, and deletions set forth in the following section, is hereby adopted by
reference as the Colma Building Code.

5.04.060 Administration of Colma Building Code
The following provisions of the California Building Code are hereby amended as follows:
(@) Section 1.11.2.1 Amended.

Item 1 of Section 1.11.2.1 of Chapter 1, Division | is amended to read: The Town of Colma
specifically delegates the enforcement of building standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal,
and published in the Building Standards Code relating to fire and panic safety and other
regulations of the State Fire Marshal, as they relate to Group R-3 Occupancies (one and two
family dwellings) to the Building Official of Town of Colma.

(b) Section 101.1 Amended.

Section 101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il is amended to state as follows: “These regulations shall
be known as the Colma Building Code, hereinafter referred as ‘this code’.”

© Section 103 Amended.

The term “Department of Building Safety” in Section 103 of Chapter 1 Division Il of the
California Building Code, as well as all other codes adopted in this subchapter where the term
appears, refers to the Building Department of the Town of Colma.

(d) Section 103.2 Amended.

Section 103.2 is amended to state as follows: “The Building Official shall be appointed by the
City Manager.”

(e) Section 105.5 Amended.
Section 105.5, “Expiration,” is amended to state as follows:
105.5 Expiration.

(a) Every permit issued by the Building Official, or his or her designee, under the
provisions of his Code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if:

1) the building or work authorized by such permitis not
commenced within twelve (12) months from the date of such
permit;

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 5 of 22



®

©))

(h)

2 the building or work authorized by such permit is
suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is
commenced for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days

(b) For permits where work has not commenced, a renewed permit
may be obtained provided that: (1) no changes have been made or will
be required in the original plans and specifications for such work; (2) the
expiration has not exceeded two (2) years from the original issuance
date; (3) the project would not be impacted by a change in the current
adopted codes, and; (4) the applicant pays a reactivation fee equal to
one half the amount of the original permit fee.

© For permits where work had commenced and was subsequently
suspended or abandoned, a renewed permit may be obtained provided
that: (1) No changes have been made or will be required in the original
plans and specifications for such work; (2) the expiration has not
exceeded two (2) years from the original issuance date; and (3) a fee
equal to one half the amount required for a new permit is paid, except
that where construction has progressed and has been approved to the
point whereby only a final inspection is required, a fee equal to one
quarter the amount required for a new permit shall be paid.

Section 109.2 Amended.
Section 109.2, “Schedule of Permit Fees,” is amended to state as follows:

For any work on buildings or structures which requires a permit and/or
plan review, fees shall be paid in accordance with Resolutions and
Ordinances that are established by action of the City Council of the Town
of Colma.

Section 109.4 Amended.

Section 109.4, “Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance,” is amended by adding

thereto the following paragraph:

That fee, for commencing work prior to permit issuance, may be equal to
up to ten times the permit fee to a maximum amount of $ 5,000.00 as
determined by the Building Official. This fee is in addition to the permit
costs and any additional investigative fees.

Section 110.1 Amended.
Section 110.1, “General,” is amended by adding the following to the end:

When required, Survey Stakes shall be provided prior to first inspection,
and maintained so they are clearly visible until after the Certificate of
Occupancy has been issued.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted )

Page 6 of 22



0] Section 1008.3.3 Amended.

Section 1008.3.3, “Rooms and Spaces,” is amended by adding thereto the following:

6. All bathrooms, and paths of egress from those bathrooms to an
exit discharge.

()] Appendix B Adopted.
Appendix B, “Board of Appeals,” is adopted as part of the Colma Building Code.

k) Appendix C Adopted.

Appendix C, “Group U Agricultural Buildings,” is adopted as part of the Colma Building Code.
0] Appendix H Adopted.

Appendix H, “Signs,” is adopted as part of the Colma Building Code.

(m)  Appendix I Adopted.

Appendix I, “Patio Covers,” is adopted as part of the Colma Building Code.

5.04.070 Colma Residential Code Adopted

The 2019 Edition of the California Residential Code, contained in Part 2.5 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2018 Edition of the
International Residential Code published by the International Code Council, together with
Chapter 1, with the following changes, additions, and deletions set forth in the following
section, is adopted by reference as the Colma Residential Code.

5.04.080 Administration of Colma Residential Code
The following provisions of the California Residential Code are hereby amended as follows:
(a) Section R103 Amended.

The term “Department of Building Safety” in Section R103 of the California Residential Code, as
well as all other codes adopted in this subchapter where the term appears, refers to the
Building Department of the Town of Colma.

(b) Section R103.2 Amended.

Section R103.2 is amended to state as follows: “The Building Official shall be appointed by the
City Manager.”

(© Section R105.5 Amended.

Section R105.5, “Expiration,” is amended to state as follows:

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 7 of 22



105.5 Expiration.

(a) Every permit issued by the Building Official, or his or her designee, under the
provisions of this Code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if:

(9] the building or work authorized by such permit is not commenced within
twelve (12) months from the issuance date of such permit;

2 the building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or
abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period of one hundred eighty (180)
days

(b) For permits where work has not commenced, a renewed permit may be obtained
provided that: (1) no changes have been made or will be required in the original plans and
specifications for such work; (2) the expiration has not exceeded two (2) years from the original
issuance date; and (3) the project would not be impacted by a change in the current adopted
codes, and; (4) the applicant pays a reactivation fee equal to one half the amount of the
original permit fee.

© For permits where work had commenced and was subsequently suspended or
abandoned, a renewed permit may be obtained provided that: (1) No changes have been
made or will be required in the original plans and specifications for such work; (2) the
expiration has not exceeded two (2) years from the original issuance date; and (3) a fee equal
to one half the amount required for a new permit is paid, except that where construction has
progressed and has been approved to the point whereby only a final inspection is required, a
feel equal to one quarter the amount required for a new permit shall be paid.

(d) Section R109.2 Amended.
Section R109.2, “Schedule of Permit Fees,” is amended to state as follows:

For any work on buildings or structures which requires a permit and/or
plan review, fees shall be paid in accordance with Resolutions and
Ordinances that are established by action of the City Council of the Town
of Colma.

(e) Section R109.4 Amended.

Section R109.4, “Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance,” is amended by adding  thereto
the following paragraph:

That fee, for commencing work prior to permit issuance, may be equal to
up to ten times the permit fee to a maximum amount of $ 5,000.00 as
determined by the Building Official. This fee is in addition to the permit
costs and any additional investigative fees.

® Section R313.2 Amended.

Section R313.2, “One- and Two-Family Dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems,” is amended

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 8 of 22



to replace Item 1 with the following: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system is not
required where an addition and/or alteration to an existing residential structure does not exceed
50% of the existing floor area.

(9) Section R313.3.1 Amended.

The second sentence in Section R313.3.1 “General” is amended to state: Partial Fire Sprinkler
Systems are not allowed, all areas of the structure shall be protected in accordance with this
chapter.

(h) Section R313.3.1.2 Amended.

Section R313.3.1.2 “Required Sprinkler Locations” Exception #4 is amended to read: Detached
garages; carports with no habitable space above; open attached porches, unless they are
located at the only egress door from the dwelling; and patio covers open on 3 sides or more.

0] Appendix H Adopted.

Appendix H, “Patio Covers,” is adopted as part of the Colma Residential Code.

()] Appendix J Adopted.

Appendix J, “Existing Buildings and Structures,” is adopted as part of the Colma Residential
Code.

(9] Appendix V Adopted.
Appendix V, “Swimming Pools Safety Act,” is adopted as part of the Colma Residential Code.
5.04.090 Colma Electrical Code

(a) The 2019 Edition of the California Electrical Code, contained in Part 3 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2017 Edition of the National
Electrical Code published by the National Fire Protection Association, together with Article 89,
with the following changes, additions, and deletions, is adopted by reference as the Colma
Electrical Code.

5.04.100 Colma Mechanical Code

(a) The 2019 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, contained in Part 4 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2018 Edition of the Uniform
Mechanical Code published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials, together with Chapter 1, with the following changes, additions, and deletions set forth,
is adopted by reference as the Colma Mechanical Code.

(b) Appendix F, “Sizing of Venting Systems and Outdoor Combustion and Ventilation
Opening Design,” is adopted as part of the Colma Mechanical Code.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 9 of 22



5.04.110 Colma Plumbing Code

(a) The 2019 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, contained in Part 5 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2018 Edition of the Uniform
Plumbing Code published by the International Association of Plumbing and Plumbing Officials,
together with Chapter 1, with the following changes, additions, and deletions, is adopted by
reference as the Colma Plumbing Code.

(b) Appendix A, “Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Supply System,” is adopted as
part of the Colma Plumbing Code.

© Appendix B, “Explanatory Notes on Combination Waste and Vent Systems,” is adopted
as part of the Colma Plumbing Code.

(d) Appendix C, “Alternate Plumbing Systems,” is adopted as part of the Colma Plumbing
Code.

(e) Appendix D, “Sizing Storm Water Drainage Systems,” is adopted as part of the Colma
Plumbing Code.

® Appendix |, “Installation Standard for PEX Tubing Systems for Hot- and Cold- Water
Distribution,” is adopted as part of the Colma Plumbing Code.

(9) Appendix J, “Combination of Indoor and Outdoor Combustion and Ventilation Opening
Design,” is adopted as part of the Colma Plumbing Code.

(h) Appendix K, “Potable Rainwater Catchment Systems,” is adopted as part of the Colma
Plumbing Code.

5.04.120 Colma Energy Conservation Code

The 2019 Edition of the California Energy Code, contained in Part 6 of Title 24 of the California
Code of Regulations, is adopted by reference as the Colma Energy Conservation Code.

5.04.130 Colma Historical Building Code

The 2019 Edition of the California Historical Building Code, contained in Part 8 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations is adopted by reference as the Colma Historical Building Code.

5.04.140 Colma Fire Prevention Code

(a) The 2019 Edition of the California Fire Code, contained in Part 9 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2018 Edition of the
International Fire Code published by the International Code Council, together with Chapter 1,
with the following changes, additions, and deletions, is adopted by reference as the Colma Fire
Prevention Code.

(b) Chapter 1 Division Il, Administration, is adopted, in its entirety, for the administration
and enforcement of the provisions of the Colma Fire Prevention Code, excepting amendments
as provided herein:

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 10 of 22



(9] Delete section 103.1, General.
2 Replace section 103.2, Appointment, with the following:
103.2 Fire Code Official.

The Fire Chief of the Colma Fire Protection District shall also be
known as the Fire Code Official, or the Fire Marshal, and may
delegate certain responsibilities to a deputy fire code official or
sworn personnel.

The Colma Building Official shall serve as the Fire Code Official
and may delegate the responsibilities under this Code to qualified
personnel retained by the Town, where relating to State Fire
Marshal Building Standards in R-3 Occupancies. The Building
Official may enforce other provisions of this code with the
approval of the Fire Chief of the Colma Fire Protection District.

3) Replace section 105.3.3, Occupancy Prohibited Before Approval, with the
following:

SECTION 105.3.3 FIRE DISTRICT APPROVAL REQUIRED.
No final inspection by the Colma Building Official, or his or her
designee, shall be made for occupancy of new or altered
construction, and no certificate of occupancy shall be issued and
no occupancy or temporary occupancy shall be granted until the
installation of the prescribed fire protection features and access
ways have been completed and approved by the Fire Code
Official, excluding R-3 Single Family Dwellings in accordance with
Health and Safety Code Section 13146.

4 Amend section 105.4, Submittals, to read as follows:

SECTION 105.4.1 Submittals. Construction documents shall
be in accordance with this section. When required by the Fire
Code Official, plans submitted to the Colma Building Department
or Building Official for a permit shall also be reviewed by the Fire
Code Official to determine compliance with the Colma Fire
Prevention Code. Upon review, a written report shall be returned
to the local building official listing deficiencies or compliance with
the Code.

(5) Amend section 110.4, Violation Penalties, to read as follows:

SECTION 110.4 VIOLATION PENALTIES. Persons who violate
a provision of this Code or shall fail to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the Fire Code Official, or falsification of a permit or
certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable as set forth in section 1.05.010 of the

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 11 of 22



Colma Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues shall
be deemed a separate offense.

(6) Adopt Chapter 4, Emergency Planning and Preparedness, in its entirety.

@) Amend the sixth (6th) sentence of Section 505.1, Address
ldentification, to read as follows:

SECTION 505.1 Address ldentification. Numbers typically
shall be a minimum of 4 inches in height with a minimum stroke
of 1/2 inch for individual residential structures, and a minimum of
6 inches in height for commercial structures with a minimum
stroke of 3/4 inch, or other approved sizes based on distances
from roadways. In multi-tenant buildings, with rear doors,
addresses shall also be posted upon those tenant space doors at
the rear of the building. The numerals on the rear doors shall be
3 inches in height and 1/2 inch in stroke.

(8) Add new section 507.5.7, Fire Hydrant Standards, to read as follows:

SECTION 507.5.7 FIRE HYDRANT STANDARDS. All fire
hydrants to be installed, or replaced, shall be new, UL listed, or
equivalent, wet-barrel type having a minimum of two 2-1/2 inch
and one 4-1/2 inch outlets equipped with National Standard
Threads.

9 Add new section 507.5.8, /dentification of Hydrants, as follows:

SECTION 507.5.8 IDENTIFICATION OF HYDRANTS. With
respect to fire hydrants located in commercial and residential
areas on public streets, and on private access roadways, the
curbs/spaces in front of the fire hydrant shall be painted red or
otherwise appropriately marked for a distance of fifteen feet (15')
in either direction from any hydrant and not less than three feet
(3") on any one side. On public streets in residential areas the
fifteen feet (15) may be reduced to five (5" feet — when
approved by the Fire Code Official. The Colma Fire Protection
District shall have the authority to require any fire hydrant
location be identified by installing a blue reflector on the street or
access road adjacent to the fire hydrant, with the specific location
of the fire hyrdrant to be determined by the Fire Code Official.

(10) Amend Section 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, to delete Sections 903.2
through 903.2.1.7 and Sections 903.2.3 through 903.10.1, and replace with the
following:

903.2 WHERE REQUIRED. Notwithstanding the provisions of
this Code or the provisions of any other codes applicable within
the Town of Colma, an approved automatic fire extinguishing
system shall be installed in the following:

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 12 of 22



A. All new non-residential buildings having a total floor area
of one thousand five hundred (1,500) square feet or more, or;

B. All new residential buildings, or;

C. All new buildings or structures thirty feet (30") or more in
height as defined in the California Building Code, or;

D. Buildings or structures which are three (3) stories or more,
irrespective of height, or;

E. All Group H occupancies, or;
F. All new habitable basements, regardless of floor area, or;
G. Existing residential structures which undergo any alteration

or addition, or combination thereof, within a five (5) year period,
wherein the area of alteration and/or addition, or combination
thereof, exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the existing floor area, or;

H. Existing non-residential structures which undergo any
addition or alteration, or combination thereof, within a five (5)
year period, wherein the area of alteration and/or addition, or
combination thereof, exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the existing
floor area, or;

l. Non-residential buildings which undergo a change of use
which results in a more hazardous occupancy classification as
determined by the fire code official.

Automatic Sprinkler System Exceptions:

1. Mausoleum and columbarium structures as defined in the
Cemetery Act, State of California; and

2. Where this Code or the California Building Code, California
Code Of Regulations Title 24, Part 2 is more restrictive.

(11) Add Section 903.2.11.7, Fire Walls, to state the following:

Section 903.2.11.7 FIRE WALLS. The use of fire walls may be
used for area increases in accordance with the California Building
Code, but shall not be used to negate the requirements for an
automatic fire extinguishing system as required by this section.

(12)  Add Section 903.3.1.3.1, NFPA 13D Sprinkler System Installation, to state the
following:

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 13 of 22



903.3.1.3.1 INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS. In addition to
the requirements of NFPA 13D the following policy shall be
followed:

PLAN REVIEW —

1. Applicant shall provide a copy of a recent (within past 6
months) water flow test report. The test report shall be supplied
by the water purveyor and printed on the water purveyor’'s
letterhead.

2. A two-head calculation is required for occupancies up to
3600 sq ft. When a single family residence cannot meet California
minimum water flow or access requirements, additional water flow
and/or sprinkler head calculations may be required.

INSTALLATION —

1. Approved back flow assemblies shall be installed in
accordance with water department requirements.

2. Water meter size shall be not less than 1 inch, with equal
size service unless the Town makes exceptions.

3. When a hanger is being supported by a composite wood
truss, pipe hangers shall have backing nuts on all threaded rods.

4. Approved annunciation devices shall be provided at
locations designated by the Town, both exterior and interior.
Exterior devices shall be an approved audible and visual sprinkler
flow alarm. All notification appliances shall receive primary power
from the kitchen refrigerator circuit.

5. The inspector's test valve shall be provided at the far
remote-side of the system away from the riser and be clearly
identified.

6. The location of the riser shall be in accordance with the
Town requirements and shall conform with any Colma Planning
Department requirements.

7. Attic (pilot) heads, for fire detection, shall be installed in
attics with greater than 30 inches of vertical space and have
access for storage, or if mechanical equipment is in the attic. Fire
sprinkler heads shall be located at the attic access point and
spaced every 30 feet on center at the ridgeline.

8. Fire sprinkler system main drains and Inspector's Test
drains, shall be clearly identified, and shall either discharge into a

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 14 of 22



Sanitary Sewer or a landscape area large enough to contain the
system contents, in accordance with provisions of Municipal
Regional Stormwater Permit.

INSPECTION REQUIREMENTS -
Inspections by the Town shall consist of not less than:

1. A rough installation inspection and hydrostatic test, prior
to concealing any components.

2. The hydrostatic test shall be performed at 200 psi for a
period of not less than 2 hours.

3. Underground piping system shall be flushed prior to
connecting to the sprinkler riser.

4, Where concealed sprinkler heads are used a pre-final
inspection shall be performed prior to the installation of the
concealing plates to verify no presence of contaminants on the
heads.

5. A final inspection.

(13) Replace Section 903.4.2, Alarms, with the following:

903.4.2 ALARMS. An approved audible and visual sprinkler flow
alarm shall be provided on the exterior of the building in an
approved location. An audible and visual sprinkler flow alarm
shall be provided in the interior of the building in a normally
occupied location. Multi-tenant buildings shall be provided with
an audible and visual sprinkler flow alarm and a manual pull
station within each separate tenant space, at an approved
location. Multi-story buildings, regardless of tenancy, shall be
provided with an audible and visual sprinkler flow alarm at each
floor level, in an approved location. All bathrooms shall be
provided with visual notification appliances where a fire alarm
system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system
shall activate the building fire alarm system.

(14) Replace Section 903.4.3, Floor Control Valves, with the following:

903.4.3 FLOOR CONTROL VALVES. Approved supervised
indicating control valves and water-flow switches shall be provided
at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in multi-level
buildings.

EXCEPTION: Within individual dwelling units.

(15) Replace Sections 907.2 and 907.9 with the following:

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 15 of 22



(16)

17

907.2 AND 907.9 WHERE REQUIRED IN NEW BUILDINGS

AND EXISTING STRUCTURES. An approved fire alarm system
shall be installed including manual fire alarm boxes in each tenant
space of a multi-tenant building and on each floor of a multi-story
building regardless of tenancy.

Replace Section 907.2.9 Group R-2, R-2.1 and R-2.2 with the
following:

907.2.9 Group R-2, R-2.1 and R-2.2. Fire alarm systems with

manual fire alarm boxes shall be installed at each exit and on each
floor. Automatic smoke detection systems and smoke alarms shall
be installed in Group R-2, R-2.1 and R-2.2 Occupancies as required
in Sections 907.2.8.2, 907.2.9.1 and 907.2.10.2.

Add item 6 to Section 1008.3.3, Rooms and Spaces, with the
following:

6. All bathrooms, and paths of egress from those bathrooms
to an exit discharge.

(c) The following Appendix Chapters are adopted;

Appendix A Board of Appeals

Appendix B Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings
Appendix BB Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings (Schools)
Appendix C Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution

Amend Table C102.1, Required Number and Spacing of Fire

Hydrants, Footnote C, to state the following:

Where water mains are extended along streets where fire
hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or similar fire
problems, fire hydrants shall be provided with spacing determined
by the Fire Code Official, to provide for transportation hazards.

Appendix CC Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution (Schools)

Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Appendix F Hazard Ranking

Appendix H HMMP / HMIS (HazMat Inventory)

Appendix | Fire Protection Systems — Noncompliant Conditions
5.04.150 Colma Existing Building Code

The 2019 Edition of the California Existing Building Code, contained in Part 10 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, is adopted by reference as the Colma Existing Building Code.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted )

Page 16 of 22



5.04.160 Colma Green Building Standards Code

(a) The 2019 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code, contained in Part 11
of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, with the following changes, additions, and
deletions, is adopted by reference as the Colma Green Building Standards Code.

(b) Section 4.408, “Construction Waste Reduction, Disposal and Recycling,” is amended by
deleting Sections 4.408.1 through 4.408.5 and adding a new Section 4.408.1 to state as
follows:

4.408.1 All construction and demolition work within the
Town of Colma shall be in compliance with sections 5.04.260
through 5.04.350 of the Colma Municipal Code.

© Section 5.408, “Construction Waste Reduction, Disposal and Recycling,” is amended by
deleting Sections 5.408.1 through 5.408.1.4 and adding a new Section 5.408.1 to state as
follows:

5.408.1 All construction and demolition work within the
Town of Colma shall be in compliance with sections 5.04.260
through 5.04.350 of the Colma Municipal Code.

(d) Section 5.04.290 of the Colma Municipal Code, “Diversion Requirements,” is amended
and restated in its entirety to read as follows:

5.04.290 Diversion Requirements

The Builder shall follow the diversion requirements in the 2019 California Green
Building Standards Code, as adopted by reference and amended by the Town in
subdivision A of this Section 5.04.160.

5.04.170 Colma Referenced Standards Code

The 2019 Edition of the California Referenced Standards Code, contained in Part 12 of Title 24
of the California Code of Regulations, is adopted by reference as the Colma Referenced
Standards Code.

5.04.180 Colma Housing Code

(a) The 1997 Edition of the Uniform Housing Code published by the International
Conference of Building Officials, with the following changes, additions, and deletions, is adopted
by reference as the Colma Housing Code.

(b) Section 203.1 is hereby deleted.

© Section 302, Fees, is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Whenever work is required to be done under the provisions of this
code, a building, plumbing, electrical or mechanical permit may be

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 17 of 22



required by the Building Official prior to commencement of the
work. Fees may be assessed pursuant to permit fee resolutions
adopted by the City Council from time to time. If abatement
proceedings are initiated against a property to gain compliance
with the provisions of this code, all costs associated with the
abatement shall be paid by the property owner pursuant to the
provisions of subchapter 2.01 of the Colma Municipal Code.

(d) Section 1001.2, /nadequate Sanitation, is amended by adding the following:
16. Lack of an approved potable water supply.
5.04.190 Colma Property Maintenance Code

The 2018 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code as published by the
International Code Council is adopted by reference as the Colma Property Maintenance Code.

5.04.200 Interpretation

The provisions of these Codes are enacted for the public health, safety, and welfare and are to
be liberally construed for those purposes thereof.

5.04.210 Codes Available to the Public

A complete set of the above referenced codes adopted in this subchapter shall be maintained in
the Building Department and shall be made available for review by the public.

ARTICLE 5. SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 3 — HOURS OF CONSTRUCTION

The following sections are added to subchapter 5.04, Building and Construction, of the Colma
Municipal Code as “Division 3 — Hours of Construction.”

Division 3: Hours of Construction
5.04.220 Standard Hours of Construction

(a) The City Council finds that regulation of construction noise is necessary to protect the
public health and safety, and that construction noise at early or late times of the day is a
nuisance to neighboring properties.

(b) As used in this subchapter, “noise generating construction activity” means the use of
any noise generating equipment or tool, including but not limited to: excavators, backhoes, post
diggers, pile drivers, saws, electric screw drivers, grinders, nail guns, compressors, generators,
hammers, jack hammers, power washers, paint guns, scaffolding erection, or similar noise
generating equipment. “Noise generating construction activity” also includes construction
material delivery, demolition activities and the servicing of tools and equipment. “Noise
generating construction activity” does not include activities such as drywall finishing, painting,

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 18 of 22



tile laying, carpet installation or the use of small hand tools in a fully enclosed structure with
windows and doors closed.

© Within a radius of 500 feet from any residential unit within the Town boundaries, noise
generating construction activity shall only be permitted between the following hours/days:

Monday Through Friday 8:00 AM through 7:00 PM
Saturday 9:00 AM through 5:00 PM
Sunday 12:00 PM through 5:00 PM

Noise generating construction activity is prohibited on all of the following federal holidays: New
Year's Day, Martin Luther King Jr. Day, President’s Day, Memorial Day, Independence Day,
Labor Day, Columbus Day, Veteran’s Day, Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day.

The Building Official, or his or her designee, may grant an exception for special conditions when
requested in writing and approved by the Building Official, or his or her designee, prior to the
start of noise generating activity. The above requirements do not apply to emergency repair
work, work for public utility and street repair, street sweeping, garbage collection and
emergency response warning systems.

(d) For projects more than 500 feet from a residential unit in the Town of Colma,
construction hours shall be assigned on a project-by-project basis by the Building Official, or his
or her designee, or as established within a project’'s Conditions of Approval, based on evaluation
of potential noise-related impacts on surrounding uses.

5.04.230 Accessibility and Pedestrian Access During Construction

No person shall conduct any construction or repair work that interferes with or encroaches
upon the public right-of-way unless that person establishes and maintains an
accessible path of travel during construction for use by persons, including those with disabilities,
and posts adequate approved signage  directing users to that path.

ARTICLE 6. SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 4 — ENFORCEMENT

The following sections are added to subchapter 5.04, Building and Construction, of the Colma
Municipal Code as “Division 4 — Enforcement.”

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 19 of 22



Division 4: Enforcement
5.04.240 Enforcement Responsibilities

(a) The Building Official of the Town of Colma, or his or her designee, shall enforce the
provisions of this Code, acting for and on behalf of the Town of Colma.

(b) Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13146, the responsibility for the
enforcement of Building Standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained within
these codes, relating to fire and panic safety and other regulations of the Office of the State
Fire Marshal as they apply to Group R, Division 3 One and Two Family Dwellings, shall be
delegated to the Building Official of the Town of Colma.

5.04.250 Violation and Penalties

(a) A willful violation of a lawful order of the Building Official issued pursuant to the Colma
Building Codes is a misdemeanor, punishable as set forth in subchapter 1.05.010 of the Colma
Municipal Code.

(b) A violation of any other provision of this subchapter is an infraction, punishable as set
forth in subchapter 1.05 of the Colma Municipal Code, including paragraph (c)(4) of section
1.05.020.

(© A violation of this subchapter shall also be deemed to be a public nuisance under section
2.01.060 of the Colma Municipal Code, and may be abated pursuant to the procedures set forth
in subchapter 2.01 of the Code. The costs of abatement shall become a lien upon the property
involved. Notwithstanding any other provision in subchapter 2.01, the authority granted the
Code Enforcement Officer, in subchapter 2.01 may also be exercised by a Colma Building
Official, or his or her designee. Specifically, but without limitation, the Colma Enforcement
Officer or the Colma Building Official may issue Administrative Citations in accordance with the
procedures set forth in subchapter 2.01 of the Colma Municipal Code.

ARTICLE 6. FILING OF ORDINANCE

The City Clerk is hereby directed to file a copy of this Ordinance with the California Building
Standards Commission of the State of California.

ARTICLE 7. LIABILITY

The provisions of the Colma Building Codes shall not be construed as imposing upon the Town
of Colma any liability or responsibility for damage to persons or property resulting from
defective work, nor shall the Town of Colma, or any official, employee or agent thereof, be held
as assuming any such liability or responsibility by reason of the review or inspection authorized
by the provisions of the Colma Building Codes of any permits or certificates issued under the
Codes.

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 20 of 22



ARTICLE 8. SEVERABILITY

If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase added by this
ordinance, or any part thereof, is for any reason held to be unconstitutional or invalid or
ineffective by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity or
effectiveness of the remaining portions of this ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council
hereby declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph,
sentence, clause or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more subsections,
subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases are declared unconstitutional, invalid or
ineffective.

ARTICLE 9. CEQA COMPLIANCE

The City Council finds that the changes made to the Codes are enacted to mitigate the threats
posed to public peace, health and safety from earthquakes, high winds and fire. Therefore, it
can be seen with certainty that adoption of this ordinance will not have a significant adverse
effect on the environment and is therefore exempt from California Environmental Quality Act
pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) of the CEQA Guidelines. The City Planner is directed to file a
notice of exemption within five (5) days of the adoption of this ordinance.

ARTICLE 10. PUBLICATION

This ordinance including the vote for and against the same shall be posted in the office of the
City Clerk and on the three (3) official bulletin boards of the Town of Colma within fifteen (15)
days of its passage and shall take force and effect thirty (30) days after its passage.

ARTICLE 11. EFFECTIVE DATE
This ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days following its adoption by the City Council.

Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Ordinance No. was duly introduced at a regular meeting of the
City Council of the Town of Colma held on December 11, 2019, and adopted at a regular
meeting of the City Council of the Town of Colma held on January , 2020, by the

following vote:

Name Voting Present, Not Voting Absent

Aye No | Abstain Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 21 of 22



Voting Tally

Dated:

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Attest:
Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Ord 2019 Colma Building Code (Adopted ) Page 22 of 22



Item #5

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Brad Donohue, Director of Public Works
Abdulkader Hashem, Associate Engineer/Project Manager

Jonathan Kwan, Associate Planner

VIA: Brian Dossey, City Manager
MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019
SUBJECT: Community Playgrounds, Inc. - Completion of Sterling Park Playground

Improvement Project

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council adopt the following:

RESOLUTION TO ACCEPT WORK PERFORMED BY COMMUNITY PLAYGROUNDS, INC.,
FOR THE STERLING PARK PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENT PROJECT AND AUTHORIZE
THE DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS TO FILE A NOTICE OF COMPLETION WITH THE
COUNTY RECORDER’S OFFICE AND MAKE THE FINAL PAYMENT TO COMMUNITY
PLAYGROUNDS, INC., IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE PROMPT PAYMENT LAWS

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

In November 2019, Community Playgrounds, Inc. (Contractor), completed contract work for the
Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project (Project). The Project began in September 2018,
when the contract was awarded and was substantially completed in November 2019. The
Contractor completed the scope of work as presented in the approved Project plans and
specifications along with approved change orders. The Project is now fully complete, and the
Town should move forward with filing Notice of Completion for the Project and releasing final
payment to the Contractor.

FISCAL IMPACT

The Project budget is in the amount of $537,500 for soft and hard costs along with construction
contingencies. The Project construction budget along with contingency was approved for
$444,303.64. The total construction cost for the Project came to $426,919.33. This is below
the amount currently budgeted for construction.

Staff Report - Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project Completion Page 1 of 3
12/11/2019



BACKGROUND

The Project was awarded to the Contractor on August 23, 2018, the project officially started in
September after the Town’'s summer events were completed, (Day Camp and Annual Picnic).
Project highlights included:

1. Removal of existing bocce court, playground equipment and play area rubberized

surfacing;

Improvement of grading and new drainage system, including ancillary works;

Replace existing concrete pathway in conformance with ADA standards;

4. Purchase and installation of new playground equipment, manufactured by Columbia
Cascade Company (Sole Source);

5. Supply and installation of a Fitness Cluster (Group B - Model No. 9700-2-B)
manufactured by Columbia Cascade Company;

6. Supply and installation of new rubberized surfacing throughout the play area
manufactured by ECORE International;

7. Supply and installation of two picnic tables including one ADA accessible table, two park
benches, and a barbecue grill manufactured by Wabash Valley Manufacturing;

8. Supply and installation of an outdoor ADA drinking fountain with bottle filling station;
and

9. Supply and installation of 3’ high guardrail fence with 5" wide gates.

wnN

Along with the contract work was approved change order work, a summary of the approved
change orders are as follows:

¢ Install additional concrete curb for retaining playground surfacing elevation and conform
along North side of the playground area;

e Furnish and install 70 LF of new guardrail along the North side of the playground area;

e Rerouting electrical conduits for bollard lights across the playground area;

¢ Remove existing chain net climber, furnish and install new swinging bridge in its place;

e Additional cost to furnish and install 3-level drinking fountain instead of 2-level one.
ANALYSIS

The Contractor has been paid for all contract work plus approved change orders to date less the
required five percent retention.

Staff requests the City Council accept work performed on the Project and authorize the Director
of Public Works to file a Notice of Completion with the San Mateo County Recorder’s Office.

The filing of the Notice of Completion means:

e The Town is satisfied the Contractor has completed the Project in accordance with the
plans and specifications.

e At the time of the filing of the Notice of Completion, there has not been a claim filed
against the Town.

e The Town accepts the Contractor’'s work as complete.

Staff Report - Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project Completion Page 2 of 3
12/11/2019



e The time frame for the filing of stop payment notice claims is shortened once the Notice
of Completion has been filed with the San Mateo County Recorder’s Office

Thirty days after the NOC has been recorded, if no claims from subcontractors and suppliers
have been filed with the Town, the Town can release the remaining 5% retention to the
Contractor in the amount of $21,345.77.

To date there have been no stop notices or claims filed with the Town for the Project.
Council Adopted Values

By approving and accepting the Project as complete, the City Council has reviewed and
approved the work performed by the Contractor, thus taking a Responsible position
requesting that the Notice of Completion be filed with the County Recorder’s Office and that
final payment be timely made to the Contractor.

Alternatives

The City Council can choose not to adopt the resolution accepting the Project and directing the
filing of the Notice of Completion for the Project. The Town would then not accept the Project
as complete and file the Notice of Completion with the San Mateo County Recorder’s Office nor
release retention to the Contractor and close out the construction contract. Such action would
increase the time for subcontractors and material suppliers to file claims and could result in
penalties under prompt payment laws.

CONCLUSION

Staff has reviewed the completed work and recommends that the City Council adopt the
resolution thereby accepting the Project as complete and authorizing the Director of Public
Works to file a Notice of Completion with the San Mateo County Recorder’s Office and make
final payment to the Contractor in accordance with the State’s prompt payment laws.

ATTACHMENTS
A. Resolution No. 2019-_
B. Notice of Completion - Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project

Staff Report - Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project Completion Page 3 of 3
12/11/2019






Attachment A

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-___
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE STERLING PARK PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENT
PROJECT (CIP 944) AS COMPLETE AND DIRECTING THE DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC
WORKS TO FILE A NOTICE OF COMPLETION FOR THE ACCESS CONTROL SYSTEM
PROJECT WITH THE SAN MATEO COUNTY RECORDER’S OFFICE

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve:
1. Background.

(a) The Town of Colma opened bids for the Sterling Park Playground Improvement Project —
CIP 944 (“Project”) on August 15, 2018.

(b) Town Staff determined that Community Playgrounds, Inc., was the lowest responsible
bidder submitting a responsive bid in the amount of $403,912.40, and the City Council awarded

a construction contract to Community Playgrounds, Inc., and established a 10% contingency
(total construction budget of $444,303.64).

© Total construction costs were $426,919.33

(d) Community Playgrounds, Inc., substantially completed work on the Project in November
of 2019 and has now fully completed all work including punch list items.

2. Finding.

(a) The City Council finds that the Project is complete to the satisfaction of the Town.
3. Order

(a) The Project is accepted as complete.

(b) The Director of Public Works is directed to file a Notice of Completion for the Project
with the San Mateo County Recorder’s Office.

(d) Town staff is directed to release the 5% retention to Community Playgrounds, Inc.,
within 30 days of the recording of the Notice of Completion for the Project in accordance with
applicable prompt payment laws.

//
//
//
//

//

Res. 2019-___, Sterling Park Playground Improvements, NOC Page 1 of 2



Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2019-__ was duly adopted at a regular meeting of
said City Council held on December 11, 2019 by the following vote:

Name Voting Present, Not Voting Absent

Aye No | Abstain Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

Voting Tally

Dated

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Attest:
Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Res. 2019-___, Sterling Park Playground Improvements, NOC Page 2 of 2



Attachment B

RECORDING REQUESTED BY AND
WHEN RECORDED MAIL TO:

Town of Colma

1198 El Camino Real

Colma, CA 94014-3212

Attn: Brad Donohue, PW Director

THE AREA ABOVE IS RESERVED FOR RECORDER’S USE

[NO RECORDING FEE SHALL BE CHARGED PURSUANT TO GOVERNMENT
CODE SECTIONS 6103 AND 27383]

TOWN OF COLMA

NOTICE OF COMPLETION

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT:

1. The Town of Colma is the owner of a work of improvement described as the Sterling Park
Playground Project - CIP 944 (hereafter, the “Work™) and of the real property on which the Work is
situated, which real property is located in the County of San Mateo, State of California and
specifically described as follows: 427 F Street, Colma, CA 94014; and

2. Community Playgrounds, Inc., is the contractor that was awarded the construction contract by the
Town of Colma for the Work, and

3. The Work was completed by Community Playgrounds, Inc., and accepted by the Town of Colma on
November 22, 2019; and

4. The nature of the interest of the Town of Colma is as a fee simple owner in the above-described real
property; and

5. The address of the Town of Colma is 1198 El Camino Real, Colma, California 94014; and

6. I, Brad Donohue, contract Public Works Director of the Town of Colma, am authorized by the City
Council of the Town of Colma to execute and file this Notice of Completion with the County
Recorder of the County of San Mateo as an authorized agent of the Town of Colma. | have read the
Notice of Completion and know the contents thereof; the same is true of my own knowledge.

| declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is
true and correct.

(Date and Place) Brad Donohue
Director of Public Works






Item #6

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council

FROM: Michael P. Laughlin, City Planner, CSG Consultants
VIA: Brian Dossey, City Manager

MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019

SUBJECT: Wild Bird and Wild Animal Feeding Ordinance

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council introduce the following:

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING COLMA MUNICIPAL CODE SUBCHAPTER 8.01
PROHIBITING THE FEEDING OF WILD BIRDS OR WILD ANIMALS ON PUBLIC
AND PRIVATE PROPERTY PURSUANT TO CEQA GUIDELINE 15061(b)(3)

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The Town currently has an ordinance that prohibits bird and wild animal feeding on public
property, including streets, sidewalks and parks. Per City Council direction at a study session on
October 9, 2019, the attached ordinance extends wild animal and bird feeding prohibitions to
private property, with an exception for hummingbird and other bird feeders on single-family
detached residential properties. An additional exception has been added for unintended feeding
from the cultural practice of leaving food at individual gravesites.

FISCAL IMPACT

There could be a very minor financial impact if the Council adopts an ordinance to prohibit
feeding on private property as it could increase staff time in enforcement. However, warnings
and citations by the Code Enforcement Officer or Police Department would be provided as a
normal course of business.

ANALYSIS
The Town currently has an ordinance prohibiting the feeding of wild birds and animals on public

property, streets and sidewalks. Bird feeding on private property has continued to be an issue
and has led to an overpopulation of pigeons and other birds.

Staff Report — Wild Animal and Bird Feeding Ordinance Page 1 of 2



The proposed ordinance would extend the prohibition of animal and bird feeding to private
property. This would include all commercial property, cemetery properties, multi-unit properties
and attached single-family properties such as Verano and Hoffman. The only exception would
be for bird feeders on detached single-family properties, which are maintained so as to not
become a nuisance. The other exception built into the ordinance is unintentional feeding from
the cultural practice of leaving food at gravesites.

Notice of the City Council meeting and proposed ordinance was sent to over 600 residents,
businesses and property owners. In addition, information was provided in Livewire and the
business newsletter.

Enforcement of the existing ordinance and any new ordinance would be by the Police
Department, with enforcement authority provided in Subchapter 1.05 of the Colma Municipal
Code (CMC). Anyone observed providing bread or food for birds or animals would first be
advised of the Town’s ordinance. A second offence could result in the issuance of a citation as
an infraction with a fee of $100.00. Subsequent infractions have a fee $200.00, then $500.00.
The Code Enforcement Officer would also have the authority to issue warnings and write a
citation for violations on private property. In addition, enforcement may also be appropriate
under Subchapter 2.01 of the CMC, the Town'’s property and nuisance abatement ordinance.
Council Adopted Values

The discussion of bird and wildlife feeding restrictions is consistent with the Council value of
responsibility, because it considers public health and safety.

Sustainability Impact

Amending the Municipal Code to restrict or prohibit bird feeding on private property supports
sustainability practices.

Alternatives

The City Council has the option of not adopting the ordinance. If the ordinance is not adopted,
bird and wild avenue feeding on private properties would remain unrestricted.

CONCLUSION
Staff recommends the City Council introduce and adopt the ordinance.

ATTACHMENTS

A. Ordinance

Staff Report — Wild Animal and Bird Feeding Ordinance Page 2 of 2



Attachment A

ORDINANCE NO.
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING COLMA MUNICIPAL CODE SUBCHAPTER
8.01 PROHIBITING THE FEEDING OF WILD BIRDS OR WILD ANIMALS
ON PUBLIC AND PRIVATE PROPERTY PURSUANT TO CEQA GUIDELINE

15061 (b)(3)

The City Council of the Town of Colma does ordain as follows:

ARTICLE 1. CMC SECTION 8.01.072 AMENDED.
8.01.072. Feeding Birds and Wild Animals Prohibited.

(@ It shall be unlawful for any person to feed or offer food to any bird or wild animal in or
on any sidewalk, street, highway or public property of the Town of Colma.

(b) It shall be unlawful for any person to feed or offer food to any bird or wild animal in or
on any private property in the Town of Colma, except for the following:

(1) Unintentional feeding of any wild bird or wild animal as a result of leaving food at
an individual gravesite within a cemetery.

(2) Use of bird or hummingbird feeders on detached single-family residentially
developed properties. Feeders shall be in such numbers that feeding does not
create an unreasonable disturbance that affects the rights of surrounding property
owners or creates a nuisance, does not create an accumulation of droppings on
the property or surrounding properties, and does not become an attractant for
rodents or other wild animals. Feeders are required to be suspended at least four
feet off the ground by a chain or other method to prevent potential feeding of wild
animals and rodents and shall be filled only with commercially available bird seed
and feed.

[History: ORrD. 637, 11/09/05; ORD. 636, 12/14/05; ORD. 637, 11/9/05; ORD. 740, 4/8/15, Ord.
H##, date]

ARTICLE 2. SEVERABILITY.

If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any
entity, person or circumstance is held for any reason to be invalid or unconstitutional, such
invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect other provisions or applications of this Ordinance
which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the
provisions of this Ordinance are severable. The City Council of the Town of Colma hereby
declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each section, sentence, clause or

Ord. No. ___ Wild Animal and Bird Feeding Ordinance Page 1 of 3



phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that anyone or more section, subsections, sentences,
clauses or phrases be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

ARTICLE 3. NOT A CEQA PROJECT.

This Ordinance is exempt from the requirements of the California Environmental Quality Act
(“CEQA”) pursuant to State CEQA Guidelines, as it is not a “project” and has no potential to
result in a direct or reasonably foreseeable indirect physical change to the environment. 14 Cal.
Code Regs. 8§ 15378(a). Further, this Ordinance is exempt from CEQA as there is no possibility
that this Ordinance or its implementation would have a significant negative effect on the
environment. 14 Cal. Code Regs. § 15061(b)(3). The City Planner shall cause a Notice of
Exemption to be filed as authorized by CEQA and the State CEQA Guidelines

ARTICLE 4. EFFECTIVE DATE.

This ordinance, or a summary thereof prepared by the City Attorney, shall be posted on the

three (3) official bulletin boards of the Town of Colma within 15 days of its passage and is to

take force and effect thirty (30) days after its passage.

//

//

/1

//

/1

/1

//

/!

/!

//

Ord. No. ___ Wild Animal and Bird Feeding Ordinance Page 2 of 3



Certificate of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Ordinance No. __ was duly introduced at a regular meeting of the
City Council of the Town of Colma held on December 11, 2019 and duly adopted at a regular
meeting of said City Council held on January ___, 2021 by the following vote:

Name

Voting

Present, Not Voting Absent

Aye

No | Abstain Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

Voting Tally

Dated

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Attest:
Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Ord. No. ___ Wild Animal and Bird Feeding Ordinance Page 3 of 3






Item #7

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

VIA: Brian Dossey, City Manager

MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019

SUBJECT: City Council Committee Assignments for 2020

RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends that the City Council determine the Council Member Committee Assignments
for 2020, and make the following motion:

MOTION APPROVING COMMITTEE ASSIGNMENTS FOR 2020 AND GRANTING TO THE
APPOINTEE DISCRETION IN VOTING ON MATTERS BROUGHT BEFORE THE
COMMITTEE.

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

In addition to their primary role as Elected Officials of the Town of Colma, the City Council
Members serve on a variety of committees that involve the direct participation of its members in
a host of local and regional issues and organizations. It is the Town’s practice for the Council to
review and modify committee assignments when a new Mayor is selected.

FISCAL IMPACT

This action has no fiscal impact.

BACKGROUND

After the Reorganization of the City Council, Council Members review the committee
assignments of the previous term and consider changes. Attached is a worksheet showing the
current committee assignments, approved by the City Council on December 12, 2018.

CONCLUSION

Staff recommends that the City Council determine the Council Member Committee Assignments
for 2020, adopt a motion approving Committee Assignments for 2020 and grant to the
appointee discretion on voting matters brought before the committee.

ATTACHMENTS

A. Council Committee Assignments 2020 Worksheet

Staff Report re Council Committee Assignments Page 1 of 1






Attachment A

Council Committee Assignments 2020 Worksheet

2019 2019 2020 2020

Committee Name . .
Primary Secondary Primary Secondary

Office of Emergency Services

(EMERGENCY SERVICES COUNCIL, MEETS
QUARTERLY 3%° THURSDAYS IN JANUARY, APRIL,
JUNE & SEPTEMBER, AT 5:30 PM, AT THE HALL OF
JUSTICE IN REDWOOD CITY IN JURY ASSEMBLY
ROOM)

Colvin del Rosario

Colma Creek Flood District

(MEETS QUARTERLY, 2P TUESDAY @ 3PM IN
MARCH, JUNE, SEPTEMBER AND DECEMBER AT
CITY HALL, SOUTH SAN FRANCISCO)

Fisicaro

Peninsula Congestion Relief Alliance - “The Alliance”
Board of Directors member Gonzalez Colvin
(6 X A YEAR, THURSDAY MORNINGS)

C/CAG

Colvi Goodwi
(2\° THURSDAY OF THE MONTH, 7PM) ovin oodwin

League of California Cities
(ANNUAL CONFERENCE, AND WORKSHOPS All
THROUGHOUT THE YEAR)

del Rosario is All Council
the voting Members
representative | can attend

San Mateo County Council of Cities
(MONTHLY DINNER AND MEETING)

Mayor/Chamber Walks

All other
(SCHEDULED BETWEEN THE MAYOR, CITY . .
del Rosario Council
MANAGER & CHAMBER OF COMMERCE,
Members

APPROXIMATELY 5+ OUTINGS)

City Representative at Colma-Daly City Chamber of
Commerce del Rosario Goodwin
(1-2 MEETINGS A YEAR, AS NEEDED)

Legislative Committee (C/CAG)

Colvi
(ONCE PER MONTH, ON 22 THURSDAYS AT 5PM) ovin

ABAG Representative
(GENERAL ASSEMBLY MEETS TWICE PER YEAR del Rosario Gonzalez
APRIL & OCTOBER)

Grand Boulevard Task Force

(MEETS 3%° WEDNESDAY, 10AM-12 NOON, MARCH,
JUNE, SEPTEMBER, DECEMBER AT EITHER SAM Goodwin Gonzalez
TRANS IN SAN CARLOS OR CITY HALL IN SANTA
CLARA)

Peninsula Clean Energy Board of Directors
(MEETS 4™ THURSDAY, 6:30PM AT THE COUNTY
OFFICE OF EDUCATION BUILDING IN REDWOOD
CITY)

Gonzalez del Rosario







Item #8

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

VIA: Brian Dossey, City Manager

MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019

SUBJECT: Council of Cities and City Selection Committee

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council make the following motion:

MOTION CONFIRMING DESIGNATION OF THE MAYOR AS THE VOTING MEMBER FOR
THE COUNCIL OF CITIES, DESIGNATING AN ALTERNATE VOTING MEMBER, AND
GIVING THE VOTING MEMBER DISCRETION ON ANY AND ALL MATTERS TO BE
CONSIDERED

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The San Mateo Council of Cities will meet on December 20, 2019 to elect its officers, to make
appointments to certain Regional Boards, and to conduct other business. According to the
Council’s bylaws, all Council Members from a city are participating members of the Council of
Cities, but only the Mayor, or the Mayor’s alternate, is a voting member. By practice, the Mayors
of each city are members of the City Selection Committee, which has been delegated the
authority to make appointments to certain regional boards.

This motion will confirm the designation of the Mayor as the voting member of the Council of
Cities and its City Selection Committee, designate an alternate to the Mayor, and grant the
voting member discretion in voting on any and all matters.

FISCAL IMPACT
This action has no fiscal impact.
BACKGROUND

The Town of Colma City Council is a participant in the San Mateo County Council of Cities and
the City Selection Committee. The Council of Cities meets once per month to discuss items of
interest to the region and provide networking opportunities for elected officials from the cities
of San Mateo County. The members of the San Mateo County Council of Cities are all of the
elected officials from the cities in the County, as well as the Board of Supervisors of San Mateo
County.

Staff Report re City Selection Committee Page 1 of 3



The City Selection Committee meets several times per year, usually immediately before a
Council of Cities business meeting, and elects representatives from among the group of
interested elected officials to serve on County-wide committees and boards, such as the San
Mateo County Transportation Authority (SMCTA), and the Bay Area Air Quality Management
District Board. Only one designated representative from each city is on the City Selection
Committee, usually the Mayor. The City Selection Committee meets for the sole purpose of
voting for the elected officials who will serve on County-wide committees and to elect the
officers to the Council of Cities for the upcoming year.

ANALYSIS

The bylaws of the San Mateo Council of Cities provides that each Council Member is a
participating member of the Council, that each city shall have one vote, and that the Mayor, or
an alternate designated by the city, is the voting member for that city.

The proposed motion would confirm the designation of the Mayor as the Town’s voting
representative to the City Selection Committee and would appoint an alternate as voting
member in case of the Mayor’'s absence.

The proposed motion would also confirm that the voting member has the discretion to vote on
any matter before the Council of Cities. The voting member may seek and hear input and
opinions of fellow Council members, but is not bound to vote in accordance with any
instructions from fellow council members.

Attached to this staff report for discussion are a list of the vacant assignments and positions,
however currently no one is listed as seeking a position. This is because the City Selection
Committee Agenda Packet has not yet been posted. It will be posted on Monday, December 9,
2019; Council will be given an updated list of those seeking appointment at the Council Meeting
on December 11, 2019.

Council Adopted Values

This recommendation is consistent with the Vision category from the Council’'s adopted values
from the Values-Based Code of Conduct. The Mayor will vote to select committee members and
board representatives that may have a direct impact on regional issues that are of interest to
the Town of Colma.

Alternative

The alternative to giving the Mayor discretion to vote at the City Selection Committee meeting
is to require the Mayor to vote in a manner consistent with the directions of the City Council.
While this alternative is technically feasible, it is not a workable alternative when there are
several potential candidates or issues to be voted on. The more candidates or issues there are
to be voted on, the more complicated and unworkable this alternative becomes.

CONCLUSION

Staff recommends that the City Council adopt the proposed motion.

Staff Report re City Selection Committee Page 2 of 3



ATTACHMENTS

A. List of Commission/Committee vacancies
B. Proxy Designation Form

Staff Report re City Selection Committee Page 3 of 3






Attachment A

City Selection Committee Meeting
December 20, 2019

Commission/Committee

Vacancies

Seeking Appointment/Reappointment

Bay Area Quality Management
District (BAAQMD)

COMPENSATED

1 seat available
that will represent
All Cities

San Mateo County
Transportation Authority
(SMCTA)

COMPENSATED

1 seat available
that will represent
Northern Cities

San Mateo County
Transportation Authority
(SMCTA)

COMPENSATED

1 seat available
that will represent
All Cities

California Identification System
(CAL-ID)

NOT COMPENSATED

1 seat available
that will represent
All Cities

San Mateo County Council

of Cities Officers Vacancies Seeking Appointment/Reappointment
Chairperson 1 seat
Vice Chairperson 1 seat







Attachment B

Glenn R. Sylvester, Chairperson
Sue Vaterlaus, Vice Chairperson
Sukhmani S. Purewal, City Selection Secretary
400 County Center

Redwood City, 94063
650-363-1802

TO: Sukhmani S. Purewal, Secretary
City Selection Committee

SUBJECT: Alternate to the City Selection Committee

I , Mayor of the City/Town of :

hereby appoint Councilmember , to serve as my

alternate to the City Selection Committee meeting(s).

In the absence of my appointee, | then appoint: (Please choose one)

C] Councilmember to represent me

C] Vice-Mayor and each Councilmember in order of seniority

(You must check only ONE of the following options)

My alternate is to serve for the:

C] meeting only

Date

C] duration of my term of office as Mayor

C] | do not choose to appoint an alternate

Signature of Mayor Date
Please return to:
Sukhmani S. Purewal, Secretary
City Selection Committee
Hall of Justice, 400 County Center / CMO 105
Redwood City, CA 94063
Or Fax to 650 363-1916 or bring to the meeting

If you should have any questions please do not hesitate to call me (650) 363-1802

Updated on 12/17/2018






Item #9

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council

FROM: Brian Dossey, City Manager

MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019

SUBJECT: Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council adopt the following:

RESOLUTION APPROVING FIFTH AMENDMENT TO EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH
KIRK STRATTON

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Pursuant to salary negotiations that took place in May of this year, the City Council, City Manager
and the Chief of Police have discussed and agreed to a contract modification to the existing
employment agreement between the Town and Mr. Stratton to address an increase in base salary.
As provided for in the fifth amendment to the employment agreement, the base salary will
increase from roughly $206,773 to $210,908. This represents a two (2) percent salary increase
consistent with the approved MOU'’s for Police and Communications/Records employee groups as
well as unrepresented employees who will receive the same two (2) percent salary increase.

FISCAL IMPACT

The City Council's adoption of the resolution and execution of the fifth amendment will cause a
slight financial impact on the Town based on the payment of a higher salary to the Chief of Police.
This increase has been factored into the 2019/20 budget.

BACKGROUND

On October 8, 2014, the Town entered into an employment agreement with Mr. Stratton to serve
as the Town's Chief of Police. On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First
Amendment to the Employment Contract with Mr. Stratton to increase his base salary. On May
10, 2017, December 13, 2017, and June 12, 2019 the Town approved the second, third and
fourth amendments to the contract.

ANALYSIS

Staff Report Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2



The proposed fifth amendment will modify section 3(a), Salary and Benefits of Mr. Stratton’s
employment contract, to increase the base salary from roughly $206,773 per year to $210,908
per year, an increase of about $4,135. The increase will take effect on December 29, 2019.

The modifications are consistent with the approved MOU's for Police and
Communications/Records employee groups as well as unrepresented employees. As approved
for the represented and unrepresented employees, Mr. Stratton is receiving a two (2) percent
salary increase on December 29, 2019.

All other terms and conditions of the employment agreement would remain unchanged.
Alternatives

The City Council could choose not to adopt the resolution and choose not to execute the fifth
amendment. Doing so is not recommended as the City Manager and Mr. Stratton are both in
agreement on this modification and the City Council has directed this modification to the
agreement.

CONCLUSION

The City Council should adopt the resolution approving the fifth amendment to the employment
agreement with Mr. Stratton.

ATTACHMENTS

Resolution

Fifth Amendment

Fourth Amendment

Third Amendment

Second Amendment

First Amendment

Original Employment Contract

GMmo o w>

Staff Report Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2



Attachment A

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-___
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING FIFTH AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(@) On October 8, 2014, the City Council entered into an Employment Contract with Kirk
Stratton to serve as the Town’s Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(c) On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(d) On December 13, 2017, the City Council approved the Third Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(e) On June 12, 2019, the City Council approved the Fourth Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

() Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Fifth Amendment to further increase
Employee’s base salary by 2%. Such increase shall be effective December 29, 2019 consistent
with the 2% increase in the approved MOU's for Police and Communications/Records employee
groups as well as for the unrepresented employees.

2. Order

(@) The Fifth Amendment to the Employment Contract between the Town of Colma and Kirk
Stratton, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by the
City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b) The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Fifth Amendment on behalf
of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate by the
Mayor and the City Attorney.

//
//
//
//

//

Res. 2019-__, Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2



Certification of Adoption

| certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2019-__ was duly adopted at a regular meeting of said
City Council held on December 11, 2019 by the following vote:

Name Voting Present, Not Voting Absent

Aye No | Abstain Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

Voting Tally

Dated

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Attest:

Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Res. 2019-__, Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2



Attachment B

FIFTH AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

This Fifth Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a municipal
corporation and general law city (“Employer”), and Kirk Stratton (“Employee”), who are
sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Fifth
Amendment. For reference purposes, this Fifth Amendment is dated December 29, 2019.

1. Recitals. This Fifth Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On October 8, 2014, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment
Contract (“Contract”) for Employee to serve as Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

© On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(d) On December 13, 2017, the City Council approved the Third Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(e) On June 12, 2019, the City Council approved the Fourth Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

® Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Fifth Amendment to further
increase Employee’s base salary by 2%. Such increase shall take effect on December 29,
2019 consistent with the 2% increase in the approved MOU's for Police and
Communications/Records employee groups as well as for the unrepresented employees.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION
CONTAINED IN THIS FIFTH AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS:

2. Subsection (a) of Section 3, “Salary” of the Contract is hereby modified as
follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $210.908.73 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be paid at
the same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town.

Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Fifth Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Fifth Amendment, along with the various other
amendments and the Contract constitutes the entire Agreement between the Parties.

Dated

Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2



Kirk Stratton, Employee

Dated: TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By
John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2



Attachment C

FOURTH AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

This Fourth Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a municipal
corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Kirk Stratton ("Employee™), who are sometimes
individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Fourth Amendment. For
reference purposes, this Fourth Amendment is dated May 22, 2019.

1. Recitals. This Fourth Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On October 8, 2014, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment Contract
("Contract”) for Employee to serve as Chief of Police.

(b)  On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(c) On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(d)  On December 13, 2017, the City Council approved the Third Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(e) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Fourth Amendment to further
increase Employee’s base salary. Such increase shall be retroactive to May 22, 2019, when
salary negotiations began.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION CONTAINED
IN THIS FOURTH AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

1. Subsection (a) of Section 3, “Salary” of the Contract is hereby modified as follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $206,773.26 per year, or such greater
amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be paid at the same
time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous Employees of the
Town.

Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Fourth Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Fourth Amendment, along with the various other amendments
and the Contract constitutes the entire Agreement between the Parties.

Dated (o 1/\ LI/’ | N>~
Kirk Stratton, Employee

Dated: g/ %’ TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By %W/M)é/zw/./

ﬂoanne del Rosario, Mayor

Fourth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 1






RESOLUTION NO. 2019-31
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING FOURTH AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:

1l

2.

1/
/1
/1
/1
/1
/1
/1

Background

(a) On October 8, 2014, the City Council entered into an Employment Contract with Kirk
Stratton to serve as the Town’s Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(c) On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(d) On December 13, 2017, the City Council approved the Third Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary.

(e) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Fourth Amendment to further
increase Employee’s base salary. Such increase shall be retroactive to May 22, 2019, when
salary negotiations began.

Order

(@) The Fourth Amendment to the Employment Contract between the Town of Colma and Kirk
Stratton, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by the
City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b) The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Fourth Amendment on behalf
of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate by the
Mayor and the City Attorney.

Res. 2019-31, Approving Fourth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2




Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2019-31 was duly adopted at a regular meeting of said
City Council held on June 12, 2019 by the following vote:

Name Counted toward Quorum | Not Counted toward Quorum
Aye | No | Abstain Present, Recused Absent

Joanne del Rosario, Mayor v~

John Irish Goodwin o

Diana Colvin /

Helen Fisicaro v

Rae Gonzalez V-

Voting Tally K\ o

Dated (/7///7’ %ﬂ')«/u? et Z‘Lﬂ/‘/ﬁ/b

J‘a/)/a/nne F. del Rosario, Mayor

Attest: Mﬁ)j

Caitlin Corley, City Clerk  ©

Res. 2019-31, Approving Fourth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2



Attachment D

THIRD AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

This Third Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a
municipal corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Kirk Stratton ("Employee”), who
are sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Third
Amendment. For reference purposes, this Third Amendment is dated November 1, 2017.

1. . Recitals. This Third Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On October 8, 2014, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment
Contract (“Contract”) for Employee to serve as Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to
November 12, 2015, the date when salary negotiations began and the performance
review was completed (“First Amendment”).

(o) On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to
December 14, 2016 when salary negotiations and the performance review by the City
Manager occurred. :

(d) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Third Amendment to
further increase Employee’s base salary.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION
CONTAINED IN THIS THIRD AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS: '

1. Subsection (a) of Section 3, “Salary” of the Contract is hereby modified as
follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $193,072 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be paid at
the same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid-to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town. '

~— T N

Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2
25977.00100\30334264.1




Execution. In Witness thereof, the partiés hereto have signed this Third Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Third Amendment, along with the First and Second

Amendment and the Contract, constitutes the entire Agreement between the Parties.

—

Sl 20

Dated ' Z. /z | [/’

Dated: P/ 13

Kirk Stratton, Employee

TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By \Z@w/wﬁ v Ce-"

RaqueI\Fz. Gonzalez, Mayor R

Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton

25977.00100\30334264.1

Page 2 of 2



RESOLUTION NO. 2017-65
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING THIRD AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(a) On October 8, 2014, the City Council entered into an Employment Contract with Kirk
Stratton to serve as the Town’s Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to November 12,
2015, the date when salary negotiations began and the performance review was completed.

(©) On May 10, 2017, the City Council approved the Second Amendment to the Employment
Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to December 14, 2016 when
salary negotiations and the performance review by the City Manager occurred.

(d)  The City Council now seeks to further amend the Chief of Police’s contract to increase
his base salary, subject to approval of a Third Amendment to the Employment Contract. Such
increase shall be retroactive to November 1, 2017, when salary negotiations began.

2. Order

(a) The Third Amendment to the Employment Contract between the Town of Colma and
Kirk Stratton, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by
the City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b)  The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Third Amendment on

behalf of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate
by the Mayor and the City Attorney.

/1
/1
/1
//
/1
//
1/
//

Res. 2017-65, Approving Third Amend to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 2
(Adopted 12/13/17)



Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2017-65 was duly adopted at a regular meeting of
said City Council held on December 13, 2017 by the following vote:

Name Counted toward Quorum | Not Counted toward Quorum

Aye No Abstain | Present, Recused | Absent

Raquel “Rae” Gonzalez, Mayor X

Joanne del Rosario X

John Irish Goodwin

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

XXX

Voting Tally

Dated a./14/18 K_O&/\QL%(JUW

Raquel “RU Gonzalez, Mayor

Attest: ( M M

Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Res. 2017-65, Approving Third Amend to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2
(Adopted 12/13/17)



Attachment E

SECOND AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

This Second Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a
municipal corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Kirk Stratton ("Employee”), who
are sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Second
Amendment. For reference purposes, this Second Amendment is dated May 10, 2017.

1. Recitals. This Second Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On October 8, 2014, Employer and Employee entered intc an Employment
Contract ("Contract”) for Employee to serve as Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to
November 12, 2015, the date when salary negotiations began and the performance
review was completed (“First Amendment”).

(c} Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Second Amendment to
further increase Employee’s base salary. Such increase shall be retroactive to December
14, 2016, when salary negotiations began.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION
CONTAINED IN THIS FIRST AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS:

1. Subsection (a) of Section 3, "Salary” of the Contract is hereby modified as
follows:

(a) Safary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $185,645.76 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be paid at
the same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town.

Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Second Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Second Amendment, along with the First Amendment
and the Contract constitutes the entire Agreement between the Parties.

Dated :{—f/, Pl /g 2 L N —
Kirk Stratton, Employee

<. P
Dated: V//Z 21177 TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

Iy
By gme,izﬂ& ﬁ/ﬂf <t A
Helen Fisicaro, Mayor

Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1of 1
25977.00120\29755294.1







RESOLUTION NO. 2017-24
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING SECOND AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

The City Councii of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(a) On October 8, 2014, the City Council entered into an Employment Contract with Kirk
Stratton to serve as the Town’s Chief of Police.

(b) On February 10, 2016, the City Council approved the First Amendment to the
Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton to increase his base salary retroactive to November 12,
2015, the date when salary negotiations began and the performance review was completed.

(c) The City Council now seeks to further amend the Chief of Police’s contract to increase
his base salary, subject to approval of a Second Amendment to the Employment Contract. Such
increase shall be retroactive to December 14, 2016, when salary negotiations began.

2. Order

(a) The Second Amendment to the Employment Contract between the Town of Colma and
Kirk Stratton, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by
the City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b) The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Second Amendment on

behalf of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate
by the Mayor and the City Attorney.

/il
i
Jil
1
111
i
1
1
1

Res, 2017-24, Approving Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stration Page 1 of 2
25977.00120\29755322.1




Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2017-24 was duly adopted at a regular meeting of
said City Council held on May 10, 2017 by the following vote:

Name Counted toward Quorum | Not Counted toward Quorum

Aye | No | Abstain | Present, Recused Absent

Helen Fisicaro, Mayor

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne del Rosario

Diana Colvin

John Irish Goodwin

U X (X [ X X [ X

Voting Tally

/ - e |
Dated & /; 7 / /7 /i@_fl_.gfmu_ % {8 AD

Helen Fisicaro, Mayor

Attest: %EQ?QQJX

Caitlin Corley, City Clerk &

Res. 2017-24, Approving Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 2 of 2
25977.001200\29755322.1



Attachment F

FIRST AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

This First Amendment is made and entered into by and hetween the Town of Colma, a
municipal corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Kirk Stratton ("Employee”), who
are sometimes individually referred to as a "Party” and collectively as "Parties" in this First
Amendment. For reference purposes, this First Amendment is dated November 12, 2015.

1. Recitals. This First Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On October 8, 2014, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment
Contract ("Contract”) for Employee to serve as Chief of Police.

(b)  The Employer and Employee now seek to amend the Contract to increase the
Employee’s base salary, retroactive to November 12, 2015.

(c) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this First Amendment to
increase Employee’s base salary.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION
CONTAINED IN THIS FIRST AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS:

1. Subsection (a) of Section 3, “Salary” of the Contract is hereby modified as
follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $178,500.00 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be paid at
the same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town.

Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this First Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this First Amendment and the Contract constitutes the entire
Agreement between the Parties.

Dated _ 2. /2.¢ (g(F N N

Kirk Stratton, Employee

Dated: .%2’75//9 TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By

Diana Colvin, Mayor

First Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 1




RESOLUTION NO. 2016-06
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING FIRST AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH KIRK STRATTON

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(a) On October 8, 2014, the City Council entered into an employment contract with Kirk
Stratton to serve as the Town's Chief of Police.

(b) The City Council now seeks to amend the Chief of Police’s contract to increase his base
salary, subject to approval of an amendment to the employment contract.

2. Order

(a) The First Amendment to the employment contract between the Town of Colma and Kirk
Stratton, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by the
City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b)  The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this First Amendment on behaif
of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate by the
Mayor and the City Attorney.

Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2016-06 was duly adopted at a regular meeting of said
City Council held on February 10, 2016 by the following vote:

Name Counted toward Quorum | Not Counted toward Quorum

Aye | No | Abstain Present, Recused Absent

Diana Colvin, Mayor

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joseph Silva

Joanne del Rosario

Ut | x| X x| X[ X

Voting Tally 0

vated_ X4/ o 0f
Diana Colvin, Mayor
Attest: MQQ%“

Caitiin Corley, City Clerk U/

Res. 2016-06, Approving First Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton Page 1 of 1
25977.00100\24482172.1



Attachment G

EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT BETWEEN THE TOWN OF COLMA
AND CHIEF OF POLICE KIRK STRATTON

This contract is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, State of California, a
municipal corporation, hereinafter called Employer and Kirk Stratton, Employee.

RECITALS
1. Purpose.
This contract is made because:

(a) Employer desires to secure and retain the services of Employee as Chief of Police, as
provided by the Municipal Code of the Town of Colma and by the laws of the State of California,
to provide inducement for Employee to remain in such employment; and to assure Employee S
“morale and peace of mind with respect to future security;

(b) Employee desires to serve as Chief of Police of the Town of Colma; and

© Employee will become an at-will employee and the parties desire to provide a just means
for terminating Employee’s services.

2. Duties

(@) The Town shall employ Employee on a full-time basis, on a work schedule determined by
the City Manager. Employee's duties shall be those generally found in the job description for this
position, state law, the Town’s Municipal Code and policies, and other duties as assigned by the
City Manager. These duties may be modifi ed in the future by the Town Manager (or designee)
or Town Council.

(b) Employee shall faithfully, diligently, and to the best of Employee's abilities perform all
duties that may be required under this Agreement. Employee agrees that Employee has a duty
of loyalty and a general fiduciary duty to the Town. Employee shall devote the whole of
Employee's working time, skill, experience, knowledge, ability, labor, energy, attention and best
effort exclusively to the Town's business and affairs. Absent prior written consent from the
Town, so long as Employee is employed with the Town, Employee shall not engage in activities
that would unreasonably interfere with the performance of Employee s duties or compete with
the Town's business.

(© Employee shall not engage in any employment, activity, service, or other enterprise, for
compensation or otherwise, which is actually or potentially in conflict with, inimical to, or
interferes with the performance of the duties required under this Agreement.

(d) Employee is expected to devote necessary time outside normal office hours to the
business of the Town and, to that end, Employee shall be allowed flexibility in setting his own
office hours when reasonably necessary to accommodate such activities.

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton Page 1 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4



3. Salary

(a) Beginning with the first pay period following execution of this contract, Employer shall
pay Employee a salary of $170,000.00 per year, or such greater salary or benefits as may be
hereinafter authorized by the City Council. The salary shall be paid at the same time and manner
as salaries are paid for police officers of the Town of Colma.

(b) Employee understands and acknowledges that Employee is obligated to pay, out of his
salary, the Employee’s share of contributions to CalPERS and the Employee’s share of
contributions due under the Federal Insurance Contributions Act (FICA), Federal Unemployment
Act (FUTA) and State Unemployment Insurance Act (SUI). Employee authorizes Employer to
withhold from Employee’s salary the amount of these contributions.

(d) Employer shall not, at any time during this Contract, reduce the salary, compensation or
other financial benefits of Employee except to the degree of such reduction across the board for
most employees of Employer.

4, Benefits

Employee shall receive the benefits as are provided for peace officers by the Colma Municipal
Code, the Colma Administrative Code, and the Memorandum of Understanding between the
Town of Colma and the Colma Peace Officers’ Association, except that:

(@ Vacation. Employee shall accrue five weeks per year, accrued monthly beginning upon
commencement of employment. Only two weeks of accrued vacation may be carried forward to
the next year.

(b) Management Leave. Management leave shall be credited to Employee in advance in a
prorated amount as of the effective date of this contract and in the full amount on January 1 of
each calendar year hereafter. Employer shall grant Employee ten (10) days management leave
per year, less the Employee’s management leave balance at close of business on December 31,
if any. Management leave shall be earned and accrued on January 1 of each year only. If
Employee has a management leave balance at close of business on December 31, that balance
shall be carried over to January 1, and the number of days of management leave that will be
granted to Employee will be fifteen days less the balance carried over from December 31 to
January 1.

(© Use of Police Car. Employer shall provide a police car to Employee for his sole and
exclusive use for travel while on duty, travel between his residence and the Town, and for any
work-related travel. Employee is permitted and encouraged to take the police car home so that
Employee can travel to and from the Town in the event of an emergency. The Town police car
shall be fueled, insured and maintained at the Town's expense.

(d) Bond. Employer shall pay the cost of any employment bonds required for Employee by
Employer.

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton Page 2 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4



(e) Uniform Allowance. 1f Employee wears a police uniform on a regular basis, Employee
shall receive the same uniform allowance as is given to police sergeants.

5. Expenses -

The Employer shall pay all reasonable and necessary business expenses of the Employee,
including subscriptions, dues and membership fees and similar expenses to local, state and
national professional associations. Payment or reimbursement of reasonable travel, lodging and
meals incurred in connection with such participation is subject to approval by the City Manager
either through approval of the expense as a budget item or specific approval of a particular
event.

6. Term

(@  The term of the employment under this Contract shall continue until either party gives
written notice of termination as provided below. Employer has delegated the power to terminate
this Contract to the City Manager, and Employee understands and acknowledges the same.

(b) No one other than the City Council can enter into a Contract for employment for a
specified period of time or make any contract contrary to the policy of at-will employment.
Further, any such contract must be in writing and approved by the City Council at a public
meeting duly held in accordance with law.

(o) Employee agrees to remain in the exclusive employ of Employer until termination of
employment upon written notice thereof as hereinafter provided. Notwithstanding the foregoing,
nothing herein shall prohibit Employee from engaging in consulting for government agencies,
occasional teaching or writing on Employee’s time off.

(d) On reasonable notice to the City Manager, Employee may, and is encouraged, to attend
conferences and professional development meetings and conventions, as a part of his duties,
provided that the subject matter is related to Employee’s duties and that attendance does not
unduly interfere with performance of his regular duties.

7. Termination by Employee

(a) Subject to the limitation hereinafter set forth in this section, the Employee may resign at
any time from the Employee’s position with Employer upon giving the City Manager at least
thirty (30) days’ notice in writing of Employee’s intention to resign, stating the reasons therefor.

(b) During the 30-day period after giving notice of termination, Employee may not take any
time off for vacation, management leave, accumulated sick leave, or any other similar reduction
of working time, without the express consent of the City Manager.

8. Termination by Employer

(a) Employee may be terminated at any time on written notice by City Manager (or in his or
her absence, the acting City Manager), with or without cause, subject to the restrictions set forth

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton Page 3 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4




in this section and subject to the requirements of Government Code 3304(c) as it may, from
time to time, be amended.

(b) Within three calendar (3) days after delivery to Employee of notice of termination,
Employee may, by written notification to the City Manager, request an administrative appeal
meeting with the City Manager. Thereafter, the City Manager shall fix a time and place for the
meeting, within thirty (30) days of such written request by Employee, at which Employee shall
appear and be heard, with or without counsel. The meeting shall be informal, and shall not
involve the taking of testimony. The Parties expressly agree that this meeting satisfies
Government Code section 3304(c)), and that the purpose of the meeting is to allow Employee to
present to the City Manager Employee’s grounds of opposition to his removal and/or to present
any “name-clearing” information he wishes to provide. . However, the City Manager shall have
the sole and absolute discretion to terminate, and its action shall be final and shall not depend
upon any particular showing or degree of proof at the hearing. .

9. Severance Pay

(a) If Employee’s employment is terminated by Employer without cause, then the Employer
shall pay Employee a lump sum cash payment equal to six months’ salary. Monthly salary for the
purpose of this paragraph shall be the average monthly salary of Employee paid by Employer
during the twelve months prior to notice of termination excluding the value of any benefits.

(b) Notwithstanding any provision of this Contract to the contrary, in the event Employee is
terminated for cause, or Employee voluntarily resigns or retires, then in that event Employer
shall have no obligation to pay the severance pay designated in this paragraph. Termination for
cause means that the termination of Employee is the result of Employee’s gross mismanagement
or Employee’s commission of an act of moral turpitude. In such an instance, Employee's sole
remedy shall be a judicial action in declaratory relief to determine whether there was substantial
evidence of gross mismanagement and/or an act or acts of moral turpitude. If the court
determines there was not substantial evidence, Employee shall receive the severance pay
provided in this subsection, but no other damages.

(© Eligibility for the severance payment described in this Agreement is expressly conditioned
upon Employee’s execution of (i) a waiver and release of any and all of Employee’s claims
against the Town, its officers, directors, and employees, and (ii) a covenant not to sue the
Town, its officers, directors, and employees. All normal payroll taxes and withholdings as
required by law shall be made with respect to any amounts paid under this section. The
Severance Payment and leave cash-out shall be paid by Town in one lump sum, less applicable
deductions, within ten (10) business days of the effective date of Employee’s waiver and
release/covenant not to sue.

10. Reviews

The City Manager shall will meet with Employee within ninety days of the start of Employee’s
employment, and annually thereafter, to evaluate his performance, discuss performance
expectations and other objectives, and make a recommendation regarding a possible increase in

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton : Page 4 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4



his compensation. This paragraph is directory, not mandatory, and failure to provide a
performance evaluation shall not be considered a breach of this contract.

ii. Residence

Employee must at all times maintain his residence within twenty-five miles of City Hall.

12. Personnel Policies and Procedures Manual

(a) Except as explicitly provided to the contrary in this Contract, all provisions of the Town of
Colma Personnel Policies in effect from time to time will be applicable to the Chief of Police.

(b) Employer may take disciplinary action relating to Employee without following the
procedures set forth in the Colma Personnel Policies for imposing discipline upon regular
employees who are not at-will employees.

13. Notice

Any notice required or permitted to be given under this Contract shall be sufficient if in writing
and if sent by registered mail or certified mail to Employee’s residence in the case of the
Employee, or to the City Attorney or to the City Manager in the case of the Employer.

i4. Waiver of Terms

A waiver of any of the terms and conditions hereof shall not be construed as a general waiver by
Employer, and the Employer shall be free to reinstate such part or clause.

15. Applicable Law

This Contract shall be governed by and shall be construed in accordance with the laws of the
State of California. :

16. Disputes

In the event of a controversy or claim arising out of this Contract which cannot be settled by the
parties herein or their legal representatives, it shall be settled by arbitratiocn in accordance with
the rules of the American Arbitration Association, and judgment upon the award may be entered

in any court having jurisdiction. The prevailing party shall be entitled to its reasonable attorney’s
fees and costs.

17. Entire Contract

This instrument contains the entire contract of the parties. It may not be changed orally but
only by a contract in writing signed by the party (and, with respect to Employer, approved by the
City Council) against whom enforcement of any waiver, change, modification, extension or
discharge is sought.

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton Page 5 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4



18. Knowing and Voluntary Execution

Employee acknowledges that Employee has not relied on the Town's legal counsel or the Town's
officers or directors to provide counseling regarding the meaning or legal impact of the
provisions of this Agreement. Employee acknowledges that the Employee has been given a
reasonable opportunity to have this Agreement reviewed by an attorney of Employee's choice.
Employee further acknowledges that the Employee's execution of this Agreement has not been
obtained by any duress, undue influence, coercion or oppressive act(s) by the Town. Finally, the
parties-fully acknowledge that they each thoroughly and carefully read this Agreement,
understand it, and willingly and voluntarily execute this Agreement.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Town of Colma has caused this Contract to be signed and executed
on its behalf by the City Manager, and Employee has signed and executed this Contract, both in
duplicate, on the respective dates written below.

Dated /Od% é}% o TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

/. 7¢/ .
By Mm L2l A 4D

Helen Fisicaro, Mayor

Dated'i y’/‘z u[/f“g

Kirk Stratton (Employee)

Employment Contract with Chief of Police Stratton Page 6 of 6
25977.17002\9319405.4



Item #10

STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor and Members of the City Council

FROM: Christopher J. Diaz, City Attorney

MEETING DATE: December 11, 2019

SUBJECT: Third Amendment to Employment Contract for City Manager

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the City Council adopt the following resolution:

RESOLUTION APPROVING THIRD AMENDMENT TO EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH
BRIAN DOSSEY

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Pursuant to salary negotiations that took place in May of this year, the City Council and City
Manager have discussed and agreed to a contract modification to the existing employment
agreement to address an increase in base salary. As provided for in the third amendment to the
employment agreement, the base salary will increase from roughly $219,014.27 to $223,394.55.
This represents a two (2) percent salary increase consistent with the approved MOU's for Police
and Communications/Records employee groups as well as unrepresented employees who will
receive the same two (2) percent salary increase.

FISCAL IMPACT

The City Council’'s adoption of the resolution and execution of the Third Amendment will cause a
slight financial impact on the Town based on the payment of a higher salary to the City Manager.
This increase has been factored into the 2019/20 budget.

BACKGROUND

On December 18, 2017, the City Council entered into an employment contract with Brian Dossey
to serve as the Town’s City Manager. On July 25, 2018, the City Council entered into a First
Amendment to the employment contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager. On
May 22, 2019, the City Council entered into a Second Amendment to the employment contract to
increase the base salary of the City Manager. The City Council is now seeking to amend the City
Manager’s employment contract a third time to increase his base salary.

Staff Report Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 2



ANALYSIS

Under the terms of the Third Amendment, which modifies section 4(a) “Salary and Benefits” of
the City Manager’'s employment contract, the City Manager’s salary will increase from the current
$219,014.27 per year to $223,394.55 per year, a total increase of $4,380.23.

This change in salary is consistent with the approved MOU's for Police and
Communications/Records employee groups as well as unrepresented employees. As approved
for the represented and unrepresented employees, the City Manager is receiving a two (2) percent
salary increase on December 29, 2019.

All other terms and conditions of the employment contract would remain unchanged.

Values

Approval of the Third Amendment to the City Manager's employment contract is a responsible
action because the Council has already directed this modification to the contract and this
amendment will formalize that direction.

Alternatives

The City Council could choose not to adopt the resolution and choose not to execute the Third
Amendment to the City Manager's employment contract. Doing so is hot recommended as the
City Council has already directed this modification to the contract as a result of contract
negotiations.

CONCLUSION

The City Council should adopt the resolution approving the Third Amendment to the employment
contract with Mr. Dossey.

ATTACHMENTS

A Resolution

B. Third Amendment

C. Second Amendment

D First Amendment

E Original Employment Contract

Staff Report Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 2 of 2



Attachment A

RESOLUTION NO. 2019-XX
Of the City Council of the Town of Colma

RESOLUTION APPROVING THIRD AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(a) On December 18, 2018, the City Council entered into an employment contract with Brian
Dossey to serve as the Town'’s City Manager.

(b) On July 25, 2018, the City Council entered into a First Amendment to the employment
contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager.

© On May 22, 2019, the City Council entered into a Second Amendment to the
employment contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager.

(d) The City Council now seeks to amend the City Manager’s contract to address an increase
in his base salary by 2%, subject to approval of an amendment to the employment contract.
Such increase shall be effective December 29, 2019 consistent with the 2% increase in the
approved MOU'’s for Police and Communications/Records employee groups as well as for the
unrepresented employees.

2. Order

(a) The Third Amendment to the employment contract between the Town of Colma and
Brian Dossey, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by
the City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b) The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Third Amendment on
behalf of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate
by the Mayor and the City Attorney.

//
//
/1
//
//
//

//

Res. 2019- , Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 2



Certification of Adoption

| certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2019-XX was duly adopted at a regular meeting of
said City Council held on December 11, 2019 by the following vote:

Name Voting Present, Not Voting Absent

Aye No | Abstain Not Participating

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

Raquel Gonzalez

Joanne F. del Rosario

Voting Tally

Dated

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Attest:
Caitlin Corley, City Clerk

Res. 2019- , Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 2 of 2



Attachment B

THIRD AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

This Third Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a municipal
corporation and general law city (“Employer”), and Brian Dossey (“Employee”), who are
sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Third
Amendment. For reference purposes, this Third Amendment is dated December 29, 2019.

1. Recitals. This Third Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On December 18, 2017, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment
Contract (“Contract”) for Employee to serve as City Manager.

(b) On July 25, 2018, the City Council entered into a First Amendment to the
employment contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager.

© On May 22, 2019, the City Council entered into a Second Amendment to the
employment contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager.

(d) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Third Amendment to increase
Employee’s base salary by 2%. Such increase shall take effect on December 29, 2019
consistent with the 2% increase in the approved MOU's for Police and
Communications/Records employee groups as well as for the unrepresented employees.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATIONS
CONTAINED IN THIS THIRD AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS:

2. Subsection (a) of Section 4, “Salary and Benefits,” of the Contract is hereby
modified as follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $223,394.55 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be subject
to all appropriate deductions and withholdings, and which shall be paid at the same time
and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous Employees of the
Town.

/

/

Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 2



Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Third Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Third Amendment and the Contract constitutes the entire
Agreement between the Parties.

Dated:

Brian Dossey, Employee

Dated: TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By

John Irish Goodwin, Mayor

Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 2 of 2



Attachment C

SECOND AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

This Second Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a municipal
corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Brian Dossey (“Employee”), who are sometimes
individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this Second Amendment. For
reference purposes, this Second Amendment is dated May 22, 2019.

Recitals.
This Second Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On December 18, 2017, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment Contract
("Contract”) for Employee to serve as City Manager.

(b) On July 25, 2018, the City Council entered into a First Amendment to the employment
contract to increase the base salary of the City Manager.

(©) The Employer and Employee now seek to further amend the Contract to increase the
Employee’s base salary pursuant to a performance review and salary negotiations that extend
back to May 22, 2019.

(d) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this Second Amendment to increase
Employee’s base salary.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION CONTAINED IN
THIS SECOND AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

1. Subsection (a) of Section 4, “Salary and Benefits,” of the Contract is hereby
modified as follows:

(@) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $219,014.27 per year, or such greater
amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be subject to all
appropriate deductions and withholdings, and which shall be paid at the same time and in the
same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous Employees of the Town.

Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Second Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this Second Amendment, the First Amendment, and the Contract
constitutes the entire Agreement between the Parties.

Dated: 4/5/ /7 W

Brian Dossey, Employee

Dated: (/5// v TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By: %“’M?MA(M

Jdénne F. del Rosario, Mayor

Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 1
25977.00100\32095770.1



RESOLUTION NO. 2019-32
OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF COLMA

RESOLUTION APPROVING SECOND AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

The City Council of the Town of Colma does hereby resolve as follows:
1. Background

(a) On December 18, 2017, the City Council entered into an employment contract with Brian
Dossey to serve as the Town’s City Manager.

(b)  On July 25, 2018, the City Council entered into a First Amendment to the employment
contract to increase the base salary provided to the City Manager.

(c) The City Council now seeks to further amend the City Manager’s contract to address an
increase in his base salary, subject to approval of a Second Amendment to the employment
contract. Such increase in salary shall be retroactive to May 22, 2019, when salary negotiations
began.

2. Order

(a) The Second Amendment to the employment contract between the Town of Colma and
Brian Dossey, a copy of which is on file with the City Clerk, shall be and hereby is approved by
the City Council of the Town of Colma.

(b)  The Mayor shall be, and hereby is, authorized to execute this Second Amendment on
behalf of the Town of Colma, with such technical amendments as may be deemed appropriate
by the Mayor and the City Attorney. :

/1
/1
/1
//
/1
/1
//
/1
/1

Res. 2019-32, Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 2
25977.00100\32095750.1




Certification of Adoption

I certify that the foregoing Resolution No. 2019-32 was duly adopted at a regular meeting of
said City Council held on June 12, 2019 by the following vote:

Name

Voting

Present, Not Voting

Absent

Aye

No | Abstain Not Participating

Joanne F. del Rosario, Mayor

John Irish Goodwin

Diana Colvin

Helen Fisicaro

NN

Raquel Gonzalez

Voting Tally

O

Dated /(/Z / v

Brvsene T et Wrsacere

ﬁoanne F. del Rosario, Mayor

Attest: ﬂ W@&\-

aitlin Corley, City Clerk

/

Res. 2019-32, Second Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey
25977.00100\32095750.1

Page 2 of 2






Attachment D

FIRST AMENDMENT TO
EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

This First Amendment is made and entered into by and between the Town of Colma, a
municipal corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Brian Dossey (“Employee™), who
are sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as "Parties" in this First
Amendment. For reference purposes, this First Amendment is dated July 11, 2018.

Recitals.
This First Amendment is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) On December 18, 2017, Employer and Employee entered into an Employment
Contract ("Contract”) for Employee to serve as City Manager.

(b)  The Employer and Employee now seek to amend the Contract to increase the
Employee’s base salary pursuant to a performance review and salary negotiations that
occurred on July 11, 2018.

(©) Employer and Employee now desire to enter into this First Amendment to
increase Employee’s base salary.

NOW, THEREFORE, BASED ON THE MUTUAL PROMISES AND CONSIDERATION
CONTAINED IN THIS FIRST AMENDMENT AND THE CONTRACT, THE PARTIES HEREBY AGREE
AS FOLLOWS:

1. . Subsection (a) of Section 4, “Salary and Benefits,” of the Contract is hereby
modified as follows:

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $199,508.40 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be
subject to all appropriate deductions and withholdings, and which shall be paid at the
same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town.

S~ YN NN N

First Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 2
25977.00120\31309462.1




Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this First Amendment on the
respective dates shown below and this First Amendment and the Contract constitutes the entire
Agreement between the Parties.

Dated: 7{/&&///’/ W

Brian Dossey, Employee

Dated: -’/ 2z CO/I % TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

By \\/&4{'\\;«—\\3\ (JA\LL)&«\
Raquel \Gonzalez Mayor \

First Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 2 of 2
25977.00120\31309462.1



Attachment E

EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT WITH BRIAN DOSSEY

This Employment Contract (“Contract”) is made and entered into by and between the Town of
Colma, a municipal corporation and general law city ("Employer”), and Brian Dossey
("Employee”), who are sometimes individually referred to as a "Party" and collectively as
"Parties” in this Contract. For reference purposes, this Contract is effective December 18, 2017.

1. Recitals. This Contract is made with reference to the following facts:

(a) Employer desires to employ the services of Employee as City Manager, as
provided by the Municipal Code of the Town of Colma and by the laws of the State of
California; and

(b) Employee desires to serve as City Manager of the Town of Colma on the terms
and conditions set forth herein.

2. Employment and Duties

(a) Beginning December 18, 2017, Employer.shall employ Employee as City Manager
on the terms and conditions set forth herein, and Employee shall serve in said
employment on these terms and conditions. Employment under this Contract shall
continue until either party gives notice of termination as provided below.

(b) Employee shall perform the functions and duties of a City Manager, as specified
in the laws of the State of California and the ordinances and resolutions of the Town of
Colma. Employee shall also perform such other legally permissible and proper duties and
functions as the City Council shall, from time to time, assign.

(c) Employee is expected to devote necessary time, within and outside normal
business hours, to the business of the Town and to fulfill the duties of the City Manager,
and Employee shall be allowed flexibility in setting his own office hours to accommodate
such activities.

(d) Employee has a duty of loyalty and a general fiduciary duty to the Town.
Employee shall devote the whole of Employee’s working time, skill, experience,
knowledge, ability, labor, energy, attention and best effort exclusively to the Town’s
business and affairs. Employee shall remain in the exclusive employ of Employer until
termination of employment as hereinafter provided

(e) Employee shall not engage in any employment, activity, consulting service, or
other enterprise, for compensation or otherwise, which is actually or potentially in
conflict with or which interferes with the performance of Employee’s duties to the Town.
Further, Employee shall not, during the term of this Agreement, engage in any activity
which is or may become a conflict of interest, prohibited contract, or which may create
an incompatibility of office under California law. Employee WI” complete annual
disclosure forms required by law.

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 1 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4




(f) On reasonable notice to the City Council, Employee may, and is encouraged, to
attend conferences, professional development meetings and conventions as a part of his
duties, provided that the subject matter is related to Employee’s duties and that
attendance does not unduly interfere with performance of his regular duties.

(g)  The City Manager shall be subject to and shall comply with the standards of
conduct and ethical principles set forth in the Town's ordinances and resolutions, and
with the ICMA Code of Ethics, a copy of which is attached as Exhibit A.

3, City Council Commitments

(a) Annual Strategic Plan Workshops. The City Council recognizes that to meet the
challenges facing the Town, it must exercise decisive policy leadership. As one step in
carrying out this leadership responsibility, the City Council commits to spending time

- each year outside of regular City Council meetings to work with the City Manager and
staff on creating and revisiting the City's strategic plan, setting goals and priorities for the
City government, and working on issues that may be inhibiting the maximum achievement
of the Town's goals. Each year, between January 1 and March 31, the City Council and
the City Manager shall meet at an Annual Strategic Plan Workshop to review the City's
existing Strategic Plan, review and establish goals and priorities for the City Manager to
implement prior to the City Manager's annual performance evaluation or such other
dates as determined in the course of the meeting, and to establish a relative priority
among those goals and objectives within the Strategic Plan.

(b) Performance Evaluations. Beginning in 2018, the City Council shall meet with the
Employee during the month of May to conduct an initial performance evaluation and
consider a potential salary increase. The City Council shall meet with the Employee each
May thereafter to evaluate his performance, discuss performance expectations and other
objectives, and consider an increase in his base salary. The annual performance review
and evaluation shall be in accordance with specific criteria developed jointly by the City
Council and the City Manager during the strategic planning and goal setting workshops.
Such criteria may: from time to time be added to or deleted as the City Council
determines in consultation with the City Manager.

(©) Standards of Conduct and Ethics. Neither the City Council nor any of its members
will give the City Manager any order, direction, or request that would require the City
Manager to violate the ICMA Code of Ethics or the City Council Protocols set forth in the
Colma Administrative Code, subchapter 1.02, as amended from time to time.

4, Salary and Benefits

(a) Salary. Employer shall pay Employee a salary of $190,008.00 per year, or such
greater amount as may hereafter be approved by the City Council, which shall be
subject to all appropriate deductions and withholdings, and which shall be paid at the
same time and in the same manner as salaries are usually paid to Miscellaneous
Employees of the Town.

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 2 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4



(b) Deductions. CalPERS Contribution and Employment Taxes. Employee shall be
responsible for, and shall pay by deduction from Employee's pay check, Employee’s
contributions to the California Public Employees’ Retirement System (Cal PERS) and all
employment taxes to be paid by law by Employee including, but not limited to, the
Federal Insurance Contributions Act (FICA), the Federal Unemployment Act (FUTA), and
the State Unemployment Insurance Act (SUI).

(©) No Reduction. Employer shall not, at any time during this Contract, reduce the
salary, compensation or other financial benefits of Employee except to the degree of
such reduction across the board for all employees of Employer who are classified as
“Local Miscellaneous Members" of the California Public Employees Retirement System.

(d) Catch-all. Except as specifically provided herein, Employee shall be entitled to
receive all benefits of employment generally available to Employer's other executive and
managerial employees when and as he becomes eligible for them.

(e) Management leave. Employee will accrue management leave in accordance with
the Town’s Personnel Policies and Procedures Manual. Under this Contract, Employee
will be credited with ten (10) days on January 1, 2018, and annually thereafter.

6) Bonds. Employer shall pay the cost of any employment bonds required for
Employee by Employer.

(9 Reservation of Rights. Employer reserves the right to modify, suspend or
discontinue any and all benefit plans, policies, and practices at any time without notice
to or recourse by Employee, so long as such action is taken generally across the board
for all employees of Employer.

(h)  Auto Allowance. Employer shall provide Employee an auto allowance of $300 per
month for traveling to meetings, events, conferences and workshops.

5. Expenses and Allowances

(a) Expense Policies. Town shall pay for or provide the City Manager reimbursement
for all actual business expenses consistent with Government Code section 53234 et
seq., also known as "AB 1234" and subchapter 3.07 of the Colma Administrative Code.

(b) Professional Development. Employer shall pay for subscriptions, dues and
membership fees and similar expenses to local, state and national professional
associations and the International City Manager's Association (ICMA). Payment or
reimbursement of reasonable travel, lodging and meals incurred in connection with
attendance at professional meetings is subject to an annual limit of $3,000.00, or such
higher amount as may be approval by the City Council either through approval of the
expense as a budget item or specific approval of a particular event.

() Technology. Employer shall, at Employer’s expense, provide Employee with a
Town-paid cell phone and laptop and associated phone and data plans.

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 3 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4



6. Personnel Policies and Procedures Manual

(a) Except as explicitly provided to the contrary in this Contract, all provisions of the
Town of Colma Personnel Policies and Procedures Manual in effect from time to time will
be applicable to the City Manager. ' "

(b) Employer may take disciplinary action relating to Employee without following the
procedures set forth in the Colma Personnel Policies and Procedures Manual for
imposing discipline. Nothing herein is intended to authorize any disciplinary action that
would change Employee’s status as an exempt employee under federal or state
employment laws or as an at-will employee.

7. City Treasurer

(a) Employer may also appoint Employee as City Treasurer of the Town to perform
the functions and duties specified in the Municipal Code of the Town of Colma and to
perform other legally permissible and proper duties and functions as the City Council
shall, from time to time, assign. There shall be no additional compensation for services
as City Treasurer.

(b) Notwithstanding any other provision in this Contract, Employer may terminate
Employee as City Treasurer at any time, and Employee shall not be entitled to any
severance pay upon such termination.

8. At-will Employment; Termination by Employer; Severance Pay

(a) At-will. Notwithstanding any Town ordinance, resolution, or policy, this
employment is “at-will,” which may be terminated by either party, with or without
notice, and with or without cause, except as expressly provided in this Contract.
Employee understands and agrees that Employee has no constitutionally protected
property or other interest in Employee’s employment as City Manager. Employee
understands and agrees that Employee works at the pleasure of the Council, and that
Employee may be terminated, or asked to resign, at any time, with or without cause.

(b) Termination for Cause. Employer may terminate this Contract at any time for
cause. No severance shall be paid in the event of termination for cause.

0 For purposes of this Contract, “cause” shall mean willful commission of a
material act of dishonesty; willful disclosure of confidential information without
prior authorization by the City Council; commission of an act punishable as a
felony under California law; the habitual or willful neglect of duties, commission
of a material act of moral turpitude; the Town has a reasonable good faith belief
that Employee has engaged in theft, embezzlement, fraud, or any other material
act of dishonesty in matters affecting the Town, the inability to fully perform the
essential duties of this contract due to drug or alcohol abuse; repeated and
extended unexcused absences from the City Manager's office and duties; or a

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 4 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4




willful and serious violation of the Town's Standards of Conduct, as set forth in
subchapter 3.03 of the Colma Administrative Code.

(i) Employer must give written notice of its intent to terminate for cause.
The Town shall provide thirty (30) days’ advance notice. Within three calendar
(3) days after delivery to Employee of such notice of termination for cause,
Employee may, by written notification to the City Council, request a name-
clearing hearing before the City Council. Thereafter, the City Council shall fix a
time for the hearing, which shall be held at the usual meeting place, and should
be held within thirty (30) days of receipt of the written request from Employee,
at which Employee shall appear and be heard, with or without counsel. The
meeting shall be informal, and shall not involve the taking of testimony. The
Parties agree that the purpose of this hearing is to allow Employee to present
any “name-clearing” information he wishes to provide. The City Council has the
sole and absolute discretion to terminate, and its action shall be final and binding
and shall not depend upon any particular showing or degree of proof at the
hearing.

(c) Severance Pay. If the City Council terminates Employee’s employment without
cause or requests the Employee’s resignation, the Town shall pay Employee, on the
effective date of termination, a lump sum cash payment equal to the Employee's base
salary for six months, and shall pay COBRA premiums for medical and dental insurance
for six months or until Employee becomes re-employed, whichever occurs first. The
Employee’s base salary shall be determined without regard to the value of any benefits
provided to Employee.

9. Termination by Employee

(a) Notice. Subject to the limitation hereinafter set forth in this section, the
Employee may resign at any time from the Employee’s position with Employer upon
giving the City Council at least thirty (30) days’ notice in writing of Employee’s intention
to resign. No severance shall be paid in the event of Employee’s voluntary resignation or
retirement.

(b) Not in May. Notwithstanding the foregoing, Employee agrees that voluntary
resignation shall not take effect during the month of May, unless the City Council
expressly agrees thereto. The purpose of this restriction is to minimize disruption to
year-end budget planning.

(c) No Personal Leave. During the 30-day period after giving notice of termination,
Employee agrees not to take any vacation leave or management leave without the
express consent of the City Council. Employee further agrees, during said period, to
assist in transition of duties to the new City Manager as may be directed by the City
Council.

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 5 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4




(d) No Other Restrictions. Nothing in this Contract shall prevent, limit, or otherwise
interfere with the right of the Employee to resign at any time from such position with
Employer, subject only to the provisions set forth in this Contract. '

10. Notice

Any notice required or permitted to be given under this Contract shall be sufficient if in writing
and if sent by first class mail, postage prepaid, to Employee’s residence in the case of the
Employee, or to the City Attorney or to the Mayor in the case of the Employer.

11. Waiver of Terms

A waiver of any of the terms and conditions hereof shall not be construed as a general waiver
by Employer, and the Employer shall be free to reinstate such part or clause.

12. Applicable Law

This Contract shall be governed by and shall be construed in accordance with the laws of the
State of California.

13. Disputes

Any dispute that arises under or relates to this Contract (whether contract, tort, or both) shall
be resolved in a court of competent jurisdiction located in San Mateo County. If an action is
commenced by either party in connection with this Contract the prevailing party shall be entitled
to an award of reasonable attorneys' fees

14. Investigation and Advice

Employee acknowledges that he has fully and independently apprized himself of the facts prior
to entering into this contract and that he has been given a reasonable opportunity to consult
with an attorney of his own choosing. Employee acknowledges that he has not received legal
advice from the City Attorney and is not relying on any statements or representations of the
City Attorney.

15. Entire Contract
This instrument supersedes all prior contracts between the parties and contains the entire
contract of the parties. It may not be changed orally but only by an amendment in writing

signed by the party (and, with respect to Employer, approved by the City Council) against
whom enforcement of any waiver, change, modification, extension or discharge is sought.

/
/
/

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 6 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4




Execution. In Witness thereof, the parties hereto have signed this Contract on the respectlve
dates shown below.

Dated /7%/@{}/7 /Z / attl

Brian Dossey, Employee

Dated: 2/{// 7 TOWN OF COLMA (Employer)

, e
By /L/@/yt. %4 /LA

Helen Fisicaro, Mayor

Employment Contract with Brian Dossey Page 7 of 7
25977.00100\30316713.4 :






	12.11.19 Regular Meeting Agenda
	1. Minutes - Regular Meeting 11.26.19
	2. Minites - Special Meeting 12.03.19
	3. Report of Checks Paid - November 2019
	4. Building Codes
	A. Ordinance
	ARTICLE 1.  FINDINGS, PURPOSE AND AUTHORITY
	ARTICLE 3.  SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 1 - GENERAL
	Division 1: General
	5.04.010   Application.
	5.04.020  Conflicts with Other Laws, Rules, etc.
	5.04.030 Titles.
	The term, “Colma Building Codes,” means the collection of laws and regulations described in this subchapter, while the term, “Colma Building Code,” refers to the particular code adopted by section 5.04.050 of this subchapter.
	5.04.040 [Reserved].


	ARTICLE 4.  SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 2 – COLMA BUILDING CODES
	Division 2: Colma Building Codes
	5.04.050 Colma Building Code Adopted
	5.04.060 Administration of Colma Building Code
	5.04.070 Colma Residential Code Adopted
	5.04.080 Administration of Colma Residential Code
	5.04.090 Colma Electrical Code
	5.04.100 Colma Mechanical Code
	5.04.110 Colma Plumbing Code
	5.04.120 Colma Energy Conservation Code
	5.04.130 Colma Historical Building Code
	5.04.140 Colma Fire Prevention Code
	5.04.150 Colma Existing Building Code
	5.04.160 Colma Green Building Standards Code
	5.04.200 Interpretation
	5.04.210  Codes Available to the Public


	ARTICLE 5.  SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 3 – HOURS OF CONSTRUCTION
	Division 3: Hours of Construction
	5.04.220 Standard Hours of Construction
	5.04.230 Accessibility and Pedestrian Access During Construction


	ARTICLE 6. SUBCHAPTER 5.04, DIVISION 4 – ENFORCEMENT
	Division 4: Enforcement
	5.04.240  Enforcement Responsibilities
	5.04.250 Violation and Penalties


	ARTICLE 6. FILING OF ORDINANCE
	ARTICLE 7. LIABILITY
	ARTICLE 8. SEVERABILITY
	ARTICLE 9. CEQA COMPLIANCE
	ARTICLE 10. PUBLICATION
	ARTICLE 11. EFFECTIVE DATE


	5. Community Playgrounds Inc.  - Completion of Sterling Park Playgrounds
	A. Resolution
	B. Notice of Completion 

	6. Wild Bird and Wild Animal Feeding Ordinance
	A. Ordinance

	7. Council Committee Assignments 2020
	A. Council Committee Assignments 2020 Worksheet

	8. Council of Cities and City Selection Committee
	A. List of Vacancies
	B. Proxy Designee Form

	9. Fifth Amendment to Employment Contract with Kirk Stratton
	A. Resolution - Stratton Amendment
	B. 5th Amendment
	C. 4th Amendment
	D. 3rd Amendment
	E. 2nd Amendment
	F. 1st Amendment
	G. Original Employment Contract

	10. Third Amendment to Employment Contract with Brian Dossey
	A. Resolution
	B. Third Amendment
	C. Second Amendment
	D. First Amendment
	E. Original Employment Contract


