TOWN OF DANVERS, MA

MONDAY, JUNE 22, 2020

DUCTILE IRON PIPE AND FITTINGS
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DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923

BID NUMBER: 2020-35 DATE: May 26, 2020

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN ;
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN

STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE 18, 2020. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAIVE ANY

TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS:
ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW.

DUCTILE IRON PIPES AND FITTINGS

* & % % % * p] FASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER * * * * * *

TERMS: 30 DAYS BIDDER: /3 Prefeod | o,
ADDRESS: fhi /7 Mon
/f’i’lfkﬂf%w, A Db

BY: ,%;’ Vit /2/

TITLE: D VR g ‘%4‘-}4‘4& ‘5‘; 27

PHONE: __ 418~77777%§




géf”;} Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
h Tel: 878-777-6001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:
1. Bid Price Form: All price proposals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this hid
2. All inclusive Bid: Ali costs to deliver the product are to be inciuded in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for

contract duration.
3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as

directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered. |
4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30
PM

BID PRICE FORM : Ductile lron Pipe & Fittings iFB # 2020-35

No. | Ttem Description Type | Size| | EstiUse | UnitPrice | Tofal Price
1. | Pipe, Ductile Push On Class52 | 6 240 o | Gaos —
2. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 8" 240 Jy. 5T $930,—
3. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 1 200 30, — o, ~
4. | Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 127 20’ o, 00, 7
5, Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 16" 200 59 - Hbor
5. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 18" 20 PR W SV,
7. Pipe, Ductite Push On Class 52 20" 20 728, ST
8. MJ Solid Sleeve Ductite Class 350 6" 2 y P fya, —
9. MJ Solid Sleeve Ductile Class 350 8" 2 fHoe ™ 2, —
10. | MJ Solid Sleeve Ductile Class 350 12" 2 iltgé, - 250, —
11. | MJ x MJ Reducers Class 350 8" x 6" 2 M.~ Jire. ~
12. | MJ Bend Ductile 11.25 degree Class 350 8" 2 gm —- by, —
13, | MJ'Bend Ductile, 22.5 degree Class 350 a8" 2 g‘/&_ — P
14. | MJ Bend Ductile 45 degree Class 350 8" 2 % - 173
15. | MdJ Bend Ductile 90 degree Class 350 8" 2 Hg .~ 3 IV
16. | MJ Bend Duciile 11.25 degree Class 350 6" 2 Lo~ 12y =~
17. | MJ Bend Ductile, 22.5 degree Class 350 G" 2 La, - 12—
18. | MJ Bend Ductile 45 degree Class 350 8" 2 - 2, ~
+9. | MJ Bend Ductile 90 degree Ciass 350 g” 2 o, ~ fbo, ™
20, | MJ Tee Ductile Class 350 8" x 8" 2 (U~ 3o~
29, | MJ Tee Ductile Class 350 12" % 8" 2 D, o
22 | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 6" 2 Jiv. Don, ™
23, | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 g8” 2 g Yo
24, | Hydrant (Anchor) Tee Ductile MJ Class 350 8" x 6" 2 £y - T
25 | End Cap Ductile MJ Class 350 5" 2 77~ o —
26. | End Cap Ductile MJ Class 350 a" 2 By - J oo, —
27 %fSWedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec 6 4 37, - fa, —
08 %‘:SWedge Action Restraining Gland See Spec 8 4 gy~ /’?_,g‘ B
g, x}JSWedge Action Resiraining Gland | See Spec 10 2 Yo, = Jer o~
30. | MJ Wedge Action Restraining Gland See Spec 12" 2 Gy, /B9 —

IFB #2020-35  Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 6 of 10



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

Kits
31 Bolted Compression Restrained Joint | See Spec 6" Ll —
Coupling e
Bolte i ined Joint | See Spec g ~
32, COUPﬁﬂ%ompress;on Restrained p. | 2, —
No. | ltemDescription Type |  Size ~ Total'Price
33. | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 8" YEon —
34. | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 8” (6o, <
35. | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 107 I
36. | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 12" B Ghy, - 5o~
37. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 6" 24 S0 - VENT Y
38. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 8" 24 T Foa.
39. | GripRing wf Accessary Packs GripRing 10" 4 qa .~ 39¢ ~
40. | GripRing wf Accessary Packs GripRing 12" 4 Jay - YO,

Section 8. Method of Award: B

® A contrack(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsible hidder(s)
submitting the lowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as needed basis contract.

¢ If there is a successful bid, the Town's plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.

/4: e {0 g

Signature of the person@‘ﬁhorized to m%fe this Bid Date
. .

.»C;CA/E’_;, {as. L aal RYIErS /Zfé’!"*’é«“ﬁ/'ﬁ
Title & printed name of the person authorized to make this Bid

IFB # 2020-35  Ductile lron Pipe & Fittings Last Revision 5/19/28 Page 7 of 10




Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: §78-777-0001 ox 3002 Fax: $78-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION
The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitied in good faith and without
collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in thig certification, the word "person” shall mean any natural person, business,
partnership, corporation, union, commiftee, club or other organization, entity or group of individuals.

Bid Form “A”

Bidder: Fot Prefoolt Ta. Address: i M Aaein H. s
i ,
Authorized Signature >, S :’\7 Title: /{’ftkj«c{éc’{uq Aab L)
Tealephone F19-11 ?-—K] 135 Fax 7Y -7 ?‘r"’;ﬁ?
Bid Form “8” TAX COMPLIANCE

IF A CORPORATION:
State in which Incorporated

MQM

President S e /’er, B i
Treasurer I d f’.v:i-r /«M!‘k
Secretary Aecbler (a2 1L ton

If a foreign (out of State) corparation - are you registered {o do business in Massachusetts? YES W NO

. if you are selected for

this work, you are reguired under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State, Foreign Corp. Section,

State House, Boston, a certificate to the awarding authority prior to award.

IF A PARTNERSHIP (Name Ail Parthers):

Name Address City StatelZip
iF AN INDIVIDUAL.
Name Address City State/Zip
IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:
Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip
Name of Individual Address City State/Zin

ATTESTATION CLAUSE

Pursuant fo MGL ¢ 82C sec 49A. | cerlify under penalties of perjury that [, to my best knowledge and belief, have filed all state tax returns

and paid all state taxes required by law.

Social Security No. Or Federal identification No

frioiM L

Signature or Individual or Corporate Name

7 /'_’;f(’ff?“r 2 ﬁ(’f?’aﬁ/’,ﬁf‘_w.
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IFB #2020-35 Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 8 of 10



DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS (1923

BID NUMBER: 2026-35 DATE: May 26, 2420

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN
STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE, 18, 2026. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAIVE ANY
TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS
ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW.

DUCTILE IRON PIPES AND FITTINGS

F ok * PLEASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER # * # # * %

TERMS: 30 DAYS RIDDER: F-W.Webb Company Waterworks

[hvision
ADDRESS: 869 Eastern Ave

{

Malden Ma, 9% 148 o~

TITLE: COQO

PHONE: 781 322-1238




Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01823

BiD FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:

Tel: §78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1028 jsmith@danversma.gov

1. Bid Price Form: All price proposals shall be submitied in the format and on the form provided for in this bid
2. Al inclusive Bid: All costs 1o deliver the product are fo be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for

coniract duration.

3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.
4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30

PM
g!E);PRICE FORM : Ductile bron Pipe & Fittings IFB # 2020.35
‘Na. | - ftem'Description” | Type . Size - Est.-Use | ‘Unit'Price. | TotalPrice |

1. | Pipe, Ductiie Push On Class 52 6 4T $16.580 $3879.72
2. | Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 8’ 240" $23390 $5473718
3. | Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 15 20° $30.650 $551.70
4 Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 12" 20 $38.600 $694.80
5. Pipe, Ductiie Push On Class &2 18" 2¢ $55.860 $1005.48
6. Pipe, Ductite Push On Class 52 18" 20 $64.260 $1156.68
7. Pipe, Ductile Push On Ciass 52 20" 20 $73.350 $1320.30
8. MJ Solid Siesve Duclile Class 350 6" 2 $52.610 $105.22
9. MJ Sclid Sieeve Ductile Class 350 8 2 $85.180 $170.36
10, i MJ Solic Sleeve Ductile Class 350 12" 2 $137.070 $274.14
11§ MJ x MJ Reducers Class 350 8" %8 2 $49.030 $O9R.06
12, | MJ Bend Ductiie 11.25 degree . Class 350 8" 2 $60.840 5172168
13 | MJ Bend Ductite, 22.5 degree Class 350 g 2 $66.930 $133.86
14, | MJ Bend Ductiie 45 degree Class 350 8" 2 $68.720 513744
15, | MJ Bend Ductile 80 degree Class 350 g" 2 $84 110 316822
16. | MJ Bend Ductite 11.25 degree Class 350 6" 2 $44.740 33748
17. | MJ Bend Ductile, 22.5 degree Class 350 g" 2 $42.950 $85.90
18. | MJ Bend Ductile 45 degree Class 350 6" 2 $47.240 $94.48
1g. | Md Bend Ductile 90 dagree Class 350 6" 2 $57.980 $115.96
20, | Wd Tee Ductile Class 350 | 8" x 8" 2 $125250 | $250.52
21. | MJ Tee Ductile Class 350 12" x 8 2 $195,050 $390.10
22. | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 8" 2 $113.000  {$226.00
23, | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 8 2 $163.880 $327.76
24, | Hydrant (Ancher) Tee Ductile MJ Class 350 8" x 8" 2 $120.610 $241.22
25 | End Cap Ductile MJ Class 353 6" 2 $23.620 $47.24
26. | End Cap Ductile MJ Class 350 8" 2 $38.650 $77.30
97, i\litifsWedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec 6" 4 $129.40 $517.60
g %fSWedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec 8" 4 $178.72 $714.88
29, MJ Wedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec 10" 2 h

Kits $127.54 $255.08
30. | MJ Wedge Action Restraining Gland See Spec 12" 2 $169.82 $339.64

IFB # 2028-35  Ductile Eron Pipe & Fittings

Last Revision

S5/19/26

Page 6 of 10



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Strest, Danvers, MA. 01823
Tel: 978.777-0001 ox 3002 Fax: 9787771025 jsmith@danversma,gov

Kitg
a1 ggiﬁ;ﬁn%ompression Restrained Joint | See Spec 6" 2 \ﬂ 25’3’; 2% jﬁ‘?’&f#’
mpression Restrained Joint | See Spac 8" 2 ;e
| B e p _ {6y
Ne. CltemDescription < LoF D Type i Size . Est Use _ Sl Total Price
33, | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 8" 20 f /?%(073 it %Cﬁj Yo
34. | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 8" 20 i 223, }@ i 44/@5‘66
35, | Bolied Compression Couplings See Spec 19" 5] jf Z{f% o & f}ZZ‘ Lo
36. { Bolted Compression Couplings Sae Spec 127 & @f 3% ¢y j 2032.2%
37. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing g" 24 /L; DB A8 BiP
38. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing g _ 24 ‘ /L/ 5 B D A0 BiD
35, | GrigRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 107 4 A/I 4 Bl D ASS By 7
40. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 12" 4 A f OB D /Uﬁ By 7]

Section 8. Method of Award:

* A contract(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsible bidder(s}
submitting the lowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as needed basis coniract.

¢ Ifthere is a successful bid, the Town's plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.

Signature of the persﬁm authorized to make this Bid Date
COO, Robert Mutciarone
Title & printed name of the person authorized to make this Bid

iFB # 2020-35  Ductile Iron Fipe & Fittings Last Revision 5/19/20 Page 7 of 16



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: B78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1028 jsmith@danversma.gov

Bid Form “A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned cerifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in geod faith and without
collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this cedification, the word “"person’ shali mean any natural person, business,
parinership, corporation, union, commitiee, club or other organization, entity or group of individuals.

aeidrase: 009 Eastern Ave Malden Ma, 02148

Title: m @

Bidder. W, ‘a.‘.- 24 117

Authorized Stgnature ) - :,;

Teisphons 781 322-1238 f’ Fax 781 322-0739
Bid Form “B” TAX COMPLIANCE
iF A CORPORATION:
State in which incorporated
President
Treasurer
Secratary
if a foreign (out of State) corporation - are you registeraed to do business in Massachusets? YES NO . If you are selected for

this work, you are required under Massachusetis General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a cerfificate fo the awarding authority prior 1o award,

iF A PARTNERSHIP (Name All Partners);
Name Address City StatelZip

iF AN INDIVIDUAL:
MName Address Clty State/dip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

MName of Fiemn Business Address Gity : Statel/Zip
Name of Individual Address Gy State/7in
ATTESTATION CLAUSE

Pursuant to MGL ¢ 62C sec 48A. | certify under penaities of perjury that 1, to my best knowladge and belief, have filed all state tax returns
and paid al! state taxes retuired by law,

Social Becurity No. Or Federal ldentification No Signature or Individual or Corporate Name
04-1952890 F.W.Webb Company Waterworks Division

iFB # 2020-35  Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings L.ast Revision 5/19/28 Page 8§ of 10



T

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:

Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: §78-777-1025 |smith@danversma.gov

1. Bid Price Form: All price proposals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid
2. All inclusive Bid: All costs to deliver the product are to be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for

contract duration.

3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.
4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30

PM
BID PRICE FORM : Buctile lron Pipe & Fittings IFB # 2020-35
No. [ -Item Description - ~Type -} 'Size |  Est.Use Unit Price | Total Price
1. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 8" 240’ No Bid No Bid
2. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 8” 240’ No Bid No Bid
3. Pipe, Ductile Push Cn Class 52 10" 20 No Bid No Bid
4. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 12" 20 No Bid No Bid
5. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 16" 20 No Bid No Bid
6. | Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 18 20 No Bid No Big
7. Pipe, Ductile Push On Class 52 20" 20 No Bid No Bid
8. MJ Solid Sleeve Ductile Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
9. i MJ Solid Sleeve Ductile Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
10. | MJ Solid Sieeve Ductile Class 350 12" 2 No Bid No Bid
11. | MJ x MJ Reducers Class 350 8" x 6" 2 No Bid No Bid
12. | MJ Bend Ductile 11.25 degree Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
13, | MJ Bend Ductile, 22.5 degree Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
14. | MJ Bend Ductile 45 degree Ciass 350 g" 2 No Bid No Bid
15. | MJ Bend Ductile 80 degree Class 350 g 2 No Bid No Bid
16. | MJ Bend Ductile 11.25 degree Class 350 g 2 No Bid No Bid
17. | MJ Bend Ductile, 22.5 degree Ciass 350 g’ 2 No Bid No Bid
18. | MJ Bend Ductile 45 degree Class 350 6" 2 No Bid No Bid
19. | MJ Bend Ductile 80 degree Class 350 6" 2 ‘No Bid 'No Bid
20. | MJ Tee Ductile Class 350 8" xg" 2 No Bid No Bid
21, | MJ Tee Ductile Class 350 12" x 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
22. | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 &’ 2 No Bid No Bid
23 | Foster Adaptor Kits Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
24. | Hydrant {Anchor) Tee Ductile MJ Class 350 8" x6" 2 No Bid No Bid
25. | End Cap Ductile MJ Class 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
26. | End Cap Ductie MJ Ciass 350 8" 2 No Bid No Bid
27 M_J Wedge Action Restraining Gland See Spec 6" 4 ‘ -
"~ | Kits No Bid No Bid
28, M.E Wedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec g 4 '
Kits No Bid No Bid
20, &/ﬁi‘:s\/vedge Action Restraining Gland | See Spec 10 2 No Bid No Bid
30, | MJ Wedge Action Restraining Giand | See Spec 12" 2 No Bid No Bid

IFB #2020-35 Daectile Iror Pipe & Fittings

ELast Revision 5/19/2¢

Page 6 of 1¢



Quoting Smith Blair 421 series.

Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Syivan Street, Danvers, MA, 01323
Tel: §78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1028 jsmith@danversma.gov

Kits

Bolted Compression Restrained Joint | See Spec 8’ 2 ) .
31| Goupiing No Bid No Bid
3p | Bolted Compression Restrained Joint | See Spec g 2 ]

" | Coupling No Bid No Bid
No. | . item Description - Type | Size Est. Use - Unit Price | Total Price
33. | Boited Compression Couplings See Spec 8" 20 $206.53 each| $4.130.60
34, | Botted Compression Couplings See Spec g" 20 $233.85 eacH $4,677.80
35, | Bolted Compression Couplings See Spec 10" g $323.85 each| $1,943.10
36. | Bolted Comgpression Couplings See Spec 12" 6 $432.78 each| $2.595.74
37. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 8" 24 No Bid No Bid
38. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 8" 24 No Bid No Bid
39. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 10" 4 No Bid No Bid
40. | GripRing w/ Accessary Packs GripRing 12" 4 No Bid No Bid

Section 8.

Method of Award:

¢ A coniraci(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsible bidder(s)
submitling the iowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as needed basis confract,
* [fthereis a successful bid, the Town's plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.

W Pod D 1L

8ignature of the person authgfized to make this Bid
President

Martin Mazzella

6/5/2020
' Date

Titie & printed name of the person authorized to make this Bid

IFB #2020-35

Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings

Last Revision 5/19/28

Page 7 of 16



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hali, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA, 01923
Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

I

Bid Form “A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penaity of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in good faith and without
collusicn or fraud with any other person. As used in this ceriification, the word “person” shali mean any natura! person, business,
partnership, corporation, union, committee, club or cther organization, entity or group of individuals.

Bidder: Ti- SALES Inc Address: 36 Hudson Road Sudbury, MA.01776
Auythorized Signature M """" Titie: President
Telephone 800-225-4616 Fax 978-443-7600

Bid Form “8" TAX COMPLIANCE

IF A CORPORATION:
State in which incorporated
President
Treasurer
Secretary
If & foreign (out of State) corporation - are you registered to do business in Massachuselts? YES __ NO . If you are selected for
this work, you are required under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, fo obtain from the Secretary of State, Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a certificate to the awarding authority prior to award.,

IF A PARTNERSHIP (Name All Partners):
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL.:
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip
Name of Individual Address  City State/Zip
ATTESTATION CLAUSE

Pursuant to MGL ¢ 62C sec 49A. | certify under penaliies of perjury that |, to my best knowledge and befief, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required by law.

Social Security No. Or Federal ldentification No Signature or individual or Corporate Name

04-2374082 Ti- SALES Inc

Corparate Officer (if Applicable

IFB #2020-35  Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings Last Revision 5/19/26 Page 8 of 10




