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Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Streef, Danvers, MA. 01923
_Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3062 Fax: §78-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:

1. Bid Price Form: All price proposals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid

2. All inclusive Bid: All costs {o deliver the product are 1o be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for
contract duration.
3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.
4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30

PM
BID PRICE FORM : Vaives Hydrants & lron Products IFB# 2020-36
No. | -ltem Description Type .. ‘Size - Est. Use Unit Price | Total Price -
1 247 x 47 DI Hinged Manhole Frame & Rexus 24" x 4" 2 $ ) $ )
' Cover Labeled Sewer No Bid No Bid
5 24" x 4" Bl Hinged Manhoie Frame & Pamrex 24" x 4" 2 .
Cover Labeled Sewsr No Bid No Bid
3. igbgl:d I\gzar;crnie Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 4 8 NG Bid No Rid
4 Egbzlgcf l’\gz\‘nvr;cﬁle Frame & Cover See Spec 28" %6 24 No Bid No Bid
5 Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 8" 4 $576.69 $2,307.16
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 8" 4 $917.86 1 3$3,671.44
7. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 10" 1 $1,430.99 | $1,430.99
8 Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 12" 1 $1.810.63 | $1,810.63
9. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 14" 1 $5.800.40 | $5.800.40
410. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 16" 1 No Bid No Bid
11. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 18" 1 No Bid No Rid
12. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 20" 1 No Bid No Bid
13, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B84B § $127.50 $765.00
14, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B62B 8 $160.00 $960.00
15, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B50B 8 No Bid No Bid
16. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Mueller 250 A-423 4 $148.50 $564 .00
17. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Kennedy K-81-A 2 $138.00 $276.00
418, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B & 1 $267.14 $267.14
19. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit Be2B 12 1 $315.54 $315.54
20. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit BG62B 18” 1 $357.03 $357.03
24. | FHydrant Top Extension Kit Bazp 24" 1 $407.94 $407.94
22. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 8" 1 $325.60 | $325.60
23. | Hydrani Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 127 1 $383.43 |3%383.43
24. .| Hydrant Top Extension Kif 250 A-423 18" 1 $434.34 $434.34
25, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 24" 1 $490.29 $490.29
26. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 g 1 $201.66 $201.66
27 | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 12" 1 $332.51 $332.51
28. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 18 1 $380.91 $380.01
29. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 247 1 $422.40 $422.40
30, Musiler Super Centuripn 250 A-423 250 A-423 | 587 bury 4 _ )
hydrant-yellow: open right No Bid No Bid
34 Darling (A.F.Cl.) B-62-B hydrant - B-62-B | &-6" bury 4
yellow; open right

No Bid

No Bid

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Preducts

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 7 of 11



Town of banvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Syivan Street, Danvers, MA. 01623
Tel: §78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

s emDescrintion - Mode! | Size Est.Use | UnitPrice | TotalPrice .
39 Ken'nedy K-81_-D hydrant with . K-81-D 5'-8" bury 4 ) ‘
Baltimore Drain — yellow; open right No Bid No Bid
3| complets sepwoover | Seeseee Soa * | NoBid | NoBig
34 Top Flangz_e Vaive Box Top & Belled See Spec 5 bury 24 ) )
Base Section complete set w/ cover No Bid No Bid
35. | Slide Extensions Pionger | 4.5"x12 6 No Bid No Bid
36, | Slide Extensions Pioneer 55"x 12" 6 No Bid No Bid
37. | Box Top Fiange Slide Extension 5.5x12" 24 No Bid No Bid
38. | Service Box Risar 2.5 x12” 12 No Bid No Bid
390. | Service Box Extensions (Slide) 25" %28 [ No Bid No Bid
40, | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 8" X 16" 2 $102.99 ea | $205.98
41. | 88 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8" X 16" 2 $125.31 ea | $250.62
42. | S8 Repair Clamp (single secfion) See Spec | 10" X 187 1 $161.36 ea | $161.36
43. | 88 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X 18" 1 $19149 ea | $19149
44. | S8 Repair Clamp (singie section) See Spec | 6" X 125" 10 $93.55ea | $935.50
45. | SS Repair Clamp (single section} See Spec | 8" X 12.5 10 $100.00 ea | $1,090.00
46. | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 10" X 12.57 1 3139.04 ea | $139.04
47. | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X12.5” 1 $168.35ea | $168.35
48, S$ Tapped_%” CC Repair Clamp 8" x12.5" 1
{singie section)12” $130.24 e | $130.24
49, 8$ Tappedj " CC Repair Clamp 8" X 12.5" 2 :
{single section) 12" $130.24 ea | $260.48
5o, | Resilient Seated Check Valve smﬁ?gmo 4" 2 No Bid No Bid

Quoting Smith Blair 261 Series

Section 8. Method of Award:

* A contract(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsibie bidder(s)
submitiing the fowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as needed basis coniract.

¢ Ifthere is a successful bid, the Town’s plan is fo award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.
A

N T 6/9/2020
Signature of the person authorized to make this Bid- " Date
Louis Schoolcraft il Vice President

Title & printed name of the person authorized to make this Bid

IFB # 20620-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products Last Revision 5/19/20 Page 8 of 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hail, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA, 01823
Tel: 278-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 ismith@danversma.gov

Bid Form "A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in good faith and without
collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any natural person, business,
parthershig, corporation, union, committee, club or other organization, entity or group of individuals,

Bidder: T’f{—mSALES Inc Address: 36 Hudson Road, Sudbury MA. 01776
Ty
Authorized Signature | / ” . Title: Vice President
L/- 13 e ey o i
Telophone 800-225-4616 Fax 978-443-7600
Bid Form “B"” TAX COMPLIANCE
IF A CORPORATION:
State in which Incorporated Massachusetts
President Martin Mazzella
Treasurer Jeff Zammett
Secretary Robert Lash
If a foreign {ouf of State) corporation - are you registered to do business in Massachusetis? YES NO . If you are selected for

this work, you are required under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State, Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a certificate to the awarding authority prior to award.

IF A PARTNERSHIP (Mame Afl Partners):
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AM INDIVIDUAL:
Name Address City Stafe/Zip

iF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip
Name of Individual Address City State/Zip

ATTESTATION CLAUSE
Pursuant to MGL ¢ 62C sec 49A. | certify under penalties of perjury that |, to my best knowiedge and belief, have filed alf state tax returns
and paid all state faxes required by law,

Social Security No. Or Federal Identification No Signature or Individual or Corporate Name
<...¢*"':ﬂ . i -
#r e Sy i
04-2374082 /1=5ales TNC

Corporate Officer (If Applicable)

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products Last Revision 5/19/20 Page S of 11




DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING e
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL A
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923

BID NUMBER: 2020-36 DATE: May 24, 2020

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF N
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN

STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01623 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE 18, 2020. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAJVE ANY -

TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN Ny

ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS

ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW. '
VALVES, HYDRANTS AND IRON PRODUCTS

* % % % % * PLEASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER * * * * * *

TERMS: 30 DAYS BIDDER: /. 7. fefiotl, T .

ADDRESS: /b2 A). AuinJd.

A e pp i
BY: fé A 7 /

TITLE: D,u frsin /ﬂiu,.w.,w/

PHONE: Z73-777-2738




Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:
1. Bid Price Form: All price propesals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid :
2. Al inclusive Bid: All costs to deliver the product are fo be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for:

contract duration.
3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DP'W located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.
4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12 30

PM
BID PRICE FORM : Valves, Hydrants, & Eron Products IFB# 2020-38
No. |- lfem Description Type " Size . “Est.Use | ‘UnitPrice | TotalPrice -
1 24" x 4" DI Hinged Marnhole Frame & Rexus 24“ x4" 2 $ ' ’ % . '
) Cover Labeled Sewer &5 o

9 24" x 4" DI Hinged Manhole Frame & Pamrex 24" x 47 2 3

Cover Labeled Sawer Sto fogo,
3 26" x 4" Manhole Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 47 6 290 — PP

Labeled Sewer 325, Jis
4 igbzigd ng\r"]:;?!e Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 6 24 250 - g{{o -
5. Resilient Seat (Gate Valve open right | See Spec g" 4 o G
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 8" 4 Pl 3
7. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 10" 1 N, — J2do.”
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 12" 1 150, = fSFa,
9, Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 14" 1 5o~ § it
10. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 16" 1 2650, " e
14. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 18" 1 7750 - 3750
12. Butterfly Gate Vaive open right 207 1 brtpan, ~ Yiran,
13. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B84B 8 235 - R
14, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B62B 8 Do, — 3 50, -
15. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B50B 8 Do - F¥ds =
16. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Mueller 250 A-423 4 2 30,7 G 1o, ~
17. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Kennedy K-81-A 2 AL Lo —
18. | Hydrant Top Exiension Kit B62B 6" 1 & oo, — Lf oo,
19, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 12" 1 Lyyo, ~ Loy, =
20. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 18" 1 gy e
24. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 24" 1 Yo, - Jyu -~
22. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 8" 1 oY ooo Lf oo T
23. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 127 1 iy~ s, T
24, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 18" 1 gy ~ L i
25 | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 24" 1 Jae, yIuw,
o6, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 8" 1 L o3, — Loz
27. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 12" 1 Lﬂ'u — sV,
28, Hydrani Top Extension Kit K-81 18" 1 Ly Lrayo —~
29, Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 247 1 {yu, 3530, ~
30, Mueller Super Centuripn 250 A-423 250 A-423 | 567 bury 4 i i o

hydrant-yellow; open right AR
31 ?ea“rg?vg;; ((Jﬁ;%éhBt £2-B hydrant B-62-B | 5'-6" bury 4 |97 e f0.

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydranis, & Iron Products

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 7;bf 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA,
Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

01923

ltem Description: . = ‘Model Size Est.Use . | ‘Unit:Price | Total Price
30 Kennedy K-81-D hydrant with _ K-§1-D 56" bury 4 -
Baltimore Drain — yeilow; open right Mib

33. S;%antg ’;c;;i i}b;t\t{c;r:% slide type See Spec 5 bury 24 2450 08
| s Sota somtco o | | | T e |
35. | Slide Extensions Pioneer 45" x 12" 6 ©p, - S|
36 | Slide Extensions Pioneer 55"x12" B ©Z. 28377
37. | Box Top Flange Slide Extension 55x%x12" 24 L3 pin O
38. | Service Box Riser 25" x12" 12 3. e
39, | Service Box Extensions {Slide) 2.5" x 28 8 o Zos <

- A0. | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 6" X 18" 2 T 30, -
41. | 88 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 8" X 18" 2 SN i,
42 | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 10" X 16" 1 235~ 210"
43, | S5 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 12" X 16" 1 TLiT T Foive
44, | SS Repair Ciamp (single section) See Spec | 6" X 12.5" 10 vy /550,
45, | SS Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8" X 12.5° 10 jga, P an e
46. | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 10" X 12,57 1 Jra, 250, -
47. | S5 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 12" X12.58 1 252, 3es.

Tapped %" CC Repair Clam 7 5" ‘
48. g’)isngiepsectign)‘iz” pair Clamp vx1zs 1 Seo T Feo. T
49. S_S Tappedj” CcC ﬁepair Clamp 8" X 12.5” 2 i“w; o
(single section) 12
50. | Resilient Seated Check Valve Seri2§g100 4" 2 26— | SBeo —
Section 8. Method of Award:

(3

I¥8 # 2020-36 Valves, Hydraunts, & iron Products

A contract(s} for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsible bidder(s)
submitting the lowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successfu
bidder(s) on an as needed basis coniract.
If there is a successful bid, the Town’s plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the [FB due date.

/“‘g e f—"

£~/§-29

Signature of the persoﬁuthorized to make this Bid
Daviron St

[

MF‘?“ ot Comn .

Daie

Titie & printed name of the person authorized to make this Bid

Last Revision 5/19/20¢

Page 8 of 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Direcior, Town Hall, 1 Syivan Street, Danvers, WA, 01523
Tel: §78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

Bid Form “A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in good faith and without
collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any natural person, business,
partnership, corporation, union, commitiee, club or other arganization, entity or group of individuals,

Bidder: Ffé’pfu H _ﬁg Address: fhi M frdnia ,Q’ ,
Authorized Signature ‘/4 ﬂﬂ” Title: /’4'&{1 e '{\S’-\  Aap . Y
T
Telephcne g7 777 77%’7 Fax G728 -4 ~3873
Bid Form “B" TAX COMPLIANCE
IF A CORPORATION: )
State in which Incorporated A ine
President S tra  PO(E O
Treasurer ety Leanlls
Secretary Lefie (o fon e
If a foreign (out of State) corporation - are you registered to do business in Massachusetts? YES _ /" NO . I[f you are seiected for

this work, you are required under Massachusetts General Law Chapler 380, to obtain from the Secretary of State Foreign Corp. Section
State House, Boston, a certificate to the awarding authority prior to award.

iF A PARTNERSHIP {(Name All Partners):
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AN BRNDIVIDUAL:
Name Address City Statel/Zip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City StatelZip
Name of individual Address City StatelZin
ATTESTATION CLAUSE

Pursuant to MGL ¢ 62C sec 49A. | certify under penalties of perjury that |, to my best knowledge and belief, have filed all state tax retumns
and paid ali state taxes required by law.

Social Secuyrity No. Or Federal identification No Signature or individual or Corporate Name

Dozl Lvered F ﬁf«?f%&}ﬁh

Corporate Officer (if Applicable)

/%//«W? [
y 4

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Produets Last Revision 5/19/20 Page ¢ of 11



DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923

BID NUMBER: 2020-36 : DATE: May 24, 2020

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN
STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE 18, 2020. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAIVE ANY
TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN

ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS

ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW.
VALVES, HYDRANTS AND IRON PRODUCTS

* ok &k ko PLEASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER * * ¥ * % *

TERMS: 30 DAYS BIDDER: Mk/es Campamu,:&lc.
ADDRESS: 904, Pleasant Steet

Marwocd; MA 00

BY: g~ ;f;?’?ﬁ/"

TITLE:  fRegident

PHONE: 300 ~Hab - a4,




Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:

1. Bid Price Form: All price proposais shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid

2. All inclusive Bid: Al costs {o deliver the product are to be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for
contract duration.

3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.
4. Delivery Time: Recetving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30

PM
BID PR%CE FORM : Valves Hydrants & Iron Products iIFB# 2020-36
No. | ltem Description L ype: - Size - . Us “Unit Price’ | Total Price:
1 24" x 4" D Hinged E\flanhoEe Frame & Rexus 24 x4 2 $ . 5
~ | Cover Labeled Sewer Ne Pic
9 24" x 4" DI Hinged Manhole Frame & Pamrex 24" x 4" 2
Cover Labeled Sewer T
3 26" x 4" Manhole Frame & Cover See Spec 268" x 4" 8
Labeled Sewer
4 26" x 6" Manhole Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 6" 24
Labeled Sewer
5. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 6" 4
5 Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec g 4
7. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 10" 1
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 12" 1
g, Resilient Seat Gate Valve apenright | See Spec 14" 1
10. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 16" 1
11. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 18" 1
12. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 20" 1
13. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling Ba4B 8
14. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B&2B 6
15. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B50B B
18. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Muelier 250 A-423 4
17. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Kennedy K-81-A 2
48, | HMydrant Top Extension Kit B&2B 6" 1 \
19. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B8R 12" 1 \
20. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 18" 1
21. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B&2B 24" 1
22 i Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 6" 1
23, [ Hydrant Top Exiension Kit 250 A-423 127 1
24, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 18" 1
25 | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 24" 1 ,
26. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 8" 1 f
27. 1 Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 12° 4 ]
28. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 18" 1 /
2g. ;i Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 24" 1
30, Muetier Super Ceﬂturipn 250 A-423 250 A-423 | 5'-6" bury 4
hydrant-yellow; open right
31 Darling {A.F.C.) B-62-B hydrant - B-682-B | 56" bury 4

yellow; open right

EFB # 2020-36  Valves, Hydrants, & Tron Products

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 7 of 11}



- sl Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01823
Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

[ WemDescription = | Wodel [ Se | Est.Use | UnitPrice | Total Price
32 g:};?nfggegf;nawh}gioaxt g;l}tn right o ) No Bid
33 Curb box top & bottom slide type See Spec 5' bury 24
complete set w/ cover
54 Top Flangg Valve Box Top & Beilled See Spec 5 bury 24
Base Section complete set w/ cover
35 | Slide Extensions Picneer 45" x12" B
36. | Slide Extensions Picheer 55"x12" 6
37. | Box Top Flange Siide Extension 55x12" 24
38. | Service Box Riser 25" x 12" 12
39, | Service Box Extensions (Slide) 2.5" x28" 8
40. | S Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 8" X 18" 2 BUs. O 19510
41. | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 8" X 18" 2 8%.04 ECI b.@%
42. | 88 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 10" X 18” 1 NCYe R 15 1373, Pa
43. 1 88 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 12" X 16° 1 ISLY = M
44, | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 6" X 12,5 10 20 Qg 9%, A0
45 | SS Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8" X125 10 25,70 R 60
46, | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 10" X 12,57 1 L5, (é;" “5_(0(1}
47 | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X12.5° 1 ;33}}% 13% Q%
8. (S‘jn;!aepg:iié)fg Repair Clamp 8" x12.5 1 (D6 .Q&Q; 1O -%b
49 (Ss?n;;pgsgi;n)cg Repair Clamp 8" X125 2 106-% | 2 1372
50 | Resilient Seated Check Valve Ser;:ngmO 4” 2 No ‘%; d
Section &, Method of Award:

* A contract(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsihle bidder(s)
submitting the lowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder{s) on an as needed basis contract.

¢ |fthere is a successful bid, the Town’s plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.

o ‘(/_;7
''''' o - {:}';ﬁ-‘; ll&,.-_"d_', . . ;-f,7
P Y 6810
Signature of the persop’authomzed to make this Bid " Date

Andrees ’)\tQW

fesident

Title & printed name™df the person authorized to make this Bid

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 8 of 11



a8 Y Town of BDanvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01823
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

Bid Form “A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in good faith and without
collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this certification, the word "person” shall mean any nafuraf person, business,
partnership, corporation, union, committes, ciub or other organization, entity or group of individuals.

Bidder: Stiles CO«"’\;DQN! Ine.  adaress: 98 Plaasovtt SE Noawond, (MA
T e
Authorized Signature / M/ """""" < Title: Q@%‘Zé&{\%
Tetephone %Cf)"“i Q[g L’(a Fax i "Q(;—%c& PIaIAY
Bid Form “B” TaX COMPLIANCE

IF A CORPORATION:
Siafe in which Incorporated m&%gﬁdﬂ\,ﬁﬁ%\'ﬁ

President Andceew Biainmen
Treasurer Yoy Y-OGmmis T
Secretary
If & foreign {out of Siate) corporation - are you registered to do business in Massachusetts? YES NO . if you are selected for

this work, you are requirad under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a certificaie to the awarding authority prior to award.

IF A PARTNERSHIP (Name All Partners):
Name Address City StatelZip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL.:
Name Address City State/Zin

IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS LINDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip
Name of individual Address City State/Zip

ATTESTATION CLAUSE
Pursuant to MGL. ¢ 62C sec 494, | certify under penaliies of perjury that i, 1o my best knowledge and belief, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxas required by law.

Social Security No. Or Federal identification No Signature or individual or Corporate Name
OY-ATRARRA Stiles Co 0.0k T

Corporate Officer {If Applicable)

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products EL.ast Revision 5/19/20 Page 9 of 11



DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923

BIl NUMBER: 2028-36 BDATE: May 24, 2820

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN
STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE 18, 2020. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAIVE ANY
TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOGSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN

ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS

ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW.
VALVES, HYDRANTS AND IRON PRODUCTS

#o® o #x PLEASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOFE WITH BID NUMBER * # * % & %

TERMS: 30 DAYS RIDDER.: I-W.Webb Company Waterworks

Division
ADDRESS: 869 Eastern Ave

/

TITLE: €00

PHONE: 781 322-1238




Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01823

Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:
1. Bid Price Form: All price proposals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid

2. All inclusive Bid: All costs o delfiver the product are to be inctuded in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for
contract duration.
3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as
directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.

4. Delivery Time: Receiving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 730 AM - 12:30

PM
BID PRICE FORM : Valves Hydrants & Ifon Products IFB# 2020-36
‘Mo, o ftemBescription o ’ “Type “Size Est.Use | ‘UnitPricg | Total Price

1 | 24x4"Di Hinged Manhole Frame & | Rexis 8 x4 2 S0 Bl ]:')‘ ’ %O B0 '

Cover Labeled Sewer -
5 24" % 4" DI Hinged Manhole Frame & Pamrex 24" % 4" 2

Cover Labeled Sewer NO BID NO BID
3 Ezb;:d l'\él:\;;zvi;c:fe Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x4 6 $273.400 $1640.40
4 Lz_zbglgd hg:?vr;le Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x8 24 $283.920 $6814.08
5. | Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spac B" 4 $449.430 | 81797.72
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve opan right | See Spec 8" 4 $715.830 $2863.32
7. Resilient Seat Gate Valve cpen right | See Spec 10" 1 $1116.180 $1116.18
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 12" 1 $1412.390 | $1412.39
0. Resilient Seat Gate Vaive open right | See Spec 14" 1 $4364.500 154364500
10. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 16" 1 $2419.390 .$2419.390
11. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 18" 1 $2903.060 [%$2903.060
12, | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 20" 1 $3447.960 |$3447.96
13. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B&4B 8 $93.950 $563.70
14, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling BS2B B $117.900 $707.40
15. | Repair Ki-Traffic hydrang, Darling B50B 8 $NO BID NO BID

16, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Muelier 250 A-423 4 $106.070 $47478

17. i Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Kennedy K-81-A 2 $183.620 5367.24
18. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B&2B 8" 1 $196.840 319684
19. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B82B 12" 1 $232.510 $232.51
20. | Hydrant Top Extension Ki B&2B 18" 1 $263.070 1%$26307
21, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B&2B 24" 1 $300.590° 1530059
22 | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 8" 1 $232.570 $23257
23. | Hydrani Top Extension Kit 260 A-423 12" 1 $273.880 27388
24. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 18" 1 $310.250 $310.25
25, | Hydrant Top Extension Kii 250 A-423 24" 1 $350.200 £350.20
26, | Hydrant Top Exiension Kit K-81 g 1 $405.930  |$405.93
27. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 12" 1 $474.010 $474.10
28. | Hydrant Top Exiension Kit K-81 18 1 $537.970 $537.97
26, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 24" 1 $620.170  [$620.17
30. Muelter Super Centuripn 250 A-423 250 A-423 | 58" bury 4

hydrant-yellow; open right NOBID NO BID
24 Darling (A.F,Q.) B-82-B hydrant - B-62-B £-6" bury 4 NQOQ BID NO BID

| yellow, open right

EFB # 2020-3¢  Vaives, Hydrants, & lron Products

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page 7 of 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Dir&ctor, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01523

Tel: 978-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 Jjsmith@danversma,gov

; Bize f)iEst Use Unit Brice: | TotalPrice. |
K-81-0 58" bury 4 132 330 g;H 32
32. Baftimore Drain - yaliow; open right 3(/ _71?} W
- Curb box top & bottom slide type Seb Spec 5 bury 24 i ST S%
53 1 complete set wi cover F 00 120§ (S5.5E
Top Flange Valve Box Top & Befled Ses Bpec 5 bury 24 o A
34. | Base Seclion complete sel w/ cover A (12090 ¥ 2690./¢
35 | Slide Extensions Pioneer | 4.5"x 12" 8 o [F.530 0158
36, | Shde Exiensions Plonger | 55" %12 & 27 eSO 4 JU 5 b
37. | Box Top Fiange Slide Exiension 55 %12 24 5 /2 .92.0 37 339/03/
38. | Service Box Riser 25 %12 12 /f/ DBID L AAB D
39. | Service Box Extensions {Slide) 2.8 x 28" ) /i/ N BID 4/ Lo
40, | S5 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec g8" X 18" 2 j] /03,50 % 207 ¢¢
41, | 85 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8 X 16" 2 S tfve 2“}"23;-}/ '
42, | 55 Repalr Clamp (single saction) Ses Spac | 107X 16" 1 [é? JoZ e B gl Fh
43. | 55 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X 16° 1 Ji 173 27n A 93 te
44. | 55 Repair Clamp (single saction) See Spec | 8" X 12.5° 10 4 2 YO <4t !Z?‘i&:@_
45. | 55 Repair Cianyp (single section) See Spec | 8"X12.5" 10 153, 240 81 4 :‘.“’&?2- L
45, | S Repalr Clamp {single section) Bee Spec | 107X 12.5 1 A0 G20 H f 3’{-5'; 2o
47. | S8 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 12"X925° | 1 o 2.0 v20 & LKL
48, S_S Tappedl%" CCi Repair Clamp 8" x 2.5 1 gnhdde 413 j ke
(single section}12 ; .
S5 Tapped 1" CC Repair Clamp "X 12.5" P 5 i F 22 EX
48| (single sestion) 12" ‘5 (31450 -
i ARG X — o Fis "0"'
sn. | Resilient Seated Check Valve e 4 2 ﬁjf :3 m o el |

Section &, Method of Award:

® A contracl(s) for one year from the date of execution will he awardad {o the responsive and responsible bidder(s)
submitling the fowest unit price for each item bid. The ardering of items will be initisted by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as neaded hasis contract.

= Ifthere Is a successful bid, the Town’s plan is o award a contract within 30 days from the IFB dus date.

iz !‘._ ;= S A §
Signature of the pérson auhorized to make this Bid
COO, Robert Mucciargne

Titie & printed name of the person suthorized to make this Bid

I¥B # 2026-36 Valves, Hydrants, & [ron Produets

Last Revision 5/19/20 Page B of 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Svivan Street, Danvers, MA. 01323
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

Bid Form “A" CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or proposal has been made and submitted in good faith and without
colusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this cettification, the word "person” shall mean any natural person, business,
parinership, corporation, union, committee, club gr otherorganization, entity or group of individuals,

Bidder: F.W.Webb C P allrwor i 869 Eastern Ave Malden Ma,02148

- i Tite: {’f En I

Felephone 781322-1238 Fax 781 322-0739

Authorized Signature

Bid Form "B TAX COMPLIANCE

IF A CORPORATION:
State in which incorporated
President
Treasurer
Secretary
If & foreign (out of State) corporation - are you registered to do business in Massachusets? YES NGO . H you are selected for
this work; you are required under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State, Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a certificate to the awartling authority prior to award.

iF A PARTNERSHIP {Name All Partners):
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL:
Name Address City State/Zip

IF AN INDIVIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip
Name of Individual Address City State!/Zip
ATTESTATION CLAUSE

Pursuant {0 MGL ¢ 82C sec 48A. | cerfify under penalties of periury that |, to my best knowledge and belief, have filed all state tax returns
and paid afl state taxes required by law.

Socig! Security No. Or Federal Identification No Signature or Individual or Corporate Name
04-1952890 F.W . Webb Company Waterworks Division

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Produets

Last Revision 5/19/20 Page 9 of 11



DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
TOWN OF DANVERS - TOWN HALL
DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923

BID NUMBER: 2020-36 DATE: May 24, 2020

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS FOR FURNISHING THE TOWN OF
DANVERS WITH THE ITEM(s) LISTED BELOW, ON THIS FORM WILL BE, RECEIVED IN
DUPLICATE AT THE OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING, TOWN HALL, ONE SYLVAN
STREET, DANVERS, MASSACHUSETTS 01923 UNTIL ON THURSDAY, JUNE 18, 2020. THE
TOWN OF DANVERS RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ALL PROPOSALS AND WAIVE ANY
TECHNICALITIES.

BID SURETY: NONE PURCHASING DIRECTOR

PROPOSAL: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER PROPOSES TO FURNISH THE FOLLOWING IN

ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF DANVERS TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS

ATTACHED TO THIS INVITATION AND AT THE PRICES AND TERMS INDICATED BELOW.
VALVES, HYDRANTS AND IRON PRODUCTS

# &%k k% PLEASE MARK OUTSIDE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER # # # # * %

TERMS: 30 DAYS BIDDER: John Hoadley and Sons, Inc

ADDRESS: 6872 Union Street

Rockiand, MA. 02370

BY: DONNA HOADLEY

TITLE: PRESIDENT

PHONE: 781-878-8098




BID FORM USE INSTRUCTIONS:

Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: §78-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax; 978-T77-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

1. Bid Price Form: Ail price proposals shall be submitted in the format and on the form provided for in this bid
2. All inclusive Bid: All costs to deliver the product are to be included in the bid price. Prices must remain firm for
contract duration.

3. Delivery: All products are to be delivered to the DPW located at 95 Hobart St., Danvers, MA 01930 or as

directed inside the Danvers Town Limits within 2 weeks of being ordered.

4. Delivery Time: Recelving Days and Hours: Mon through Thurs, 7:30 AM - 2:30 PM Fri, 7:30 AM - 12:30

PM
BID PRICE FORM _Valves, Hydrants, & iron Products IFB# 2020-36
N
1 24" x 4" DI Hinged Manhole Frame & Rexus 24" x 4 2 $ $ noeD
' Cover Labgled Sewer

5 24" x 4" D Hinged Manhole Frame & Pamrex 24" x 4" 2 0 BID

Cover Labeled Sewer
3 26" x 4" Manhole Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 4" 8 :

Labeled Sawer 29500 1,77000
4 26" x 6" Manhole Frame & Cover See Spec 26" x 6" 24

Labeled Sewer 305.00 7,320.00
5, Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 6" 4 473.00 1892.00
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec g" 4 751.00 3,004.00
7. Resilient Seat Gate Valve openright | See Spec 10" 1 1,473.00 1,173.00
8. Resilient Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 12" 1 1.484.00 1.484.00
g Resiliert Seat Gate Valve open right | See Spec 14" 1 4 585.00 4,585.00
10. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 16" 1 2,925.00 2 625.00
11. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 18" 1 3.282.00 3,282.00
12. | Butterfly Gate Valve open right 20" 1 4.415.00 4.415.00
13. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B84B 8 NO BID
14. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B62B 6 NO BID
15, | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Darling B50B 8 NO BID
16. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Muelier 250 A-423 4 178.00 712.00
17. | Repair Kit-Traffic hydrant, Kennedy K-81-A 2 NO BID
18. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 6" 1 NO BID
19, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 127 1 NO BID
26. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 18" 1 NO RID
21, | Hydrant Top Extension Kit B62B 24" 1 NO BID
22. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 8" 1 427 00 427.00
23. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 12" 1 503.00 503.00
24 | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 18 1 570.00 570.00
25. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit 250 A-423 24 1 640.00 540.00
26. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 8" E NO BID
27. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 12 1 NO BID
28. | Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 18’ 1 NO BID
29, i Hydrant Top Extension Kit K-81 24" 1 NO BID
30, Mueller Super Centuriqn 250 A-423 250 A-423 | 56" bury 4

hydrant-yeliow; open right 1,800.00 7,600.00
31 Darling (A.F.C.} B-62-B hydrant — B-62-B | 5-6" bury 4

NO BID

IFB#2

yellow; apen right

020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products

Last Revision 5/19/28

Page 7 0f 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA.
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 978-T77-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

01923

Size st. Us

5 | Kennedy K-81-D hydrant with K-81-D | 5-6 bury 4

Baltimore Drain — yellow; open right NO BID
33, Curb box top & bottom slide typs See Spec 5 bury 24

complete set w/ caver 71.25 1,710.40
34 Top Fiangg Valve Box Top & Belled See Spec 5 bury 24

Base Section complete set w/ cover 118.00 2,832.00
35. | Slide Extensions Pioneer 4.5"x12" 6 17.52 105.12
36. | Slide Extensions Pioneer 55" x12" B 22 67 136.02
37. | Box Top Flange Slide Extension 55x12" 24 14.42 346.08
38. | Service Box Riser 2.5 x 12 12 15.49 185.88
38, | Service Box Extensions {Slide) 2.5"x 28" 5 17.10 102.60
40, | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec 8" X 18" 2 g98.50 197.00
41. | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8" X 16" 2 117.00 234.00
42. | SS Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 10" X 18" 1 154.00 151.00
43, | 38 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X18" 1 180.00 180.00
44. | 88 Repair Clamp {single section) See Spec | 6" X 12.5 10 87.00 870.00
45 | 88 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 8" X125 10 102.00 1,020.00
46. | S8 Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 10" X 12.5" 1 130.00 130.00
47. | SS Repair Clamp (single section) See Spec | 12" X125 1 158.00 158.00
48, S_S Tapped _%” CC Repair Clamp 8" x12.5" 1

{single section)12” 125.00 125.00
49, SS Tapped 1" CC Repair Clamp 8" X 12.5" 2

(single section) 12" 125.00 250.00
5p | Resilient Seated Check Valve Serifa\'s:gwo 4" 2 NO BID

Section 8. Method of Award:

* A contraci(s) for one year from the date of execution will be awarded to the responsive and responsible bidder{s)
submitting the fowest unit price for each item bid. The ordering of items will be initiated by the Town to the successful
bidder(s) on an as needed basis contract.

® Ifthere is & successful bid, the Town's plan is to award a contract within 30 days from the IFB due date.

iy

6-8-2020

Signature of the person authorized to

Donna Hoadiey, President

rf?é this Bid

Title & printed name of the person autherized to make this Bid

Date

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products

Last Revision 5/19/20

Page8of 11



Town of Danvers, Office of the Purchasing Director, Town Hall, 1 Sylvan Street, Danvers, MA. 01923
Tel: 878-777-0001 ex 3002 Fax: 878-777-1025 jsmith@danversma.gov

Bid Form “A” CERTIFICATE OF NON-COLLUSION

The undersigned certifies under penalty of perjury that this bid or praposal has been made and submitted in good faith and withous
colusion or fraud with any other person, As used in this certification, the word “person” shall mean any natural person, business,
partnership, corperation, union, committee, club or other crganization, entity or group of individuals,

Bidder: John Hoadley and Sons, Ing 672 Union Streat, Rockland, MA. 02370
T 7
Authorized Signature m Q:[!;"{i@ac PRESIDENT
Y
Telephone 781-878-8098 Fax 7R1-B78.-5208
Bid Form “B" TAX COMPLIANCE
IF A CORPORATION:
Stafe in which Incorporated Massachusetis
President Donna Headlsy
Treasurer Michaet Hoadley
Secretary DAVID HOADLEY
If a fareign (out of State) corporation - are you registered o do business in Massachusetts? YES NG . |If you are selected for

this work, you are required under Massachusetts General Law Chapter 38D, to obtain from the Secretary of State, Foreign Corp. Section,
State House, Boston, a certificate to the awarding authority prior to award.

IF A PARTNERSHIP (Name At Partners):
hName Address City StatelZip

IF¥ AN INDIVIDUAL:
Name Address City State/Zip

iIF AN INDRIDUAL DOING BUSINESS UNDER A FIRM NAME:

Name of Firm Business Address City State/Zip '
Mame of Individual Address City StatelZip

ATTESTATION CLALISE
Pursuant to MGL ¢ 82C sec 49A. | certify under penaities of perjury that |, to my best knowledge and belief, have filed all state tax retums
and paid alt state taxes required by law.

Social Security No. Or Federal Identification No Signature or Individual or Corporate Name

04-2854005 JOHN HOADLEY AND SONS, INC

Corporate Officer (If Applicable)

Donna Hoadley, President

IFB # 2020-36 Valves, Hydrants, & Iron Products Last Revision 5/19/20 Page 9 of 11



