

**Hellam Township
Material & Services Bids/2023**

Aggregates:**York Building Products**

	<u>Pick-Up</u>	<u>Delivered</u>
AASHTO # 1	13.00	19.95
AASHTO # 3	13.00	19.95
AASHTO # 57	13.00	19.95
AASHTO # 67	13.00	19.95
AASHTO # 67 Washed	13.00	19.95
AASHTO # 7	14.00	20.95
AASHTO # 8 Washed	17.00	23.95
AASHTO #10	9.00	15.95
AASHTO # 2 Aggregate	8.25	15.20
NCSA R4 Rip Rap	14.00	24.90
NCSA R5 Rip Rap	15.00	26.90
NCSA R6 Rip Rap	16.00	27.90
3A Modified Base Material	9.50	16.45
# 9 or Rice	17.00	23.95
Gabions	14.00	23.45

Paving Material**York Materials Group**

	<u>Pick-Up</u>
9.5 mm Superpave	69.55
12.5 mm Superpave	69.55
19 mm Superpave	62.30
25 mm Superpave	57.90

Paving in Place**Highway Materials**

Total

Range Road: T946

Trout Run Road: T952

	<u>Ton price</u>	<u>Total</u>
1300 tons Scratch and leveling	87.64	\$113,932.00
1825 tons Superpave	87.64	\$159,943.00
850 tons 25mm Base Course	74.99	\$63,741.50

Combined projects total

\$337,616.50

Materials & Services Bid Opening on April 20, 2023

Present:

Representing

Curt Ferree

Hellam Township

Corina Mann

Hellam Township

Dan Russell

Kinsley Construction

Mike Gemmill

York Building Products

Chris Hartman

Construction Masters Services

Josh Packart

Stewart & Tate

Aggregates:

Per ton price

Item:	Kinsley		Vulcan		York Building Products		County Line Quarry	
	Pick-up	Delivered	Pick-Up	Delivered	Pick-Up	Delivered	Pick-Up	Delivered
AASHTO # 1	14.00	22.50	20.00	26.85	13.00	19.95	13.10	18.95
AASHTO # 3	14.00	22.50	20.00	26.85	13.00	19.95	20.10	25.95
AASHTO # 57	15.00	23.50	20.00	26.85	13.00	19.95	13.20	19.05
AASHTO # 67	15.00	23.50	20.00	26.85	13.00	19.95	No bid	No bid
AASHTO # 67 Washed	15.00	23.50	20.00	26.85	13.00	19.95	No bid	No bid
AASHTO # 7	No bid	No bid	22.85	29.70	14.00	20.95	21.00	26.85
AASHTO # 8 Washed	16.00	24.50	22.20	29.05	17.00	23.95	21.00	26.85
AASHTO # 10	8.00	16.50	17.95	24.80	9.00	15.95	11.10	16.95
AASHTO # 2 Aggregate	9.00	17.50	14.85	21.70	8.25	15.20	8.75	14.60
NCSA R4 Rip Rap	17.00	25.50	29.40	40.85	14.00	24.90	19.45	25.30
NCSA R5 Rip Rap	26.00	40.00	30.60	42.05	15.00	26.90	24.25	36.10
NCSA R6 Rip Rap	26.00	40.00	30.60	42.05	16.00	27.90	26.75	38.60
3A Modified Base Material	9.00	17.50	15.50	22.35	9.50	16.45	10.99	16.84
# 9 or Rice	18.00	35.00	29.10	35.95	17.00	23.95	No bid	No bid
Gabions	24.00	38.00	No bid	No bid	14.00	23.45	No bid	No bid

TOTAL

Paving Material

Highway Materials

Item:	Pick-Up	Delivered	Pick-Up	Delivered
9.5mm Superpave Mix (200 +/-)	69.55			
12.5mm Superpave Mix (200 +/-)	69.55			
19mm Superpave Mix (200 +/-)	62.30			
25mm Superpave Mix (100 +/-)	57.90			

All quotes are based on a ton

