City of Lucas

Water System Improvements
Single Pressure Plane Facilities
North Pump Station
Bid Opening: Monday, August 26, 2019 Time: 2:00p.m.
As Read Compilation

CAL DAYS BASE (ADD ALT NO. CAL DAYS ADD
BIDDER BID BOND |ADDENDA BASE BID BID 1 ADD ALT NO. 2| ADD ALT NO. 3| ADD ALT NO. 4| ADD ALT NO. 5| ADD ALT NO. 6 ALT(S)
Crescent Constructors, Inc. Yes Yes $ 1,977,000.00 300 $108,670.00 | $ 236,510.00 | $ 25975.00 | $§ 22,500.00 [ § 15,000.00 | $§ 65,000.00 360
Dake Construction Yes Yes $ 1,578,650.00 300 $151,728.00 | $ 217,722.00 No Bid $ 11,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lamarc Inc. Yes Yes $ 1,457,299.00 390 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red River Construction Co. Yes Yes $ 1,629,900.00 390 $ 57,200.00 | $ 139,700.00 | $ 26,400.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 66,000.00 [ $ 14,600.00 420




