CITY OF MADEIRA

BEACH

Adopted Operating and
Capital Budget

\ 4

Sanvor

N\ADHRA BEACH

Fiscal Year 2016

October 1, 2015 - September 30, 2016



THE CITY OF
MADEIRA BEACH, FLORIDA

ELECTED OFFICIALS

Travis Palladeno, Mayor
Terry Lister, City Commissioner (District 1)
Nancy Hodges, City Commissioner (District 2)
Elaine Poe, Vice Mayor (District 3)

Patricia Shontz, City Commissioner (District 4)

CHARTER OFFICERS

Shane B. Crawford, City Manager
Aimee Servedio, City Clerk
Thomas J. Trask, City Attorney

Vincent M. Tenaglia, City Treasurer



THE CITY OF MADEIRA BEACH

DATE INCORPORATED:

FORM OF GOVERNMENT:

AREA:

GOVERNING BODY:

ADMINISTRATION:

SERVICES:

LOCATION:

1947
Council/Manager
445 Acres

City Commission

4 Commissioners run by single districts,
elected at-large to 2 year overlapping terms
and Mayor-Commissioner in at-large
election for a three year term.

City Manager, City Clerk, City Treasurer
and City Attorney
Appointed by the City Commission.

A full service city, including police, fire,
sanitation and recreation services. Police
protection is contracted through the Pinellas
County Sheriff’s Department. Water and
sewer services are provided by Pinellas
County Utilities.

On the West coast of Florida, the City of
Madeira Beach is located on the island of
Sand Key and is surrounded on the east by
the Boca Ciega Bay and the west by the
Gulf of Mexico.



1. Introduction



City of Madeira Beach
300 Municipal Drive
Madeira Beach, FL 33708

City Manager’s Budget Message
October 1, 2015
Honorable members of the City of Madeira Beach Board of Commissioners and Citizens of Madeira Beach:

It is my privilege to present the adopted budget for the upcoming fiscal year. The budget increases the
current millage rate from 1.99 to 2.20. This is the second proposed millage rate increase since 1989 and
of this administration. Based on the City Commission’s direction to handle and perform a multitude of
capital projects currently on the table and the various new services offered by the City, the increased rate
is appropriate and necessary to help provide sustainable services for years to come.

This current administration has been labeled as hard-working, progressive, and willing to take on
increased workloads in order to get things done that should have been addressed in previous years.
Others have labeled it as a spend thrift and irresponsible as reserves were used to complete capital
projects. Taxation’s intent is to provide services for the public who pays the respective tax rather than
bank it for years and years providing no benefit to the current constituency. That being said, a healthy
reserve is necessary for a sustainable government but also for flexibility.

As you are aware, the City is progressing, developing, and evolving. Our new City Centre was completed
this year including a massive band shell that attracted major acts from across the country. The Recreation
Center is offering services, classes, and events that we’ve never offered previously. The Marina continues
to flourish and be a major hub and destination for the boating public in our area waters. Major
renovations done at the marina include dock replacements and boat lift installations. The fire department
has expanded in a way to provide water rescue services throughout our city and the cities we respond to.

Revenue projections are projected in a conservative fashion as we are in “uncharted territory” in a number
of the new programs that we’re administering. New positions were evaluated and few new position
requests were granted. Capital projects and purchases were scrutinized heavily and only the immediate
needs were included.

As the Board of Commissioners considers the multitude of capital projects currently in the queue, it needs
to consider new revenue streams for the proper funding of these projects or borrowing. The City has
been incredibly successful in receiving grants to assist in sizeable capital projects such as the major
amounts awarded by SFWMD for stormwater work and US Fish and Wildlife grants for a major dock
replacements/renovations at the marina. However, the City is at a critical juncture. We need to either
tax at a rate that funds the wish list of accomplishments assigned to the City Manager and the current
administration of employees willing to constantly take on additional responsibilities or begin to eliminate
projects off the “wish list”. It’s evident that the citizenry has trust in the current Commission and



administration and appreciates the facelift and amenities being offered to the people of Madeira Beach.
A millage increase last year was not only accepted by the members who attended the final reading but
was also applauded.

As | conclude this letter, | wish to thank my exceptional department head team and City staff who worked
so diligently during this process. These are people who wear multiple hats as my employees due to the
fact | prefer a lean but highly skilled and highly compensated staff. | want to thank the Board of
Commissioners for trusting me and allowing me to put together the current team that | have because
without them, none of what | do would be possible.

Very truly yours,

Shane B. Crawford
City Manager



FY 2016 FINANCE MESSAGE

Citywide Summary

The combined FY 2016 all funds budget total is $21,800,100. As in each of the two previous years,
significant funding is allocated to capital outlay based on direction by the Board of Commissioners (BOC)
to complete previously deferred infrastructure projects; particularly, stormwater drainage and roadway
improvements. Personnel costs account for nearly 20% of the budget, and include a four percent annual
wage increase for most positions. Several positions have been reclassified with respect to the new pay
plan effective for FY 2016, which is based on comparable salary information from neighboring
municipalities. Medical insurance rates increased 8.3%, due to both plan experience and industry trends.
Liability insurance rates are virtually flat, as a result of replacing aged City Hall, Fire Station and
Recreation Center buildings with modern facilities. Staff is committed to preserving the condition of the
City Centre facilities and has included an increase to contractual services and maintenance accounts
accordingly.

Fund Balance

Finance staff identified fund balance concerns as the top priority in developing the FY 2016 budget. After
multiple rounds of workshop discussions between June and August, the Board of Commissioners adopted
a new fund balance policy on September 8, 2015. Below are the directives established by the City’s fund
balance policy, which have been incorporated into the adopted budget and achieved:

The GFOA recommends, at a minimum, that general purpose governments maintain
aggregate unrestricted fund balances in their general fund of no less than two months
(16.67%) of regular general fund operating revenues or expenditures, whichever is most
predictable. All measures should be applied within the context of long-term forecasting,
so as to avoid the risk of placing too much emphasis on the level of unrestricted fund
balance in the general fund at any one time. GFOA recognizes that entities with a range
of designated reserves may have sufficient liquidity to meet this defined standard through
inclusion of funds formally designated for other purposes, yet available for re-designation
should circumstances warrant. In accordance with best practices, and legal and
accounting guidelines, the City hereby adopts the following fund balance policies:

A. Periodically, and in no event less than once every five years, the City shall affirm the
funding of the committed fund balance for the explicit and singular purpose of an
emergency storm response. In determining the level of such committed fund balance, the
City shall consider the perceived exposure to significant one-time outlays, liquidity
pressures, and anticipated commitments should a catastrophic tropical storm hit the City.
Historically, the City has maintained a balance for an emergency storm response equal to
33% of General Fund operating expenditures (meaning, excluding capital outlays).
Accordingly, it shall be the policy of the City to seek to maintain year-over-year a
committed fund balance for the explicit and singular purpose of an emergency storm



response fund that is no less than 33% of General Fund operating expenditures unless such
fund balance was in fact drawn upon in an emergency storm response. In such event,
depending upon the amount drawn down, the severity of the storm, and the anticipated
recovery, the City shall seek to restore the funds committed for such purpose as soon as is
practicable and in no event later than five years.

B. The City shall make a determination as to its target unassigned fund balance level. In
determining this level of fund balance, the City shall give consideration to economic
growth / weakening; revenue and expenditure stability / volatility; operating and capital
programs; financial and investment market risk; anticipated City commitments; and the
then-current five-year financial projection. Inorder to ensure for an appropriate unassigned
fund balance, the BOC’s stated expectation is a current five-year projection shall be
incorporated into the City’s budget processes which shall clearly articulate all material
underlying assumptions. Moreover, significant one-time revenues / outlays shall also be
considered. As a general policy, material one-time revenues shall not be used to fund on-
going expenses. Notwithstanding other requirements and fund balance designations as
described herein, it shall be the policy of the City to seek to maintain an unassigned General
Fund fund balance equal to 16.67% of annual General Fund operating expenditures.

C. The City shall establish reserve funds as required by the documents governing
outstanding debt and other long-term obligations, taking into account market exigencies
and exercising prudence in funding contingencies for specific risks. These reserve funds
may be restricted, assigned or committed, depending on the cause for the reserve (e.g. bond
covenants), source of funds (e.g. bond proceeds), and purpose (e.g. capital projects).

D. The City policy is to utilize restricted fund balances first, then unrestricted resources, as
they are needed. The City may choose to release a committed or assigned classification, if
unassigned funds are used to satisfy the funding obligation. The City shall utilize funds in
the following spending order: restricted; committed; assigned; unassigned.

E. The City may choose to balance its annual budget by assigning a portion of existing
unassigned fund balance, or by reassigning funds in an amount no greater than the projected
excess of expected expenditures over expected revenues.

General Fund

The City of Madeira Beach FY 2016 budget includes a millage rate increase from 1.9900 to 2.2000 mills,
which represents the second consecutive increase adopted by the City. As indicated in the City Manager’s
transmittal letter, the intent of generating additional ad valorem proceeds is to facilitate the City’s desire
for service level expansion while preserving the City’s long-term financial position.



Property values in Madeira Beach are estimated to increase 8.5%, which alone is sufficient to generate
$145,400 in additional ad valorem revenue. When combined with the 10.6% millage rate increase, ad
valorem revenue is projected to increase by $342,900. The property tax levy of $2,069,000 allows the
City to balance its General Fund operating budget, fund annual debt service obligations, and bolster net
position for future consideration; specifically, retiring outstanding debt and addressing fund balance
concerns.

As the City of Madeira Beach has experienced, Florida voters approved an amendment to Save Our Homes
legislation in January 2008, which limited property taxes by increasing property value exemptions and
providing portability of such provisions. The FY 2016 property tax levy is virtually equivalent to that of
FY 2009, essentially negating the impact of property tax reform on the City of Madeira Beach. The graphs
below chart the City’s experience over the past ten years, with sharp declines in property revenue
bottoming in FY 2012 before increasing steadily each of the past three years.

City of Madeira Beach
Ten-Year Property Tax History
FY 2007 - FY 2016

Year Millage Rate Revenue Percent +/ -
FY 2007 1.9000 2,417,146
FY 2008 1.7954 2,232,709 -7.6%
FY 2009 1.7954 2,018,974 -9.6%
FY 2010 1.7954 1,694,316 -16.1%
FY 2011 1.7954 1,506,269 -11.1%
FY 2012 1.7954 1,411,551 -6.3%
FY 2013 1.7900 1,424,325 0.9%
FY 2014 1.7900 1,490,180 4.6%
FY 2015 1.9900 1,726,100 15.8%
FY 2016 2.2000 2,069,000 19.9%
Property Tax Revenue History
3,000,000
2,500,000
2,000,000
1,500,000
1,000,000
500,000
FY 2007 FY 2008 FY 2009 FY 2010 FY 2011 FY 2012 FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016




The table below illustrates the relationship between Madeira Beach home values, property exemptions,
and the estimated impact of the FY 2016 millage rate increase:

$ 328,600.00 Median home market value, City of Madeira Beach
$ (50,000.00) Homestead exemption
$ 278,600.00 Adjusted taxable value

$ 612.92 Estimated City of Madeira Beach property taxes, 2.20 millage rate
$ 554.41 Estimated City of Madeira Beach property taxes, 1.99 millage rate

$ 58.51 Estimated impact, millage rate increase

Despite the millage rate increase, City taxes represent just 12.1% of residents’ total estimated tax bill. The
chart below identifies the various authorities levying property taxes in Madeira Beach and the
corresponding tax burden posed by each:

Total Estimated Madeira Beach Property Tax Bill
= Pinellas County School Board 1.9%

4.1%

0.3% 0.1%

H Pinellas County

# City of Madeira Beach

®Emergency Medical Services

= Juvenile Welfare Board

= Suncoast Transit Authority
Southwest FL Water Management
District

Health Department

Pinellas County Planning Council

Adoption of the 2.2000 millage rate for FY 2016 returns the City to the equivalent rate in place from FY
1996 through FY 2004. As compared to similar municipalities in Pinellas County, Madeira Beach
continues to maintain a relatively modest millage rate despite the increase. The following table provides
a list of similar municipalities and corresponding millage rates:



Municipality Millage Rate

Town of Belleair 5.9257
City of Belleair Bluffs 5.3500
Town of Kenneth City 4.7592
City of Gulfport 4.0390
City of South Pasadena 3.6250
City of Treasure Island 3.3368
City of St. Pete Beach 3.1500
City of Madeira Beach 2.2000
City of Belleair Beach 2.1414
City of Indian Rocks Beach 2.0000
Town of Redington Shores 2.0000
Town of Redington Beach 1.9410
Town of Indian Shores 1.8700
Town of North Redington Beach 0.7511
Town of Belleair Shore 0.7283

General Fund revenues are further supported by the strength of the City’s parking enforcement program.
Parking-related revenue is anticipated to exceed $1.5M, while enforcement expenditures remain very
manageable at just $268,300. Below is a summary of parking growth over the past several years:

FY 2010 FY 2011 FY 2012 FY 2013 FY 2014
John's Pass Village $ 133971 $ 147,934 $ 144,105 $ 141,880 $ 202,291
John's Pass Park & City Lots  $ 81,946 $ 117,179 $ 141891 $ 188,811 $ 291,167
Village Blvd. $ 271,354 $ 274893 $ 289,964 $ 338,275 $ 548,244
Parking Permits $ 4830 $ 6,910 $ 11,141 % 14,640 $ 19,147
Parking Tickets $ 84,854 $ 69,966 $ 73,093 $ 67,160 $ 222,252
General Fund Total $ 576,955 $ 616,882 $ 660,194 $ 750,765 $ 1,283,101
Annual growth 6.9% 7.0% 13.7% 70.9%

The City of Madeira Beach General Fund is structured such that operating revenues and expenditures are
distinguished from non-operating revenues and expenditures. This allows for an assessment as to whether
the City’s ongoing General Fund operations are structurally balanced. Because the City has recently
committed to a 30-year debt service obligation on its City Centre facilities, staff suggests the Series 2013
Capital Improvement Revenue Bond debt service requirements be included in this evaluation. For FY
2016, operating revenues less operating expenditures and Series 2013 debt service provides $384,000 in
surplus funds, as illustrated in the following chart:



OPERATING LESS: OPERATING LESS: SERIES 2013
REVENUES EXPENDITURES DEBT SERVICE

EQUALS: $384,000

*$7,034,600 ©$6,354,400 ©$296,200

#$192,000 to
future debt
service

#$192,000 to
fund balance

The surplus General Fund operating balance has been adopted to fund future debt service payments and
to address fund balance concerns.

Special Revenue Funds

Local Option Sales Tax Fund

The Local Option Sales Tax Fund includes an 8% revenue increase projection based on recent trends.
Virtually all sales tax-related revenue items have experienced growth over the past year and staff
anticipates sustained improvement through FY 2016. As in each of the two previous years, the City will
be drawing down available resources in the Local Option Sales Tax Fund in FY 2016. Staff does not
consider the utilization of such funding sources a concern, as there are no operating expenditures to be
supported by this fund,; it is specifically intended only to support major capital improvements.

Archibald Fund

The Archibald Fund was established in FY 2014 to properly account for restricted revenue earned on
Archibald Memorial Beach Park. Staff has projected a revenue increase of over 8%, driven exclusively
by parking activity. Expenditures are similar to the prior year with the exception of capital outlay; the FY
2016 budget includes the acquisition of a second beach rake to be operated by City staff.

Building Fund

The Building Fund is one of three new special revenue funds established for FY 2016. Building Fund
revenue was previously included in the General Fund, with net revenue reported as restricted balance.

Development activity has increased substantially since the City began managing construction services in
FY 2013 and staff anticipates similar activity over the next two years. Projected revenue for FY 2016
assumes new construction starts valued at approximately $9.3M.

Annual expenditures primarily consist of personnel and administrative overhead charges. Positions
previously reported in the Community Development Department have been allocated to the Building Fund
based on estimated time spent administering the Florida Building Code. The budget is adopted as
balanced, but the timing of various construction projects will dictate whether prior year reserves are to be



utilized. Delays or cancellations in anticipated developments would require offsetting appropriations from
fund balance.

Gas Tax Fund

Revenues reported in the Gas Tax Fund include local option gas tax and the motor fuel portion of State
Revenue Sharing, both of which must be used for transportation-related expenditures. The City has
allocated these funds to traffic light leases and corresponding utility expenditures. Staff anticipates this
fund serving as a stable operating program, with fairly predictable revenues and expenditures. The FY
2016 budget is adopted with a surplus of $8,100. Like the City’s two other special revenue operating
funds, Archibald and Building, any unanticipated shortfalls in this fund would likely require transfers in
from the General Fund.

Debt Service Fund

Based on the degree to which budgeted General Fund operating revenues exceed operating expenditures,
the BOC has adopted staff’s recommendation to reserve a portion of surplus funds for principal and
interest maturing in future years. As such, generally accepted accounting principles require the operation
of a debt service fund. The FY 2016 budget includes $192,000 to be committed for the purpose of
exercising future redemption options or otherwise retiring outstanding debt obligations.

Enterprise Funds

Sanitation

The Sanitation Fund includes the introduction of a new fee to recover the cost of recycling service.
Recycling services are provided contractually and costs have increased over 56% since FY 2013; without
recovering costs of this service, the Sanitation Fund would continue to draw down net position as a result
of its operations. The Fund is indeed budgeted to draw down resources in FY 2016; however, the City’s
basis of budgeting includes the full cost of capital outlay rather than depreciating assets as reported in the
CAFR. The deficit is due to the fact that the budget accounts for the full cost of a packer vehicle
($202,000) and design fees ($40,000) related to the future construction of an equipment storage facility.

Stormwater

City staff closed on a $6.2M Stormwater debt issue in August 2015, which is summarized as follows:



Interest rate (fixed) 2.59%

Delivery date 8/14/2015
First coupon 10/1/2015
Last maturity 10/1/2030

Total interest $ 1,381,906.01
Total debt senice $ 7,581,906.01
Maximum annual debt senice $ 504,580.00
Awerage annual debt senice $ 501,098.98

The City will be responsible for debt service expenses of over $500,000 related to construction on Boca
Ciega Drive, Rex Place, Municipal Drive, and American Legion Drive. Approximately $1.3M in
reimbursement funding is anticipated from the Southwest Florida Water Management District
(SWFWMD) following completion of the Boca Ciega Drive project. The City plans to utilize the future
SWFWMD funds to reduce outstanding debt obligations, which could reduce debt service expenses to
approximately $390,000 per year.

Marina

The Marina Fund experienced its best financial performance in FY 2014, operating at a budgetary gain of
$127,304. As such, the Marina Fund will contribute to its own CIP activity in FY 2016 for the first time
since FY 2010. Reconstruction of the “A” docks is budgeted at $600,000, allocated 50% each to the
General Fund and Marina Fund. Upon completion of the project, the marina will be operating with
virtually all new infrastructure, including its slips, lifts, fuel dock, and retail center.

Budgeted retail activity shows zero growth, based primarily on the relationship between fuel prices and
fuel sales. Following the recent oil market decline, it is possible that FY 2014 totals will represent peak
nominal sales. However, it is ultimately the margin between fuel prices and fuel sales that serves as the
determining factor in the Marina Fund’s performance; the budgeted markup percentage of 13.8% remains
unchanged.

Capital Improvement Project Update

Since the appointment of a new city manager in early 2012, the Board of Commissioners has provided
direction to staff to aggressively pursue numerous capital improvement projects. The Capital
Improvement Program (CIP) section of this document provides detailed information on capital
improvement activity, funding sources and cost estimates. The following is a short summary of recent
major projects completed, initiated, and/or scheduled for the upcoming year:

10



Completed:
Archibald Park beautification

Beach groyne rehabilitation
Beach walkover replacements
City Centre construction

Marina “B” dock improvements

Monument sign installation

Normandy Road stormwater drainage and roadway improvements
Parking pay station installation
Seawall rehabilitation

In progress:
Gulf Blvd. improvements (utility undergrounding)

Scheduled:

American Legion Drive stormwater drainage and roadway improvements
Boca Ciega stormwater drainage and roadway improvements
Citywide park beautification
Fire engine replacement
John’s Pass lighting installation at Village Blvd.

John’s Pass transient dock installation
Madeira Way transportation improvements
Marina “A” dock improvements
Municipal Drive stormwater drainage and roadway improvements
Rex Place stormwater drainage and roadway improvements

11



2. General Fund



GENERAL FUND

OPERATING REVENUE

Property Taxes 29.4% 2,069,000
Franchise Fees 6.7% 469,300
Utility Service Taxes 10.0% 704,400
Licenses and Permits 1.3% 90,600
Intergovernmental Revenue 21.0% 1,476,300
Charges for Services 3.9% 275,000
Parking Enforcement 22.4% 1,573,800
Fines and Forfeitures 0.1% 9,400
Culture and Recreation 2.5% 173,300
Investment Earnings 0.2% 15,000
Miscellaneous Revenue 2.5% 178,500
Total Operating Revenue 100.0% $7,034,600
259 M 0.2% 2.5%

'\ / B Property Taxes

B Franchise Fees

m Utility Service Taxes

M Licenses and Permits

H Intergovernmental Revenue

m Charges for Services

1 Parking Enforcement

I Fines and Forfeitures

Culture and Recreation

W Investment Earnings

H 1.3%

Miscellaneous Revenue

12



GENERAL FUND

OPERATING EXPENDITURES

City Manager's Office 7.6% 484,200
Community Development 5.1% 325,300
Finance 7.0% 445,500
City Clerk/Commission 5.5% 348,300
Non-Departmental 6.9% 435,700
Public Works 3.3% 210,700
Fire/EMS 22.2% 1,410,700
Law Enforcement 20.4% 1,294,800
Parks 3.5% 224,400
Recreation 12.1% 768,700
Parking Enforcement 4.2% 268,300
John's Pass Village 2.2% 137,800
Total Operating Expenditures 100.0% $6,354,400

B 4.2%

0 2.2%

B City Manager's Office
B Community Development
M Finance

H City Clerk/Commission
B Non-Departmental

B Public Works

M Fire/EMS

B Law Enforcement

i Parks

M Recreation

m Parking Enforcement

m John's Pass Village

13



GENERAL FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
Beginning available resources:
Unassigned balance 5,580,645 4,492,317 3,394,800 3,871,126 4,502,000 16.30%
Emergency reserve reconciliation - - - (183,300) (79,200) -56.79%
Florida building code net revenue - - - - (66,000)
Estimated prior year net operating budgetary balance - - - - 320,000
Proceeds from sale of sewer system - 3,344,700 - - -
Former Vehicle Replacement Fund assigned balance - 517,800 - - -
Open encumbrances - - - 5,406,176 - -100.00%

Total beginning available resources 5,580,645 8,354,817 3,394,800 4,676,800

Operating revenues:
Property tax:

311.000 Ad valorem - current 1,381,266 1,452,929 1,726,100 1,726,100 2,069,000 19.87%
311.006 Ad valorem - delinquent 1,597 3,297 - - -
311.0140 Ad valorem - tax certificates 41,462 33,954 - - -

Total property taxes 1,424,325 1,490,180 1,726,100 1,726,100 2,069,000 19.87%

Franchise fees:

313.215 Electricity 471,972 487,908 485,000 485,000 462,800 -4.58%
313.505 Gas 8,342 5,630 7,500 7,500 6,500 -13.33%
Total franchise fees 480,314 493,538 492,500 492,500 469,300 -4.71%

Utility service taxes:

314.1011 Electricity 563,875 579,692 575,000 575,000 561,800 -2.30%
314.3011 Water 84,985 142,008 105,000 105,000 115,200 9.71%
314.4011 Gas 6,011 4,435 4,700 4,700 4,400 -6.38%
314.8011 Propane 22,849 26,967 23,000 23,000 23,000 0.00%

Total utility service taxes 677,720 753,101 707,700 707,700 704,400 -0.47%

Licenses and permits:

321.010 Local business tax receipts 71,022 71,249 72,600 72,600 71,000 -2.20%
321.012 Contractor reciprocals - 1,960 800 800 600 -25.00%
322.009 Variance applications 4,425 7,393 2,500 2,500 - -100.00%
322.020 Building permits 230,959 549,649 200,000 200,000 - -100.00%
322.021 Re-inspection fees - 305 - - -
322.022 Fire inspection fees 4,515 6,110 3,000 3,000 4,000 33.33%
322.023 Plan reviews 1,088 1,262 1,200 1,200 - -100.00%
322.024 Rental inspection - - 14,000 14,000 15,000 7.14%
Total licenses and permits 312,009 637,929 294,100 294,100 90,600 -69.19%

Intergovernmental revenue:

312.410 Local option gas tax 58,330 58,389 57,600 57,600 - -100.00%
315.2011 Communication services tax 248,193 241,800 241,200 241,200 237,300 -1.62%
331.490 FDOT beautification program 9,800 9,995 - - -
331.509 FEMA flood mitigation program - - - - 133,000
335.120 State revenue sharing 204,385 205,593 205,000 205,000 157,200 -23.32%
335.150 Alcoholic beverage licenses 17,018 25,008 14,000 14,000 14,000 0.00%
335.180 Half cent sales tax 236,318 248,444 242,000 242,000 255,900 5.74%
335.230 Firefighters supplemental income 3,477 4,582 4,400 4,400 5,500 25.00%
335.490 Fuel tax refund 3,532 3,482 3,000 3,000 3,200 6.67%
338.900 Pinellas County - EMS 324,856 363,043 381,100 381,100 387,400 1.65%
342.202 Fire protection - Redingtons 228,346 233,597 236,500 236,500 240,800 1.82%
342.904 FDOT maintenance agreements 39,453 42,349 39,500 39,500 42,000 6.33%
Total intergovernmental revenue 1,373,708 1,436,282 1,424,300 1,424,300 1,476,300 3.65%

Charges for services:

347.594 Beach concession - Archibald Memorial Beach Park 12,000 - - - -

347.596 Snack shack concession - Paradise Sweets 38,600 - - - -

347.597 Beach walkover chair rental agreement - 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000 0.00%

389.400 Administrative services allocation 247,100 247,400 254,800 254,800 265,000 4.00%
Total charges for service 297,700 257,400 264,800 264,800 275,000 3.85%

Parking enforcement:

344.502 Parking meters - John's Pass Village - 202,291 205,000 205,000 278,200 35.71%
344.504 Parking meters - John's Pass Park - 291,167 275,000 275,000 374,500 36.18%
344.506 Non-resident parking permits - 19,147 16,500 16,500 18,500 12.12%
344.507 Parking meters - Village Blvd. - 548,244 520,000 520,000 722,500 38.94%
344.509 Parking meters - misc. lots - - - - 82,200

14



GENERAL FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
351.112 Parking fines - 222,252 140,000 140,000 97,900 -30.07%
Total parking enforcement - 1,283,101 1,156,500 1,156,500 1,573,800 36.08%
Fines and forfeitures:
351.111 Ordinance violations 5,887 6,128 5,000 5,000 4,400 -12.00%
359.091 Code enforcement 4,137 12,711 3,000 3,000 5,000 66.67%
Total fines and forfeitures 10,024 18,839 8,000 8,000 9,400 17.50%
Culture and recreation:
347.210 Activity registration 43,204 33,193 40,000 40,000 27,000 -32.50%
347.211 Softball registration 37,260 25,020 40,000 40,000 - -100.00%
347.220 After school program 108,316 109,841 95,000 95,000 52,000 -45.26%
347.221 Summer program 47,266 47,903 45,000 45,000 45,000 0.00%
347.222 Field rentals - - 10,000 10,000 15,000 50.00%
347.224 Sponsorships - - - - 7,500
347.228 Adult leagues - - - - 15,000
347.229 Youth leagues - - - - 5,000
362.004 Facility rentals 3,303 729 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%
369.386 Special event fees 1,900 1,900 1,200 1,200 1,800 50.00%
Total culture and recreation 241,249 218,585 236,200 236,200 173,300 -26.63%
Investment earnings:
361.100 Interest earnings 18,531 11,459 15,000 15,000 15,000 0.00%
Total investment earnings 18,531 11,459 15,000 15,000 15,000 0.00%
Miscellaneous revenue:
341.901 Election qualifying fees - 439 - - 100
347.290 Vending machine 390 359 100 100 - -100.00%
362.005 Storage rental - Beach Masonizing 336 336 300 300 300 0.00%
362.013 Rent- Tango Bay - 100,363 102,800 102,800 105,400 2.53%
362.587 Rent - cell tower 73,533 67,983 62,600 62,600 65,900 5.27%
364.411 Sale of equipment 7,124 75 3,000 3,000 - -100.00%
369.002 Gasoline sold 327 - - -
366.366 Donations - 200 - - -
366.368 John's Pass Village donations - 500 - -
369.369 Miscellaneous 40,433 - - - -
369.370 Copy charges 133 858 200 200 500 150.00%
369.374 Notary services 195 355 200 200 200 0.00%
369.376 Lawn maintenance - library 2,400 400 - - -
369.379 Refund prior year expenses - - - -
369.381 Sales tax collection allowance 635 2,116 - - -
369.382 Lien searches 2,935 2,933 2,500 2,500 4,000 60.00%
369.385 FEMA application fees 1,000 - - -
369.389 Sister city donations 297 - - -
369.390 CPR training - 125 100 100 100 0.00%
369.391 Civil review fees - 500 500 2,000 300.00%
Total miscellaneous revenue 129,738 177,042 172,300 172,300 178,500 3.60%
Total operating revenue $ 4965318 $ 6,777,456 $ 6,497,500 $ 6,497,500 $ 7,034,600 8.27%
Non-operating funding sources:
331.490 FDOT beautification capital outlay reimbursement - - - 87,781 - -100.00%
331.508 Assistance to Firefighters (AFG) grant award - - - 23,655 - -100.00%
331.509 FEMA flood mitigation program - - - - 2,853,900
337.092 FRDAP recreation equipment grant - - - - 50,000
337.555 Pinellas Co. capital project reimbursement 75,000 50,000 - - -
369.369 Lawsuit settlement - - - 746,904 -
381.017 Transfer from John's Pass Village Fund 75,500 908,108 - - -
381.407 Transfer from Parking Fund - 568,349 - - -
381.405 Repayment from Marina Fund (Ship Store) 26,233 29,000 29,000 29,000 29,000 0.00%
381.777 Boating improvement grant award - - 322,000 322,000 - -100.00%
381.888 Pinellas Co. Gulf Blvd. improvements funding schedule - 128,469 629,900 861,230 329,900 -61.69%
381.999 Debt proceeds - 4,760,000 2,955,000 2,955,000 - -100.00%
Total non-operating funding sources $ 176,733 $ 6,443,926 $ 3,935900 $ 5,025570 $ 3,262,800 -21.68%

Total funding sources $ 5,142,051 $ 13,221,382 $ 10,433,400 $ 11,523,070 $ 10,297,400

15



GENERAL FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Operating expenditures by department:
City Manager 333,950 380,530 448,100 675,911 484,200 -28.36%
Community Development 341,163 366,573 419,800 440,259 325,300 -26.11%
Finance 288,146 407,330 395,000 397,138 445,500 12.18%
City Clerk / Commission 438,405 259,376 346,500 355,500 348,300 -2.03%
Non-Departmental 233,008 347,103 367,400 357,400 435,700 21.91%
Public Works 329,369 289,380 311,800 311,800 210,700 -32.42%
Fire | EMS 1,180,090 1,189,797 1,379,400 1,379,400 1,410,700 2.27%
Law Enforcement 1,116,641 1,141,076 1,172,100 1,205,100 1,294,800 7.44%
Parks 378,317 212,772 202,500 202,500 224,400 10.81%
Recreation 352,333 464,999 656,500 658,395 768,700 16.75%
Parking Enforcement - 252,354 290,900 290,900 268,300 -7.77%
John's Pass Village - 101,076 126,700 126,700 137,800 8.76%
Total operating expenditures $ 4991422 $ 5,412,367 $ 6,116,700 $ 6,401,003 $ 6,354,400 -0.73%
Non-operating funding uses:
Capital improvements and vehicle replacements 594,852 6,549,774 3,155,200 9,307,265 1,429,000 -84.65%
Debt service, 2013 revenue bond (transfer to D.S. Fund) - 91,807 309,100 309,100 296,200 -4.17%
Debt service, 2014 revenue bond (transfer to D.S. Fund) - - 42,700 42,700 231,600 442.39%
Cost of issuance, 2013 revenue bond - 244,950 - - -
Cost of issuance, 2014 revenue bond - - 55,000 55,000 - -100.00%
FEMA flood mitigation program - - - - 2,853,900
Appropriation to Debt Service Fund committed balance - - - - 192,000
Appropriation to General Fund committed balance - - - - 191,900
Total non-operating funding uses $ 594,852 $ 6,886,531 $ 3,562,000 $ 9,714,065 $ 5,194,600 -63.33%

Total funding uses 5,586,274 $ 12,298,897 $ 9,678,700 $ 16,115,068 $ 11,549,000

Outstanding encumbrances $ 644,105 $ 5,406,176

Unassigned fund balance 4,492,317 $ 3,871,126 $ 4,149500 $ 4,502,004 $ 3,425,200
Available balance as percent of operating budget 90.0% 71.5% 67.8% 70.3% 53.9%

16



CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 272,920 252,411 265,700 266,400 299,500
OPERATING 61,030 128,119 182,400 409,511 179,700
CAPITAL - - - - -
DONATIONS - - - - 5,000
TOTAL $333,950 $380,530 $448,100 $675,911 $484,200

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $333,950 $380,530 $448,100 $675,911 $484,200

MISSION

By the Charter of the City of Madeira Beach, the City Manager is the chief administrative
officer of the City. The City Manager is responsible to the City Commission for
administration of all City affairs placed in the manager's charge by or under the charter. The
City Manager shall uphold City ordinances and regulations in the discharge of his/her duties
for the betterment of the entire community.

SERVICES

ADMINISTRATION. The City Manager provides overall direction and supervision to all City
departments and is responsible for advising and carrying out policies established by the
Board of Commissioners. All department heads report directly to the City Manager, as do
the Executive Office Manager, Volunteer Coordinator, and Community Policing Deputy.

17



CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE (001.1000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL  ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:

1200 Salaries & Wages 199,223 190,771 200,000 200,700 227,700 13.45%

1400 Overtime 1,710 2,100 3,000 3,000 1,500 -50.00%

2100 Social Security 15,091 14,126 15,300 15,300 17,500 14.38%

2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 21,293 19,182 20,000 20,000 22,100 10.50%

2300 Group Insurance 31,647 25,804 26,800 26,800 30,100 12.31%

2400 Worker's Compensation 381 428 600 600 600 0.00%

2500 Unemployment Compensation 3,575 - - - -

Subtotal Personnel 272,920 252,411 265,700 266,400 299,500 12.42%
OPERATING:

3100 Professional Services 6,151 11,527 - - -

3101 City Attorney - Retainer - 54,600 50,400 50,400 50,400 0.00%

3102 City Attorney - Non-Retainer - 22,853 20,000 50,000 40,000 -20.00%

3103 Other Legal Expenses - 306 - 167,111 - -100.00%

3105 Legal - Labor Attorney 2,274 581 3,000 3,000 3,000 0.00%

3135 Pre-Employment Services 1,465 - - - -

3400 Other Contractual Services 21,389 6,500 7,500 17,500 9,000 -48.57%

4000 Travel and Training 1,558 3,801 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%

4001 Auto Allowance 6,000 6,000 6,000 6,000 6,000 0.00%

4200 Postage 1,415 2,889 1,500 1,500 1,500 0.00%

4700 Print & Reproduction 10,495 11,655 15,000 15,000 16,600 10.67%

4800 Promotions & Public Relations 304 663 65,000 85,000 40,000 -52.94%

4900 Other Current Charges 2,303 234 2,000 2,000 - -100.00%

5100 Office Supplies 4,902 1,744 2,000 2,000 2,000 0.00%

5200 Uniforms - 19 - 1,200

5210 Departmental Supplies 355 1,213 - - -

5420 Dues & Subscriptions 2,419 3,536 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 61,030 128,119 182,400 409,511 179,700 -56.12%
DONATIONS:

8400 Chamber of Commerce - - - - 5,000
Subtotal Donations - - - - 5,000
TOTAL CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE $333,950 $380,530 $448,100 $675,911 $484,200 -28.36%

18



CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE (001.1000)

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE

FY 2016
BUDGET

DESCRIPTION

1200
1400
2100

2203

2300
2400

3101
3102

3105
3400

4000
4001
4200
4700
4800

5100
5200

5420

8400

PERSONNEL:

Salaries & Wages
Overtime
Social Security

ICMA 401(a) Plan
Group Insurance
Worker's Compensation

Subtotal Personnel

OPERATING:
City Attorney - Retainer
City Attorney - Non-Retainer

Legal - Labor Attorney
Other Contractual Services

Travel and Training

Auto Allowance

Postage

Print & Reproduction
Promotions & Public Relations
Office Supplies

Uniforms

Dues & Subscriptions

Subtotal Operating

DONATIONS:
Chamber of Commerce

Subtotal Donations

TOTAL CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE

227,700

Wages for the City Manager's office, including estimated funding for the City
Manager's annual vacation hour payout

1,500

QOvertime expenses as necessary for the Executive Office Manager

17,500

FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary

22,100

City contribution to City Manager's retirement at 12% of salary, per contract,
and staff retirement at 9% of salary

30,100

Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage

600

Worker's compensation insurance costs for three employees

299,500

50,400

City attorney recurring legal fees

40,000

Additional city attorney legal expenses as incurred

3,000

Labor attorney's legal expenses for union negotiations and personnel
management issues

9,000

Grant writing contractual services provided by Pinellas Planning Council

5,000

Costs for City Manager to attend one national and one in-state conference,
per contract. Additional funds are included for the Executive Office Manager
and any other professional development as appropriate.

6,000

City Manager's automobile allowance as provided by contract ($500/month)

1,500

Mailing costs for the City's quarterly newsletter and other general
correspondence

16,600

Preparation costs for the City's quarterly newsletter, promotions, etc.

40,000

Special event and promotions budget for various community activities

2,000

Minor recurring office supply purchases

1,200

Work shirts requested for office volunteers

5,000

Professional membership fees for the City Manager, including ICMA per
contract and civic organizations as approved by City Commission in FY 2014

179,700

5,000

Tresure Island & Madeira Beach Chamber of Commerce contribution

5,000

$484,200

19



CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

City Manager 1 1 1 1
Executive Office Manager 0 0 0 1
Executive Assistant 0 0 1 0
Administrative Assistant 2 1 0 0
Volunteer Coordinator 0 0 0.5 0.5
Total Funded Positions 3.0 2.0 2.5 25

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The Executive Assistant position has been reclassified to Executive Office Manager, in
recognition of additional internal office responsibilities.

20



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

SUMMARY
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET
EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 211,687 259,337 311,800 328,900 122,300
OPERATING 129,476 102,016 108,000 111,359 203,000
CAPITAL - 5,220 15,000 113,603 -
OTHER - - - - 2,853,900
TOTAL $341,163 $366,573 $434,800 $553,862 $3,179,200
FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $341,163 $366,573 $434,800 $553,862 $3,179,200
MISSION

The Community Development Department provides the City with professional urban planning
services, code compliance administration, and flood plain management. The mission is to
maintain the City's unique beach community character while working toward a vision of
improved land and water uses. The planning process is intended to improve the health,
safety and welfare of the City.

MAJOR INITIATIVES

The Community Development Department is tasked with coordinating the Federal
Emergency Management Agency's flood plain management program. To date, eight (8)
Madeira Beach properties have been identified for mitigation-related improvements in FY
2016, with estimated construction costs totaling over $2.8M. Funding is included in the
budget to facilitate this process, including reimbursable professional service expenditures to
be managed in the Community Development Department.

21



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT (001.1050)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 166,038 201,987 231,000 244,200 85,500 -64.99%
1400 Overtime 1,808 352 1,000 1,000 500 -50.00%
2100 Social Security 11,716 14,393 17,700 18,750 6,600 -64.80%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 6,762 12,701 21,500 22,750 9,800 -56.92%
2300 Group Insurance 24,124 29,390 35,700 37,300 19,500 -47.72%
2400 Worker's Compensation 1,239 514 4,900 4,900 400 -91.84%
Subtotal Personnel 211,687 259,337 311,800 328,900 122,300 -62.82%
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 90,076 33,958 34,000 37,359 158,000 322.92%
3125 Special Magistrate 23,277 24,332 30,000 30,000 30,000 0.00%
3400 Contractual Services 1,948 20,805 - - -
4000 Travel and Training 2,436 2,933 - - 2,500
4100 Telephone 54 - - - -
4110 Cellular Telephone 516 199 600 600 - -100.00%
4200 Postage 3,259 6,064 - - 1,500
4500 General Insurance 417 383 400 400 - -100.00%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 35 1,124 2,000 2,000 - -100.00%
4700 Print & Reproduction 2,605 1,741 - - 1,000
4930 Bank Service Fees - 210 - - -
5100 Office Supplies 2,790 6,941 - - 1,000
5200 Uniforms - 205 - - -
5210 Departmental Supplies 114 26 - - -
5220 Gasoline & Oil 632 1,759 3,000 3,000 - -100.00%
5300 Building Management - - 14,000 14,000 - -100.00%
5301 Code Enforcement - - 6,000 6,000 2,500 -58.33%
5302 Planning & Zoning - - 14,000 14,000 5,000 -64.29%
5303 Business Tax - 4,000 4,000 1,500 -62.50%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 1,317 1,338 - - -
Subtotal Operating 129,476 102,016 108,000 111,359 203,000 82.29%
6400 Capital Equipment - 5,220 15,000 113,603 - -100.00%
Subtotal Capital Outlay - 5,220 15,000 113,603 - -100.00%
OTHER:
8000 FEMA Flood Mitigation Program - - - - 2,853,900
Subtotal Other - - - - 2,853,900
TOTAL COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT $341,163 $366,573 $434,800 $553,862 $3,179,200 474.01%

22



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT (001.1050)

FY 2016

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION

PERSONNEL:

Salary for Code Enforcement Specialist and allocated portion of Planning &

1200 Salaries & Wages 85,500 Zoning Coordinator and Administrative Assistant positions
1400 Overtime 500 Overtime as authorized by management
2100 Social Security 6,600 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 9,800 City contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 19,500 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 400 Worker's compensation insurance allocation

Subtotal Personnel 122,300

OPERATING:

Engineering services and planning services, including FEMA flood mitigation

3100 Professional Services 158,000 reimbursable administrative expenditures
3125 Special Magistrate 30,000 Fee estimate for code enforcement hearings
4000 Travel and Training 2,500 Flood plain management training and continuing education credits
4200 Postage 1,500 Mailing costs for general correspondence
4700 Print & Reproduction 1,000 Misc. printed supplies including letterhead and envelopes
5100 Office Supplies 1,000 Miscellaneous office supplies as needed
5301 Code Enforcement 2,500 Code enforcement field-related operating expenses
5302 Planning & Zoning 5,000 Planning and flood plain management discretionary expenses
5303 Business Tax 1,500 Expenditures associated with business tax management and accounting

Subtotal Operating 203,000

OTHER:
8000 FEMA Flood Mitigation Program 2,853,900 FEMA flood mitigation reimbursable construction expenditures

Subtotal Other 2,853,900

TOTAL COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT $3,179,200

23



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Community Development Director 1 1 1 0
Planning and Zoning Coordinator 0 0 0 0.5
Building Official 0 0 1 0
Code Enforcement Officer 1 0 0 0
Code Enforcement Specialist 0 0 0 1
Permit Technician 0 1 1 0
Administrative Assistant 1 1 1 0.5
Total Funded Positions 3 3 4 2

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

Multiple positions associated with the building management function have been transferred
to the Building Fund. The Code Enforcement Specialist is a nhew position authorized by the
Board of Commissioners after proposal of the FY 2016 budget. Remaining positions, which
include the Planning & Zoning Coordinator and Administrative Assistant, are allocated 50%
each to Community Development and Building.

24



FINANCE

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:

PERSONNEL 205,231 315,264 300,700 296,200 342,900
OPERATING 82,915 92,066 94,300 100,938 102,600
CAPITAL - - - - -

TOTAL $288,146  $407,330  $395,000  $397,138 $445,500

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $288,146 $407,330 $395,000 $397,138 $445,500

MISSION

The Finance Department, led by the Assistant City Manager, is responsible for administration of the
City's financial affairs and development of financial policies to ensure accountability and fiscal
discipline. Finance Department staff manage the City's day-to-day financial operations.

SERVICES

FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT. Development and management of the annual budget, Capital
Improvement Program (CIP), and long-term financial projections.

TREASURY MANAGEMENT. Management of operating cash, investment balances, and debt
financing.

FINANCIAL REPORTING. Monthly revenue, expenditure and cash reports; annual
Comprehensive Annual Financial Report (CAFR).

COMPLIANCE. Revenue, expenditure and encumbrance monitoring; annual financial audit
reporting.

HUMAN RESOURCES. Personnel budgeting, benefit/insurance program administration, pre-
employment services, risk management and payroll management.

INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY (IT). Management of contractual IT service relationship.

25



FINANCE (001.1100)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:

1200 Salaries & Wages 159,945 240,163 226,600 222,100 258,800 16.52%

1400 Overtime - 410 - - -

2100 Social Security 11,646 17,713 17,400 17,400 19,800 13.79%

2201 Retirement - FRS - - - - -

2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 9,859 17,719 20,200 20,200 23,500 16.34%

2300 Group Insurance 23,781 38,660 35,700 35,700 40,100 12.32%

2400 Worker's Compensation - 600 800 800 700 -12.50%
Subtotal Personnel 205,231 315,264 300,700 296,200 342,900 15.77%
OPERATING:

3100 Professional Services 28,320 17,476 7,500 14,138 12,000 -15.12%

3121 Computer Software Support 14,794 16,139 21,000 21,000 17,900 -14.76%

3135 Pre-Employment Services - 2,955 2,500 2,500 2,500 0.00%

3200 Accounting and Auditing 26,600 35,500 36,500 36,500 40,900 12.05%

3400 Other Contractual Services 6,417 10,973 11,000 11,000 14,000 27.27%

4000 Travel and Training 527 2,203 3,000 3,000 4,500 50.00%

4100 Telephone 75 - - - -

4110 Cellular Telephone - 300 400 400 400 0.00%

4200 Postage 1,427 1,339 2,000 2,000 2,000 0.00%

4500 General Insurance 1,200 - 1,200 1,200 - -100.00%

4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment - 169 500 500 500 0.00%

4700 Print & Reproduction 2,198 2,457 3,500 3,500 2,500 -28.57%

4900 Other Current Charges 89 - - - -

4930 Bank Service Fees - - - - 400

4990 Debt Management Fees - - 2,500 2,500 2,000 -20.00%

5100 Office Supplies 1,198 2,134 2,500 2,500 2,000 -20.00%

5200 Uniforms - 60 - - -

5210 Departmental Supplies - 17 - - -

5420 Dues & Subscriptions 70 344 200 200 1,000 400.00%
Subtotal Operating 82,915 92,066 94,300 100,938 102,600 1.65%
TOTAL FINANCE $288,146 $407,330 $395,000 $397,138 $445,500 12.18%

26



FINANCE (001.1100)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Salary for Finance staff, including estimated funding for department director's
1200 Salaries & Wages 258,800 vacation hour payout
2100 Social Security 19,800 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 23,500 City contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 40,100 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 700 Worker's compensation insurance costs for four employees
Subtotal Personnel 342,900
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 12,000 Financial Advisor retainer agreement and associated travel expenses
3121 Computer Software Support 17,900 Munis financial software system support contract
3135 Pre-Employment Services 2,500 Background checks, physicals and drug screens for new hires (citywide)
Annual independent audit of the City's financial statements as required by
3200 Accounting and Auditing 40,900 State Statutes and City Charter; Single Audit fees; OPEB valuation fees
Paychex payroll processing software contract; flexible spending account
3400 Other Contractual Services 14,000 (FSA) administration
Required training for Assistant City Manager/Finance Director, including
annual investment courses and CPFO CPEs; annual FGFOA conference;
4000 Travel and Training 4,500 annual Group Health conference
Personal cell phone reimbursement for Assistant City Manager/Finance
4110 Cellular Telephone 400 Director
4200 Postage 2,000 Postage for all correspondence including invoices and payments
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 500 Service calls and maintenance for various Finance Department equipment
Printing costs for purchase orders, checks, annual CAFR and budget
4700 Print & Reproduction 2,500 documents
4930 Bank Service Fees 400 FDIC deposit fees
Annual continuing disclosure fee, registrar and paying agent services as
4990 Debt Management Fees 2,000 related to Series 2013 revenue bond
5100 Office Supplies 2,000 Miscellaneous office supplies as needed
Government Finance Officers Association (GFOA) dues and other relevant
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 1,000 professional memberships
Subtotal Operating 102,600
TOTAL FINANCE $445,500

27



FINANCE

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Assistant City Manager/Finance Director
Finance Director

Accounting Manager

Accountant

Financial Coordinator

Accounting Specialist

Accounting Specialist (Part-time)
Administrative Assistant

o
P U, OOOR O

P OPFPRPOPFr ORFrOoO
P OFR,ORFr OO
P OOPFRPOPFr OB

N
IN

Total Funded Positions 35 4

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The Accountant position has been reclassified to Accounting Manager, in recognition of additional
technical responsibilities. The Accounting Specialist position has been reclassified to Financial
Coordinator, based on the nature of work currently being performed.

28



CITY CLERK/COMMISSION

SUMMARY
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET
EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 122,213 124,310 194,900 196,400 189,500
OPERATING 250,028 62,317 71,900 71,900 78,300
CAPITAL - 1,161 7,500 7,500 -
DONATIONS 66,164 71,588 79,700 79,700 80,500
TOTAL $438,405 $259,376 $354,000 $355,500 $348,300
FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $438,405 $259,376 $354,000 $355,500 $348,300
MISSION

The Charter of the City of Madeira Beach vests the Board of Commissioners (BOC) with all
the legislative authority of the City. The BOC consists of four Commissioners and a Mayor-
Commissioner and is authorized to adopt, amend and repeal ordinances and resolutions;
levy taxes; grant, renew or extend franchises; set service or user charges for municipal
services; and appoint a City Clerk, City Manager and a City Attorney.

SERVICES
LEGISLATION. The City Clerk's office acts as a liaison for the citizens in their

communications to the Mayor and Commission members.

ELECTIONS. City elections are held on the second Tuesday in March of each year. The
Clerk's office advises candidates of procedures for running for office, recruits poll workers,
places all required legal advertisements and serves as the Supervisor of Municipal Elections.

RECORDS. As custodian of the records, the City Clerk fulfills record requests for the public
and other agencies.

CONTRACTS. The City Clerk maintains responsibility for ensuring contractual agreements
are legally approved and are administered appropriately by all parties.

MINUTES. The City Clerk's office prepares meeting minutes for all public meetings.

29



CITY CLERK/COMMISSION (001.1300)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:

1100 Salaries - Commission 26,400 26,400 26,400 26,400 34,300 29.92%

1200 Salaries & Wages 75,585 75,527 114,500 116,000 113,400 -2.24%

1400 Overtime - - 3,000 3,000 500 -83.33%

2100 Social Security 7,772 7,736 10,800 10,800 11,300 4.63%

2201 Retirement - FRS 2,298 4,656 5,400 5,400 5,500 1.85%

2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 3,915 864 6,800 6,800 4,500 -33.82%

2300 Group Insurance 5,957 8,869 26,500 26,500 19,600 -26.04%

2400 Worker's Compensation 286 257 1,500 1,500 400 -73.33%
Subtotal Personnel 122,213 124,310 194,900 196,400 189,500 -3.51%
OPERATING:

3100 Professional Services 19,866 32,800 30,000 30,000 30,000 0.00%

3101 City Attorney - Retainer 46,200 720 - - -

3102 City Attorney - Non-Retainer 38,495 - - - -

3137 Legal Recording 526 - 1,500 1,500 1,500 0.00%

3400 Other Contractual Services 46,104 3,405 2,500 2,500 6,500 160.00%

4000 Travel and Training 15 830 1,000 1,000 3,600 260.00%

4010 Travel - Commission District #1 1,951 129 1,000 1,000 1,500 50.00%

4020 Travel - Commission District #2 772 27 1,000 1,000 1,500 50.00%

4030 Travel - Commission District #3 170 2,035 1,000 1,000 1,500 50.00%

4040 Travel - Commission District #4 201 27 1,000 1,000 1,500 50.00%

4050 Travel - Mayor 1,142 1,293 1,000 1,000 2,000 100.00%

4100 Telephone 106 199 - - -

4110 Cellular Telephone 243 - 300 300 - -100.00%

4200 Postage 156 278 500 500 500 0.00%

4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 2,603 300 2,000 2,000 1,000 -50.00%

4700 Print & Reproduction 2,720 130 600 600 1,100 83.33%

4800 Promotions & Public Relations 63,961 2,185 3,000 3,000 3,000 0.00%

4802 Board Appreciation Dinner 950 700 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%

4803 Boat Parade 4,779 - - - -

4900 Other Current Charges 9,600 - - - -

4901 Legal Advertisements - 11,210 15,000 15,000 10,000 -33.33%

4910 Election Expenses 3,458 2,239 4,000 4,000 6,200 55.00%

5100 Office Supplies 2,764 1,075 2,000 2,000 2,000 0.00%

5200 Uniforms 60 436 500 500 500 0.00%

5210 Departmental Supplies 1,065 71 - - -

5420 Dues & Subscriptions 2,121 2,230 3,000 3,000 3,400 13.33%
Subtotal Operating 250,028 62,317 71,900 71,900 78,300 8.90%
CAPITAL:

6400 Capital Equipment - 1,161 7,500 7,500 - -100.00%
Subtotal Capital Outlay - 1,161 7,500 7,500 - -100.00%

30



CITY CLERK/COMMISSION (001.1300)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
DONATIONS:

8201 Seniors Club 1,700 1,700 1,700 1,700 1,700 0.00%

8222 Neighborly Care Network - 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%

8340 Gulf Beaches Library 64,464 69,888 77,000 77,000 77,800 1.04%
Subtotal Donations 66,164 71,588 79,700 79,700 80,500 1.00%
TOTAL CLERK/COMMISSION $438,405 $259,376 $354,000 $355,500 $348,300 -2.03%

31



CITY CLERK/COMMISSION (001.1300)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
1100 Salaries - Commission 34,300 Wages for Mayor and Commissioners
Wages for City Clerk and Administrative Support Specialist, including
1200 Salaries & Wages 113,400 estimated funding for City Clerk's vacation hour payout
1400 Overtime 500 Overtime expenditures to film public meetings
2100 Social Security 11,300 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2201 Retirement - FRS 5,500 City contribution to staff retirement
City contribution to Administrative Support Specialist retirement at 9% of
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 4,500 salary
2300 Group Insurance 19,600 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 400 Worker's compensation insurance costs for two employees and the BOC
Subtotal Personnel 189,500
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 30,000 Records retention services; Municode online ordinance program
3137 Legal Recording 1,500 Legal recording of liens and release of liens
3400 Other Contractual Services 6,500 Offsite records storage facility monthly fees
Travel and training for City Clerk to attend the Florida Association of City
4000 Travel and Training 3,600 Clerks conference and related professional training
4010 Travel - Commission District #1 1,500 Available budget for City Commissioner, District 1
4020 Travel - Commission District #2 1,500 Available budget for City Commissioner, District 2
4030 Travel - Commission District #3 1,500 Available budget for City Commissioner, District 3
4040 Travel - Commission District #4 1,500 Available budget for City Commissioner, District 4
4050 Travel - Mayor 2,000 Available budget for Mayor
4200 Postage 500 Postage for miscellaneous correspondence
Repair and maintenance of digital equipment, microphones, speakers, etc.
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 1,000 in Commission Chambers
4700 Print & Reproduction 1,100 Business cards and invitations
Hosting professional association lunches and meetings (i.e. Suncoast
4800 Promotions & Pub Relations 3,000 League of Cities, BIG-C)
4802 Board Appreciation 1,000 Gift cards for City Hall volunteers and volunteer board members
4901 Legal Advertisements 10,000 Legal advertising expenses for various departments
Anticipated election expenses based on Pinellas County Supervisor of
4910 Election Expenses 6,200 Elections cost estimate
5100 Office Supplies 2,000 Recurring office supply purchases
5200 Uniforms 500 City shirts for Mayor and Commissioners
City Commission memberships for various professional associations,
including Florida League of Cities, Suncoast League of Cities, BIG-C,
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 3,400 Florida Shore and Beach Preservation Association, etc.
Subtotal Operating 78,300
DONATIONS:
8201 Seniors Club 1,700 Annual Madeira Beach Seniors Club donation
8222 Neighborly Care Network 1,000 Requested donation by City Commissioner
8340 Gulf Beaches Library 77,800 Per library FY 2016 budget submittal
Subtotal Donations 80,500
TOTAL CLERK/COMMISSION $348,300

32



CITY CLERK/COMMISSION

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

City Clerk 1 1 1 1
Administrative Support Specialist 0 0 1 1
Public Works Technician 0 0 1 0
Mayor 1 1 1 1
Commissioners 4 4 4 4
Total Funded Positions 6 6 8 7

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The custodial position intended for FY 2015 was never filled. The position has been
eliminated for FY 2016.

33



NON-DEPARTMENTAL

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
OPERATING 233,008 345,979 367,400 357,400 419,700
CAPITAL 406,284 6,488,118 2,940,200 8,703,723 466,000
DEBT SERVICE - 91,807 351,800 351,800 -
OTHER - 244,950 55,000 55,000 -
TOTAL $639,292 $7,170,854  $3,714,400  $9,467,923 $885,700

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $639,292 $7,170,854  $3,714,400  $9,467,923 $885,700

MISSION

The non-departmental program includes all costs and activities not allocated to one specific
department. Expenditures are managed by the Assistant City Manager, including: capital
projects and any related debt expense; facility maintenance and insurance; utilities and
IT/communication systems.

34



NON-DEPARTMENTAL (001.1400)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
OPERATING:
3122 Computer Support 14,281 7,765 70,000 80,000 94,700 18.38%
3123 Website Services - 11,255 7,500 7,500 7,500 0.00%
3400 Other Contractual Services 20,917 11,381 6,100 16,100 20,700 28.57%
3443 Telephone System Maintenance 180 - - - -
4100 Telephone 22,806 9,428 10,000 10,000 29,000 190.00%
4110 Cellular Telephone - 99 200 200 400 100.00%
4200 Postage - 99 - - -
4300 Utilities 2,412 3,100 5,000 5,000 8,500 70.00%
4331 Electric - Building 26,781 29,999 33,000 33,000 36,000 9.09%
4340 Waste Disposal 2,500 2,600 2,700 2,700 2,500 -7.41%
4400 Rentals and Leases 11,425 11,454 10,000 10,000 11,500 15.00%
4500 General Insurance 98,734 124,086 138,200 108,200 132,200 22.18%
4610 Maintenance - Building 22,715 7,466 20,000 20,000 12,000 -40.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 328 631 500 500 500 0.00%
4700 Print & Reproduction 2,387 4,001 3,000 3,000 4,000 33.33%
4800 Promotions & Pub Relations 37 67,164 - - -
4801 Christmas Decorations - 30,670 25,000 25,000 25,000 0.00%
4804 Fireworks - 21,000 26,000 26,000 26,000 0.00%
5100 Office Supplies 4,586 539 5,000 5,000 9,000 80.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 2,854 2,670 5,000 5,000 - -100.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 65 573 200 200 200 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 233,008 345,979 367,400 357,400 419,700 17.43%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements - 241,072 - 156,639 16,000 -89.79%
6318 City Centre 406,284 6,088,242 - 5,031,925 150,000 -97.02%
6319 Marina Dock Construction - 425 - 349,574 300,000 -14.18%
6322 Transient Dock Construction - 10,145 - 12,695 - -100.00%
6323 Gulf Blvd. Improvements - 147,110 2,940,200 3,152,890 - -100.00%
6400 Capital Equipment - 1,124 - - -
Subtotal Capital Outlay 406,284 6,488,118 2,940,200 8,703,723 466,000 -94.65%
DEBT SERVICE:
7100 Debt Service - Principal - - 100,000 100,000 - -100.00%
7200 Debt Service - Interest - 91,807 251,800 251,800 - -100.00%
Subtotal Debt Service - 91,807 351,800 351,800 - -100.00%
OTHER:
9999 Cost of Issuance - 244,950 55,000 55,000 - -100.00%
Subtotal Other - 244,950 55,000 55,000 - -100.00%
TOTAL NON-DEPARTMENTAL $639,292 $7,170,854 $3,714,400 $9,467,923 $885,700 -90.65%

35



NON-DEPARTMENTAL (001.1400)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
OPERATING:
Turn-key IT services, including scheduled hardware replacement, service
3122 Computer Support 94,700 calls, software licenses, etc.
3123 Website Services 7,500 Website development and maintenance
3400 Other Contractual Services 20,700 City Hall facility contractual cleaning services and cleaning supplies
4100 Telephone 29,000 City hall communications services including internet and phone system
4110 Cellular Telephone 400 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless (emergency phones)
4300 Utilities 8,500 Pinellas County water and reclaimed water services at municipal complex
4331 Electric - Building 36,000 Electrical service costs for municipal complex facilities
4340 Waste Disposal 2,500 Sanitation Fund billing to General Fund for waste disposal services
Leasing fees for citywide office equipment, including copiers and postage
4400 Rentals and Leases 11,500 machine
Insurance premiums based on quoted estimates. Includes property, flood,
4500 General Insurance 132,200 general liability, crime and public officials liability coverage.
Annual air conditioning service contract; estimated window cleaning and
4610 Maintenance - Building 12,000 maintenance service
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 500 Miscellaneous small office equipment maintenance
4700 Print & Reproduction 4,000 General citywide printed supplies including letterhead and envelopes
4801 Christmas Decorations 25,000 Annual citywide Christmas ornaments and displays
4804 Fireworks 26,000 Fireworks and barge rental for City's July 4th event
5100 Office Supplies 9,000 Recurring supplies such as mail machine supplies, copy paper, etc.
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 200 Website renewal and Sam's Club membership fee
Subtotal Operating 419,700
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 16,000 Facility keying project ($6,000); gym equipment ($10,000)
Ongoing municipal campus capital outlay, including design and permitting of
6318 City Centre 150,000 municipal dock and fishing pier installation
6319 Marina Dock Construction 300,000 Marina "A" dock construction
Subtotal Capital Outlay 466,000
TOTAL NON-DEPARTMENTAL $885,700

36



PUBLIC WORKS

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 34,442 52,833 63,000 63,000 67,200
OPERATING 294,927 231,221 248,800 248,800 143,500
CAPITAL 10,149 5,325 - - 144,000
TOTAL $339,518 $289,380 $311,800 $311,800 $354,700

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $339,518 $289,380 $311,800 $311,800 $354,700

MISSION

The Public Works Department includes administrative support for the development,
operation, maintenance and engineering of streets, beaches, parks, drainage systems and
refuse disposal. Field personnel in various departments managed by Public Works
administrative staff are responsible for the construction, maintenance and repair of streets,
sidewalks, docks and signs. Public Works activities are intended to ensure the health,
safety and welfare of the community.

37



PUBLIC WORKS (001.3000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 30,150 44,039 50,000 50,000 51,400 2.80%
1400 Overtime - 120 - - -
2100 Social Security 1,992 3,324 3,900 3,900 4,000 2.56%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 747 1,497 2,500 2,500 2,300 -8.00%
2300 Group Insurance 600 2,311 3,600 3,600 7,100 97.22%
2400 Worker's Compensation 953 1,542 3,000 3,000 2,400 -20.00%
Subtotal Personnel 34,442 52,833 63,000 63,000 67,200 6.67%
OPERATING:
3400 Other Contractual Services - 1,996 - - -
4000 Travel and Training - 691 1,500 1,500 1,500 0.00%
4110 Cellular Telephone 654 39 - - 100
4200 Postage 26 16 - - -
4331 Electric - Building 1,806 - - - -
4336 Electric - Street Lights 91,839 87,312 95,000 95,000 - -100.00%
4337 Electric - Traffic Signals 4,119 4,244 6,000 6,000 - -100.00%
4340 Waste Disposal 3,300 - - - -
4400 Rentals and Leases 7,287 9,342 11,500 11,500 12,700 10.43%
4500 General Insurance 39,723 37,132 44,200 44,200 37,300 -15.61%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 2,004 910 3,000 3,000 3,000 0.00%
4610 Maintenance - Building 21,952 4,779 - - -
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 9,608 3,307 6,000 6,000 7,500 25.00%
4650 Maintenance - Streets 1,120 24,784 15,000 15,000 15,000 0.00%
4670 Maintenance - Signs & Signals 40,186 37,533 42,500 42,500 45,000 5.88%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 2,679 577 1,600 1,600 - -100.00%
4801 Christmas Decorations 24,931 - - - -
4804 Fireworks 26,000 - - - -
5100 Office Supplies 138 - - - -
5200 Uniforms 493 40 - - -
5210 Departmental Supplies 6,614 4,804 6,000 6,000 6,000 0.00%
5217 Flag Supplies 1,378 3,831 3,200 3,200 4,000 25.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 8,280 7,903 12,500 12,500 10,600 -15.20%
5230 Tools 569 1,982 800 800 800 0.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 221 - - - -
Subtotal Operating 294,927 231,221 248,800 248,800 143,500 -42.32%
CAPITAL:
6400 Capital Equipment 10,149 5,325 - - 144,000
Subtotal Capital Outlay 10,149 5,325 - - 144,000
TOTAL PUBLIC WORKS $339,518 $289,380 $311,800 $311,800 $354,700 13.76%

38



PUBLIC WORKS (001.3000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages to support allocation of Public Works Director and Administrative
Assistant positions (20% each) and part-time Mechanic, including estimated
1200 Salaries & Wages 51,400 funding for department director's vacation hour payout
2100 Social Security 4,000 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 2,300 City contribution to full-time staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 7,100 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 2,400 Allocation of worker's compensation insurance costs for three employees
Subtotal Personnel 67,200
OPERATING:
American Public Works Association (APWA) Conference for Public Works
4000 Travel and Training 1,500 Director
4110 Cellular Telephone 100 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4400 Rentals and Leases 12,700 Public works storage facility rental, including planned increase per contract
Insurance premiums based on quoted estimates. Includes property and
environmental liability coverage. Also includes auto liability and physical
4500 General Insurance 37,300 damage coverage for Public Works vehicles.
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 3,000 Auto maintenance on Public Works vehicles
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 7,500 Maintenance of tractors and small equipment
4650 Maintenance - Streets 15,000 Patching of roadways and repair of sidewalks
Interlocal agreement for traffic signal maintenance with Pinellas County and
4670 Maintenance - Signs & Signals 45,000 other street/informational signs as needed
5210 Departmental Supplies 6,000 Small parts or operating equipment as needed by the Mechanic
5217 Flag Supplies 4,000 Supplies for flag displays, special event banners, city signs, etc.
5220 Gasoline & Oil 10,600 Fuel expenditures for Public Works vehicles
5230 Tools 800 Hand tools as needed by the Mechanic
Subtotal Operating 143,500
CAPITAL:
Replacement of vehicles no. 39 ($84,000); no. 43 ($15,000), and no. 44
6400 Capital Equipment 144,000 ($45,000)
Subtotal Capital Outlay 144,000
TOTAL PUBLIC WORKS $354,700

39



PUBLIC WORKS

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Public Works Director 0.1 0.1 0.2 0.2
Lead Mechanic 0.3 0.3 0.3 0.3
Administrative Assistant 0 0.1 0.2 0.2
Total Funded Positions 0.4 0.5 0.7 0.7

40



FIRE / EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 1,057,487 1,069,318 1,233,500 1,233,500 1,250,400
OPERATING 122,603 120,479 145,900 145,900 151,300
CAPITAL 113,128 28,449 47,500 48,000 9,000
TOTAL $1,293,218 $1,218,246 $1,426,900 $1,427,400 $1,410,700

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $1,293,218 $1,218,246 $1,426,900 $1,427,400 $1,410,700

MISSION

Under the direction of the Fire Chief, the Madeira Beach Fire Department is committed to
providing high-quality responsive services promoting the health, safety and welfare of all who
reside, work or visit within the City's service area. The Fire/EMS department strives to reduce
the loss of life and property, through emergency medical services, education, fire prevention,
marine operations and suppression. The Fire Chief reports to the City Manager.

SERVICES

EDUCATION. The Fire Department holds classes and provides lectures to the public
concerning fire prevention and disaster/hurricane planning. An emphasis is placed on
educating school age children about Fire Prevention.

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT. The Fire Department has the responsibility of preparing,
publishing and updating the City’'s Emergency Management Plan. This includes all City
departments and the four phases of Emergency Management: Preparation, Response,
Recovery and Mitigation. In addition, this program coordinates the evacuation of all citizens,
especially those with special needs.

FIRE PREVENTION/SUPPRESSION. In FY 2014, the Fire/EMS Department responded to a
total of 1,875 calls. Of these calls, 410 were related to structure/vehicle fires or other non-
medical emergencies.

EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICE. In FY 2014, The Fire/EMS Department answered 1,377
emergency medical calls.

41



FIRE/EMS (001.4000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 658,383 656,471 753,000 753,000 765,500 1.66%
1400 Overtime 106,185 89,531 100,000 100,000 100,000 0.00%
2100 Social Security 58,107 55,539 57,700 57,700 58,600 1.56%
2201 FRS - Regular Class 1,943 - - - -
2202 FRS - Special Risk 93,559 112,427 148,000 148,000 135,000 -8.78%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 5,262 8,856 3,300 3,300 11,800 257.58%
2300 Group Insurance 103,038 110,845 121,500 121,500 138,100 13.66%
2400 Worker's Compensation 27,160 35,649 50,000 50,000 41,400 -17.20%
2500 Unemployment Compensation 3,850 - - - -
Subtotal Personnel 1,057,487 1,069,318 1,233,500 1,233,500 1,250,400 1.37%
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 91 - - - -
3135 Employee Physicals 6,149 6,122 10,000 10,000 9,000 -10.00%
3200 Accounting and Auditing 1,800 1,800 2,500 2,500 2,500 0.00%
3400 Contractual Services 5,347 6,429 6,100 6,100 15,900 160.66%
4000 Travel and Training 6,155 8,823 8,000 8,000 9,000 12.50%
4100 Telephone 3,473 3,600 4,000 4,000 3,000 -25.00%
4110 Cellular Telephone 816 691 800 800 400 -50.00%
4200 Postage 198 252 300 300 300 0.00%
4340 Waste Disposal - - - - 2,500
4500 General Insurance 17,081 17,382 16,600 16,600 17,200 3.61%
4515 AD&D Insurance 793 - 900 900 900 0.00%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 20,337 11,902 20,000 20,000 25,000 25.00%
4610 Maintenance - Building 4,543 1,059 4,000 4,000 11,000 175.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 6,719 7,165 4,600 4,600 5,000 8.70%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 4,903 1,341 2,000 2,000 - -100.00%
4691 Maintenance - Radio Equipment 4,153 3,927 14,200 14,200 8,500 -40.14%
4700 Print & Reproduction 620 308 500 500 500 0.00%
4800 Promotions & Public Relations 2,361 755 2,000 2,000 1,500 -25.00%
4920 Licenses & Permits 2,270 - 3,000 3,000 500 -83.33%
5100 Office Supplies 1,903 1,912 2,000 2,000 2,000 0.00%
5200 Uniforms 10,808 20,822 14,000 14,000 6,000 -57.14%
5210 Departmental Supplies 5,364 8,177 7,500 7,500 8,500 13.33%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 13,988 14,832 16,500 16,500 15,200 -7.88%
5230 Tools 555 785 4,000 4,000 4,000 0.00%
5250 Other Medical Supplies 276 - 400 400 400 0.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 1,900 2,394 2,000 2,000 2,500 25.00%
Subtotal Operating 122,603 120,479 145,900 145,900 151,300 3.70%
CAPITAL:
6400 Capital Equipment 113,128 28,449 47,500 48,000 9,000 -81.25%
Subtotal Capital Outlay 113,128 28,449 47,500 48,000 9,000 -81.25%
TOTAL FIRE/EMS $1,293,218 $1,218,246 $1,426,900 $1,427,400 $1,410,700 -1.17%

42



FIRE/EMS (001.4000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages for the Fire/EMS Department staff, including estimated funding for
1200 Salaries & Wages 765,500 department director's vacation hour payout
Estimated overtime expenditures required to maintain appropriate staffing
1400 Overtime 100,000 levels
2100 Social Security 58,600 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2202 FRS - Special Risk 135,000 FRS retirement contributions for the Fire Chief and Firefighters
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 11,800 City contribution to Administrative Assistant retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 138,100 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 41,400 Worker's compensation insurance costs for Fire/EMS Department staff
Subtotal Personnel 1,250,400
OPERATING:
3135 Employee Physicals 9,000 Annual physical exams for Fire Chief and Firefighters
3200 Accounting and Auditing 2,500 Annual EMS Audit as required by Pinellas County
Cleaning and janitorial services contract; fire software; taxi service for
3400 Contractual Services 15,900 paramedics returning from hospital
4000 Travel and Training 9,000 Training required to maintain medical certifications
4100 Telephone 3,000 Fire Department's telephone and wireless internet service
4110 Cellular Telephone 400 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4200 Postage 300 Postage for miscellaneous correspondence
4340 Waste Disposal 2,500 Sanitation Fund billing to General Fund for waste disposal services
Auto liability and physical damage insurance for Fire/EMS Department
4500 General Insurance 17,200 apparatus and vehicles, based on quoted increase estimate
Accidental death and dismemberment insurance coverage for Firefighters,
4515 ADA&D Insurance 900 based on quoted estimate
Preventive maintenance and repairs on Fire/EMS Department apparatus
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 25,000 and vehicles
4610 Maintenance - Building 11,000 Air conditioning and window cleaning services
Air tank maintenance; certified bunker gear repairs; annual pump testing;
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 5,000 miscellaneous office/departmental supply repairs; siren testing
Annual maintenance contract and radio/headset equipment repairs as
4691 Maintenance - Radio Equipment 8,500 needed
4700 Print & Reproduction 500 Printing training manuals, emergency plan, annual service report
4800 Promotions & Public Relations 1,500 Public education materials and teaching supplies
4920 Licenses & Permits 500 Federal and state licensing requirements and re-certifications
5100 Office Supplies 2,000 Miscellaneous recurring office supplies
Uniforms, shoes, bunker gear, helmets, boots, safety equipment and rain
5200 Uniforms 6,000 gear
5210 Departmental Supplies 8,500 Daily supplies as necessary to operate the Fire Station on a 24-hour basis
5220 Gasoline & Ol 15,200 Fuel used in the operation of Fire/EMS Department apparatus and vehicles
5230 Tools 4,000 Acquisition or replacement of firefighting tools as needed
5250 Other Medical Supplies 400 Batteries for AEDs and medical equipment
Memberships to various organizations including Fire Chief's Associations,
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 2,500 National Fire Protection Association, Pinellas Advanced Life Support
Subtotal Operating 151,300

43



FIRE/EMS (001.4000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
CAPITAL:
6400 Capital Equipment 9,000 Bunker gear acquisition and replacement
Subtotal Capital Outlay 9,000
TOTAL FIRE/EMS $1,410,700

44



FIRE/EMS

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Fire Chief 1 1 1 1
Fire Lieutenant 3 3 3 3
Firefighter 9 9 9 9
Administrative Assistant 1 1 1 1
Total Funded Positions 14 14 14 14

45



LAW ENFORCEMENT

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
OPERATING 1,116,641 1,141,076 1,172,100 1,205,100 1,294,800
CAPITAL 1,808 - - - -
TOTAL $1,118,449 $1,141,076 $1,172,100 $1,205,100 $1,294,800

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND  $1,118,449 $1,141,076 $1,172,100 $1,205,100 $1,294,800

MISSION

The City of Madeira Beach contracts with the Pinellas County Sheriff's Office (PCSO) for law
enforcement within the City.

SERVICES

COMMUNITY POLICING. The City has a full-time community policing deputy permanently
assigned to Madeira Beach to address neighborhood crime issues.

COMPLIANCE. The budget includes two (2) full-time PCSO deputies permanently assigned
to Madeira Beach to enforce ordinances; particularly, code enforcement and rental
inspections.

46



LAW ENFORCEMENT (001.4010)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
OPERATING:

3131 Law Enforcement Services 1,115,641 1,141,076 1,171,100 1,204,100 1,293,800 7.45%

3410 County Services 1,000 - 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 1,116,641 1,141,076 1,172,100 1,205,100 1,294,800 7.44%
CAPITAL:

6400 Capital Equipment 1,808 - - - -
Subtotal Capital Outlay 1,808 - - - -
TOTAL LAW ENFORCEMENT 1,118,449 $1,141,076 $1,172,100 $1,205,100 $1,294,800 7.44%

47



LAW ENFORCEMENT (001.4010)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
OPERATING:
Pinellas County Sheriff's Office contract, including three Community Policing
3131 Law Enforcement Services 1,293,800 Deputies
3410 County Services 1,000 County's ordinance enforcement fee; $10 per violation
Subtotal Operating 1,294,800

TOTAL LAW ENFORCEMENT  $1,294,800

48



PARKS

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 180,780 - - - -
OPERATING 197,537 202,777 202,500 202,500 224,400
CAPITAL 63,483 24,827 62,500 323,333 100,000
TOTAL $441,800 $227,604 $265,000 $525,833 $324,400

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $441,800 $227,604 $265,000 $525,833 $324,400

MISSION

The Parks Department is responsible for the maintenance and repair of parks and public
beach lands, including the setting and maintenance of swimming and boating buoys along
the Gulf of Mexico. The activities of the division are intended to ensure the health, safety
and welfare of the community.

49



PARKS (001.4900)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 127,471 - - - -
1400 Overtime 2,596 - - - -
2100 Social Security 9,259 - - - -
2201 Retirement - FRS 4,152 - - - -
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 4,565 - - - -
2300 Group Insurance 26,924 - - - -
2400 Worker's Compensation 5,813 - - - -
Subtotal Personnel 180,780 - - - -
OPERATING:
3400 Contractual Services 18,193 81,537 84,000 84,000 91,500 8.93%
3405 Temporary Contractual Service 21,801 - - - -
3412 Contractual Services - Archibald - 413 - - -
3414 Contractual Services - Causeway Park 7,275 5,666 3,500 3,500 12,100 245.71%
3415 Contractual Services - John's Pass Park 11,782 5,666 3,500 3,500 12,100 245.71%
4000 Travel and Training 443 271 - - -
4110 Cellular Telephone 1,065 1,092 1,200 1,200 1,200 0.00%
4311 Water Service - Medians 5,244 3,374 5,500 5,500 5,500 0.00%
4312 Water Service - Parks 8,917 14,589 6,900 6,900 26,200 279.71%
4314 Water Service - Buildings 3,062 2,384 1,600 1,600 - -100.00%
4332 Electric - Sprinklers 3,560 3,828 4,000 4,000 4,100 2.50%
4339 Electric - Park Restrooms 1,537 1,250 1,100 1,100 2,600 136.36%
4340 Waste Disposal 43,600 43,600 43,600 43,600 13,200 -69.72%
4500 General Insurance 9,927 9,861 11,100 11,100 9,500 -14.41%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 751 913 1,500 1,500 1,800 20.00%
4612 Maintenance - Building (Archibald Park) 20,335 75 - - -
4613 Maintenance - Building (John's Pass Park) 978 480 1,000 1,000 12,000 1100.00%
4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (Pocket Parks) 19,088 8,912 7,000 9,500 8,000 -15.79%
4622 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (Causeway) 1,386 385 4,000 4,000 12,000 200.00%
4630 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (J.P. Park) 126 - 4,000 4,000 5,000 25.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 1,988 8,830 8,000 5,500 1,000 -81.82%
4660 Maintenance - Seawalls 7,240 2,800 3,000 3,000 - -100.00%
4680 Maintenance - Tires - 298 - - -
5100 Office Supplies 29 - - - -
5200 Uniforms 1,145 468 - - -
5210 Departmental Supplies 886 317 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 6,562 5,358 7,000 7,000 5,600 -20.00%
5230 Tools 219 11 - - -
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 398 399 - - -
Subtotal Operating 197,537 202,777 202,500 202,500 224,400 10.81%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 6,400 - 25,000 285,833 100,000
6400 Capital Equipment - 9,995 37,500 37,500 - 166.67%
6911 9/11 Memorial 57,083 14,832 - - -
Subtotal Capital Outlay 63,483 24,827 62,500 323,333 100,000 -69.07%
TOTAL PARKS $441,800 $227,604 $265,000 $525,833 $324,400 -38.31%

50



PARKS (001.4900)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
OPERATING:
3400 Contractual Services 91,500 Contractual services to provide City's primary landscaping care
3414 Contractual Services - Causeway Park 12,100 Cleaning and janitorial services contract
3415 Contractual Services - John's Pass Park 12,100 Cleaning and janitorial services contract
4110 Cellular Telephone 1,200 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4311 Water Service - Medians 5,500 Water service on the City's landscaped medians
Water service to all City parks, street end pocket parks, beach accesses,
4312 Water Service - Parks 26,200 ball fields, etc.
4332 Electric - Sprinklers 4,100 Electrical service for sprinklers located throughout the city
4339 Electric - Park Restrooms 2,600 Electrical service at John's Pass Park restrooms
4340 Waste Disposal 13,200 Sanitation Fund billing to General Fund for waste disposal services
Estimated park property insurance premium, including the 9/11 Memorial,
based on quoted estimate. Also includes auto liability and physical damage
4500 General Insurance 9,500 policy for parks vehicles.
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 1,800 Auto maintenance as necessary for parks vehicles
4613 Maintenance - Building (John's Pass Park) 12,000 Repairs and upkeep to restroom and facilities at John's Pass Park
Beautification and landscaping of parks and green spaces throughout the
4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (Pocket Parks) 8,000 City
4622 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (Causeway) 12,000 Landscaping and maintenance at Causeway Park, including 9/11 Memorial
4630 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks (J.P. Park) 5,000 Landscaping and maintenance at John's Pass Park
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 1,000 Maintenance of sprinkler systems, tractors, mowers, edgers, blowers, etc.
Miscellaneous supplies required to manage parks: keys, safety fence, gas
5210 Departmental Supplies 1,000 cans, small parts, etc.
5220 Gasoline & Oil 5,600 Fuel expenditures for parks vehicles and equipment
Subtotal Operating 224,400
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 100,000 Citywide park beautification
Subtotal Capital Outlay 100,000
TOTAL PARKS $324,400

51



PARKS

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Central Services Director 0.1 0 0 0
Parks Supervisor 1 0 0 0
Grounds Maintenance Worker 4 0 0 0
Grounds Maintenance Worker (Part-time) 0.4 0 0 0
Total Funded Positions 5.5 0 0 0

52



RECREATION

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 183,306 299,998 366,600 366,600 365,800
OPERATING 169,027 159,429 289,900 289,900 364,900
CAPITAL - 5,572 15,000 65,000 73,000
TOTAL $352,333 $464,999 $671,500 $721,500 $803,700

FUNDING SOURCE:
GENERAL FUND $352,333 $464,999 $671,500 $721,500 $803,700

MISSION

The leisure services provided to the community through the Recreation Department are
intended to enhance the quality of life for citizens and visitors. The City of Madeira Beach
provides multiple programs for adults and children. The Recreation Department is managed
by the Parks and Recreation Director.

MAJOR INITIATIVES

The City has overhauled its Recreation services by reconstructing the Recreation Center and
improving various amenities located throughout the municipal complex, including
baseball/softball fields, basketball courts, tennis courts and walking trails. It is anticipated
that such efforts will help facilitate tourism and visitor activity in Madeira Beach, while
offering convenient, high-level services to full-time residents. New programming will take
effect in FY 2016 to that end, which is reflected in the Recreation Department budget.

53



RECREATION (001.5000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 143,349 238,184 281,800 281,800 278,800 -1.06%
1400 Overtime 2,945 3,567 4,000 4,000 3,000 -25.00%
2100 Social Security 10,902 18,443 21,600 21,600 21,400 -0.93%
2201 Retirement - FRS 1,583 2,647 - - -
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 4,186 12,277 18,100 18,100 17,500 -3.31%
2300 Group Insurance 15,766 20,424 35,400 35,400 39,100 10.45%
2400 Worker's Compensation 3,907 4,456 5,700 5,700 6,000 5.26%
2500 Unemployment Compensation 668 - - - -
Subtotal Personnel 183,306 299,998 366,600 366,600 365,800 -0.22%
OPERATING:
3117 Umpires & Officials 20,240 15,376 34,000 34,000 30,200 -11.18%
3121 Computer Software Support - - - - 2,100
3400 Contractual Services 16,812 12,935 39,100 39,100 35,700 -8.70%
3401 Scorekeepers 7,211 8,467 10,000 10,000 10,000 0.00%
3402 Instructors - - - - 25,000
3405 Temporary Services - - - - 10,000
4000 Travel and Training 355 2,007 500 500 6,000 1100.00%
4100 Telephone 1,667 2,731 2,900 2,900 5,500 89.66%
4110 Cellular Telephone 426 334 500 500 500 0.00%
4200 Postage 8 22 100 100 500 400.00%
4331 Electric - Buildings 7,053 4,474 7,200 7,200 9,600 33.33%
4333 Electric - Ball Fields 11,427 8,116 16,500 16,500 19,100 15.76%
4340 Waste Disposal 4,800 4,800 4,800 4,800 5,900 22.92%
4400 Rentals and Leases 500 1,617 14,000 14,000 2,400 -82.86%
4500 General Insurance 34,387 32,914 41,800 41,800 32,000 -23.44%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 1,262 1,047 1,500 1,500 1,500 0.00%
4610 Maintenance - Building 6,093 3,125 6,000 6,000 10,000 66.67%
4620 Maintenance - Grounds & Parks 7,608 5,640 20,000 20,000 20,300 1.50%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 4,629 1,270 4,000 4,000 1,500 -62.50%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 463 114 - - -
4700 Print & Reproduction 65 975 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%
4800 Promotions & Public Relations 987 568 5,000 5,000 55,000 1000.00%
4920 Licenses & Permits 370 533 500 500 500 0.00%
5100 Office Supplies 555 806 100 100 3,000 2900.00%
5101 Athletic Programming - - - - 5,500
5200 Uniforms 438 31 2,000 2,000 3,500 75.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 13,448 17,461 30,000 30,000 25,400 -15.33%
5212 After School Program 8,256 10,536 15,000 15,000 15,000 0.00%
5218 Summer Program 16,104 18,889 25,000 25,000 20,000 -20.00%
5220 Gasoline & OIl 3,767 4,613 4,000 4,000 3,800 -5.00%
5230 Tools 66 - - - -
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 30 30 400 400 400 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 169,027 159,429 289,900 289,900 364,900 25.87%

54



RECREATION (001.5000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
CAPITAL:

6300 Capital Improvements - - - 1,895 2,500 31.93%

6400 Capital EQuipment - 5,572 15,000 63,105 70,500 11.72%
Subtotal Capital Outlay - 5,572 15,000 65,000 73,000 12.31%
TOTAL RECREATION $352,333 $464,999 $671,500 $721,500 $803,700 11.39%

55



RECREATION (001.5000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages for Recreation Center staff, including estimated funding for
1200 Salaries & Wages 278,800 department director's vacation hour payout
1400 Overtime 3,000 Estimated overtime expenditures, primarily related to special event activity
2100 Social Security 21,400 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 17,500 City contribution to full-time staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 39,100 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage for full-time staff
2400 Worker's Compensation 6,000 Worker's compensation insurance costs for recreation staff

3117
3121
3400

3401
3402

3405
4000
4100
4110
4200
4331
4333
4340
4400

4500
4600
4610

4620
4640
4700

4800
4920
5100
5101
5200
5210

5212
5218
5220
5420

Subtotal Personnel
OPERATING:

Umpires & Officials
Computer Software Support
Other Contractual Services

Scorekeepers
Instructors

Temporary Contractual Services
Travel and Training

Telephone

Cellular Telephone

Postage

Electric - Buildings

Electric - Ball Fields

Waste Disposal

Rentals and Leases

General Insurance
Maintenance - Auto Equipment
Maintenance - Building

Maintenance - Grounds & Parks
Maintenance - Other Equipment
Print & Reproduction

Promotions & Public Relations
Licenses & Permits

Office Supplies

Athletic Programming
Uniforms

Departmental Supplies

After School Program
Summer Program
Gasoline & Oil

Dues & Subscriptions

Subtotal Operating

365,800

30,200

Officiating expenditures, which correspond to revenue-generating programs
such as tournaments, league play, etc.

2,100

Munis billing and customer database software support contract

35,700

Cleaning and janitorial services contract and related supplies

10,000

Scorekeeping expenditures, which correspond to revenue-generating
programs such as tournaments, league play, etc.

25,000

Fitness class (i.e. yoga, Zumba, etc.) independent contractor expenditures

10,000

Call-in labor as necessary for special events, weekend tournaments, etc.

6,000

Registration/reimbursement expenditures for staff development

5,500

Phone and internet service at the recreation facility

500

Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless

500

Postage for miscellaneous correspondence

9,600

Electrical service at recreation facility

19,100

Electrical service for baseball/softball fields and lighting

5,900

Sanitation Fund billing to General Fund for waste disposal services

2,400

Portable restrooms for league play, special events, tournaments, etc.

32,000

Insurance premiums based on quoted estimates. Includes property, flood,
auto liability and physical damage policies.

1,500

Maintenance as necessary for recreation vehicles and bus

10,000

Air conditioning and window cleaning services

20,300

General maintenance and upkeep of recreation complex grounds, including
fences, seawalls, docks, clay, baseball fields, sprinkler systems, etc.

1,500

Lawn tools and tractor maintenance as necessary

5,000

Advertisements, flyers, etc. to help increase tournament and league play

55,000

Community outreach, sponsorships, promotions etc. to help increase
tournament and league play

500

Pinellas County Health Department and License Board fees

3,000

Miscellaneous office supplies as needed

5,500

Sports field supplies and equipment

3,500

Staff uniforms, work shirts, etc.

25,400

Special event expenditures, trophies, awards, sports equipment, etc.

15,000

Full-week holiday camps and after-school program supplies including
games, arts and crafts, snacks, etc.

20,000

Field trip expenditures and summer camp supplies

3,800

Fuel expenditures for recreation vehicles

400

Florida Recreation and Park Association membership

364,900

56



RECREATION (001.5000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvement 2,500 Rec Center entrance facade improvements
Passenger van acquisition ($35,000); portable generator ($2,500); tennis
court wind screen ($1,000); golf cart ($6,000); soccer goals ($2,000); ice
6400 Capital Equipment 70,500 machines ($7,500); special event tents ($4,500); field tarp ($2,000)
Subtotal Capital Outlay 73,000
TOTAL RECREATION $803,700

57



RECREATION

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Parks and Recreation Director 0 0 1 1
Leisure Services Director 0 0 1 0
Central Services Director 0.1 0.1 0 0
Administrative Assistant 0 0.1 0 0
Recreation Supervisor 1 1 1 0
Recreation Coordinator 1 1 1 0
Grounds Maintenance Worker 1 0 0 0
Building Maintenance (Part-time) 0.5 0.7 0.5 0
Grounds Maint. Worker (Part-time) 0.5 0.7 0 0
Recreation Leader IlI 0 0 0 3
Recreation Leader I 0 0 2.1 1
Recreation Leader (Part-time) 2.05 2.1 0 0
Recreation Leader | 0 0 1.5 2.75
Recreation Aide (Part-time seasonal) 1.54 1.5 0 0
Total Funded Positions 7.69 7.2 8.1 7.75

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The FY 2016 budget reflects the impact of the employee buyout program, which went into
effect during the prior year. The Recreation Department has been restructured to include a
Director, three (3) full-time positions, and 3.75 full-time equivalent seasonal and part-time
Recreation Leader positions to fill specific programmatic needs.

58



PARKING ENFORCEMENT

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 64,984 81,009 114,200 114,200 108,600
OPERATING 140,109 171,345 176,700 176,700 152,200
CAPITAL 215,712 - 27,500 - 7,500
TOTAL $420,805 $252,354 $318,400 $290,900 $268,300
FUNDING SOURCE:
PARKING FUND $420,805 $252,354 - - -
GENERAL FUND - - $318,400 $290,900 $268,300

MISSION

Parking personnel, managed by the Assistant City Manager, maintain pay stations and
enforce parking activity throughout the City. The mission is to ensure compliance with City
ordinances and to help provide safety and mobility throughout the City's parking lots, which
are often heavily congested. Parking was previously operated as an enterprise fund prior to
FY 2014. Budget information on the retired fund can be found in the supplemental section
of this document.

59



PARKING ENFORCEMENT (001.6000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 45,582 58,834 80,000 80,000 74,700 -6.63%
1400 Overtime 1,034 4 800 800 - -100.00%
2100 Social Security 3,502 4,513 6,200 6,200 5,700 -8.06%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 1,799 2,479 5,300 5,300 5,600 5.66%
2300 Group Insurance 8,049 12,169 17,500 17,500 19,100 9.14%
2400 Worker's Compensation 3,431 2,914 4,400 4,400 3,500 -20.45%
2500 Unemployment Compensation 1,587 97 - - -
Subtotal Personnel 64,984 81,009 114,200 114,200 108,600 -4.90%
OPERATING:
3111 Armored Car Service 1,858 1,291 1,500 1,500 1,700 13.33%
3410 County Services 41,680 62,029 - - -
3411 Contractual Ticket Processing - - 20,000 20,000 12,800 -36.00%
3600 Administrative Services 30,100 - - - -
4110 Cellular Telephone 426 298 400 400 400 0.00%
4200 Postage 345 213 800 800 600 -25.00%
4500 General Insurance 750 749 700 700 800 14.29%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 273 1,394 2,000 2,000 2,000 0.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 565 1,271 2,500 2,500 2,500 0.00%
4655 Maintenance - Pay Stations - 23,447 42,000 42,000 39,600 -5.71%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 169 434 - - -
4700 Print & Reproduction 4,788 5,688 5,000 5,000 2,500 -50.00%
4930 Bank Service Fees - 67,743 87,000 87,000 77,000 -11.49%
5100 Office Supplies 160 31 500 500 500 0.00%
5200 Uniforms 576 368 800 800 800 0.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 55,727 4,054 10,000 10,000 7,500 -25.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 2,692 2,337 3,500 3,500 3,500 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 140,109 171,345 176,700 176,700 152,200 -13.87%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 115,722 - - - -
6400 Capital Equipment 99,990 - 27,500 - 7,500
Subtotal Capital Outlay 215,712 - 27,500 - 7,500
TOTAL PARKING ENFORCEMENT $420,805 $252,354 $318,400 $290,900 $268,300 -1.77%

60



PARKING ENFORCEMENT (001.6000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 74,700 Wages for parking enforcement employees
1400 Overtime - Call-back duty as necessary to maintain pay station functionality
2100 Social Security 5,700 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 5,600 City's contribution to full-time staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 19,100 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage for full-time employees
2400 Worker's Compensation 3,500 Worker's compensation insurance costs for parking staff
Subtotal Personnel 108,600
OPERATING:
3111 Armored Car Service 1,700 Coin delivery service to the bank for coins received at parking pay stations
3411 Contractual Ticket Processing 12,800 Contractual ticket processing services with Complus Data Innovations
4110 Cellular Telephone 400 Cell phone service contract with VVerizon Wireless
4200 Postage 600 Miscellaneous correspondence as necessary
Estimated auto liability and physical damage premiums for two parking
4500 General Insurance 800 enforcement vehicles
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 2,000 Auto maintenance for parking enforcement vehicles
Maintenance for change machines located in John's Pass Village and
change-counting machine at City Hall; maintenance of electric-vehicle
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 2,500 charging station located in John's Pass Park
Pay station spare parts kit; connection service required to process credit card
4655 Maintenance - Pay Stations 39,600 transactions; service calls at $125/call; extended warranty service
4700 Print & Reproduction 2,500 Parking passes and parking ticket production
4930 Bank Service Fees 77,000 Interchange fees for processing credit card payments
5100 Office Supplies 500 Miscellaneous recurring office supplies
5200 Uniforms 800 Uniforms and work shirts for parking enforcement officers
Tools, batteries and replacement items as needed to support pay stations;
5210 Departmental Supplies 7,500 drinking water for staff
5220 Gasoline & Oil 3,500 Fuel expenditures for parking enforcement vehicles
Subtotal Operating 152,200
CAPITAL:
6400 Capital Equipment 7,500 Change machine replacements
Subtotal Capital Outlay 7,500

TOTAL PARKING ENFORCEMENT  $268,300

61



PARKING ENFORCEMENT

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Parking Enforcement Supervisor 0 0 1 1
Parking Enforcement Officer Il 1 1 1 1
Parking Enforcement Officer | 2.40 2.10 1.05 0.75
Total Funded Positions 3.40 3.10 3.05 2.75

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

Budgeted hours for the part-time Parking Enforcement Officer position have been reduced by
0.30 FTE.

62



JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
OPERATING 148,174 101,076 126,700 126,700 137,800
CAPITAL 179,144 19,499 40,000 55,501 700,000
OTHER 185,200 - - - -
TOTAL $512,518 $120,575 $166,700 $182,201 $837,800

FUNDING SOURCE:
JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE FUND  $512,518 $120,575 - - -
GENERAL FUND - - $166,700 $182,201 $837,800

MISSION

The John's Pass Village district includes the commercial fishing and entertainment center located
immediately north and adjacent to the John's Pass Bridge. The City's mission at this location is to
help facilitate tourism by providing the infrastructure and services necessary to support local
businesses. The John's Pass Village division was previously operated as an enterprise fund prior
to FY 2014. Budget information on the retired fund can be found in the supplemental section of
this document.

63



JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE (001.8000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
OPERATING:

3400 Other Contractual Services 22,882 5,667 6,600 6,600 17,300 162.12%

3600 Administrative Services 22,900 - - -

4314 Water Service - Buildings 8,639 9,223 8,000 8,000 15,600 95.00%

4331 Electric - Buildings 1,743 2,108 3,000 3,000 2,200 -26.67%

4336 Electric - Street Lights 12,569 11,934 15,000 15,000 13,000 -13.33%

4340 Waste Disposal 27,600 27,600 27,600 27,600 38,900 40.94%

4500 General Insurance 37,375 32,292 38,500 38,500 27,300 -29.09%

4610 Maintenance - Building 4,959 2,934 6,000 6,000 5,000 -16.67%

4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks 5,427 7,387 12,000 12,000 12,000 0.00%

4630 Maintenance - Boardwalk 235 1,079 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%

4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment - 71 - - -

5210 Departmental Supplies 3,845 781 5,000 5,000 1,500 -70.00%
Subtotal Operating 148,174 101,076 126,700 126,700 137,800 8.76%
CAPITAL:

6300 Capital Improvements 179,144 19,499 40,000 55,501 700,000 1161.24%
Subtotal Capital Outlay 179,144 19,499 40,000 55,501 700,000 1161.24%
OTHER:

9175 Transfer to Parking Fund 109,700 - - - -

9950 Transfer to General Fund 75,500 - - - -

Subtotal Other 185,200 - - - -
TOTAL JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE $512,518 $120,575 $166,700 $182,201 $837,800 359.82%

64



JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE (001.8000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
OPERATING:
3400 Other Contractual Services 17,300 Cleaning and janitorial services contract
4314 Water Service - Buildings 15,600 Water service to city facilities located in John's Pass Village
4331 Electric - Buildings 2,200 Electrical service to city facilities located in John's Pass Village
4336 Electric - Street Lights 13,000 Street lights for John's Pass boardwalk signs and decorative lights
4340 Waste Disposal 38,900 Sanitation Fund billing to General Fund for waste disposal services
Estimated property and flood insurance premiums for retail store, boardwalk
4500 General Insurance 27,300 and bell tower based on quoted estimates
General maintenance and upkeep of Fantasy Planet retail store, village
4610 Maintenance - Building 5,000 restrooms and air-conditioning systems
4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks 12,000 Grounds maintenance and beautification within John's Pass Village
4630 Maintenance - Boardwalk 5,000 Boardwalk maintenance and upkeep as needed
Additional supplies needed for operations, maintenance and aesthetics within
5210 Departmental Supplies 1,500 the village, including signage, electrical supplies, bricks, garbage bins, etc.
Subtotal Operating 137,800
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 700,000 Up-lighting at Village Blvd. ($400,000); transient dock construction ($300,000)
Subtotal Capital Outlay 700,000

TOTAL JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE  $837,800

65



3. Local Option
Sales Tax Fund



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:

CAPITAL 740,177 1,352,683 65,000 867,677 690,000
TOTAL $740,177 $1,352,683 $65,000 $867,677 $690,000

FUNDING SOURCE:
LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND $740,177 $1,352,683 $65,000 $867,677 $690,000

MISSION

The Local Option Sales Tax Fund generates revenue through Pinellas County's 1% sales surtax program
(Penny for Pinellas), originally approved by voters in 1990. The tax has been extended twice, with the current

extension in place through December 2019. Funds are shared between the county and municipalities in order
to fund infrastructure improvements.

66



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

7th Cent Sales Tax 57.1% 394,200
Interest Earnings 0.2% 1,100
Fund Balance 42.7% 294,700
Total Funding Sources 100.00% $690,000

H 7th Cent Sales Tax
M Interest Earnings

= Fund Balance

67



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND

FUNDING USES

Capital Outlay 100.0% 690,000
Total Funding Uses 100.00% $690,000

M Capital Outlay

68



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:
Restricted balance 2,226,885 1,847,565 126,800 879,824 378,200 -57.01%
Total beginning available resources $2,226,885 $1,847565 $ 126,800 $ 879,824 $ 378,200 -57.01%

Operating revenues:

312.600 7th cent sales tax 359,960 383,159 365,000 365,000 394,200 8.00%
361.100 Interest earnings 897 1,783 1,100 1,100 1,100 0.00%
Total funding sources $ 360,857 $ 384,942 $ 366,100 $ 366,100 $ 395,300 7.98%
Total funding uses $ 740,177 $1,352,683 $ 65,000 $ 867,677 $ 690,000 -20.48%
Restricted fund balance $1,847,565 $ 879,824 $ 427,900 $ 378,247 $ 83,500 -77.92%

69



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND (103.9519)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 435,096 5,887 - 88,868 - -100.00%
6311 Archibald Memorial Beach Park Rehabilitation 203,962 577,934 - 8,588 - -100.00%
6313 Seawall Improvements - - 15,000 - -
6319 Marina Dock Construction - 77,665 - 422,335 - -100.00%
6320 Stormwater Drainage & Roadway Improvements 77,369 377,345 - 297,886 - -100.00%
6321 Beach Groyne Rehabilitation 6,000 273,852 - - -
6325 Madeira Way Improvements - - 50,000 50,000 40,000 -20.00%
6400 Capital Equipment 17,750 - - - 650,000
6406 ALS Vehicle Acquisition - 40,000 - - -
Subtotal Capital Outlay 740,177 1,352,683 65,000 867,677 690,000 -20.48%
TOTAL LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND $740,177 $1,352,683 $65,000 $867,677 $690,000 -20.48%

70



LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND (103.9519)

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE

FY 2016
BUDGET DESCRIPTION

CAPITAL:
6325 Madeira Way Improvements
6400 Capital Equipment

Subtotal Capital Outlay

TOTAL LOCAL OPTION SALES TAX FUND

40,000 Madeira Way roadway improvement design

650,000 Fire engine replacement

690,000

$690,000

71



4. Archibald Fund



ARCHIBALD FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL - 134,099 164,200 164,200 117,100
OPERATING - 33,092 101,700 101,700 135,500
CAPITAL - 3,311 20,000 20,000 77,000
TOTAL $0 $170,502 $285,900 $285,900 $329,600

FUNDING SOURCE:
ARCHIBALD FUND $0 $170,502 $285,900 $285,900 $329,600

MISSION

The Archibald Fund is a special revenue fund that was established in FY 2014. It is intended to
illustrate the extent to which revenues collected at Archibald Memorial Beach Park are
expended for parks and recreation services, in accordance with National Parks Service
requirements.

72



ARCHIBALD FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Parking Enforcement 69.9% 259,500
Lease Agreements 30.1% 112,000
Total Funding Sources 100.00% $371,500

M Parking Enforcement

M Lease Agreements

73



ARCHIBALD FUND

FUNDING USES

Personnel Costs 31.5% 117,100
Operating Costs 36.5% 135,500
Capital Outlay 20.7% 77,000
Fund Balance 11.3% 41,900
Total Funding Uses 100.00% $371,500

M Personnel Costs
M Operating Costs
i Capital Outlay

B Fund Balance

74



ARCHIBALD FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:
Restricted balance - - 1,700 30,333 36,400 20.00%
Total beginning available resources $ - $ - $ 1,700 $ 30,333 $ 36,400

Operating revenues:

344.501 Archibald Park parking meters 149,153 180,000 180,000 259,500 44.17%
347.594 Beach concession lease 25,667 40,000 40,000 40,000 0.00%
347.596 Snack Shack operator lease 26,015 72,000 72,000 72,000 0.00%
Total funding sources $ - $ 200,835 $ 292,000 $ 292,000 $ 371,500 27.23%
Total funding uses $ = $ 170,502 $ 285,900 $ 285,900 $ 329,600 15.29%
Restricted fund balance $ - $ 30,333 $ 7,800 $ 36,433 $ 78,300 114.92%

75



ARCHIBALD FUND (110.9910)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages - 95,072 111,000 111,000 78,100 -29.64%
1400 Overtime - 595 2,500 2,500 3,000 20.00%
2100 Social Security - 6,919 8,600 8,600 6,000 -30.23%
2201 Retirement - FRS - 3,377 4,200 4,200 4,100 -2.38%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan - 3,741 5,500 5,500 2,800 -49.09%
2300 Group Insurance - 20,967 26,300 26,300 19,300 -26.62%
2400 Worker's Compensation - 3,428 6,100 6,100 3,800 -37.70%
Subtotal Personnel - 134,099 164,200 164,200 117,100 -28.68%
OPERATING:
3405 Temporary Contractual Services 10,000
3600 Administrative Services - - 49,000 49,000 55,000 12.24%
4000 Travel and Training - - 800 800 800 0.00%
4312 Water Service - Parks - 1,890 3,300 3,300 3,600 9.09%
4314 Water Service - Buildings - 9,515 3,300 3,300 11,800 257.58%
4339 Electric - Park Restrooms - 3,292 1,500 1,500 1,700 13.33%
4340 Waste Disposal - - - - 14,900
4500 General Insurance - - 15,000 15,000 12,200 -18.67%
4612 Maintenance - Building - 3,145 3,000 3,000 6,000 100.00%
4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks - 3,011 6,000 6,000 7,500 25.00%
4660 Maintenance - Beach - 9,402 12,000 12,000 10,000 -16.67%
5200 Uniforms - - 800 800 500 -37.50%
5210 Departmental Supplies - 2,837 5,000 5,000 - -100.00%
5230 Tools - - 1,500 1,500 1,000 -33.33%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions - - 500 500 500 0.00%
Subtotal Operating - 33,092 101,700 101,700 135,500 33.24%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 22,000
6400 Capital Equipment - 3,311 20,000 20,000 55,000 175.00%
Subtotal Capital Outlay - 3,311 20,000 20,000 77,000 285.00%
TOTAL ARCHIBALD FUND $0 $170,502 $285,900 $285,900 $329,600 15.29%

76



ARCHIBALD FUND (110.9910)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 78,100 Wages for Parks Supervisor and Grounds Maintenance Worker
1400 Overtime 3,000 Estimated overtime expenses
2100 Social Security 6,000 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2201 Retirement - FRS 4,100 FRS retirement contributions
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 2,800 City contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 19,300 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 3,800 Worker's compensation insurance costs for park staff
Subtotal Personnel 117,100
OPERATING:
3405 Temporary Contractual Services 10,000 Call-in labor as necessary for park maintenance service
3600 Administrative Services 55,000 General Fund costs for support services provided to external operating funds
4000 Travel and Training 800 Florida Nursery Growers & Landscape conference
4312 Water Service - Parks 3,600 Estimated water service at Archibald Park
4314 Water Service - Building 11,800 Water service to City facilities at Archibald Park
4339 Electric - Park Restrooms 1,700 Electrical service at Archibald Park restrooms
4340 Waste Disposal 14,900 Sanitation Fund billing for waste disposal services
4500 General Insurance 12,200 Property insurance premium based on quoted estimate
4612 Maintenance - Building 6,000 Repairs and upkeep to restroom and facilities at Archibald Park
4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks 7,500 Beautification and landscaping of parks and green spaces
4660 Maintenance - Beach 10,000 Beach cleaning contract; swim buoy maintenance or replacement as needed
5200 Uniforms 500 Uniforms and work shirts for park staff as needed
5230 Tools 1,000 Miscellaneous hand tools for park staff as needed
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 500 Florida Nursery Growers & Landscape dues; Florida Farm Bureau dues
Subtotal Operating 135,500
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 22,000 Dog park station equipment ($10,000); security system ($12,000)
6400 Capital Equipment 55,000 Beach rake acquisition
Subtotal Capital Outlay 77,000
TOTAL ARCHIBALD FUND $329,600

77



ARCHIBALD FUND

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Parks Supervisor 0 1 1 1
Grounds Maintenance Worker 0 1 2 0.75
Total Funded Positions 0 2 3 1.75

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The full-time Grounds Maintenance Worker position has been eliminated, following
implementation of the FY 2014 employee buyout program. Budgeted hours for the part-
time Grounds Maintenance Worker position have been reduced by 0.25 FTE.

78



5. Building Fund



BUILDING FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL - - - - 268,000
OPERATING - - - - 65,300
CAPITAL - - - - -

TOTAL $0 $0 $0 $0  $333,300

FUNDING SOURCE:
BUILDING FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $333,300

MISSION

The Building Fund is a new special revenue fund established for FY 2016. It reports the
proceeds generated by the City's administration of the Florida Building Code; specifically,
building plan reviews, building inspection fees, and building permit processing. Per Florida
Statutes, such proceeds may only be used for the direct and reasonable indirect costs related
to enforcing the building code.

79



BUILDING FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Service Fees 100.0% 333,300
Total Funding Sources 100.00% $333,300

M Service Fees

80



BUILDING FUND

FUNDING USES

Personnel Costs 80.4% 268,000
Operating Costs 19.6% 65,300
Total Funding Uses 100.00% $333,300

M Personnel Costs

B Operating Costs

81



BUILDING FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 204 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
Beginning available resources:
FY 2014 restricted balance - - - - 100,100
FY 2015 restricted balance - - - - 66,000
Total beginning available resources $ - $ - $ > $ - $ 166,100
Operating revenues:
322.009 Variance applications - - - - 6,000
322.020 Building permits - - - - 326,100
322.023 Plan reviews - - - - 1,200
Total funding sources $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 333,300
Total funding uses $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 333,300
Restricted fund balance $ = $ = $ = $ = $ 166,100

82



BUILDING FUND (125.5240)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages - - - - 199,100
2100 Social Security - - - - 15,300
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan - - - - 19,100
2300 Group Insurance - - - - 29,600
2400 Worker's Compensation - - - - 4,900
Subtotal Personnel - - - - 268,000
OPERATING:
3121 Computer Software Support - - - - 11,600
3600 Administrative Services - - - - 35,400
4000 Travel and Training - - - - 5,000
4500 General Insurance - - - - 500
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment - - - - 2,000
4930 Bank Service Fees - - - - 5,000
5100 Office Supplies - - - - 2,000
5220 Gasoline & Oil - - - - 3,000
5230 Tools - - - - 500
5420 Dues & Subscriptions - - - - 300
Subtotal Operating - - - - 65,300
TOTAL BUILDING FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $333,300

83



BUILDING FUND (125.5240)

FY 2016

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION

PERSONNEL:

Direct wages for staff administering the Florida Building Code, including

1200 Salaries & Wages 199,100 estimated funding for department director's vacation hour payout
2100 Social Security 15,300 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 19,100 City contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 29,600 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 4,900 Worker's compensation insurance costs for staff

Subtotal Personnel 268,000

OPERATING:
3121 Computer Software Support 11,600 Munis property database software support contract
3600 Administrative Services 35,400 General Fund costs for support services provided to external operating funds
4000 Travel and Training 5,000 Continuing eduction credits for the Building Official and Permit Technician
4500 General Insurance 500 Auto insurance premium based on quoted estimate
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 2,000 Auto maintenance for Building Official's vehicle
4930 Bank Service Fees 5,000 Anticipated processing fees for online payments
5100 Office Supplies 2,000 Miscellaneous office supplies as needed
5220 Gasoline & Oil 3,000 Fuel expenses for the Building Official's vehicle
5230 Tools 500 Small hand tools as needed by the Building Official
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 300 International Code Council membership fees

Subtotal Operating 65,300

TOTAL BUILDING FUND $333,300

84



BUILDING FUND

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Community Services Director 0 0 0 1
Planning and Zoning Coordinator 0 0 0 0.5
Permit Technician 0 0 0 1
Administrative Assistant 0 0 0 0.5
Total Funded Positions 0 0 0 3

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The Community Services Director and Permit Technician are transferred in from the
Community Development Department. The Planning and Zoning Coordinator (previously
Community Development Director) and Administrative Assistant position are allocated 50%
each to the Community Development Department and Building Fund.

85



6. Gas Tax Fund



GAS TAX FUND

SUMMARY
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET
EXPENDITURES:

OPERATING - - - - 101,000
TOTAL $0 $0 $0 $0 $101,000
FUNDING SOURCE:

GAS TAX FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $101,000

MISSION

The Gas Tax Fund is a new special revenue fund established for FY 2016. It reports the municipal fuel tax
portion of State Revenue Sharing revenue as well as the City's share of Pinellas County's local option gas tax.

Proceeds must be spent on transportation-related services.

86



GAS TAX FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Local Option Gas Tax 54.2% 57,900
State Revenue Sharing (Motor Fuel Portion) 45.8% 48,900
Total Funding Sources 100.00% $106,800

M Local Option Gas Tax

B State Revenue Sharing (Motor
Fuel Portion)

87



GAS TAX FUND

FUNDING USES

Operating Costs 94.6% 101,000

Fund Balance 5.4% 5,800

Total Funding Uses 100.00% $106,800
N 5.4%

B Operating Costs

W Fund Balance

88



GAS TAX FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:
Restricted balance - - - - -
Total beginning available resources $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -

Operating revenues:

312.410 Local option gas tax - - - - 57,900
335.120 State revenue sharing - - - - 48,900
Total funding sources $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 106,800
Total funding uses $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 101,000
Restricted fund balance $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 5,800

89



GAS TAX FUND (150.5410)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
OPERATING:
4336 Electric - Street Lights - - - 95,000
4337 Electric - Traffic Signals - - - 6,000
Subtotal Operating - - - 101,000
TOTAL GAS TAX FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $101,000

90



GAS TAX FUND (150.5410)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
OPERATING:
4336 Electric - Street Lights 95,000 Electrical service for City street lights
4337 Electric - Traffic Signals 6,000 Electrical service for City traffic signs and signals
Subtotal Operating 101,000
TOTAL GAS TAX FUND $101,000

91



7. Debt Service Fund



DEBT SERVICE FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
OPERATING - - - - 527,800
TOTAL $0 $0 $0 $0 $527,800

FUNDING SOURCE:
DEBT SERVICE FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $527,800

MISSION
The Debt Service Fund is a special revenue fund established for FY 2016. This fund is required if the Board

of City Commissioners adopts the budget, as proposed by staff, with the intention of accumulating reserve
funds for the purpose of retiring outstanding debt.

92



DEBT SERVICE FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Interfund Transfers 100.0% 719,800
Total Funding Sources 100.00% $719,800

H Interfund Transfers

100.0%

93



DEBT SERVICE FUND

FUNDING USES

Debt Service Expenditures 73.3% 527,800
Fund Balance 26.7% 192,000
Total Funding Uses 100.00% $719,800

B Debt Service Expenditures

B Fund Balance

94



DEBT SERVICE FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:
Committed balance - - - - -
Total beginning available resources $ - $ - $ - $ = $ =

Non-operating funding sources:

Transfer from General Fund - restricted - - - - 527,800
Transfer from General Fund - committed - - - - 192,000
Total funding sources $ - $ - $ = $ - $ 719,800
Total funding uses $ - $ - $ = $ - $ 527,800
Committed fund balance $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 192,000

95



DEBT SERVICE FUND (170.5170)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

DEBT SERVICE:

7100 Principal - - - - 280,000
7200 Interest - - - - 247,800
Subtotal Debt Service - - - - 527,800
TOTAL DEBT SERVICE FUND $0 $0 $0 $0 $527,800

96



DEBT SERVICE FUND (170.5170)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
DEBT SERVICE:
7100 Principal 280,000 Series 2013: $90,000; Series 2014: $190,000
7200 Interest 247,800 Series 2013: $206,163; Series 2014: $41,685
Subtotal Debt Service 527,800
TOTAL DEBT SERVICE FUND $527,800

97



8. Sanition Fund



SANITATION FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 327,364 345,838 378,700 378,700 418,800
OPERATING 606,188 673,534 680,300 680,300 665,800
CAPITAL 161,948 7,383 220,000 220,000 242,000
OTHER 1,516 - - - -
TOTAL $1,097,016 $1,026,755 $1,279,000 $1,279,000 $1,326,600

FUNDING SOURCE:
SANITATION FUND $1,097,016 $1,026,755 $1,279,000 $1,279,000 $1,326,600

MISSION

The Sanitation Fund accounts for all activities related to solid waste removal. Sanitation staff
keep the environment free from hazard and unsightliness. Recycling services are provided
under contract with a third party. Sanitation services are intended to help ensure the health
and safety of the community.

98



SANITATION FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Service Fees 94.9% 1,259,400

Interest Earnings 0.0% 600

Sale of Scrap Iron 0.2% 2,000

Fund Balance 4.9% 64,600

Total Funding Sources 100.0% $1,326,600
" 0.2%

H 0.0%

M Service Fees
B Interest Earnings
m Sale of Scrap Iron

B Fund Balance

99



SANITATION FUND

FUNDING USES

Personnel Costs 31.6% 418,800
Operating Costs 50.2% 665,800
Capital Outlay 18.2% 242,000
Total Funding Uses 100.0% $1,326,600

M Personnel Costs
B Operating Costs

1 Capital Outlay

100



SANITATION FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:
Unrestricted net position 1,238,403 1,341,575 1,208,600 1,466,565 1,316,100
Total beginning available resources $1,238,403 $1,341,575 $1,208,600 $1,466,565 $1,316,100 -10.26%

Operating revenues:

337.337 Recycling grant 6,611 3,311 - - -

343.415 Sanitation service fee 1,156,160 1,145,198 1,125,000 1,125,000 1,140,000 1.33%

343.418 Recycling service fee - - - - 119,400

361.100 Interest earnings 503 106 1,200 1,200 600 -50.00%

364.411 Sale of equipment 35,820 - - - -

369.369 Miscellaneous revenue - 51 - - -

369.378 Sale of scrap iron 1,094 3,079 2,400 2,400 2,000 -16.67%
Total funding sources $1,200,188 $1,151,745 $1,128,600 $1,128,600 $ 1,262,000 11.82%
Total funding uses $1,097,016 $1,026,755 $1,279,000 $1,279,000 $ 1,326,600 3.72%
Unrestricted net position $1,341,575 $1,466,565 $1,058,200 $1,316,165 $1,251,500 -4.91%

101



SANITATION FUND (402.7000)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 202,387 203,966 226,000 226,000 252,500 11.73%
1400 Overtime 27,782 30,416 30,000 30,000 34,000 13.33%
2100 Social Security 16,887 17,395 17,300 17,300 19,400 12.14%
2201 Retirement - FRS 6,322 6,018 7,800 7,800 6,200 -20.51%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 7,405 9,023 11,800 11,800 15,500 31.36%
2300 Group Insurance 45,616 51,855 56,800 56,800 67,300 18.49%
2400 Worker's Compensation 20,965 27,165 29,000 29,000 23,900 -17.59%
Subtotal Personnel 327,364 345,838 378,700 378,700 418,800 10.59%
OPERATING:
3405 Temporary Contractual Services 63,980 55,155 58,000 58,000 35,000 -39.66%
3420 Waste Disposal 204,004 206,293 205,000 205,000 216,000 5.37%
3422 Curbside Recycling 76,215 98,837 116,400 116,400 119,400 2.58%
3423 Recycling Material Disposal 20,971 17,228 22,000 22,000 24,000 9.09%
3600 Administrative Services 96,100 127,300 98,000 98,000 72,200 -26.33%
4110 Cellular Telephone 1,065 792 1,100 1,100 1,100 0.00%
4202 Postage - Utility Bills 8,131 8,067 9,500 9,500 9,000 -5.26%
4400 Rentals and Leases 1,314 9,189 12,400 12,400 14,900 20.16%
4500 General Insurance 16,165 15,737 15,700 15,700 16,300 3.82%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 13,732 23,145 20,000 20,000 26,000 30.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 83 2,151 1,000 1,000 2,500 150.00%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 9,555 15,793 15,000 15,000 15,000 0.00%
5200 Uniforms 2,188 1,416 2,700 2,700 2,700 0.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 38,124 39,397 40,000 40,000 54,000 35.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 54,561 52,404 63,000 63,000 56,700 -10.00%
5230 Tools - 546 200 200 1,000 400.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions - 84 300 300 - -100.00%
Subtotal Operating 606,188 673,534 680,300 680,300 665,800 -2.13%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements - - - - 40,000
6400 Capital Equipment 161,948 7,383 220,000 220,000 202,000 -8.18%
Subtotal Capital Outlay 161,948 7,383 220,000 220,000 242,000 10.00%
OTHER:
9900 Contingency 1,516 - - - -
Subtotal Other 1,516 - - - -
TOTAL SANITATION FUND $1,097,016 $1,026,755 $1,279,000 $1,279,000 $1,326,600 3.72%

102



SANITATION FUND (402.7000)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages for sanitation employees, including estimated funding for department
1200 Salaries & Wages 252,500 director's vacation hour payout
1400 Overtime 34,000 Authorized overtime for sanitation workers
2100 Social Security 19,400 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2201 Retirement - FRS 6,200 FRS retirement contributions based on State contribution requirements
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 15,500 City contribution to administrative staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 67,300 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage for full-time employees
2400 Worker's Compensation 23,900 Worker's compensation insurance costs for sanitation staff
Subtotal Personnel 418,800
OPERATING:
3405 Temporary Services 35,000 Call-in service as necessary to maintain adequate staffing levels
3420 Waste Disposal 216,000 Pinellas County solid waste dumping fees
3422 Curbside Recycling 119,400 Residential curbside recycling contract, including contractual increase
Recycling services for brush disposal, bulk-item recycling and City Hall
3423 Recycling Material Disposal 24,000 recycling container
General Fund costs for support services provided to external operating
3600 Administrative Services 72,200 funds
4110 Cellular Telephone 1,100 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4202 Postage - Utility Bills 9,000 Pinellas County utility billing postage fees
4400 Rentals and Leases 14,900 Rental of public works storage facility, including contractual increase
Anticipated auto liability and physical damage premiums for sanitation
4500 General Insurance 16,300 packers, claw truck and pickup trucks, based on quoted estimate
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 26,000 Sanitation vehicle maintenance
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 2,500 Maintenance of dumpsters as necessary
4680 Maintenance - Tires 15,000 Sanitation vehicle tire maintenance
5200 Uniforms 2,700 Sanitation worker uniforms and work shirts
5210 Departmental Supplies 54,000 Cleaning supplies, gloves, trash bags, barrels, dumpster replacements
5220 Gasoline & Oll 56,700 Fuel expenditures for sanitation vehicles
5230 Tools 1,000 Miscellaneous hand tools as hecessary
Subtotal Operating 665,800
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 40,000 Design of new storage facility
6400 Capital Equipment 202,000 Scheduled replacement of vehicle no. 37
Subtotal Capital Outlay 242,000
TOTAL SANITATION FUND $1,326,600

103



SANITATION FUND

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Public Works Director 0.2 0.25 0.25 0.25
Administrative Assistant 0 0.25 0.25 0.25
Field Operations Manager 0 0.5 0 0
Sanitation Supervisor 1 0 1 1
Public Works Technician 0 0 0.5 0.5
Sanitation Worker II 3 3 3 3
Sanitation Worker | 3 3 1 2
Total Funded Positions 7.2 7 6 7

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

A Sanitation Worker | position has been added, offset by a corresponding reduction to
temporary/contractual labor services.

104



9. Stormwater Fund



STORMWATER FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 146,258 222,828 190,500 190,500 181,700
OPERATING 157,083 159,183 193,600 193,600 174,600
CAPITAL 74,650 270,939 2,500,000 2,991,990 3,170,000
DEBT SERVICE - - 33,800 21,000 504,600
OTHER - - 55,000 55,000 -
TOTAL $377,991 $652,950 $2,972,900 $3,452,090 $4,030,900

FUNDING SOURCE:
STORMWATER FUND $377,991 $652,950 $2,972,900 $3,452,090 $4,030,900

MISSION

Stormwater operations include all activities pertaining to the construction, maintenance and
repair of the City's stormwater management system in order to help ensure community health
and safety.

MAJOR INITIATIVES

The City initiated a significant investment in its stormwater infrastructure in FY 2012, beginning
with a master plan documenting the condition of all outfalls and drainage systems. In August
2015, the City closed on the first phase of financing pursuant to the Stormwater capital
improvement program. The FY 2015 revised budget total reflects the Series 2015 revenue note
approved by the Board of Commissioners.

105



STORMWATER FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Service Fees 17.1% 690,000
Interest Earnings 0.3% 12,900
Fund Balance 82.6% 3,328,000
Total Funding Sources 100.0%  $4,030,900

M Service Fees
B Interest Earnings

= Fund Balance

106



STORMWATER FUND

FUNDING USES

Personnel Costs 4.5% 181,700
Operating Costs 4.3% 174,600
Capital Outlay 78.6% 3,170,000
Debt Service 12.5% 504,600
Total Funding Uses 100.0% $4,030,900

B 4.5%

B Personnel Costs
B Operating Costs
i Capital Outlay

B Debt Service

107



STORMWATER FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
Beginning available resources:
Unrestricted net position $1,327,000 $1,312,137 $ 476,400 $ 1,007,291 $ 1,237,500 22.85%
Restricted net position $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 3,170,000
Covenant to budget and appropriate - - - - (158,000)
Total beginning available resources $1,327,000 $1,312,137 $ 476,400 $ 1,007,291 $ 4,249,500 321.87%
Operating revenues:
343.700 Stormwater service fees 362,754 347,897 650,300 650,300 690,000 6.10%
361.100 Interest earnings 374 207 2,000 2,000 12,900 545.00%
Non-operating funding sources:
381.999 Debt proceeds - - 2,500,000 6,200,000 - -100.00%
272.0272 Covenant to budget and appropriate - - - - 158,000
Total funding sources $ 363,128 $ 348,104 $ 3,152,300 $ 6,852,300 $ 860,900 -87.44%
Total funding uses $ 377991 $ 652,950 $ 2,972,900 $ 3,452,090 $ 4,030,900 16.77%
Unrestricted net position $1,312,137 $1,007,291 $ 655800 $ 1,237,501 $ 1,079,500 -12.77%

108



STORMWATER FUND (404.9200)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 97,402 147,820 125,000 125,000 116,600 -6.72%
1400 Overtime 8,643 5,483 4,000 4,000 6,000 50.00%
2100 Social Security 7,304 11,530 9,600 9,600 9,000 -6.25%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 8,151 12,149 11,300 11,300 10,400 -7.96%
2300 Group Insurance 17,262 32,206 26,700 26,700 29,000 8.61%
2400 Worker's Compensation 6,671 13,640 13,900 13,900 10,700 -23.02%
2500 Unemployment Compensation 825 - - - -
Subtotal Personnel 146,258 222,828 190,500 190,500 181,700 -4.62%
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 89,788 37,248 47,000 47,000 38,000 -19.15%
3400 Contractual Services - 2,400 7,500 7,500 10,000 33.33%
3407 Street Sweeping Contract 11,008 11,008 15,000 15,000 12,400 -17.33%
3600 Administrative Services 13,500 54,600 49,000 49,000 39,200 -20.00%
4000 Travel and Training 960 1,153 1,500 1,500 1,300 -13.33%
4110 Cellular Telephone 213 1,289 1,300 1,300 1,300 0.00%
4202 Postage - Utility Bills 8,137 8,153 9,500 9,500 8,500 -10.53%
4313 Water Service - Pump Station 68 92 200 200 200 0.00%
4334  Electric - Pump Station 457 531 800 800 800 0.00%
4400 Rentals and Leases 540 10,438 11,600 11,600 14,000 20.69%
4500 General Insurance 17,327 15,300 25,200 25,200 17,500 -30.56%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 108 795 2,000 2,000 3,000 50.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 381 668 500 500 500 0.00%
4650 Maintenance - Streets - 30 1,200 1,200 5,000 316.67%
4661 Maintenance - Storm Drains 7,255 8,276 12,000 12,000 15,000 25.00%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 740 580 700 700 - -100.00%
4900 Other Current Charges 216 222 - - -
4920 Licenses & Permits 182 182 500 500 200 -60.00%
5200 Uniforms 490 627 800 800 1,000 25.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 46 583 800 800 1,000 25.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 5,028 4,620 5,000 5,000 4,500 -10.00%
5230 Tools 139 184 500 500 500 0.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 500 204 1,000 1,000 700 -30.00%
Subtotal Operating 157,083 159,183 193,600 193,600 174,600 -9.81%
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 74,650 129,643 200,000 233,286 300,000 28.60%
6320 Stormwater Drainage & Roadway Improvements - 141,296 2,300,000 2,758,704 2,800,000 1.50%
6400 Capital Equipment - - - - 70,000
Subtotal Capital Outlay 74,650 270,939 2,500,000 2,991,990 3,170,000 5.95%
DEBT SERVICE:
7100 Principal - - - - 344,000
7200 Interest - - 33,800 21,000 160,600 664.76%
Subtotal Debt Service - - 33,800 21,000 504,600 2302.86%
OTHER:
9999 Cost of Issuance - - 55,000 55,000 - -100.00%
Subtotal Other - - 55,000 55,000 - -100.00%
TOTAL STORMWATER FUND $377,991 $652,950 $2,972,900 $3,452,090 $4,030,900 16.77%

109



STORMWATER FUND (404.9200)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages for stormwater employees, including estimated funding for
1200 Salaries & Wages 116,600 department director's vacation hour payout
1400 Overtime 6,000 Authorized overtime for stormwater staff
2100 Social Security 9,000 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 10,400 City contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 29,000 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 10,700 Worker's compensation insurance costs for stormwater staff
Subtotal Personnel 181,700
OPERATING:
NPDES management and annual reporting (estimated $23,000); grant
3100 Professional Services 38,000 lobbying services (estimated $15,000)
3400 Contractual Services 10,000 Palm tree and debris maintenance contract
Street sweeping services provided by contract, including anticipated
3407 Street Sweeping Contract 12,400 increase
General Fund costs for support services provided to external operating
3600 Administrative Services 39,200 funds
4000 Travel and Training 1,300 Florida Stormwater Association conference registration and travel
4110 Cellular Telephone 1,300 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4202 Postage - Utility Bills 8,500 Pinellas County utility billing postage fees
4313 Water Service - Pump Station 200 Water service for stormwater pump station
4334 Electric - Pump Station 800 Electrical service for stormwater pump station
4400 Rentals and Leases 14,000 Rental of public works storage facility, including contractual increase
Estimated property and flood insurance premiums for the City's stormwater
pump station, based on quoted estimates. Also includes auto liability and
4500 General Insurance 17,500 physical damage policy for stormwater vehicles.
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 3,000 General maintenance and upkeep as necessary of stormwater staff vehicles
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 500 Maintenance of generator, equipment, pumps as needed
4650 Maintenance - Streets 5,000 Patching of roadways and repair of streets as necessary
4661 Maintenance - Storm Drains 15,000 Maintenance of storm drains and cleaning of CDS units
Pinellas County National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES)
4920 Licenses & Permits 200 permit fees
5200 Uniforms 1,000 Uniform purchases and work shirts as needed
5210 Departmental Supplies 1,000 Gloves, rags, chemicals, soaps, etc. as needed
5220 Gasoline & Oil 4,500 Fuel expenditures for stormwater vehicles
5230 Tools 500 Miscellaneous hand tools as needed
Florida Stormwater Association dues; Florida Water and Pollution Control
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 700 dues
Subtotal Operating 174,600
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 300,000 Ongoing repair and rehabilitation of the City's stormwater outfalls
Construction funding: Boca Ciega Drive ($1.5M), Rex Place ($600K),
6320 Stormwater Drainage & Roadway Improvements 2,800,000 Municipal Drive ($100K), American Legion Drive ($600K)
6400 Capital EqQuipment 70,000 Vehicle acquisition and replacement
Subtotal Capital Outlay 3,170,000
DEBT SERVICE:
7100 Principal 344,000 Principal payment on Series 2015 revenue note
7200 Interest 160,600 Interest payment on Series 2015 revenue note
Subtotal Debt Service 504,600
TOTAL STORMWATER FUND $4,030,900

110



STORMWATER FUND

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Public Works Director 0.2 0.25 0.25 0.25
Administrative Assistant 0 0.25 0.25 0.25
Field Operations Manager 0 0.5 0 0
Public Works Supervisor 1 1 1 1
Public Works Technician 1 1 1.5 1.5

Total Funded Positions 2.2 3 3 3

111



10. Marine Fund



MARINA FUND

SUMMARY

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016
ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET

EXPENDITURES:
PERSONNEL 136,835 201,844 196,500 196,500 221,700
OPERATING 1,605,131 1,830,489 1,982,800 1,981,063 2,016,500
CAPITAL - 15,393 25,000 29,350 405,000
DEBT SERVICE 26,233 29,000 29,000 29,000 29,000
TOTAL $1,768,199 $2,076,726 $2,233,300 $2,235,913 $2,672,200
FUNDING SOURCE:
MARINA FUND $1,768,199 $2,076,726 $2,233,300 $2,235,913 $2,672,200
MISSION

The Marina Fund includes personnel and operating costs associated with the City's marina
facility and Ship Store on 150th Avenue. The marina is located on Boca Ciega Bay, providing
quick access to the Gulf of Mexico through John's Pass. The marina features wet and dry slips
available for lease by patrons. The Ship Store sells live and frozen bait, tackle, snack food,
beverages, propane fuel, unleaded and diesel fuel and various items for the convenience of
boaters. Marina operations are intended to provide safe and convenient access to the
community's waterways.

MAJOR INITIATIVES

The City has committed to supporting a highly functional marina facility. Recent investments in
the Ship Store retail center have contributed to increased sales activity, resulting in the Marina
Fund achieving its best financial performance. The City completed a major renovation of the
marina "B" docks in FY 2015, including the installation of lift slips. Similar funding is provided in
the FY 2016 budget for "A" dock reconstruction.

112



MARINA FUND

FUNDING SOURCES

Slip Rentals 10.6% 283,000
Retail Sales 75.1% 2,005,500
Interest Earnings 0.0% 200
Miscellaneous Revenue 0.3% 7,500
Fund Balance 14.1% 376,000
Total Funding Sources 100.0% $2,672,200

m Slip Rentals

M Retail Sales

I Interest Earnings

B Miscellaneous Revenue

M Fund Balance

113



MARINA FUND

FUNDING USES

Personnel Costs 8.3% 221,700

Operating Costs 75.5% 2,016,500

Capital Outlay 15.2% 405,000

Debt Service 1.1% 29,000

Total Funding Uses 100.0% $2,672,200
B 1.1%

M Personnel Costs
M Operating Costs
i Capital Outlay

B Debt Service

114



MARINA FUND: REVENUE AND FUND BALANCE

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED  REVISED BUDGET CHANGE

Beginning available resources:

Unrestricted net position (276,747) (168,297) 346,800 357,288 412,900
Amortized advance from General Fund - 398,281 - - -
Total beginning available resources $ (276,747) $ 229,984 $ 346,800 $ 357,288 $ 412,900 15.57%

Operating revenues:

347.401 Late fees - 555 - - -

347.520 Dry storage fees 69,277 65,526 70,000 70,000 72,000 2.86%

347.521 Transient rentals 37,792 39,563 36,000 36,000 36,000 0.00%

347.530 Unleaded fuel sales 929,294 1,160,909 1,225,000 1,225,000 1,225,000 0.00%

347.531 Propane sales 7,655 8,646 12,000 12,000 5,000 -58.33%

347.532 Diesel sales 101,706 79,264 80,000 80,000 80,000 0.00%

347.533 Diesel commercial 362,413 464,893 515,000 515,000 515,000 0.00%

347.534 Propane - exempt 64 (19) - - -

347.551 Store sales - exempt 5,614 6,913 5,500 5,500 5,500 0.00%

347.552 Store sales - taxable 173,270 193,469 175,000 175,000 175,000 0.00%

347.553 Special marine orders 709 - - - -

347.580 Marina wet slip rentals 177,380 171,336 165,000 165,000 175,000 6.06%

361.100 Interest earnings (192) (134) 600 600 200 -66.67%

364.411 Sale of equipment 1,400 - - - -

369.369 Miscellaneous revenue 2,659 4,274 - - -

369.377 Commission - laundry equipment 1,386 1,195 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%

369.381 Sales tax collection allowance 360 (57) - - -

369.384 Boat ramp fees 5,862 7,697 6,500 6,500 6,500 0.00%
Total funding sources $1,876,649 $ 2,204,030 $ 2,291,600 $ 2,291,600 $ 2,296,200 0.20%
Total funding uses $1,768,199 $2,076,726 $ 2,233,300 $ 2,235,913 $ 2,672,200 19.51%
Unrestricted net position $ (168,297) $ 357,288 $ 405,100 $ 412975 $ 36,900 -91.06%

115



MARINA FUND (405.9300)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
PERSONNEL:
1200 Salaries & Wages 76,683 129,589 124,000 124,000 144,600 16.61%
1400 Overtime 8,875 10,622 11,000 11,000 12,000 9.09%
2100 Social Security 9,751 10,274 9,500 9,500 11,100 16.84%
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 8,469 11,195 11,200 11,200 11,300 0.89%
2300 Group Insurance 28,292 33,051 31,700 31,700 34,600 9.15%
2400 Worker's Compensation 4,765 7,113 9,100 9,100 8,100 -10.99%
Subtotal Personnel 136,835 201,844 196,500 196,500 221,700 12.82%
OPERATING:
3100 Professional Services 90 4,806 - - -
3121 Computer Software Support - - - - 4,800
3400 Contractual Service 5,599 6,491 7,100 7,100 15,900 123.94%
3600 Administrative Services 84,500 65,500 58,800 58,800 63,200 7.48%
4000 Travel and Training 1,126 1,989 2,900 2,900 3,000 3.45%
4100 Telephone 4,009 3,980 4,300 4,300 4,500 4.65%
4110 Cellular Phone 816 911 1,000 1,000 1,600 60.00%
4200 Postage 598 708 800 800 800 0.00%
4300 Utilities - Water Service 12,564 18,191 20,200 20,200 20,700 2.48%
4331 Electric - Buildings 10,578 11,450 11,500 11,500 12,400 7.83%
4335 Electric - Docks 15,589 14,876 18,000 18,000 18,000 0.00%
4340 Waste Disposal - - - - 5,000
4400 Rentals and Leases - 1,860 4,000 4,000 1,200 -70.00%
4402 Submerged Land Lease 3,100 2,542 2,600 2,600 2,700 3.85%
4500 General Insurance 6,024 12,611 8,900 8,900 8,600 -3.37%
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 206 834 500 500 1,500 200.00%
4610 Maintenance - Building 1,979 1,043 2,300 3,800 4,500 18.42%
4620 Maintenance - Grounds 536 1,835 5,000 5,000 6,500 30.00%
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 2,289 3,734 3,500 3,500 5,000 42.86%
4680 Maintenance - Tires 292 - - - -
4692 Maintenance - Marina 11,102 9,128 12,500 9,650 14,000 45.08%
4700 Print & Reproduction 245 212 1,000 1,000 800 -20.00%
4800 Promotions & Public Relations 10,340 10,364 18,000 18,000 22,500 25.00%
4803 Boat Parade - 4,981 5,000 5,000 5,000 0.00%
4920 Licenses & Permits 1,232 1,692 1,000 1,000 1,000 0.00%
4930 Bank Service Charges 24,025 29,495 27,500 27,500 26,400 -4.00%
5100 Office Supplies 2,073 1,859 1,200 1,200 1,500 25.00%
5200 Uniforms 758 424 800 800 800 0.00%
5210 Departmental Supplies 7,634 4,735 7,000 7,000 7,000 0.00%
5220 Gasoline & Oil 1,073 852 1,100 1,100 1,100 0.00%
5230 Tools 340 637 800 800 1,000 25.00%
5270 Fuel Purchases - Resale 1,247,843 1,476,497 1,600,000 1,600,000 1,600,000 0.00%
5271 Store Purchases - Resale 141,288 130,333 145,000 144,613 145,000 0.27%
5272 Propane Purchases - Resale 6,906 5,299 10,000 10,000 10,000 0.00%
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 377 620 500 500 500 0.00%
Subtotal Operating 1,605,131 1,830,489 1,982,800 1,981,063 2,016,500 1.79%

116



MARINA FUND (405.9300)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED BUDGET CHANGE
CAPITAL:

6300 Capital Improvement - - - 2,850 300,000  10426.32%

6400 Capital Equipment - 15,393 25,000 26,500 105,000 296.23%
Subtotal Capital Outlay - 15,393 25,000 29,350 405,000 1279.90%

DEBT SERVICE:

7100 Principal 19,400 22,500 22,500 22,500 23,500 4.44%
7200 Interest 6,833 6,500 6,500 6,500 5,500 -15.38%
Subtotal Debt Service 26,233 29,000 29,000 29,000 29,000 0.00%
TOTAL MARINA FUND $1,768,199 $2,076,726 $2,233,300 $2,235,913 $2,672,200 19.51%

117



MARINA FUND (405.9300)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
PERSONNEL:
Wages for marina employees, including estimated funding for department
1200 Salaries & Wages 144,600 director's vacation hour payout
1400 Overtime 12,000 Authorized overtime for special events such as King of the Beach
2100 Social Security 11,100 FICA contributions at 7.65% of salary
2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 11,300 City's contribution to staff retirement at 9% of salary
2300 Group Insurance 34,600 Medical, dental, life and long-term disability coverage
2400 Worker's Compensation 8,100 Worker's compensation insurance costs for marina staff
Subtotal Personnel 221,700
OPERATING:
3121 Computer Software Support 4,800 Point of sale system support fees
3400 Contractual Service 15,900 Cleaning and janitorial service contract
General Fund costs for support services provided to external operating
3600 Administrative Services 63,200 funds
Registration and travel costs for Public Works Director to attend relevant
4000 Travel and Training 3,000 training programs
4100 Telephone 4,500 Telephone, cable and internet services at the Marina Ship Store
4110 Cellular Phone 1,600 Cell phone service contract with Verizon Wireless
4200 Postage 800 Miscellaneous correspondence costs
4300 Utilities - Water service 20,700 Pinellas County Utility fees
4331 Electric - Buildings 12,400 Electricity costs for fuel dock, charter boat slips and Ship Store
4335 Electric - Docks 18,000 Electricity costs for A and B docks
4340 Waste Disposal 5,000 Sanitation Fund billing for waste disposal services
Rental of ice machine, to be terminated upon installation of commercial ice
4400 Rentals and Leases 1,200 closet
Florida Department of Environmental Protection (FDEP) submerged land
4402 Submerged Land Lease 2,700 lease for fuel dock and wet slips
Marina insurance premiums, based on quoted estimates. Includes property,
flood and environmental liability coverage. Auto liability and physical
4500 General Insurance 8,600 damage policy also included for two vehicles.
4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 1,500 Miscellaneous small auto maintenance as needed
4610 Maintenance - Building 4,500 Repair and upkeep of the Ship Store facility
4620 Maintenance - Grounds 6,500 Mulch, rock, fencing, etc. as needed for upkeep of the Ship Store facility
Maintenance of lawn equipment, bait tank, other miscellaneous items as
4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 5,000 needed
Repair and maintenance of fuel pumps, docks, water lines, electrical repairs,
4692 Maintenance - Marina 14,000 etc.
4700 Print & Reproduction 800 Miscellaneous printed materials including business cards, signs, flyers, etc.
4800 Promotions & Public Relations 22,500 Advertisements, fishing tournament expenditures, public events
4803 Boat Parade 5,000 Annual city boat parade event expenses and prize purse
State licenses required by Florida Department of Agriculture and Florida
4920 Licenses & Permits 1,000 Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission
4930 Bank Service Charges 26,400 Interchange fees for processing credit card payments
5100 Office Supplies 1,500 Miscellaneous office supplies as needed
5200 Uniforms 800 Uniforms for marina employees
Point of sale-system expenses, drinking water, computer equipment and
5210 Departmental Supplies 7,000 other miscellaneous items associated with marina operations
5220 Gasoline & Qil 1,100 Fuel for marina staff vehicles
5230 Tools 1,000 Dock and plumbing equipment as needed
5270 Fuel Purchases - Resale 1,600,000 Fuel purchased for re-sale to the public
5271 Store Purchases - Resale 145,000 Retail items for customer sales at the Ship Store

118



MARINA FUND (405.9300)

FY 2016
CODE ACCOUNT TITLE BUDGET DESCRIPTION
5272 Propane Purchases - Resale 10,000 Propane purchased for re-sale at the Ship Store
5420 Dues & Subscriptions 500 Association of Marina Industries membership
Subtotal Operating 2,016,500
CAPITAL:
6300 Capital Improvements 300,000 Marina "A" dock construction
105.000 Commercial ice closet ($40,000); point of sale system replacement
6400 Capital Equipment ' ($15,000); boat acquisition ($50,000)
Subtotal Capital Outlay 405,000
DEBT SERVICE:
Repayment of General Fund loan for construction of the Ship Store (20
7100 Principal 23,500 vyears, 1.5%)
Repayment of General Fund loan for construction of the Ship Store (20
7200 Interest 5,500 vyears, 1.5%)
Subtotal Debt Service 29,000
TOTAL MARINA FUND $2,672,200

119



MARINA FUND

POSITION COUNTS (FTE)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Public Works Director 0.3 0.3 0.3 0.3
Administrative Assistant 0 0.3 0.3 0.3
Marina Supervisor 0 1 1 1
Marina Assistant 2 2 2 2.75
Marina Attendant 1 0 0 0
Total Funded Positions 3.3 3.6 3.6 4.35

FY 2016 POSITION CHANGES SUMMARY

The FY 2016 budget includes the addition of a part-time Marina Assistant to maintain
adequate staffing levels during peak activity hours.

120



11. Capital
Improvement Program



FY 2016 - FY 2020 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM (CIP)

Fund FY 2016
General Fund 23.9% 1,429,000
Local Option Sales Tax Fund 11.5% 690,000
Archibald Fund 0.9% 55,000
Sanitation Fund 4.0% 242,000
Stormwater Fund 52.9% 3,170,000
Marina Fund 6.8% 405,000
Total Budget 100.0% $ 5,991,000

Marina Fund
6.8%

General Fund
23.9%

H General Fund
M Local Option Sales Tax Fund

H Archibald Fund

Local Option Sales Tax M Sanitation Fund

Fund
Stormwater Fund 11.5%

52.9% ® Marina Fund

B Stormwater Fund

Archibald Fund
0.9%

121



- - - - - - 2L0'TVe eyal pleqiyoly
- - - - - - 2€8'vT [eLIOWSN TT/6
:sjuswanoldwy/sioafoid

%S°LT %0'62 %E'TS %E'SS %6'€S %€'0L %S'TL 186png Bunelado Jo wsalad se soueleq a|ge|ieAy
002'6v2'T $ 009'9T0'C $ 00S'65V'E $ 006'6T9'E $ 002'Ger'e $ ¥00'20S'V $ 92T'TL8'E $ aoue[eq puny paubisseun
006'TL6°L $ 00S'C8E'6 $ 006'T0T'8 $ 00E'9.T'TT $ 000'6vS'TT $ 890°GTT'9T $ 168'862'CT $ S3asn buipuny [e30L

- - - - - - - pun4 buip|ing o1 Jajsuel |
00g's R B . - - - pun4 xe| seo 0} Jajsuel ]

- - - - 006'T6T - - 9ouEleq paniWwwWod pun4 [eisauss) o} uoneudoiddy

- - - - 000°26T - - 9due[eq PaIWWOD pun4 32IAISS 103 01 uoneudoiddy

- - - - 006'€58'C - - welboid uonebmw pooy Y3
000°06 - 000'S0T 00096 000'6.T 00S'Le - MOJ3q P3INPaYds se sjuswade|dal ddIYdA
000'0ET 000'G2T - 000'00S'€ 000'052'T §9/'6.2'6 v..'6¥S5'9 MOJ3q pajNpayds se sjaafoid [ended

- - - 000'G9 - - - B8J0U BNUBAaI /TQZ ‘9ouenss| Jo 10D

N N - - - 000'GS - 9JOU dnuaAal $TQgZ ‘@auenssi Jo 1s0)

- - - - - - 0S6'v72 puog anuaAal £TQZ ‘9ouUenss| JO 150D
000'00€ 000'00€ 000'00€ 000'0ST - - - (pun4 's°@ 01 I8ysuen) BJOU BNUBABI LTOZ ‘@IIAIBS 198

- 002'9T.'T 006'659 006'TeS 009'TEC 00L'ey - (pun4 "s*@ 01 I3jsuen) S10U BNUBA3I HTOZ ‘93INISS 193
00.'v62 00.',62 009'G62 00v'862 002'962 00T'60€ 108'16 (pund s°@ 01 J3jsuel) PUOQ dNUBARI ETOZ ‘9IAISS 10aQ
006'TST'Z 009'€EV6'9 00v'TVL'9 000'G¥S'9 00¥'¥SE'9 €00'TOV'9 19€'2TV'S sainlipuadxa 196pnq Bunessado

:sasn Buipung

006'€L2'L $ 000°L00'8 $ 000°L00'8 $ 00S'VEV'TT $ 00¥',62'0T $ 0L0°€2S'TT $ ¢8e'TeT'eT $ S82In0s bulpunj [el0L
- - - - - 06'9v. - JuswiaMmas unsme
- - - - 006'€58'c - - wrelboid uonebniw pooy VINIS
- 006°659 006'659 006°659 006'62€ 0€2'198 697'82T 8|npayds Buipuny syuswaroidul "pAlg JiND 0D selauld
- - - 000'00S'E - - - 810U 8NUBA8I /TOZ ‘speadoid 1gad
- - - - - 000'5S6'C - 3lou 8nuaAal Tz ‘spaadoid 1gaa
- - - - - - 000'09.'v puog anuaAal €10z ‘spasdoid 1geq

000°62 000°62 000°62 000°62 000°62 000°62 000°62 (81015 diys) pund eutiey wou JuswAhedsy
B N N - - 000°zzE - preme juelb Juswaaoidw buireog
- - - - - - 000°0S uonnguuod [ended ‘09 sejjauld
- - - - - G59'ee - pleme juelb siaiybyali4 0) 9oUelSISSY
- - - - 000'0S - - 1uelb uonealdal dvayd
- - - - - 18.'/8 - weiboid uomreoynneaq 1044
- - - - - - 61£'895 pun4 Bupjred woly Jajsuel |
B, - - - - - 80T'806 pun4 abejiIA SSed S,uyor wouy Jajsuel |

006'7¥72'L 00T'8TE'L 00T'8TE'L 009'G¥7¢'L 009'7€0°'L 00S'L6%'9 9SV'LLL'9 sanuanal bunelado

:s921n0s Buipuny

002'.v6'T $ 00T'C6E'E $ 00¥'¥SS'E $ 00L'T9E'E $ 008'9.9'% $ 200'760'6 $ LI8'YSE'8 $ S821N0sal d|qe|reAe buiuuibag [ejo L

: - - - - 9/T'90%'S - SadueIqundud uado

- - - - - - 008'LTS @oueleq paubisse punj Juswade|dal S|IIYSA Jawio

- - - - - - 00.'vve'S WIB)SAS 19MBS JO 3jes Wol) Spaadonid

- - - - 000'02€ - - aoueleq Arelabpnq buneiado 1au JesaA Joud parewnsy

- - - - (000'99) - - anuanal 18U apo3 Buiping epLoj4
(0017'69) (0ot'29) (005'59) (005°'€9) (00z'62) (0og'€8T) - uonelIou0d8l 8AIaSal Aousbiswg
009'9T0°'C 00S'65t'E 006'6T9'E 00z'ser'e 000°20S'? 92T'T.L8'E LTE'Z6Y'Y aouefeq paubiisseun

:s901n0sal a|qe|reAe Buiuuibag

NOILO3ArOYd 0¢ A4 NOILDOArO™d 6T A4 NOILOACOHd 8T A4 NOILOArOHd LT A4 139dNg 9T Ad d3SINTY ST Ad IVNLOV ¥T Ad

EICIEDED)

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

122



000002 $ 000°0TT $ 000'S0T $ 000'96S°€

$ 000'62V'T

$ S92°L0E'6

$ vL.'6VS9

$

[e10l dID

000°06 $ - $ 000°S0T $ 00096

$ 0006.T

$ 00S'/.Z

$ -

$

[B10L S3|2IYIA

uonisinboe uea labuassed

000'S€

00S°22

(00T#) uomisinboe apdIyaA uoisiAp Bulping

(GG#) sng UOISIA pligan|g 0T0Z

pajnpayods Juswade|dal ou - (86#) Jobuey pio4 8002

painpayds Juswade|dal ou - (L6#) Jabuey pio4 2002

(96#) adeas3 pio4 /002

(89#) 05€4 P104 9002

(vv#) Jopeo aoyydeg a18ad uyor 5002

(€#) 0524 P104 G002

(0z#) 0STd p104 G002

(06#) wey abpoq 666T

(9€#) 0624 piod /66T

(BE#) 19M0Ng /M UBA p104 TE6T

(Ev#) Y11 5104 91980 UYOr /86T

$ 000'00S'E

$ 000'052'T

$ S59.'6.2'6

$ vLL'6YS'9

$

EEIRINEN

lero] syuawanoidwy/sioaloid

(papunjun) sjuswanoidwi Aemasne) Henis wo

(papunjun) uoisuedxa ai01S diys

(papunyun) Ayjioe} uoisuedxs bBupiled

(papunjun) Auioey Kip pue UBIy eurei

(papunyun) uonisinboe pueq

(papunyun) siayays sng

S69'CT

UONINASUOD XI0p Judlsuel]

SOT'ET

3IeMyjos Juaupedap uoneanay

00528

juawdinba punoibied

1uswade|dal uoiels Ked bBunjieq

¥.5'67€

144

UONONASUOD XI0p eulely

667'6T

uoneodynneaq abe|iA SSed s,ujyor

667'cY

Bunaauibua - sjuswanoldwi "pAIg HND

068'CST'E

0T9'€0T

sjuswaoidwl "pAIg JND

000'000'€

000'8Y

juawdinba Juswyredap a4

£€8'58¢

6v1'8C

welboid uoneannneaq 1044

000'00%

T0S'SS

"PAIG 9D/ 18 UOHE|[eISUl [B01190]3

€01'98

asemyjos Juswnedap uswdojaasg Aunwwo)

000'00T

uonedynneaq sred spmAID

6€9'95T

welboid suonn|os 1| apmAD

000'005

000'0ST

SZ6'TE0'S

2v2'880'9

anuad Ao

NOILO3ArOYd 0¢ A4 NOILDOArO™d 6T A4 NOILOACOHd 8T A4 NOILOArOHd LT A4 139dNg 9T Ad

d3SINTY ST Ad

EICIEDED)

IVNLOV ¥T Ad

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

123



000'G8 $ - $ 000°00% $ 000'SEV $ 000069 $ 119298 $ €89'CSE'T $ [eldio

000'G8 $ - $ - $ 000'GE $ 000059 $ - $ 00007 ¢ [e101 S9|2IYsA
000°01 - - - - - - juswade|dal Ys 18l endsal Jaye\
000'Sy - - - - - 000'0% uonisinbae aIYyaA STV SN/
- - - - - - - (Gzd#) aulbu3 ali4 ueneds 666T
- - - - 000059 - - (Gz3#) auibu3 a114 19di0ju3 d23ld 002
- - - 000'se - - - (Gz0#) 1a10]dx3 pio4 6002
EEIRITEIN
- $ - $ 000007 $ 000007 $ 00007 $ 119298 $ €89'CIE'T $ [e1ol suswanoidwi/siosloid
- - - - - 000'ST - sluawaoe|dal J1aA0xem yoeag
- - - - - - 188'S |[eIOWSN TT/6
- - - - - See'eey G99'//) uondoNJISU0d Xo0p eule
- - - 000’00 000'0% 000'0S - sjuawanoidwi Aep eliapey
- - 000'00¥ - - 898'€L - UOIONJISU02 ¥90p auad Ao
- - - - - 988262 SvE'LLE sjuawanoidwi Aempeol % abeurelp 1a1emwliols
- - - - - 885’8 v€6°L.S uoneljigeyal xled preqiydly
- - - - - - 2588°€le uoneyigeyal aukolb yoeag
:syuswanoldwy/sioalolid
00S'v617 $ 00L'LLY $ 00.'0L $ 009'65 $ 005'€8 $ LvZ'8lE $ v28'6.8 $ aoueeq punj pa1dLISay
000'G8 $ - $ 000007 $ 000'GEV $ 000069 $ 119798 $ €89'CSE'T $ Sasn buipuny [e}0L
000'G8 - - 000'GE 000°059 - 000°0% MO[3(q P3INPaYIs Se sjuaLiade|dal 3|dIYaA
- - 000'001 000'001 000'0% 119798 €89'CIE'T MoJ3q pa|npayds se sjoslold [eyded
- - - - - - - salnypuadxa 186pnq Buiresado
:sasn buipun4g
008'T0T $ 000'L0¥% $ O00T'TTV $ O00T'TTV $ 00£'G6E $ 00T'99¢€ $ 2v6'v8e $ $321Nn0s buipuny [ejo L
008'T0T 000°L0% 00T'TTV 00T'TTV 00€£'G6€ 00T'99¢€ Zv6'v8E sanuaAal bupelado
:s92In0s Buipung
00,1V $ 00L.0L $ 009'6S $ 005'€8 $ 002'8.€ $ ¥28'6/8 $ S9S'/v8'T $ $921n0sal d|qe|reAe buiuuibag [ejo |
00L°LLY 002'0L 009'65 00S'€8 002'8.¢€ ¥28'6.8 S9S'Lv8'T 9dueleq pajLlIsay
:s92In0sal a|qejiene Buuuibag
NOILD3ArOHd 0Z A4 NOILD3r0dd 6T A4 NOILD3IC0OHd 8T A4 NOILO3COdd LT A4 139ANG 9T Ad Ad3SIATY ST Ad AVNLOV 7T Ad

pun- xe| sajes uondo [e207

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

124



- $ - $ 000'0S $ 000'ST $ 000'SS $ 000'0C - $ [e101 dID
- $ - $ - $ - $ 000'SS $ 00002 - $ 2101 S9|2IYaA
- - - - 000'SS 000'02 - el yoeaq :uonisinbdy
EEIETEN
- $ - $ 00005 $ 000'ST $ - $ - - ¢ [e10] siuawanoidwi/s1oalfold
- - - - - - - (papunjun) Bunybl [eqAs|ioA
- - 000'0S 000'ST - - - uoisuedxa woonsay
:syuswanoldwy/sioalolid
00V'€SE $ 005'€8C $ 008002 $ 00¥'6ST $ 00£'8L $ €ep'oe €EE'0E $ aouele(q puny paldllIsay
000'60E $ 000'00€ $ 00€'TvE $ 008'.6C $ 009'62E $ 006'G82 20S'0.T $ Sasn buipuny [e}0L
- - - - 000'SS 000'02 - MO[3Q pa|npayos Se siuawade|dal 8|dIyaA
- - 000'0S 000'ST - - - MOJ( pPaINPayds se sjoaloid [eyded
000°'60E 000°'00€ 00€'T6C 008282 009'v.2 006'G92 20S'0LT sainypuadxs 186pnq Bunelado
:sasn buipun4g
006'8.E $ 00.'Z8€ $ 00.'Z8€ $ 006'8.€ $ 00S'T.E $ 000262 G€8'002 $ $321Nn0s buipuny [ejo L
006'8.E 00.'28E 00.'28E 006'8.E 00S'T.E 000262 G€8'00C sanuanal buiesado
:s921n0s Buipun4
005'€82 $ 008002 $ 00¥'6ST $ 00£'8. $ 00¥'9€ $ €€£'0€ - $ $90In0sal a|qejieAe bujuuibaq [el0L
00S°'€8¢ 008'00C 00¥'6ST 00£'8L 00v'9€ €€€'0E adueeq palIsay

:s901n0sal a|qe|reAe Buiuuibag

NOILO3Arodd 0¢C Ad

NOILO3Arodd 6T Ad

NOILO3Aroyd 8T Ad

NOILO3ArOY™d LT A4 139dN4d 9T Ad

pund pleqiyaly

d3SINTY ST Ad

IVNLOV ¥T Ad

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

125



- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - 1101 dID
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - 12101 S3|JIYaA
(€01#) 0614 Piod GLOZ
EEIRITEIN
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - lero] sjuswsanoidwy/sidoafoid
:sjuswanoidwy/sioalold
002'02 $ O00V'TIET $ 00.'G9T $ 007'68T $ 00T'99T $ - $ S aoue[eq punj pa1ol1say
001°G.€ $ 00Zv9E $ 009°€Se $ 00€'eve $ oog'eee $ - $ - Sasn bulpunj |e}o |
- - - - - - MO|2q Pa|Npayds Se sjuawade|dal d|oIyaA
- - - - - - - MO|2q pajnpayds se sjosloid |eyde)d
001'G2€ 00Z'¥9¢€ 009°'€G€ 00€'eve 00€'eee - - saunyipuadxa Jo6pnq bunesedo
:sasn Buipun4
006°€92 $ 006'62E $ 006'62E $ 009°99¢ $ 00g€'cee $ - $ - $801nos Bujpuny [ejo]
- - - - - - - pun4 |eJaus9) wouj Jajsuel|
006°€92 006°62€ 006'62¢€ 009°99¢ 0og‘eee - - sanuanal bunesedo
:s901n0s Buipung
00%'LEL $ 00,69l $  00¥'681 $ 001991 $ 001991 $ - $ - S92Inosal d|qejleAe buiuuibaq [ejo
- - - 001991 - - - oueleq pajoLisey
- - - - 00099 - - ddueleq pajolysal GLOZ Ad
- - - - 001001 - - 8oueleq pajouysal 102 Ad
:s901n0sal a|qejieAe Buuuibag
NOILOArOdd 0Z A4 NOILOArOYdd 61 A4 NOILO3IrOdd 8L A4 NOILO3rodd ZL A4 139ANg 91 A4 A3SINTY SL A4 IVNLOV v1 Ad

pund Buipjing

uo130afo.d dduefeg pund 02102 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

126



- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - [e101 dID
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - [e101 S8|dIYsA
EEIETEN
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - lero] syuawanoidwy/sioaloid
:syuswanoldwy/syoaloid
- $ 00T $ 0089 $ 0092 $ 008'S $ - $ - aoueeq punj pal1dLISay
002'02T $ 00£'9TT $ 000'€TT $ 002'80T $ 000'T0T $ - $ - S8sn buipuny [ejoL
- - - - - - - MO|2( pa|Npayds Se sjuawade|dal )dIYdA
- - - - - - - MOJ( pPa|NPayds se sjoslouid [eyde)d
006'0T 00T'6 006'L 002's - - - sasealoul 1500 pajedionue suawanoduwi "pAIg NS
00€'60T 002'20T 00T'S0T 000'€0T 000'T0T - - sainpuadxa 196png Buneiado
:sasn Buipun4
00S'.TT $ 0022TT $ 00221 $ 0000TT $ 008'90T $ - $ - $821n0s Buipuny [ejoL
005G . . = = = N pung [eJauas woly Jajsuel]
002211 002°2TT 002211 000°0TT 008'90T - - sanuaaal Bupelado
:s92In0s Buipung
00,2 $ 0089 $ 0092 $ 008'S $ - $ - $ - S92In0sal d|qejleAe buiuuibaq [ejoL
00LC 008'9 0092 008'S - aoueeq pajolsay
NOILD3COHdd 0C Ad  NOILDOACOHd 6T Ad  NOILDOICOHd 8T Ad  NOILO3ACO™d LT Ad  139dANd 9T Ad d3SINTY ST Ad AVNLOV ¥T Ad

pun4 xe] seo

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

127



- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ [e10l dID
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ [e101 S3|0IYsA
EEIRITEIN
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - ¢ |e1ol siuawanosdwy/sioafold
:sjuswanoidwy/sioalold
000'26T $ 000267 $ 000267 $ 000267 $ 000267 $ aoueeq pun) paniwwod
009'9T9 $ 008'GEE'C $ 00¥'L.2'T $ 002186 $ 008,25 $ Sasn buipuny [ejo L
009'9T9 008'Gee’'e 00v'L.2'T 002’186 008°22S sainypuadxa 82IAIBS 108Q
:sasn Buipun4
009'9T9 $ 008'GEL' $ 00v'L.2'T $ 002'186 $ 008'6T.L $ S30IN0S bulpuny (€101
- - - - 000°26T panNIWIWO - Ul sisgjsuel |
009'919 008'see'e 00v'2L2'T 002'186 008°.2S pajolLIsall - Ul sigjsuel |
:$921n0s Buipung
000'26T $ 0002C6T $ 000C6T $ 000C6T $ - $ $921n0sal d|qe|reAe buiuuibag [ejo |
000°26T 000°26T 000'26T 000°26T - aoue[eq paniuwo)
NOILD3COHdd 0C Ad  NOILDOACOHd 6T Ad  NOILDOICOHd 8T Ad  NOILO3ACO™d LT Ad  139dANd 9T Ad d3SINTY ST Ad AVNLOV ¥T Ad

pun4 821AI8S 198d

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

128



000'G¥2 $ 000'GTZ $ 00526 $ 0002.S $ 000Z¥2 $ 000022 - $ [e101 dID
000'G¥2 $ 000'GTZ $ 005'/6 $ 0002L $ 000202 $ 000'022 - $ [e101 S8|OIYdA
- - - - - - - (gee#) Nonyy 1axoed Yiqia)ed 9102
- - - - - - - (8T#) Yonu med Jqia1ed ¥102
000'002 - - - - - - (9z#) Yony 1axoed Yiqi9)ed 2102
- 000'GTZ - - - - - (TG#) Yonu 1axoed Jiqi818d 6002
000'Sy - - - - - - (0t#) 05€4 P104 6002
- - - 000'0% - - - (€#) 05z4 p104 G002
- - - - 000'202 - - (L€#) Yonyy 1x0ed Y1qi8)ed 002
- - 000°09 - - - - (6T#) Xona dwnp 0G5 p1od ¥002
- - 00G'.€ - - - - (G#) 05T p104 002
- - - 000'2€ - - - (y2#) 0GT4 pJod ¥002
- - - - - 000°06T - (egEH) Yon4 Jxoed BullglS €002
- - - - - 000'0€ - (8€#) 0GTd pJod /66T
1S9|J1YBA
- $ - $ - $ 000005 $ 00007 $ - - ¢ [e10] sjuswanoldwy/sioslold
- - - 000'00S 000'0% - - Aujioey abelols
:syuswanoldwy/syoaloid
%L 0% %165 %6°2L %8'EL %b'STT %EV2T %8'ZrT 186png Bunelado Jo Jusoiad se soueeq a|qe|leAY
005'961 $ 00200 $ 00£'8€8 $ 00v'ves $ 00S'TSC'T $ GOT'9TE'T G9G'991'T $ uonsod 189U pajollsalun
00.°G9%'T $ 00T00V'T $ 00T8vCT $ 0076897 $ 009'9Z€T $ 000627 GG/'920°T $ sasn bulpunj [ejoL
000°5¥¢C 000'GTe 005'L6 0002. 000202 000022 - MO|3Q P8|NPayds Se sluawade|dal 3|dIYsA
- - - 000°'00S 000'0% - - MOJ( pPa|NPayds se sjoaloid [ende)d
002'022'T 00T'S8T'T 009'0ST'T 00T'LTIT'T 009'780'T 000'650'T §G62'920'T sainypuadxa 196png Bunesado
:sasn buipun4g
000292°T $ 0002927 $ 0002927 $ 0002927 $ 0002927 $ 009'8ZTT Sy/TISTT $ $82INn0S Bulpuny [e10L
000292°T 000292°T 000292°T 000292°T 000292°T 009'82T'T SY.TIST'T senuanal buielado
:$32IN0S mc_Uczn_
002'00. $ 00€'8E8 $ 00v7e8 $ 00STSCT $ 00T 9TET $ G95'997'T G/GTVET $ S92In0sal d|qejleAe buiuuibaq [ejoL
002'00. 00€'8€8 00v'v28 00S'1S2T 00T'9TET G9G'99%'T S/GTVET uomsod 18u pajoLIsalun

:s901n0sal a|qe|reAe Buiuuibag

NOILO3Arodd 0¢C Ad

NOILO3Arodd 6T Ad

NOILO3Aroyd 8T Ad

NOILOArOY™d LT A4 139dN4d 9T Ad

pung uonellues

d3SINTY ST Ad

IVNLOV ¥T Ad

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

129



000'002 $ 000'00T'S $ 000002 $ 000'002 $ 000'0LT'E $ 066'166'C $ 6£6'0.2 $ [e101 dID

- $ - $ - $ - $ 000'0L $ - $ - $ [e101 S9|2IYsA
- - - - 000'0€ - - (0/#) 05€4 p10o4 TTOZ UdWade|day
- - - - 000’0 - - P X ¥ 39N dnxdid uo] /€ :uonisinboy
EEIRINEIN
000'002 $ 000°'00T'S $ 000002 $ 000002 $ 000°'00T'E $ 066'166'C $ 6£6'0.2 $ [e101 sjuswanoldwy/sioalold
- - - - - ¥0.'8SY 962 TV sjuaswanoidwi Aempeols pue abeurelp Jaremwiols oSN
- 000'00. - - - - - syuawanoldwi ‘any Y1LET
- 000'002'% - - - - - sjuswanoldwi puels| [e1skio
- - - - 000009 - - sjuawanoidwi uoibaT uesuswy
- - - - 000'00T - - aAuQ [edpuny
- - - - 000'009 - - sjuawanoidwi ade|d xay
- - - - - - - sjuawanoidwi aAlq aloysheg
- - - - 000'00S'T 000'00€'C - sjuawanoldwi aAlq ebal) eoog
000002 000'002 000'002 000'002 000'00€ 982'eee £79'62T weiboud uswaoe|das pue uoneligeyay
:sjuawanosdwi/sioalold
%6°0% %€ 182 %2 Gy %8 S %0°€0€ %S LvTT %."€92 196pnq Bunelado Jo 1wsdiad Se soueeq a|ge|reAY
00T'¥9T $ 002'S60'T $ 002°',09'T $ 00£'666'T $ 00S'6.0'T $ TOS'LOV'V $ 162°,00'T $ uonisod 1ou pajoulsalun
009'T29'T $ 00S'20E'9 $ 009'C80'T $ 00.'0.0'T $ 006'0E0'V $ 060'CSV'E $ 056259 $ sasn Buipuny (830 |
- - - - 000'0L - - MO[3( pa|Npayds se sjuawade|dal d|dIYsA
000'002 000'00T'S 000'002 000'002 000'00T'E 066'766'C 6£6'0L2 MoJaq pajnpayos se sjoaloud jenden
- 000'G9 - - - - - 910U dNUdAaJ GTOZ ‘92UBNSS] JO 1S0D
- - - - - 000'SS - 90U dNUdAaI GTOZ ‘8duenssl Jo 10D
000'9TS 000'v¥7e - - - - - 310U 8NUBAal TOZ ‘99IAISS 199Q
009'70S 002'v0S 009'70S 00.'€0S 009'0S 000'T2 - 9J0U BNUBABI GTOZ ‘92IAIBS 1o
000'T0% 00€'68¢€ 000'8.E 000°29€ 00£'9G¢E 00T'¥8€ TT0'28¢ sainypuadxae 186pnq Bunesado
:sasn Buipuny
009'506 $ 00S'€66'S $ 009'C88 $ 00L'0.T'C $ 006098 $ 00£'258'9 $ v0T'8re $ $82.n0s Bulpuny [ejo |
- - - 000°00€'T - - - Juswasinquial Juelb ANMAMS
- 000°'00T'S - - - - - 9J0u anuaAal TOZ ‘spaadoid 1gaq
- - - - - 000'002'9 - 310U aNuUaAal GTOZ ‘spaadoid 1gad
00T'STZ 000°€02 00T°26T 002'08T 000'8ST - - areudoidde pue 1o6png 0} JueUaN0D
005'069 005'069 005'069 00S'069 00620 00€'2S9 v0T'8vE sanuanal buiresado
:$92In0s Bulpuny
00T'088 $ 002'vOv'T $ 002',08'T $ 00£'668 $ 00S'6vC'V $ T162',00'T $ LET'CIE'T $ $80.n0s3J d|qe|reAe buluuibag [ejo L
(o0T'ST2) (000°€02) (00T'26T) (00z'08T) (000'85T) - - arendoidde pue 186pnq 03 JueUBAOD
002'S60'T 002'209'T 00£'666'T 00S'620'T 00S'L0V'Y T62'200'T LET'TIE'T uonisod 18u pajoisalun
:$92In0sal a|qe|iene Buluuibag
NOILD3C0dd 0 Ad  NOILD3r0dd 6T Ad  NOILD3ACOHd 8T A4 NOILO3ACOHd LT A4 1390Nd 9T Ad A3SIATY ST Ad IVNLOV 7T Ad

pun4 islfemuliols

uonoalfold dduereg pund 020z Ad - 9702 Ad

130



- - - $ 000°CE $ 000'SOv $ 0SE'6Z $ €6E'ST $ [e101 dIO
- $ - $ - $ 000°CE $ 000°0S5 $ - $ - ¢ [e101 S9|2IYsA
. - - - 000'0S - - Inboe jeoq
- - - - - - - (L0T#) vxy wey abpod GT0Z
- - - 000'2€ - - - (66#) 0TS ANaUD 866T
EEIRITEIN
- $ - $ - $ - $ 000'SSE $ 0SE'6C $ E€6E'ST $ [e10] syuswanolduwi/siosfold
- - - - - - - (papunjun) uoisuedxa ai01S diys
i - N - - 0SE'6C €6E'ST Juswdinba eulep
- - - - 000'00€ - - uoI1oNJISU0D XO0p eule
- - - - 000'0% - - 19S0|2 92! [el2IaWwWo)
- - - - 000'ST - - wa)sAs ales Jo uiod
:sjuswanoidwy/sioalold
%€E'6 %T'8 %6'S %G'C %9'T %0°'6T %9°LT 196png Bunelado Jo wsdlad se aoueleq a|ge|leny
006'S22 $ 009°C6T $ 00V'9ET $ 000'8S $ 0069 $ S.6CTY $ 882/SE $ uojisod 1au paldlsalun
008'1S¥'C $ 00E'v0V'C $ 00L'/GE'C $ 000'vvE'C $ 002'2.9'C $ €T6'GECC $ 92.'9.0'C $ sasn Buipuny [ejoL
- - - 000'cE 000'0S - - MO|B( Pa|NPaYISs Sk sjuawade|dal 3|aIyaA
- - - - 000'S5€ 05€'62 €6€'GT Mo|3q pa|Npayds se sjosloid eyded
000'62 000'62 000'62 000'62 000'62 000'62 000'62 (21015 diyS) pund [I8USD WO} SdUBAPY
008‘zev'e 00€'GLE'C 00.'8z€'e 000'€82'2 002'8€2'2 €9G6'2/T'2 €€€'2€0'2 sainypuadxa 196pnq Buielsdo
:sasn Buipun4
00T'G8Y'C $ 00S'09v'C $ 00T'9EV'C $ 00T'G9E'C $ 002'962'C $ 009'T62°C $ 0£0'v02'C $ $821n0s Buipuny [ejoL
00T'G87'¢ 00S'09%'2 00T'9EV'2 00T'G9€E' 002'962'C 009'162'C 0£0'v02' sanuaAal bunelado
:s921n0s Buipung
009'26T $ 00V'9ET $ 000'8S $ 006'9¢ $ 006CT¥ $ 88¢/SE $ v86'6cC $ $901n0sal d|qejleAe buiuuibaq [ejoL
. . . B B - 182°86€ (e101S diyS) pund [e1aus WOy 8IULAPE POZIIOWY
009°26T 007'9ET 000'8S 006'9€ 006°ZTV 88¢'LGE (,62'89T) uonisod Jau pajousalun

:s901n0sal a|qe|reAe Buiuuibag

NOILO3Arodd 0 Ad

NOILD3Arodd 6T Ad

NOILO3Aroyd 8T Ad

NOILOArOY™d LT A4 139dN4d 9T Ad

d3SIN3Y ST Ad IVNLOV ¥T Ad

pund eutrep

uo1oafold aduefeg pund 0202 Ad - 9T0Z Ad

131



12. Supplemental



BUDGET SUMMARY




FY 2016 BUDGET SUMMARY: FUNDING SOURCES

Fund FY 2016
General Fund (Operating) 7,034,600
General Fund (Non-operating) 3,262,800
Local Option Sales Tax Fund 395,300
Archibald Fund 371,500
Building Fund 333,300
Gas Tax Fund 106,800
Debt Service Fund 719,800
Sanitation Fund 1,262,000
Stormwater Fund 702,900
Marina Fund 2,296,200
Fund Balance 5,314,900
Total FY 2016 Funding Sources $21,800,100

M General Fund (Operating)

M General Fund (Non-operating)

Fund Balance M Local Option Sales Tax Fund

24.4% .
M Archibald Fund
M Building Fund
General Fund (Operating)
32.3% M Gas Tax Fund
Marina Fund Debt Service Fund
10.5%

Sanitation Fund
Stormwater Fund

3.2% \ § ; ‘L“General Fur-1d (Non- Stormwater Fund
Sanitation Fund 1 Marina Fund

5.8% Fund Balance

Gas Tax Fund | 1 Local Option Sales
0.5% Building Fund Archibald Fund Tax Fund
1.5% 1.7% 1.8%

132



FY 2016 BUDGET SUMMARY: FUNDING USES

Fund FY 2016
General Fund (Operating) 6,354,400
General Fund (Non-operating) 5,194,600
Local Option Sales Tax Fund 690,000
Archibald Fund 329,600
Building Fund 333,300
Gas Tax Fund 101,000
Debt Service Fund 527,800
Sanitation Fund 1,326,600
Stormwater Fund 4,030,900
Marina Fund 2,672,200
Fund Balance 239,700
Total FY 2016 Funding Uses $21,800,100

Fund Balance
1.1%

M General Fund (Operating)
H General Fund (Non-operating)
M Local Option Sales Tax Fund

M Archibald Fund

M Building Fund
General Fund (Operating) uilding Fun

Stormwater Fund
29.1% M Gas Tax Fund

18.5%
1 Debt Service Fund

M Sanitation Fund

General Fund (Non- Stormwater Fund

) operating)
Sanitation Fund 4 23.8% = Marina Fund
6.1%
Debt Service Fund Fund Balance
2.4%  Gas Tax Building
Fund Fund Archibald Fund Local Option Sales Tax Fund
0.5% 1.5% 1.5% 3.2%

133



FY 2016 BUDGET SUMMARY: REVENUES BY FUND
Funding sources less transfers and fund balance appropriations

Fund FY 2016
General Fund (Operating) 7,034,600
General Fund (Non-Operating) 3,262,800
Local Option Sales Tax Fund 395,300
Archibald Fund 371,500
Building Fund 333,300
Gas Tax Fund 106,800
Sanitation Fund 1,262,000
Stormwater Fund 702,900
Marina Fund 2,296,200
Total Budgeted Revenues $15,765,400

Marina Fund . I Fund (O ting)
eneral Fun perating
Stormwater Fund 14.6%
4.5% B General Fund (Non-Operating)
M Local Option Sales Tax Fund
B Archibald Fund
Gas Tax Sanitation Fund GEnetal |'=und
Fund 8.0% (Operating) = Building Fund

0.79 44.6%
% ® Gas Tax Fund
Building

Sanitation Fund
Archibald Fund

Fund 2.1% Stormwater Fund
2.4% General Fund (Non- Marina Fund
Local Option Operating)
Sales Tax Fund 20.7%
2.5%

134



FY 2016 BUDGET SUMMARY: EXPENDITURES BY FUND

Funding uses less transfers and fund balance appropriations

Fund FY 2016
General Fund (Operating) 6,354,400
General Fund (Non-Operating) 4,282,900
Local Option Sales Tax Fund 690,000
Archibald Fund 329,600
Building Fund 333,300
Gas Tax Fund 101,000
Debt Service Fund 527,800
Sanitation Fund 1,326,600
Stormwater Fund 4,030,900
Marina Fund 2,672,200
Total Budgeted Expenditures $20,648,700

Marina Fund
12.9%

M General Fund (Operating)

B General Fund (Non-Operating)
General Fund
(Operating)

30.8% M Archibald Fund

M Local Option Sales Tax Fund

Stormwater Fund M Building Fund

R I Gas Tax Fund
Debt Service Fund
Sanitation Fund
General Fund (Non-
Sanitation Fund _< | Operating) Stormwater Fund

6.4% 20.7% Marina Fund

Debt Service Fund _/

Gas Tax Fund

0.5%

2.6%

Local Option Sales
Building Fund Tax Fund
1.6% 1.6% 3.3%

135




FY 2016 BUDGET SUMMARY: EXPENDITURES BY CATEGORY

Funding uses less transfers and fund balance appropriations

Fund FY 2016
Personnel 3,953,500
Operating 6,610,900
Capital Outlay 6,083,500
Donations 85,500
Debt Service 1,061,400
Other 2,853,900
Total Budgeted Expenditures $20,648,700

Debt Service Personnel
5.1% 19.1%

Donations
0.4%

M Personnel

M Operating

M Capital Outlay
M Donations

M Debt Service

 Other

Operating
32.0%

136



PERSONNEL SUMMARY




PERSONNEL SUMMARY

Department / Position Title Position Counts (FTE)
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

City Manager's Office

City Manager 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Executive Office Manager 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Executive Assistant 0.00 0.00 1.00 0.00
Administrative Assistant 2.00 1.00 0.00 0.00
Volunteer Coordinator 0.00 0.00 0.50 0.50
3.00 2.00 2.50 2.50
Clerk/Commission
City Clerk 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Administrative Support Specialist 0.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
Public Works Technician 0.00 0.00 1.00 0.00
Mayor 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
City Commissioners 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00
6.00 6.00 8.00 7.00
Community Development
Community Development Director 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Planning and Zoning Coordinator 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.50
Building Official 0.00 0.00 1.00 0.00
Code Enforcement Officer 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Code Enforcement Specialist 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Permit Technician 0.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Administrative Assistant 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.50
3.00 3.00 4.00 2.00
Finance
Assistant City Manager/Finance Director 0.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
Finance Director 1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00
Accounting Manager 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Accountant 0.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Financial Coordinator 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Accounting Specialist 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Accounting Specialist (Part-time) 0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00
Administrative Assistant 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
3.50 4.00 4.00 4.00
Public Works
Public Works Director 0.10 0.10 0.20 0.20
Lead Mechanic 0.30 0.30 0.30 0.30
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.10 0.20 0.20
0.40 0.50 0.70 0.70

137



PERSONNEL SUMMARY

Department / Position Title Position Counts (FTE)
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Fire/EMS
Fire Chief 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Lieutenant 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00
Firefighter 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
Administrative Assistant 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Parks
Central Services Director 0.10 0.00 0.00 0.00
Parks Supervisor 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Grounds Maintenance Worker 4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Grounds Maintenance Worker (Part-time) 0.40 0.00 0.00 0.00
5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00
Recreation
Parks and Recreation Director 0.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
Leisure Services Director 0.00 0.00 1.00 0.00
Central Services Director 0.10 0.10 0.00 0.00
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.10 0.00 0.00
Recreation Supervisor 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Recreation Coordinator 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.00
Grounds Maintenance Worker 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Building Maintenance Worker (Part-time) 0.50 0.70 0.50 0.00
Grounds Maintenance Worker (Part-time) 0.50 0.70 0.00 0.00
Recreation Leader llI 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.00
Recreation Leader Il 0.00 0.00 2.10 1.00
Recreation Leader (Part-time) 2.05 2.10 0.00 0.00
Recreation Leader | 0.00 0.00 1.50 2.75
Recreation Aide (Part-time seasonal) 1.54 1.50 0.00 0.00
7.69 7.20 8.10 7.75
Parking
Parking Enforcement Supervisor 0.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
Parking Enforcement Officer Il 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Parking Enforcement Officer | 2.40 2.10 1.05 0.75
3.40 3.10 3.05 2.75

138



PERSONNEL SUMMARY

Department / Position Title Position Counts (FTE)
FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016

Archibald
Parks Supervisor 0.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Grounds Maintenance Worker 0.00 1.00 2.00 0.75
0.00 2.00 3.00 1.75
Building
Community Services Director 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Planning and Zoning Coordinator 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.50
Permit Technician 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.00
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.50
0.00 0.00 0.00 3.00
Sanitation
Public Works Director 0.20 0.25 0.25 0.25
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.25 0.25 0.25
Field Operations Manager 0.00 0.50 0.00 0.00
Sanitation Supervisor 1.00 0.00 1.00 1.00
Public Works Technician 0.00 0.00 0.50 0.50
Sanitation Worker I 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00
Sanitation Worker | 3.00 3.00 1.00 2.00
7.20 7.00 6.00 7.00
Stormwater
Public Works Director 0.20 0.25 0.25 0.25
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.25 0.25 0.25
Field Operations Manager 0.00 0.50 0.00 0.00
Public Works Supervisor 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Public Works Technician 1.00 1.00 1.50 1.50
2.20 3.00 3.00 3.00
Marina
Public Works Director 0.30 0.30 0.30 0.30
Administrative Assistant 0.00 0.30 0.30 0.30
Marina Supervisor 0.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
Marina Assistant 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.75
Marina Attendant 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3.30 3.60 3.60 4.35
TOTAL FUNDED POSITIONS 59.19 55.40 59.95 59.80

139



CITY OF MADEIRA BEACH PAY PLAN
EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 1, 2015

GRADE

POSITION TITLE

RANGE
MINIMUM

RANGE
MAXIMUM

Grounds Maintenance Worker 1
Marina Assistant I

Parking Enforcement Officer I
Public Works Technician I
Recreation Leader 1

Sanitation Worker 1

Volunteer Coordinator

$9.50/hout

$12.00/hour

Administrative Assistant I

Code Enforcement Specialist
Grounds Maintenance Worker 11
Marina Assistant 11

Parking Enforcement Officer II
Public Works Technician II
Recreation Leader 11

Sanitation Worker 11

$11.50/hour

$20.00/hour

Administrative Assistant 11
Administrative Support Specialist
Division Supervisor

Recreation Leader 111

$17.00/hour

$27.00/hour

Financial Coordinator
Executive Office Manager

$24.00/hour

$34.00/hour

Accounting Manager

City Clerk

Lead Mechanic*

Planning and Zoning Coordinator

*$32.00/hour

$66,560

*$40.00/hour

$83,200

Community Services Director

Fire Chief

Parks and Recreation Director

Public Works Director/Marina Manager

$82,000

$99,840

Assistant City Manager/Finance Director

$96,000

$110,240

140




29y

SYIDJ

Iojoaliq
uoloaIo8y

pUD S04

PIPGIY2LY

18JOMWIOIS

juswiadiojul
Buring

uoljpjIUDS DULIDW Bujuoz Buiuuoyq Buippng ¥H

1l

20UDUY

JoBounyy
MO juojsissy

1040810
SHOM g9nd

10}0811q S80INBS
Ajunwwod

SW3

oy

JusWwadIou3 Bupiod
9po) Aunwiwo)

fal0 a1y

Juswiaoiou3
MD]

¥ Ao — _&mwcz — 3%2

(004
§19UOISSIUILIOD)

J0 pInog

oYY [ouolozIUDBIO Yonag RISPOW JO Al

141



RETIRED FUNDS




JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE FUND: REVENUE AND CASH BALANCE (CLOSED FY 2014)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED REVISED CHANGE
Beginning cash balance $ 839,732 $ 909,108
REVENUE

344.502 John's Pass Parking Meters 139,239
344.507 Village Blvd. Parking Meters 339,767
361.100 Interest Earnings 59
362.013 Rent - Tango Bay 98,077

362.015 Rent - Chamber Kiosk -

366.366 Donations 2,300

369.369 Miscellaneous Revenue 394
Total revenue $ 579,836 $ -
Total expenditures $ 510,460 $ 909,108
Available cash balance $ 909,108 $ =

142



JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE FUND (CLOSED FY 2014)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED PROPOSED CHANGE
OPERATING:

3400 Other Contractual Services 22,882

3600 Administrative Services 22,900

4314 Water Service - Buildings 8,639

4331 Electric - Buildings 1,743

4336 Electric - Street Lights 12,569

4340 Waste Disposal 27,600

4500 General Insurance 37,375

4610 Maintenance - Building 4,959

4620 Maintenance - Grounds/Parks 5,427

4630 Maintenance - Boardwalk 235

4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment -

5210 Departmental Supplies 1,787
Subtotal Operating 146,116 - - - -
CAPITAL:

6300 Capital Improvements 179,144
Subtotal Capital Outlay 179,144 - - - -
OTHER:

9175 Transfer to Parking Fund 109,700

9950 Transfer to General Fund 75,500 909,108
Subtotal Other 185,200 909,108
TOTAL JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE $510,460 $909,108 $0 $0 $0

143



PARKING FUND: REVENUE AND CASH BALANCE (CLOSED FY 2014)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED REVISED CHANGE
Beginning cash balance $ 366,605 $ 568,349
REVENUE

344.501 Archibald Beach Parking Meters 130,223

344.504 City/South Beach Parking Meters 188,811

344.506 Non-Resident Parking Permits 14,681

351.112 Parking Fines 78,984

361.100 Interest Earnings (414)

381.017 Transfer from John's Pass Fund 109,700
Total revenue $ 521985 $ -
Total expenditures $ 320,241 $ 568,349
Available cash balance $ 568349 $ =

144



PARKING FUND (CLOSED FY 2014)

FY 2013 FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2015 FY 2016 PERCENT

CODE ACCOUNT TITLE ACTUAL ACTUAL ADOPTED REVISED REVISED CHANGE
PERSONNEL:

1200 Salaries & Wages 45,008

1400 Overtime 1,034

2100 Social Security 3,502

2203 ICMA 401(a) Plan 1,799

2300 Group Insurance 8,049

2400 Worker's Compensation 3,431

2500 Unemployment Compensation 1,587
Subtotal Personnel 64,410 - - - -
OPERATING:

3111 Armored Car Service 1,858

3410 County Ticket Processing 41,680

3600 Administrative Services 30,100

4110 Cellular Telephone 426

4200 Postage 345

4500 General Insurance 750

4600 Maintenance - Auto Equipment 273

4640 Maintenance - Other Equipment 565

4680 Maintenance - Tires 169

4700 Printing & Binding 4,788

5100 Office Supplies 160

5200 Uniforms 576

5210 Departmental Supplies 55,727

5220 Gasoline & Oil 2,692
Subtotal Operating 140,109 - - - -
CAPITAL:

6300 Capital Improvements 15,732

6320 Community Park Funding -

6400 Capital Equipment 99,990
Subtotal Capital Outlay 115,722 - - - -
OTHER:

9950 Transfer to General Fund - 568,349
Subtotal Other - 568,349 - - -
TOTAL JOHN'S PASS VILLAGE $320,241 $568,349 $0 $0 $0

145





