
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 
August 3, 2020 

7:00 P.M.  
New Fairview City Hall 

999 Illinois Ln. 
New Fairview TX 76078 

AGENDA 

1. CALL MEETING TO ORDER:

2. ROLL CALL:

3. PLEDGE TO FLAGS
A. United States of America

B. Texas Flag Honor the Texas Flag, I pledge allegiance to thee,
Texas, one state under God, one and indivisible

4. CONSENT AGENDA:
All matters listed as Consent Agenda are considered to be routine by the City Council and will be enacted
by one motion. There will not be a separate discussion of these items. If discussion is desired, that item
will be removed from the consent agenda and will be considered separately.
A. Approve minutes for July 13 & July 17, 2020
B. Approve to extend the application for Pioneer Ranch preliminary plat till next monthly meeting
in September
C. Approve to extend the application for Pioneer Ranch final plat till the next monthly meeting in
September

5. OPEN FORUM
The City Council invites persons with comments or observations related to city issues, projects, or
policies to briefly address the City Council. Anyone wishing to speak should sign-in with the City
Secretary before the beginning of the City Council Meeting. In order to expedite the flow of business and
to provide all citizens the opportunity to speak, there is a three-minute limitation on any person
addressing the City Council. State law prohibits the City Council from discussing or taking action on any
item not listed on the posted agenda.

6. NEW BUSINESS:
A. Discuss, consider and act on approving an application packet for participation in the Texas 
Cooperative Liquid Assets Securities System Trust Program (Texas CLASS) and authorize the 
Mayor to sign the Resolution to Participate

B. Discuss, consider and act on Resolution to approve agreement with the East Wise Fire 
Rescue Fire Department

C. Discuss, consider and act on adopting the International Building Code 2015 (IBC 2015)



D. Discuss, consider and act on approving an amendment to the employee handbook that allows the 
City Administrator to make changes on an as needed basis. The document, if amended by the City 
Administrator, shall be presented to the City Council on an annual basis for review. 
 
E. Discuss, consider and act on transitioning the City of New Fairview to an electronic record 
keeping system 
 
F. Discuss, consider and act on options regarding the City’s streets maintenance program following 
the lapse of the Devon Energy Road Maintenance Agreement.  
 
G. Discuss, consider and act on enforcement of Ordinance 1998-05-0014 as amended by  
2007-12-127 regarding code enforcement 
 
H. Present and discuss the no-new-revenue tax rate and its impact on the 2020/2021 budget 
 
I. Present and discuss development activity in New Fairview. 
 
J. Present and discuss options regarding establishing a CCN for the City of New Fairview. 
 
K. Future agenda items 
 
7. EXECUTIVE SESSION 
Pursuant to Sec. 551.071 of the Texas Government Code, the City Council reserves the right to convene 
in Executive Session from time to time as deemed necessary during this meeting for any posted agenda 
item to receive advice from its attorney as permitted by law.  
 
Pursuant to Sec. 551.074, deliberation regarding the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, 
duties, discipline or dismissal of a public officer or employee.  
 
8. ADJOURN: 
I, the undersigned authority, do hereby certify the above notice of the meeting of the City Council of New 
Fairview, is a true and correct copy of the said notice that I posted on the official posting place at New 
Fairview City Hall, FM 407, New Fairview, Texas, a place of convenience and readily accessible to the 
general public at all times, and said notice posted this 31st  day of July 2020 at 7:00 PM at least 72 hours 
proceeding the meeting time.  
 
_______________________________ 
Monica Rodriguez, City Secretary    SEAL: 
 
This facility is wheelchair accessible; parking spaces are available. Requests for accommodations or 
interpretive services must be made 48 hours prior to this meeting. Please contact the City Secretary at city 
hall 817-638-5366 or fax 817-638-5369 or by email at citysecretary@newfairview.org for further 
information.  

mailto:citysecretary@newfairview.org


 

City Council Agenda 

July 13, 2020 

 

Agenda Item:   Resolution    (Action Item) 

 

Agenda Description: 
Discuss, consider and possible action approving an application packet for participation in the 

Texas Cooperative Liquid Assets Securities System Trust program (Texas CLASS) and 

authorize the Mayor to sign the Resolution to Participate. 

 

Background Information: 

The City of New Fairview City Council approved an investment policy at the June 6, 2020 

meeting. The three objectives of the policy are to make investments that are safe, provide 

easy liquidity and provide a reasonable return on investment. Most Texas cities use a 

statewide investment pool such as Texas CLASS to meet these objectives and receive better 

returns then their local bank. 

Staff recommends the Council approve the application and authorize the Mayor to sign the 

Resolution to Participate to provide the City with an additional investment option 

emphasizing safety and liquidity. 

 

Financial Information: 
Current interest rates are around 50 basis point. 

 

City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 

Staff recommends that Council approve application and authorize the Mayor to sign the 

resolution. 

 

Attachments: 
Resolution and Application Packet 

 











































































































 

City Council Agenda 
July 13, 2020 
 
Agenda Item:   Resolution    (Action Item) 
 
Agenda Description: 
Discuss, consider and possible action approving a Resolution approving an agreement with the 
East Wise County Volunteer Fire Department and authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement. 
 
Background Information: 
Part of the City of New Fairview is located in Wise County. The City of New Fairview has not 
had a formal agreement with East Wise County Volunteer Fire Department to provide fire 
protection services in the New Fairview city limits. This agreement is similar to the one with the 
Justin Volunteer Fire Department but is limited to fire protection services. As part of the 
agreement the City agrees to provide the far east bay for East Wise County to stage a brush 
truck. The City agrees to fence off that bay and provide a keyless entry system to the door that 
accesses that bay 
 
 
Financial Information: 
$1,000 annually. Funds are provided in the Administration budget under Professional Services. 
 
City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 
Staff recommends that Council approve the resolution and the agreement and authorize the 
Mayor to sign the agreement. 
 
Attachments: 
Resolution 
Agreement 
 
 
  



 
 

City of New Fairview, Texas 
Resolution No. ______ 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, TX APPROVING THE 
AGREEMENT WITH THE EAST WISE COUNTY VOLUNTEER FIRE 
DEPARTMENT. 
 
WHEREAS,  the City of Fairview is an incorporated city in the State of Texas; and 
 
WHEREAS,  the City of New Fairview is a General Law city as classified by the Texas 

Municipal Code; and 
 
WHEREAS,  the City desires to have a fire services provided for that part of the City located in 

Wise County; and 
 
WHEREAS, the East Wise County Volunteer Fire Department desires to provide fire 

suppression services to the City of New Fairview. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY  
NEW FAIRVIEW: 
 

1. The City Council of New Fairview has reviewed the contract with the East Wise County 
Volunteer Fire Department and determines it to be acceptable; and 

 
2. That this Resolution shall cause the contract to take effect immediately upon its approval. 

 

PRESENTED AND PASSED on this 3rd day of August, at a meeting of the New Fairview City 
Council. 
 
APPROVED:       ATTESTED: 
 
____________________     _____________________ 
Joe Max Wilson      Monica Rodriguez 
Mayor        City Secretary  
 















Aurora

Boyd

Rhome

COUNTY ROAD 4421

COUNTY ROAD 4010

FM 407

E STATE HIGHWAY 114

BROCK LN

HICKORY ST

ILLINOIS DR

COUNTY ROAD 4460

WA

U
RO

RA
VIST

A
T

R
L

COUNTY ROAD 4522

C
O
U
N
T
Y
R
O
A
D

4227

FM
718

FM 2264

COUNTY ROAD 4530

K
IN

C
A
N
N
O
N
 L
N

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
36
0

FM 2449

CURRIE RD

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
71
7

C
O
N
ES

TO

GA
TRL

S U
S H

IG
H
W
A
Y
 287

AABUMGARNERRD S
H
E
R
M
A
N
 R
D

LANGEW
AY

L
A
K
E
V
IE
W
 R
D

S
 C
O
U
N
T
Y
 L
IN

E
 R
D

EUSHIGHWAY380

HILLTOP TRL

C
O
U
N
T
Y
R
O

AD4733

C
H
R
IS
T
Y
 K

A
Y
 L
N

T
A
Y
 L
N

M
A
R
T
IN

D
A
L
E
 L
N

JUDGELN

P
IO

N
E
E
R
 R
D

D
E
RT

IN
G
R
D

LATHAM LN

H
E
R
IT

A
G
E
CR

EE
K

D
R

CHISHOLMHILLSDR

RED
BAROND

R

B JUDGE LN

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
51
1

H
AC

K
A
M
O
R
E
C
T

B
U
R
N
E
T
T
 R
D

H
A
W
K
 R
ID

G
E

N
 M

A
IN

 S
T

D
E
U
S
S
E
N
 R
D

DOVE HOLLOW LN

JA
M
E
S
 C
 J
A
C
K
 R
D

AUDRA CIR

B
R
O
O
K
FI
E
L
D
 D

R

N
 C
O
U
N
T
Y
 L
IN

E
 R
D

FR
O
N
TA

G
E R

D

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
21
3

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
43
0

GEORGEFOSTER

RD

PO
C
K
R
U
S
D
R

W
IL
LI
A

M
S
T
R
L

OLD
STONEYRD

D
IL
L
A
V
O
U
 L
N

OLD DENTON HWY

C
O
U
N
T
Y
R
O
A
D

44
11

STON

Y
C
R
E
E
K
D
R

D
A
L
R
Y
M
P
L
E
L
N

COUNTY ROAD 4730

C
O
U
N
T
Y
R
O
A
D

43
15

G
R
A
B
E
N
 L
N

K
A
TY

 L
N

C
O
U
N
TY

ROA
D

4223

HIGH
M
E
S
A

D
R

O
L
IV

E
R

CR
EE
K
RD

S
A
M
 R
E
Y
N
O
L
D
S
 R
D

114

114

114

81

81

380

City
of New
Fairview

W
I
S
E
 C

O
.

D
E
N
T
O

N
 C

O
.

0 3,200 6,4001,600
Feet

The City With A View

City of New Fairview
Updated July 7, 2020

East Wise Fire & Rescue
Service Area

Legend
East Wise Fire & Rescue Service Area

New Fairview City Limits

New Fairview Extra-Territorial Jurisdiction (ETJ)

Other City Limits

Fort Worth ETJ

County Line

Railroad

Parcel



Denton

Dish

Fort Worth

Haslet

Justin

Northlake

Ponder

Rhome

Roanoke

EAKIN CEMETERY RD

FM 407

M
IC
H
EL

L
E
W
A
Y

BROCK LN

HOLDER RD

HWY 114

HWY114I 3
5 W

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
52
2

N
 I 
35
 W

T
IM

 D
O
N
A
L
D
 R
D

ARBOR
LAKE

RD

EAGLE PKW
Y

COUNTY ROAD 4530

N
FM

15
6

K
IN

C
A
N
N
O
N
 L
N

W1STST

S 
I 3
5 W

HARMONSON RD

OLENDR

COWBOYTR
L

C
O
U
N
T
Y
 R
O
A
D
 4
71
7

DOUB
LE

EA
G
L
E
BL
V
D

FM
 1
56
 S

S
 F
M
 1
56

WEBB RD

FA
U
G
H
T
 R
D

RA
CE

WAY

D
R

W 7TH ST

AABUMGARNERRD

PETTYPL

ILLINOIS DR

FL
O
R
A
N
C
E
 R
D

JCHESHIERRD

LITSEYRD

OLD JUSTIN RD

SHERMAN RD

SEABORN RD

P
R
62
02

CL
EV

EL
A
N
D
G
IB
BS

R
D

Y
A
R
B
ER

RY
DR

FM
 4
07

G
U
L
F 
A
V
E

E
L
IZ

A
B
E
TH

T
O
W
N

C
E
M
ET

ERYRD

FM 1384

SEV
E
N
T
E
E
N
LA

KESB
L
V
D

AMAZON DR

B
O
S
S
R
A
N
G
E
R
D

N
 S
E
A
L
Y
 A
V
E

A
R

APAHORD

W 5TH ST
W 4TH STW 3RD STW2NDST M

U
L
K
E
Y
 R
D

R
O
B
IN

S
O
N
 R
D

L
E
U
T
Y
 A
V
E

MELISSADR

LO
N
E
S
TA

R
C
IR

W

V
IC
TO

RY
CI
R
E

P
R
 4
71
6

S
 C
O
U
N
T
Y
 L
IN

E
 R
D

FM
15
6
S

H LIVELY RD

STONERIDGEDR

VI
CT

OR
YCIR

W

KIRA LN

SWAFFORD RD

HICKORY ST

S
 F
M
 1
56

HELEN RD

ROBSON RANCH RD

BU
T
T
E
R
C
U
P
LN

VICTORYCIR

SONGBIRD LN

B
LU

E 
M
O
U
N
D
 R
D

C
H
R
IS
T
Y
 K

A
Y
 L
N

T
A
Y
 L
N

JUDGELN

JOHN WILEY RD

C
A
R
T
W
R
IG

H
T

TRL

C
A
C
T
U
S
 C
T

H
ER

IT
A
G
E
PK

W
Y

GORDONRD

SMITHRD

T
H
IS
T
LE

LN

ESTATEHIGHWAY114

B
EA

C
H
ST

BLAIR RD

LO
N
E
S
TA

R
C
IR

E

T
H
R
E
E
W
ID

E
D
R

C
IN

D
Y
S
 L
N

B JUDGE LN

M
A
R
Y
 P
O
L
K
 R
D

H
AC

K
A
M
O
R
E
C
T

SAM LEE LN

H
A
W
K
 R
ID

G
E

G
U
Y
 J
A
M
E
S
 R
D

JOHN DAY RD

B
U
R
N
E
T
T
 R
D

DOVE HOLLOW LN

JA
M
E
S
 C
 J
A
C
K
 R
D

B
R
O
O
K
FI
E
L
D
 D

R

12THST

RANGE RD

SC
O
U
N
T
Y
L
IN

E
R
D

STRADER RD

SN
EV

A
R

D

E

M
ULN

L
O
N
G
H
O
R
N
 D

R

A
N
G
U
S
 D

R

B
R
A
H
M
A
 D

R

FOYT DR

SUNFIRELN
RANC

H
RD

F
A
IT
H

LN

MATANY RD

B
R
U
N
O
 R
D

PO
C
K
R
U
S
D
R

GAFFIELD RD

B
O
N
A
N
Z
A
 R
D

C
E
S
S
N
A
 R
D

W
IL
LI
A

M
S
T
R
L

W
A
K
E
FI
E
L
D
 R
D

S
T
R
A
D
E
R
 L
N

S
C
H
O
B
E
R
 R
D

W
A
R
B
L
E
R
 L
N

N
IG

H
T
IN

G
A
L
E
 L
N

D
A
L
R
Y
M
P
L
E
L
N

S
P
U
D

L
U
C
K

L
N

D
O
V
E
 H

IL
L
 R
D

COUNTY ROAD 4840

COUNTY ROAD 4730

B
IL
L
 C
O
O
K
 R
D

K
A
TY

LN

MADISON LN

DEUSSENRD

Y
A
R
B
R
O
U
G
H
 W

A
Y

H
O
V
EN

K
A

MPLN

HIGHM
E
S
A

D
R

TEXAND
R

JIM
B

A

KERRD

O
L
IV

E
R
 C
R
E
E
K
 R
D

SAM REYNOLDS RD

SAM REYNOLDS RD

114 114

114

114

114

Fort
Worth ETJ

City of New
Fairview

W
I
S
E
 C

O
.

D
E
N
T
O

N
 C

O
.

0 3,200 6,4001,600
Feet

The City With A View

City of New Fairview
Updated July 6, 2020

Justin Volunteer Fire Department
Service Area

Legend
Justin Volunteer Fire Department Service Area

New Fairview City Limits

New Fairview Extra-Territorial Jurisdiction (ETJ)

Other City Limits

Fort Worth ETJ

County Line

Railroad

Parcel



 

City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 
 
Agenda Item:   Resolution    (Action Item) 
 
Agenda Description: 
Discuss, consider, and possible action on the adoption of an ordinance amending Chapter 3, 
Building Regulations, Division 7, Article 3.02 adopting the International Building Code, the 
International Fire Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, the 
International Residential Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Property 
Maintenance Code, and NFPA 70 - National Electrical Code, 2017 Edition. 
 
Background Information: 
Earlier this year the City received its Insurance Service Office (ISO) rating. The City received a 
rating of 9, the lowest possible rating. A major factor in this rating was the City’s reliance on the 
2009 version of the International Building Code (IBC). The City received zero (0) points for 
using a code older than 10 years. Further, New Fairview is not in compliance with Texas House 
Bill 1736 passed by the Texas Legislature in 2016 requiring all cities in Texas to adopt and 
enforce the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC).  All of the current home 
builders in New Fairview already operate under the 2015 IBC and 2016 National Electric Code 
(NEC). 
  
The accompanying adoption ordinance also includes an exhibit containing amendments for the 
construction codes that have been prepared by the North Central Texas Council of Governments  
to address area construction methods and climate conditions.  This is done as these codes are 
used across the country and amended to reflect the specific region where they are adopted.  Some 
of the amendments only address adoption by the City of New Fairview.  
  
Financial Information: 
NA 
 
City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 
Staff recommends that Council adopt the International Building Code, the International Fire 
Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, the International 



Residential Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Property Maintenance Code, 
and NFPA 70 - National Electrical Code, 2017 Edition.. 
 
Attachments: 
Ordinance 
 
  



CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, TEXAS ORDINANCE NO. ________________ 
  
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, TEXAS, AMENDING THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, AS HERETOFORE 
AMENDED, BY AMENDING CHAPTER 3, “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, DIVISION 
7, ARTICLE 3.02, ADOPTING THE 2015 EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, THE 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 
THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AND NFPA 70 - 
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2017 EDITION; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL 
OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY OF FINE NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF TWO 
THOUSAND DOLLARS ($2,000.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE; AND PROVIDING AN 
EFFECTIVE DATE.  
  
WHEREAS, the City Council for the City of New Fairview, Texas, has investigated and 
determined that it would be advantageous and beneficial to the citizens of New Fairview to adopt 
the 2015 Editions of the International Building Code, the International Fire Code, the 
International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, the International Residential 
Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Property Maintenance Code and the 
2017 Edition of NFPA 70 - National Electrical Code save and except the amendments set forth in 
Exhibit “A”, attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes.  
  
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

NEW FAIRVIEW, TEXAS: 
  

SECTION 1 
FINDINGS INCORPORATED 

The findings set forth above are incorporated into the body of this Ordinance as if fully set forth 
herein.  
  

SECTION 2 
ADOPTION OF CONSTRUCTION AND TECHNICAL CODES 

The 2015 Editions of the International Building Code, the International Fire Code, the 
International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, the International Residential 
Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Property Maintenance Code and the 
2017 Edition of NFPA 70 - National Electrical Code save and except the amendments set forth in 
Exhibit “A”, attached hereto and incorporated herein, is adopted as the construction and 
technical codes for the City of New Fairview.  A copy of each Code with amendments is on file 
in the office of the City Secretary.  
  
 



SECTION 3 
PENALTY CLAUSE 

Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions or terms of this Ordinance shall 
be subject to a fine in the amount up to two thousand dollars ($2,000.00).  Each and every 
violation or day such violation continues or exists shall be deemed a separate offense.  The 
provisions of this Ordinance can also be enforced by injunction, suit, civil action, and civil 
penalty for any violation as authorized by law.  
  

SECTION 4 
CUMULATIVE REPEALER CLAUSE 

This ordinance shall be cumulative of all provisions of ordinances of the City of New Fairview, 
Texas, and shall not repeal any of the provisions of said ordinances except where the provisions 
of this ordinance are in direct conflict with the provisions of such ordinances, in which event the 
conflicting provisions of such ordinances are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.  All 
other provisions of ordinances of the City of New Fairview, Texas not in direct conflict with this 
ordinance shall remain in full force and effect.  
  

SECTION 5 
SAVINGS CLAUSE 

All rights and remedies of the City of New Fairview, Texas are expressly saved as to any and all 
violations of the provisions of any other ordinance, which have secured at the time of the 
effective date of this Ordinance; and, as to such accrued violations and all pending litigation, 
both civil and criminal, whether pending in court or not, under such ordinances same shall not be 
affected by this Ordinance but may be prosecuted until final disposition by the court.  
  

SECTION 6 
SEVERABILITY 

The sections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases, clauses and words of this ordinance are severable, 
and if any section, paragraph, sentence, phrase, clause or word in this ordinance or application 
thereof to any person or circumstances is held invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent 
jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance, 
and the City Council hereby declares that it would have passed such remaining portions of this 
ordinance despite such invalidity, which remaining portions shall remain in full force and effect.  
  

SECTION 7 
ENGROSSMENT AND ENROLLMENT 

The City Secretary of the City of New Fairview, Texas, is hereby directed to engross and enroll 
this ordinance by copying the caption, publication clause, penalty clause, and effective date 
clause in the minutes of the City Council of the City of New Fairview and by filing this 
ordinance in the ordinance records of the City.  
  
 
 



SECTION 8 
EFFECTIVE DATE 

This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon its passage and publication as required 
by law.  
  
 DULY PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the City of New Fairview, Texas, on 
the 13th day of July, 2020.  
  
 
  
         APPROVED:  
  
  
  

    __________________________________        
                                                               Shea Dane-Patterson, Mayor  

  
ATTEST:  
  
  
  
_____________________________________  
Monica Rodriguez, City Secretary  
  
 



2009 -2015 IBC Significant Changes Summary 

Tier I 

 503 – General Building Height & Area Limitations – Methods for determining allowable heights 

and areas have been dramatically revised and reformatted to improve user-friendliness – 3 

revised Tables with no change in technical application – Does not alter results 

 308.3 - Classification segmentation of I-1 Occupancies into two conditions – Condition 1 (capable 

of self-preservation and egress) – Condition 2 (Assisted egress and defend-in-place methods) – 

More stringent requirements for story limitations, smoke barriers, sprinkler protection, and fire 

detection  

 308.4 - Classification segmentation of I-2 Occupancies into two conditions – Condition 1 (long-

term care facilities) – Condition 2 (short-term medical facilities) – More stringent requirements 

for story limitations, smoke barriers, sprinkler protection, and fire detection  

 407.2.5 – Group I-2 Shared Living Spaces – Adds specific requirements to allow shared spaces to 

be part of, and open to, corridors where egress is not impeded 

 407.2.6 – Group I-2 Cooking Facilities – Adds specific requirements to allow cooking spaces to be 

part of, and open to, corridors where egress is not impeded 

 407.5 – I-2, Condition 2 - Smoke Compartment maximum size increased to 40,000 sf 

 507.9 – Group H-5 in Unlimited Area Buildings – The fire-safety controls of Section 415.11 (H-5) 

adequately reduce the hazards to those similar to a B Occupancy, and therefore can take 

advantage of similar code relief  

 705.3 – Buildings on the same lot – Allows a Type I or IIA, S-2 parking garage directly adjacent to 

a R-2 building – Allows occupant-use openings between the structures, but only requires opening 

protection in the exterior wall of the parking garage – 90 minute protection  is required  

 903.2.1.6 – Sprinkler Systems in Assembly Occupancies – When an assembly use is established on 

an occupied roof – A-2 > 100 or any other A > 300, all floors below will be required to be 

sprinklered to the level of exit discharge 

 903.2.1.7- Multiple Fire Areas – Group A-1, A-2, A-3, and A-4 that share egress components, and 

contain more than 300 occupants, will be sprinklered, regardless of size 

 Chapter 10 – MOE – Dramatic renumbering and provision relocation – Examples: 1015 now 1006, 

1021 deleted, 1007 now Exit and Exit Access, 1009 now AMOE 

 1110 – Recreational Facilities – More detailed scoping requirements have been provided to 

coordinate with the ADA – Added scoping for technical requirements to align with Chapter 11 of 

the A117.1 standard. 

 1705.2.3 – Open Web Steel Joists and Joist Girders – Addition – Special inspections are now 

required during the installation – Types of inspections and reference standards identified 

 2612 – Plastic Composites – Addition – New definitions and applicable test standards for plastic 

composites used in decks, stairs, handrails, and guards 

 2902.3 – Public Toilet Facilities – Limited-size quick-service tenant spaces (300 sf or less) are no 

longer required to provide toilet facilities for public customers  

 3004 – Elevator Hoistway Venting – Provisions have been deleted - No longer required to be 

vented to the exterior – Technology advances and energy concerns have eliminated the historical 

justification 

 3006 – Elevator Lobbies – All requirements have been relocated from Chapter 7 

 Chapter 34 - Deletion of Chapter 34 – Existing Buildings – IEBC is the now the only tool 

 Chapter 35 - 2015 IBC References the 2009 ICC/ANSI A117.1 Accessibility standard – New Chapter 

11 within for recreation  



 

Tier II 

 111.1 – Change of use or occupancy terms are synonymous – New CO’s required on change 

 310.6 - Classification segmentation of R-4 Occupancies into two conditions – Condition 1 (capable 

of self-preservation and egress) – Condition 2 (Assisted egress and methods) – Further research 

ramifications  

 311.1.1 – Small storage rooms (less than 100 sf) are automatically accessory and not classified 

separately – Aggregates are still limited to 10% of the floor area 

 404.5 – Atriums - Smoke control is now mandated in I-2 and I-1, Condition 2 that connect two 

stories  

 404.9 & 404.10 – Egress travel through an atrium – Greatly expands the language regulating the 

provisions and referenced sections, but does not significantly change intent 

 505.2.3, Ex 2 – Mezzanine Openness – Direct access to at least one exit at the mezzanine level is 

no longer required 

 Table 509 – Fire Protection of Incidental Uses – This table has been extensively expanded to 

include occupancy specifics and clarifications – Nifty comparison table to 2012 IBC in SC 

 711 & 712 – Horizontal assemblies and Vertical openings – Sections have been reorganized to 

separate requirements, and provide better clarity 

 903.2.8 – Group R Sprinkler Systems – Numerous changes and clarifications for R-4’s due to the 

new use conditions 

 903.3.1.1.2 – NFPA 13 Exempt Locations – An exemption for bathrooms no more than 55 sf tom 

align the IBC with recent changes to NFPA 

 903.3.1.2.2 – Breezeways – It clarifies that open-ended corridors, and associated stairways, and 

ramps must be protected when a 13R system is used – Not exempt 

 903.3.8 – Limited Area Sprinkler System – Reduces the exceptions for small systems serving a 

single fire area from 20 to 6 

 915 – Carbon Monoxide Detection – Relocated and expanded requirements –Group E added – 

Group I-3 excluded 

 1006 & 1007 – Number of Exits and Exit Access Doorways – Major reconsolidation of provisions – 

New Table 1006.2.1 (all previous provisions & some minor changes) – The Common Paths in non-

sprinklered occupancies that require sprinklers have been changed from a number to NP – 

Extensive overall change 

 1007.1 - Exits and Exit Access Doorway Configuration – Clarification of measurement points – 

Remoteness must be maintained in exit access stairways and ramps – Performance language 

added to remoteness of three exits 

 1010.1.9 – Door Operations & Locking Systems – Numerous revisions throughout the locking 

provisions help clarify application through consistent terminology 

 1016.2 – Egress through Intervening Spaces – A means of egress is now permitted through an 

elevator lobby, provided access to at least one exit is available without passing through the lobby 

– Clears up misconception 

 1017.2.2 – Travel Distance increase for F-1 & S-1 – Increase to 400 feet if conditions are met 

 1023.3.1 – Stairway Extension – An interior exit stairway is now permitted be open directly to an  

exit passageway – No door is required 

 1103.2.8 – Areas in Places of Religious Worship – Small areas (Defined in the change) used for 

religious ceremonies are now exempt from access requirements 

 1104.4 – Multi-story Buildings and Facilities – Clarifies the Group M exception – Clarifies that 

government buildings may not use the exception 



 1107.3 & 1107.4 – Accessible Spaces and Routes – Provisions for connecting all spaces within a 

building have been modified – Distinctions have been provided for changes in elevation for stories 

and mezzanines – R-2 Dormitories not exempt 

 1107.5.1.1 & 1107.6.4.1 – Accessible Units in Assisted Living Facilities – The number of accessible 

units now depends on the capability of the residents 

 1107.6.1.1 – Group R Accessible units – Modification of how multiple buildings on a site are 

evaluated – Building size is described 

 1109.2 – Accessible Water Closet Compartments – In larger toilet rooms, 5% must be wheelchair 

accessible, and 5% must be ambulatory – New exception for toilet and bathing rooms serving 

bariatric patients 

 1602.1 – Definitions and Notations – The definitions of flexible and rigid diaphragms have been 

deleted and replaced with a reference to the procedures within the 2010 national load standard 

(ASCE/SEI 7-10) – Inconsistencies resolved 

 1603 – Construction Documents – Modification – Two additional roof snow items are required to 

be identified on the construction documents – Drift surcharge & Width of snow drifts 

 1603.1.8 – Special Loads – Addition – The dead load of rooftop PV must be identified on the 

construction documents  

 1607.12 – Roof Loads – Addition – The term vegetative roof has been defined in 202 and a 

reference to ASTM E 2397 has been added 

 1607.12.5 – Photovoltaic Panel Systems – Addition – Design requirements for roof structures have 

been added 

 1613.6 – Ballasted Photovoltaic Panel Systems – Addition – Seismic requirements added 

 1704.5 – Submittals to the Building Official – Addition – Requirements for submittal of reports 

and certificates are now clearly specified 

 1705.2 – Steel Construction – The special inspection requirements have been modified to align 

with the new terminology – References new SDI standard 

 1705.3 – Required Special Inspections of Concrete Construction – Specific requirements for the 

design and installation of adhesive anchors are now included in ACI 318, and continuous 

inspection added for defined loads 

 1804.1 – Excavation Near Foundations – Addition – Basic requirements have been added since 

the code was not specific  

 1808.3 – Design Surcharge Loads – Addition – Requirements to protect adjacent structures has 

been added 

 1901.3 – Anchoring to Concrete – Previous Sections 1908 and 1909 have been deleted due to 

inconsistency – New provisions have been added to the general requirements  

 1901.4 – Composite Structural Steel and Concrete Structures – Previous specific requirements 

have been deleted – New provisions have been added to the general requirements 

 2304.6 – Exterior Wall Sheathing – Section has been modified to establish minimum structural 

performance requirements and clarify provisions – References ASCE/SEI 7-10 – The term gable 

has been added 

 2308 – Conventional Light-frame Construction – Much of the Section is extensively reformatted 

and reorganized – New wall bracing designations and requirements, similar to the IRC, are 

provided 

 2309 – Wood Frame Construction Manual – Added Section – Manual allows designs for Risk 

Category I and II within described limitations 

 2406.4.7 – Safety Glazing adjacent to Bottom Stair Landing – Method of measurement revised to 

provide clarity – Restores 2009 language 

 



Tier III 

 202 – Definition of Private Garage added – For motor vehicles used by the tenants of the building 

– No repair or service for profit 

 202 – Definition of Horizontal Exit changed to focus on compartmentalization versus the path of 

egress travel 

 304.1 – Independent commercial kitchens < 2500 sf now included in the B Occupancy list 

 304.1 – Training and skill development description expanded for clarification in the B Occupancy 

list 

 306.2 - Independent commercial kitchens > 2500 sf clarified in the F-1 Occupancy list 

 310.5 – Lodging Houses (typical B&B’s) clarified – 5 or fewer guest rooms – Constructed as IRC or 

R-3 – Change in 2012 IRC did not get carried to IBC 

 403.1, Ex 3 & 5 – Clarification of provisions when A-5, or H-1 thru H-3 are present in a high-rise – 

Self-limited by other specific requirements 

 406.3.1 – Private Garage floor area limitation (Group U) – Limited to 1000 sf, unless 

compartmentalized by 1-hour fire separations 

 412.7 – Travel distance in aircraft manufacturing facilities – Recognizes the current travel distance 

limits are problematic in large facilities – Introduces new table to derive compliance 

 510.2 – Horizontal Building Separation – The single story limit above grade is removed – Overall 

building height control remains the same 

 Table 601, Footnote d – One-Hour substitution – Removed because application was extremely 

limited, and to eliminate misuse. 

 602.4 – Type IV Requirements – FRTW and cross-laminated timber (CLT) now allowed within 

exterior walls – Introduces structural composite lumber (SCL) into the size equivalency table 

 603.1, Item 26 – Wall construction of freezers and coolers – May be framed with combustible 

materials, if covered with non-combustible materials, are of less than 1000 sf of floor area, and 

the building is fully sprinklered 

 705.2 – Projections at Exterior Walls – The minimum required separation between leading edge 

of a projection and the line used to determine the FSD has been modified – Dramatically – 

Question intent and logic – Worst-case example changes from 40 inches clear to 20 feet 

 705.2.3 – Combustible Projections – Confusing language to determine application removed 

 706.2 – Structural Stability – Small language clarifications – Acknowledges tied and cantilevered 

options in NFPA 221 

 714.4.2 – Membrane penetrations – Further clarification of a wood, double top plate intersecting 

a horizontal assembly’s lower membrane  

 904.13 – Domestic cooking systems in Group I-2, Condition1 – Creates reasonable 

accommodations for industry designs while adding proper safeguards 

 907.2.3 – Group E – Manual Fire Alarms – Increases threshold to 50 – Increases EVAC threshold 

to 100 

 909.21.1 – Elevator Hoistway Pressurization Alternative – Creates viable alternatives to the 

traditional testing and measurement requirements  

 910 – Smoke and Heat Removal – Updated revisions for clarity – Allows mechanical smoke 

removal systems – Draft curtain provisions deleted – Based on the Technology Committees’ 

evaluation of current available safeguards 

 1004.1.1 – Cumulative occupant loads – Clarifications for intervening spaces and mezzanine 

 1004.1.2 – Occupant load factor for Group M main levels and basements raised to 60 sf – Now all 

levels 60 SF 

 1009.8 - Two-way Communication Systems – Clarifies that a system may serve multiple elevators 

– Not required at service, freight, or private residence elevators 



 1011.15 & 1011.16 – Ladders – Addition – Permitted locations identified – Requirements in the 

IMC 

 1014.8 – Handrail Projections – Guidance provided for obstructions of required stairway widths 

with intermediate handrails 

 1018.3 – Aisles in Groups B & M – Clarifications of required width – Aligns with corridor widths 

now 

 1020.2 – Corridor Width and Capacity – Clarification for I-2 where bed or stretcher movement is 

necessary 

 1109.2.3 – Accessible Lavatories – Modification - The only accessible lavatory in a toilet room may 

not be in the accessible water compartment closet 

 1405.3 – Vapor Retarders – The required types and locations for each class of vapor retarder have 

been revised – Clarifies prohibited locations 

 1604.3 – Serviceability – Modifications have been made to the deflection limits of varying 

members to clarify and update 

 1607.9 – Impact Loads for Façade Access Equipment – Addition – New provisions added to align 

with OSHA requirements 

 1607.10.2 – Alternate Uniform Live Load Reduction – This method has been corrected to be 

consistent with the original intent as it appeared in the UBC 

 1609.1.1 – Determination of Wind Loads – New wind tunnel test added – ASCE 49 

 1613.5 – Amendments to ASCE 7 – Addition – Amendment to the diaphragm anchorage 

requirements – Clarifies aspect ratios 

 1705.11 – Special Inspection for Wind Resistance – Clarifies intent and specific requirements 

 1705.12 – Special Inspection for Seismic Resistance – Addition – Periodic special inspection of 

cold-formed steel special bolted moment frames is now mandated – Several modifications to 

other special inspections for seismic 

 1708.3.2 – Static Load Testing – Requirements have been revised to clarify intent – Arbitrary factor 

of two removed – Methods of testing are specified – Differences influenced by load duration 

effects when testing wood elements now addressed 

 1709.5 – Exterior Window and Door Assemblies – Clarifies that design pressure ratings are to be 

done on an allowable stress design basis 

 1711 – Material and Test Standards – Requirements for testing joist hangers has been deleted – 

Testing of concrete and clay roof tiles relocated to 1504 

 1803.5 – Investigated Conditions – The requirements addressing the evaluation of rock materials 

have been updated to align with current geotechnical engineering practice – Underpinning and 

excavation requirements have been added 

 1810.2.5 – Group Effects – Clarification of the requirements on uplift of grouped deep foundation 

elements 

 1810.3 - Design and Detailing – Addition – Provisions for structural steel piles have been added to 

clarify intent 

 1904 – Durability Requirements – IBC requirements have been deleted and replaced by a 

reference to ACI 318’s (2014) requirements 

 1905.1.3 – Modifications to ACI 318, Section 18.5 - IBC requirements have been deleted and 

replaced by a reference to ACI 318’s (2014) requirements 

 1905.1.8 – Extensive modifications have been made to the concrete anchorage provisions to 

achieve consistency with Chapter 17 of ACI 318’s (2014) requirements 

 2101.2 - Masonry Design Methods – References to the MSJC have been deleted because the 2013 

edition of TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 have been substantially reorganized to be more user-friendly 

– Section now simply references these documents 



 2103 – Masonry Construction Materials – Provisions have been deleted because they are now 

contained in TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 

 2104 – Masonry Construction – Provisions have been deleted because they are now contained in 

TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 

 2105 – Quality Assurance – Provisions have been deleted because they are now contained in TMS 

602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 and the special inspection and testing requirements of Chapter 17 

 2111 & 2113 – Masonry Fireplaces and Chimneys – Definitions relocated to 202 – Reinforcement 

and anchorage requirements updated to clarify intent 

 2210 – Cold-formed Steel – A new SDI standard for composite decks has been added to Chapter 

35 

 2211 - Cold-formed Steel Light-frame Construction – A new AISI standard (S220) is now referenced 

for non-structural products 

 2303.1.4 – Structural Glued Cross-laminated Timber – Abbreviated CLT – New definition added to 

202 – New standard ANSI/APA PRG 320 

 2303.1.13 – Engineered Wood Rim Board - New definition added to 202 – Two new referenced 

standards in Chapter 35 

 2304.10.6 – Load Path – Requirements for steel straps modified to align with AISI Product Data 

Standard S201 

 2304.12 – Protection against Decay and Termites – Modifications clarify where waterborne 

preservatives are required and where they are not required 

 Chapter 25 – Gypsum Panel Products – Definition of gypsum board revised and a new definition 

for gypsum panel products added to 202 – Terms aligned throughout Chapter 

 

 



City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 

Agenda Item: Resolution (Action Item) 

Agenda Description: 
Discuss, consider and possibly take action to approve a resolution allowing the City 
Administrator to make changes to the employee handbook as necessary.  

Background Information: 
The City of New Fairview recently adopted an updated employee handbook that provides 
policies and procedures on how the City and employees will interact. Further, the City 
Administrator has been appointed by the City Council to administer the affairs of the City and 
from time to time it may be necessary or prudent to make adjustments to the employee 
handbook. The employee handbook will be presented to the City Council on an annual basis with 
any changes highlighted for review. 

Financial Information: 
This should have no impact on the adopted budget. 

City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 
Staff recommends that Council approve the resolution. 

Attachments: 
Resolution 



City of New Fairview, Texas 
Resolution No. ______ 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, TX AUTHORIZING THE CITY 
ADMINISTRATOR TO AMEND THE EMPLOYEE HANDBOOK. 

WHEREAS,  the City of Fairview is an incorporated city in the State of Texas; and 

WHEREAS,  the City of New Fairview is a General Law city as classified by the Texas 
Municipal Code; and 

WHEREAS,  the City desires to maintain a quality workforce and provide clear communication 
with its employees. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
NEW FAIRVIEW: 

1. The City Council of New Fairview authorizes the City Administrator to amend the
Employee Handbook; and

2. That this Resolution shall take effect upon its approval.

PRESENTED AND PASSED on this 3rd day of August, at a meeting of the New Fairview City 
Council. 

APPROVED: ATTESTED: 

____________________ _____________________ 
Joe Max Wilson Monica Rodriguez 
Mayor  City Secretary  



 

City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 
 
Agenda Item:   Resolution    (Action Item) 
 
Agenda Description: 
Discuss, consider and possibly take action authorizing staff to digitize the City’s paper records 
and seek permission from the state to implement an electronic records retention program for 
maintenance of all City records.  
 
Background Information: 
The City of New Fairview has tens-of-thousands of pages of paper records that are required to be 
maintained by the State. If the City were to have a natural disaster, fire, or other unforeseen 
event, it is possible that all of the paper records could be lost or destroyed. Further, when an 
interested party files an open records request, staff is required to research and provide the eligible 
records. This can take a significant amount of time and resources. Utilizing current technology, 
we can digitize and store the records locally and back them up in the “cloud” so that they are safe 
from potential hazards as well as make them keyword searchable for open records requests. This 
will also help to make us compliant with records retention requirements of emails and other 
documents. 
 
Financial Information: 
This process can be completed using existing technology, but an upgrade to include access to 
Google Vault will increase our monthly user cost by $5/user.  
 
City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 
Staff recommends that Council approve the resolution. 
 
Attachments: 
Resolution 
 



City of New Fairview, Texas 
Resolution No. ______ 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF NEW FAIRVIEW, TX AUTHORIZING THE 
CITY STAFF TO RETAIN RECORDS IN AN ELECTRONIC FORMAT. 

WHEREAS,  the City of Fairview is an incorporated city in the State of Texas; and 

WHEREAS,  the City of New Fairview is a General Law city as classified by the Texas 
Municipal Code; and 

WHEREAS,  the City desires to reduce use of paper products and create a level of redundancy 
with City records; and 

WHEREAS,  the City desires to maintain compliance with records retention and improve 
transparency. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
NEW FAIRVIEW: 

1. The City Council of New Fairview authorizes staff to implement the process of digitizing
all paper records seek approval from the State of Texas; and

2. That this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its approval.

PRESENTED AND PASSED on this 3rd day of August, at a meeting of the New Fairview City 
Council. 

APPROVED: ATTESTED: 

____________________ _____________________ 
Joe Max Wilson Monica Rodriguez 
Mayor  City Secretary  



 

City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 
 
Agenda Item:   Discussion     (Seek Direction) 
 
Agenda Description: 
Discuss and consider options regarding the streets maintenance program.  
 
Background Information: 
The City of New Fairview had previously entered into an agreement with Devon Energy to 
maintain three roads (Graham, Martindale, and Pioneer) in the City limits. This agreement was 
terminated upon the implementation of the City ad valorem tax. It appears that Devon Energy 
had also maintained a number of private roads which are no longer being maintained. City Hall 
has received requests to repair these private roads now that we are collecting a property tax.  
 
Financial Information: 
This has the potential for significant costs associated with road maintenance and repair.  
 
City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 
 
 
Attachments: 
N/A 

 
 

 



















City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 

Agenda Item: Discussion (Seek Direction) 

Agenda Description: 
Discuss and consider options regarding code enforcement Ordinance 1998-05-0014 adn 2007-
12-127.

Background Information: 
The City of New Fairview has adopted a code enforcement ordinance that allows for the 
monitoring and enforcement of garbage, grass, and other nuisances within the City limits but has 
been lenient in their enforcement.  A significant amount of road damage within the City limits is 
the result of poor drainage due to a lack of maintenance of bar ditches, culverts, and changing the 
flow of water from designated routes. Prior to the City making significant investments in street 
repairs, the drainage issues need to be addressed.  

Financial Information: 
This has the potential for significant costs associated with enforcement, ticketing, and abatement 
activities.  

City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 

Attachments: 
N/A 



Discussion (Seek Direction) 

City Council Agenda 
August 3, 2020 

Agenda Item: 

Agenda Description: 
Discuss and consider options regarding the 2020-2021 annual budget and the No-New-Revenue 
tax rate.

Background Information: 
State law requires presenting in a public meeting the No-New-Revenue tax rate to the City 
Council and posting the same material to the website by August 7th or as soon as posible 
thereafter. These numbers are preliminary and subject to change, as Denton County has not yet 
completed the certified taxable value. We are working with the Denton CAD and the Tax 
Appraiser to get this resolved, but this is a Denton County wide problem.  

Financial Information: 
This will impact our tax rate which may have significant financial implications.  

City Contact and Recommendation: 
Ben Nibarger, City Administrator 

Attachments: 
N/A 



NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF

C45

2020 DENTON CAD

No-New-Revenue Tax Rate Assumption Data

Taxing Unit Number: Taxing Unit Type:061-134-03 City

$0

16. Taxes in tax increment financing (TIF) for tax year 2019.

$0

$4,330,348

A.  2019 market value:

A.  Certified Values:

$0

4. 2019 total adopted tax rate

1. 2019 total taxable value.

$5,849,205

2. 2019 tax ceilings

10. 2019 taxable value lost because property first qualified for an exemption in 2020.

$0

D. Tax increment financing:

B . 2020 value of properties not under protest or included on certified appraisal roll.

A. Absolute exemptions, 2019 market value:

C. Value Loss:

$0

$9,599,465

$0

$3,691,838

B.  Counties: Include railroad rolling stock values certified by the Comptroller’s office:

A . 2020 taxable value of properties under protest (Estimated Lower Taxable Value):

C. Value Loss, Total of A and B:

$0

23. Total 2020 taxable value of new improvements and new personal property located on new improvements.

0.3

B. Partial exemptions, 2020 exemption amount

11.  2019 taxable value lost because property first qualified for agricultural appraisal (1-d or 1-d-1), timber appraisal, recreational/scenic
appraisal or public access airport special appraisal in 2020.

22. Total 2020 taxable value of properties in territory annexed after January 1, 2019

C. Total value under protest or not certified.

County/Other Worksheet Field Number & Data

C. Pollution control and energy storage system exemption:

$0

B. 2020 productivity or special appraised value:

18. Total 2020 taxable value on the 2020 certified appraisal roll today.

$0

$0

$1,556,545

$0

19. Total value of properties under protest or not included on certified appraisal roll.

$0

$020. 2020 tax ceilings.

$205,399

Powered by: <trueprodigy.com>July 27, 2020 4:52:20 PM CDT Page 1  of 1



REAL PROPERTY & MFT HOMES

11,547,419Market Value

2,942,799Improvement HS Value

124Improvement NHS Value

2,942,923Total Improvement

967,226Land HS Value

5,644,384Land NHS Value

BUSINESS PERSONAL PROPERTY

1,992,886Ag Land Market Value

8,604,496Total Land Value

0HS CAP Limitation Value (-)

9,599,465NET APPRAISED VALUE

(Count) (144)

(1)

19,660Market Value

OIL & GAS / MINERALS (0)

0Market Value

OTHER (Intangibles, Rolling Stock) (0)

0Market Value

9,599,465NET TAXABLE

11,567,079TOTAL MARKET

(Total Count) (145)

4,603,909

0

0

5,849,205

0

749,039

5,849,205

5,100,166

(Count) (62)

749,039

0

(0)

0

5,849,205

(Total Count) (62)

(0)

0

496,257

5,849,205

(0)

10,248,293

19,660

0

17,416,284

1,992,886

3,691,962

15,448,670

13,704,662

(Count) (206)

3,691,838

124

(0)

0

17,396,624

(Total Count) (207)

(1)

0

1,463,483

15,448,670

(0)

PRELIMINARY UNDER REVIEW TOTAL

DENTON CAD

C45 0

2020

As of Roll #

Preliminary Totals NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF

APPROX TOTAL LEVY = NET TAXABLE * (TAX RATE / 100)

$46,346.01 = 15,448,670 0.300000* / 100)

APPRAISED VALUE 9,599,465 15,448,6705,849,205

25,27225,272 0

1,967,6141,967,614

0Ag Land Market Value 1,992,886

0

1,992,886

Ag Loss (-)

Ag Use

00Total Exemption Amount 0

100%37.9%62.1%

9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 249



9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 250



Preliminary Totals NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF
C45

2020 DENTON CAD

No-New-Revenue Tax Rate Assumption As of Roll # 0

New Value

Total New Market Value:

Total New Taxable Value:

$3,691,838

$3,691,838

New Annexations/Deannexations

Taxable ValueMarket ValueCount
205,3991 205,399Annexations

Average Exemption Average TaxableCount of HSCategory Average Market

Average Homestead Value

399,252399,252A Only 01

A & E 0 399,252399,2521

Property Under Review - Lower Value Used

Lower Market ValueCount Market Value Estimated Lower Taxable Value
4,330,34862 5,849,205 4,330,348

9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 251



Preliminary Totals NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF
C45 As of Roll # 0

2020 DENTON CAD

State Category Breakdown

Preliminary

Count Acres New ValueCode Description Market Value Taxable Value

A Single-family Residential 17 2,781,482 3,784,286 3,784,286

C1 Vacant Lots and Tracts 66 0 5,396,325 5,396,325

D1 Qualified Open-Space Land 64 3,542.94 0 1,992,886 25,272

D2 Farm or Ranch Improvements on Qualified 8 0 124 124

E Rural Land,Not Qualified for Open-Space Land 2 161,317 373,798 373,798

L1 Commercial Personal Property 1 0 19,660 19,660

Totals: 3,542.94 2,942,799 11,567,079 9,599,465

9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 252



Preliminary Totals NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF
C45 As of Roll # 0

2020 DENTON CAD

State Category Breakdown

Under Review

Count Acres New ValueCode Description Market Value Taxable Value

A Single-family Residential 11 749,039 1,245,296 1,245,296

C1 Vacant Lots and Tracts 56 0 4,603,909 4,603,909

Totals: 0 749,039 5,849,205 5,849,205

9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 253



Preliminary Totals NEW FAIRVIEW CITY OF
C45 As of Roll # 0

2020 DENTON CAD

State Category Breakdown

Grand Totals

Count Acres New ValueCode Description Market Value Taxable Value

A Single-family Residential 28 3,530,521 5,029,582 5,029,582

C1 Vacant Lots and Tracts 122 0 10,000,234 10,000,234

D1 Qualified Open-Space Land 64 3,542.94 0 1,992,886 25,272

D2 Farm or Ranch Improvements on Qualified 8 0 124 124

E Rural Land,Not Qualified for Open-Space Land 2 161,317 373,798 373,798

L1 Commercial Personal Property 1 0 19,660 19,660

Totals: 3,542.94 3,691,838 17,416,284 15,448,670

9:42:00 PM <trueprodigy.com>07/27/20Printed:7/27/20 9:36 PMGenerated:  of 1185Page 254









Page 1 1001.1.6

07/29/2020 08:07 AMDate: 

2020 City of New Fairview

999 Illinois Lane, New Fairview, TX, 76078

Taxing Unit Name Phone (area code and number

Taxing Unit's Website AddressTaxing Unit Address, City, State, ZIP Code

GENERAL INFORMATION: Tax Code Section 26.04(c) requires an officer or employee designated by the governing body to 
calculate the no-new-revenue (NNR) tax rate and voter-approval tax rate for the taxing unit. These tax rates are expressed in dollars per 
$100 of taxable value calculated. The calculation process starts after the chief appraiser delivers to the taxing unit the certified appraisal 
roll and the estimated values of properties under protest. The designated officer or employee shall certify that the officer or employee has 
accurately calculated the tax rates and used values shown for the certified appraisal roll or certified estimate. The officer or employee 
submits the rates to the governing body by Aug. 7 or as soon thereafter as practicable.

School districts do not use this form, but instead use Comptroller For 50-859 Tax Rate Calculation Worksheet for School Districts.

Water districts as defined under Water Code Section 49.001(1) should use Comptroller Form 50-858 Water District Rollback Tax Rate 
Worksheet. All other taxing units should use Comptroller Form 50-856 Tax Rate Calculation, Taxing Units Other Than School Districts.

The Comptroller's office provides this worksheet to assist taxing units in determining tax rates. The information provided in this 
worksheet is offered as technical assistance and not legal advice. Taxing units should consult legal counsel for interpretations of law 
regarding tax rate preparation and adoption.

Line No-New-Revenue Rate Activity Amount/Rate
1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6.

2019 total taxable value. Enter the amount of 2019 taxable value on the 2019 tax 
roll today. Include any adjustments since last year's certification; exclude Tax Code 
Section 25.25(d) one-fourth and one-third over-appraisal corrections from these 
adjustments. Exclude any property value subject to an appeal under Chapter 42 as of 
July 25 (will add undisputed value in Line 6). This total includes the taxable value of
homesteads with tax ceilings (will deduct in Line 2) and the captured value for tax 
increment financing (will deduct taxes in Line 17).

2019 tax ceilings. Counties, cities and junior college districts. Enter 2019 total 
taxable value of homesteads with tax ceilings. These include the homesteads of 
homeowners age 65 or older or disabled. Other taxing units enter 0. If your taxing 
unit adopted the tax ceiling provision in 2019 or a prior year for homeowners age 65 
or older or disabled, use this step

Preliminary 2019 adopted taxable value. Subtract Line 2 from Line 1.

2019 total adopted tax rate

2019 taxable value lost because court appeals of ARB decisions reduced 2019 
appraised value:
A. Original 2019 ARB values:

B. 2019 values resulting from final court decisions:

C. 2019 value loss. Subtract B from A.[3]

2019 taxable value subject to appear under Chapter 42, as of July 25.

A. 2019 ARB certified value

$167,708,925 

$0 

$167,708,925 

    $.300000 

 

 

 

$0 

 

$0

$0

Taxing Units Other Than School Districts or Water Districts
2020 Tax Rate Calculation Worksheet

STEP 1: No-New-Revenue Tax Rate

The NNR tax rate enables the public to evaluate the relationship between taxes for the prior year and for the current year based on a tax 
rate that would produce the same amount of taxes (no new taxes) if applied to the same properties that are taxed in both year.

The NNR tax rate for a county is the sum of the NNR tax rates calculated for each type of tax the county levies.

While uncommon, it is possible for a taxing unit to provide an exemption for only maintenance and operation taxes. In this case, the 
taxing unit will need to calculate the NNR tax rate separately for the maintenance and operations tax and the debt tax, then add the two 
components together.



Page 2 1001.1.6

Line No-New-Revenue Rate Activity Amount/Rate

7.

8.

9.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

B. 2019 disputed value

C. 2019 undisputed value Subtract B from A

2019 Chapter 42-related adjusted values. Add Line 5 and 6

2019 taxable value, adjusted for court-ordered reductions. Add Line 3 and Line 
7

2019 taxable value of property in territory the taxing unit deannexed after Jan. 
1, 2019. Enter the 2019 value of property in deannexed territory.[4]

2019 taxable value lost because property first qualified for an exemption in 
2020. If the taxing unit increased an original exemption, use the difference between 
the original exempted amount and the increased exempted amount. Do not include 
value lost due to freeport, goodsin-transit, temporary disaster exemptions. Note that 
lowering the amount or percentage of an existing exemption in 2020 does not create 
a new exemption or reduce taxable value.

A. Absolute exemptions. Use 2019 market value:

B. Partial exemptions. 2020 exemption amount or 2020 percentage exemption times
2019 value:

C. Value loss. Add A and B.

2019 taxable value lost because property first qualified for agricultural 
appraisal (1-d or 1-d-1),timber appraisal, recreational/scenic appraisal or 
public access airport special appraisal in 2020. Use only properties that qualified 
in 2020 for the first time; do not use properties that qualified in 2019.

A. Use 2019 market value:

B. 2020 productivity or special appraised value:

C. Value loss. Subtract B from A.

Total adjustments for lost value. Add Lines 9, 10C and 11C.

Adjusted 2019 taxable value. Subtract Line 12 from Line 8

Adjusted 2019 taxes. Multiply Line 4 by Line 13 and divide by $100

Taxes refunded for years preceding tax year 2019.  Enter the amount of taxes 
refunded by the district for tax years preceding tax year 2019. Types of refunds 
include court decisions, Tax Code Section 25.25(b) and (c) corrections and Tax Code
Section 31.11 payment errors. Do not include refunds for tax year 2019. This line 
applies only to tax years preceding tax year 2019. [8]

Taxes in tax increment financing (TIF) for tax year 2019  Enter the amount of 
taxes paid into the tax increment fund for a reinvestment zone as agreed by the 
taxing unit. If the taxing unit has no 2020 captured appraised value in Line 18D, 
enter 0.

Adjusted 2019 levy with refunds and TIF adjustment. Add Lines 14, and 15, 
subtract Line 16.

Total 2020 taxable value on the 2020 certified appraisal roll today. This value 
includes only certified values or certified estimate of values and includes the total 
taxable value of homesteads with tax ceilings (will deduct in Line 20). These 
homesteads include homeowners age 65 or older or disabled. 

A.Certified values

B. Counties Include railroad rolling stock values certified by the Comptroller's 
office

C. Pollution control and energy storage system exemption  Deduct the value of 
property exempted for the current tax year for the first time as pollution control or 
energy storage system property

D. Tax increment financing  Deduct the 2020 captured appraised value of property 
taxable by a taxing unit in a tax increment financing zone for which the 2020 taxes 
will be deposited into the tax increment fund. Do not include any new property value
that will be included in Line 23 below.

 

 

0 

0 

$167,708,925 

$0 

 

 

 

$74,441 

 

 

 

$142,530 

$216,971 

$167,491,954 

$502,475 

$0 

$0 

$502,475 

 

 

 

 

 

0

0

$0

$74,441

$143,180

$650

$140,859,561

$0

$0

$0



Page 3 1001.1.6

Line No-New-Revenue Rate Activity Amount/Rate

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

E. Total 2020 value Add A and B, then subtract C and D

Total value of properties under protest or not included on certified appraisal 
roll. [13]
A. 2020 taxable value of properties under protest  The chief appraiser certifies a 
list of properties still under ARB protest. The list shows the appraisal district�s 
value and the taxpayer's claimed value, if any, or an estimate of the value if the 
taxpayer wins. For each of the properties under protest, use the lowest of these 
values. Enter the total value under protest

B. 2020 value of properties not under protest or included on certified appraisal 
roll. The chief appraiser gives taxing units a list of those taxable properties that the 
chief appraiser knows about but are not included in the appraisal roll certification. 
These properties also are not on the list of properties that are still under protest. On 
this list of properties, the chief appraiser includes the market value, appraised value 
and exemptions for the preceding year and a reasonable estimate of the market value,
appraised value and exemptions for the current year. Use the lower market, appraised
or taxable value (as appropriate). Enter the total value of property not on the certified
roll. 

C. Total value under protest or not certified.Add A and B.

2020 tax ceilings. Counties, cities and junior colleges enter 2020 total taxable value 
of homesteads with tax ceilings. These include the homesteads of homeowners age 
65 or older or disabled. Other taxing units enter 0. If your taxing unit adopted the tax 
ceiling provision in 2019 or a prior year for homeowners age 65 or older or disabled, 
use this step.

2020 total taxable value. Add Lines 18E and 19C. Subtract Line 20C.

Total 2020 taxable value of properties in territory annexed after Jan. 1, 2019. 
Include both real and personal property. Enter the 2020 value of property in territory 
annexed. 

Total 2020 taxable value of new improvements and new personal property 
located in new improvements. New means the item was not on the appraisal roll in 
2019. An improvement is a building, structure, fixture or fence erected on or affixed 
to land. New additions to existing improvements may be included if the appraised 
value can be determined. New personal property in a new improvement must have 
been brought into the taxing unit after Jan. 1, 2019 and be located in a new 
improvement. New improvements do include property on which a tax abatement 
agreement has expired for 2020. 

Total adjustments to the 2020 taxable value. Add Lines 22 and 23.

Adjusted 2020 taxable value. Subtract Line 24 from Line 21.

2020 NNR tax rate. Divide Line 17 by Line 25 and multiply by $100.

COUNTIES ONLY.  Add together the NNR tax rates for each type of tax the 
county levies. The total is the 2020 county NNR tax rate

$140,859,561 

 

 

 

$520,860 

$0 

$141,380,421 

$0 

$2,201,010 

$2,201,010 

$139,179,411 

    $.361027 /$100

    $.361026 /$100

[1]Tex. Tax Code Section [2]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[3]Tex. Tax Code Section [4]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[5]Tex. Tax Code Section [6]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[7]Tex. Tax Code Section [8]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[9]Tex. Tax Code Section [10]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[11]Tex. Tax Code Section [12]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[13]Tex. Tax Code Section [14]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[15]Tex. Tax Code Section [16]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[17]Tex. Tax Code Section [18]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[19]Tex. Tax Code Section [20]Tex. Tax Code Section 

[21]Tex. Tax Code Section 

$520,860

$0



Page 4 1001.1.6

Line Voter Approval Tax Rate Activity Amount/Rate

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

2019 M&O tax rate.  Enter the 2019 M&O tax rate.

2019 taxable value, adjusted for actual and potential court-ordered 
adjustments. Enter the amount in Line 8 of the No-New-Revenue Tax Rate 
Worksheet.

Total 2019 M&O levy. Multiply Line 28 by Line 29 and divide by $100

Adjusted 2019 levy for calculating NNR M&O rate.  Add Line 31E to Line 30.

A. 2019 sales tax specifically to reduce property taxes. For cities, counties and 
hospital districts, enter the amount of additional sales tax collected and spent on 
M&O expenses in 2019, if any. Other taxing units, enter 0. Counties must exclude 
any amount that was spent for economic development grants from the amount of 
sales tax spent

B. M&O taxes refunded for years preceding tax year 2019. Enter the amount of 
M&O taxes refunded in the preceding year for taxes before that year. Types of 
refunds include court decisions, Tax Code Section 25.25(b) and (c) corrections and 
Tax Code Section 31.11 payment errors. Do not include refunds for tax year 2019. 
This line applies only to tax years preceding tax year 2019

C. 2019 taxes in TIF: Enter the amount of taxes paid into the tax increment fund for
a reinvestment zone as agreed by the taxing unit. If the taxing unit has no 2020 
captured appraised value in Line 18D, enter 0

D. 2019 transferred function: If discontinuing all of a department, function or 
activity and transferring it to another taxing unit by written contract, enter the 
amount spent by the taxing unit discontinuing the function in the 12 months 
preceding the month of this calculation. If the taxing unit did not operate this 
function for this 12-month period, use the amount spent in the last full fiscal year in 
which the taxing unit operated the function. The taxing unit discontinuing the 
function will subtract this amount in E below. The taxing unit receiving the function 
will add this amount in E below. Other taxing units enter 0. 

E. 2019 M&O levy adjustments. Add A and B, then subtract C. For taxing unit 
with D, subtract if discontinuing function and add if receiving function

Adjusted 2020 taxable value.  Enter the amount in Line 25 of the No-New-
Revenue Tax Rate Worksheet.

2020 NNR M&O rate (unadjusted)  Divide Line 31 by Line 32 and multiply by 
$100.

Rate adjustment for state criminal justice mandate. Enter the rate calculated in C.
If not applicable, enter 0.

A. 2020 state criminal justice mandate.  Enter the amount spent by a county in the 
previous 12 months providing for the maintenance and operation cost of keeping 
inmates in county-paid facilities after they have been sentenced. Do not include any 
state reimbursement received by the county for the same purpose. 

B. 2019 state criminal justice mandate  Enter the amount spent by a county in the 
12 months prior to the previous 12 months providing for the maintenance and 
operation cost of keeping inmates in county-paid facilities after they have been 
sentenced. Do not include any state reimbursement received by the county for the 
same purpose. Enter zero if this is the first time the mandate applies

    $.300000 

167,708,925 

503,126 

 

 

 

 

 

0 

139,179,411 

0.361495 

0.000000 

 

 

0

0

0

0

0

0

STEP 2: Voter-Approval Tax Rate

The voter-approval tax rate is the highest tax rate that a taxing unit may adopt without holding an election to seek voter approval of the 
rate. The voter-approval tax rate is split into two separate rates:

1. Maintenance and Operations (M&O) Tax Rate: The M&O portion is the tax rate that is needed to raise the same amount of taxes 
that the taxing unit levied in the prior year plus the applicable percentage allowed by law. This rate accounts for such things as salaries, 
utilities and day-to-day operations.

2. Debt Rate: The debt rate includes the debt service necessary to pay the taxing unit�s debt payments in the coming year. This rate 
accounts for principal and interest on bonds and other debt secured by property tax revenue.

The voter-approval tax rate for a county is the sum of the voter-approval tax rates calculated for each type of tax the county levies. In 
most cases the voter-approval tax rate exceeds the no-new-revenue tax rate, but occasionally decreases in a taxing unit�s debt 
service will cause the NNR tax rate to be higher than the voter-approval tax rate.



Page 5 1001.1.6

Line Voter Approval Tax Rate Activity Amount/Rate

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

C. Subtract B from A and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

Rate adjustment for indigent health care expenditures Enter the rate calculated in
C. If not applicable, enter 0

A. 2020 indigent health care expenditures Enter the amount paid by a taxing unit 
providing for the maintenance and operation cost of providing indigent health care 
for the period beginning on July 1, 2019 and ending on June 30, 2020, less any state 
assistance received for the same purpose

B. 2019 indigent health care expenditures  Enter the amount paid by a taxing unit 
providing for the maintenance and operation cost of providing indigent health care 
for the period beginning on July 1, 2018 and ending on June 30, 2019, less any state 
assistance received for the same purpose

C. Subtract B from A and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

Rate adjustment for county indigent defense compensation Enter the lessor of C 
and D. If not applicable, enter 0

A. 2020 indigent defense compensation expenditures  Enter the amount paid by a 
county to provide appointed counsel for indigent individuals for the period beginning
on July 1, 2019 and ending on June 30, 2020, less any state grants received by the 
county for the same purpose

B. 2019 indigent defense compensation expenditures Enter the amount paid by a 
county to provide appointed counsel for indigent individuals for the period beginning
on July 1, 2018 and ending on June 30, 2019, less any state grants received by the 
county for the same purpose

C. Subtract B from A and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

D. Multiply B by 0.05 and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

Rate adjustment for county hospital expenditures. Enter the lessor of C and D, if 
applicable. If not applicable, enter 0.

A. 2020 eligible county hospital expenditures  Enter the amount paid by the county
or municipality to maintain and operate an eligible county hospital for the period 
beginning on July 1, 2019 and ending on June 30, 2020

B. 2019 eligible county hospital expenditures Enter the amount paid by the county 
or municipality to maintain and operate an eligible county hospital for the period 
beginning on July 1, 2018 and ending on June 30, 2019

C. Subtract B from A and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

D.  Multiply B by 0.08 and divide by Line 32 and multiply by $100

Adjusted 2020 NNR M&O rate.  Add Lines 33, 34, 35, 36, and 37

2020 voter-approval M&O rate. Enter the rate as calculated by the appropriate 
scenario below.
Special Taxing Unit If the taxing unit qualifies as a special taxing unit, multiply 
Line 38 by 1.08
-or-
Other Taxing Unit If the taxing unit does not qualify as a special taxing unit, 
multiply Line 38 by 1.035. 
-or-
Taxing unit affected by disaster declaration If the taxing unit is located in an area 
declared as disater area, the governing body may direct the person calculating the 
voter-approval rate to calculate in the manner provided for a special taxing unit. The
taxing unit shall continue to calculate the voter-approval rate in this manner until the
earlier of 1) the second year in which total taxable value on the certified appraisal 
roll exceeds the total taxable value of the tax year in which the disaster occurred, and
2) the third tax year after the tax year in which the disaster occurred. If the taxing 
unit qualifies under this scenario, multiply Line 38 by 1.08. [27] 

Total 2020 debt to be paid with property taxes and additional sales tax revenue. 
Debt means the interest and principal that will be paid on debts that: 

(1) are paid by property taxes,

(2) are secured by property taxes,

(3) are scheduled for payment over a period longer than one year, and

(4) are not classified in the taxing unit's budget as M&O expenses.

 

0.000000 

 

 

 

0.000000 

 

 

 

 

0 

 

 

 

 

0.361495 

 

 

0.000000

0

0

0.000000

0

0

0.000000

0.000000

0

0

0.000000

0.000000



Page 6 1001.1.6

Line Voter Approval Tax Rate Activity Amount/Rate

41.

42.

43.

44.

45.

46.

47.

48.

A. Debt also includes contractual payments to other taxing units that have incurred 
debts on behalf of this taxing unit, if those debts meet the four conditions above. 
Include only amounts that will be paid from property tax revenue. Do not include 
appraisal district budget payments.

 Enter debt amount

B. Subtract unencumbered fund amount used to reduce total debt.

C.  Subtract certified amount spent from sales tax to reduce debt(enter zero if 
none)

D. Subtract amount paid from other resource 

E. Adjusted debt Subtract B, C and D from A

Certified 2019 excess debt collections Enter the amount certified by the collector. 

Adjusted 2020 debt Subtract Line 41 from Line 40E

2020 anticipated collection rate. . If the anticipated collection rate in A is lower 
than actual collection rates in B, C and D, enter the lowest collection rate from B, C 
and D. If the anticipated rate in A is higher than at least one of the rates in the prior 
three years, enter the rate from A. Note that the rate can be greater than 100%

A. Enter the 2020 anticipated collection rate certified by the collector

B. Enter the 2019 actual collection rate

C. Enter the 2018 actual collection rate

D. Enter the 2017 actual collection rate

2020 debt adjusted for collections. Divide Line 42 by Line 43. 

2020 total taxable value. Enter the amount on Line 21 of the No-New-Revenue 
Tax Rate Worksheet.

2020 debt rate Divide Line 44 by Line 45 and multiply by $100.

2020 voter-approval tax rate

COUNTIES ONLY

 

 

 

 

0 

0 

0 

  100.00 

 

 

 

 

0 

141,380,421 

0.000000 

 

 

Line Additional Sales and Use Tax Worksheet Amount/Rate

49.

50.

51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

Taxable sales. For taxing units that adopted the sales tax in November 2019 or May 
2020, enter the Comptroller's estimate of taxable sales for the previous four quarters.
Estimates of taxable sales may be obtained through the Comptroller's Allocation 
Historical Summary webpage. Taxing units that adopted the sales tax before 
November 2019, skip this line.

Estimated sales tax revenue. Counties exclude any amount that is or will be spent 
for economic development grants from the amount of estimated sales tax revenue.

  Taxing units that adopted the sales tax in November 2019 or in May 2020. 
Multiply the amount on Line 49 by the sales tax rate (.01, .005 or .0025, as 
applicable) and multiply the result by .95[3]  -or-

  Taxing units that adopted the sales tax before November 2019. Enter the sales 
tax revenue for the previous four quarters. Do not multiply by .95.

2020 total taxable value. Enter the amount from Line 21 of the No-New-Revenue 
Tax Rate Worksheet..

Sales tax adjustment rate. Divide Line 50 by Line 51 and multiply by $100.

2020 NNR tax rate, unadjusted for sales tax.[35] Enter the rate from Line 26 or 
27, as applicable, on the No-New-Revenue Tax Rate Worksheet.

2020 NNR tax rate, adjusted for sales tax.

  Subtract Line 52 from Line 55.

2020 voter-approval tax rate, unadjusted for sales tax.[36] Enter the rate from 

0

0

141,380,421

0.000000

    $.361026

    $.361026

0.372752

0

0

0

0

  100.00

  100.00

  100.00

  100.00

STEP 3 NNR Tax Rate and Voter-Approval Tax Rate Adjustments for Additional Sales tAx to Reduce Property Taxes

Cities, counties and hospital districts may levy a sales tax specifically to reduce property taxes. Local voters by election must approve 
imposing or abolishing the additional sales tax. If approved, the taxing unit must reduce its NNR and voter-approval tax rates to offset 
the expected sales tax revenue.

This section should only be completed by a county, city or hospital district that is required to adjust its NNR tax rate and/or voter-
approval tax rate because it adopted the additional sales tax.



Page 7 1001.1.6

Line Additional Sales and Use Tax Worksheet Amount/Rate

56.

Line 47 or Line 48 as applicable, of the Voter-Approval Tax Rate

Worksheet

2020 voter-approval tax rate, adjusted for sales tax.

   Subtract Line 52 from Line 55.

0.374147

[37]Tex. Tax Code Section [38]Tex. Tax Code Section 

Line  Activity Amount/Rate

57.

58.

59.

60.

Certified expenses from the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ).[6] Enter the 
amount certified in the determination letter from TCEQ. The taxing unit shall provide its tax assessor 
collector with a copy of the letter.[7]

2020 total taxable value. Enter the amount from Line 21 of the No-New-Revenue Tax Rate Worksheet

Additional rate for pollution control. Divide Line 57 by Line 58 and multiply by $100.

2020 voter-approval tax rate, adjusted for pollution control. Add Line 59 to one of the following lines 
(as applicable): Line 47, Line 48 (counties) or Line 56 (taxing units with the additional sales tax).

$0 

$141,380,421 

0.000000 

 

Line  Activity Amount/Rate
61.

62.

63.

64.

65.

2019 unused increment rate.  Subtract the 2019 actual tax rate and the 2019 unused increment rate from
the 2019 voter-approval tax rate. If the number is less than zero, enter zero. If the year is prior to 2020, 
enter zero.
2018 unused increment rate.  Subtract the 2018 actual tax rate and the 2018 unused increment rate from
the 2028 voter-approval tax rate. If the number is less than zero, enter zero. If the year is prior to 2020, 
enter zero.
2017 unused increment rate.  Subtract the 2017 actual tax rate and the 2017 unused increment rate from
the 2017 voter-approval tax rate. If

the number is less than zero, enter zero. If the year is prior to 2020, enter zero.
2020 unused increment rate. Add Lines 61, 62 and 63.

2020 voter-approval tax rate, adjusted for unused increment rate. Add Line 64 to one of the 
following lines (as applicable): Line 47, Line 48 (counties), Line 56 (taxing units with the additional 
sales tax) or Line 60 (taxing units with pollution control).

0.000000 

0.000000 

0.000000 

0.000000 

0.000000 

STEP 4: Additional Rollback Protection for Pollution Control

A taxing unit may raise its rate for M&O funds used to pay for a facility, device or method for the control of air, water or land pollution. 
This includes any land, structure, building, installation, excavation, machinery, equipment or device that is used, constructed, acquired or 
installed wholly or partly to meet or exceed pollution control requirements. The taxing unit�s expenses are those necessary to meet the 
requirements of a permit issued by the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ). The taxing unit must provide the tax 
assessor with a copy of the TCEQ letter of determination that states the portion of the cost of the installation for pollution control.

This section should only by completed by a taxing unit that uses M&O funds to pay for a facility, device or method for the control of air, 
water or land pollution.

STEP 5: Voter-Voter-Approval Tax Rate Adjustment for Unused Increment Rate

The unused increment rate is the rate equal to the difference between the adopted tax rate and voter-approval tax rate before the unused 
increment rate for the prior three years.[39] In a year where a special taxing unit adopts a rate above the voter-approval tax rate by 
applying any portion of the unused increment rate, the unused increment rate for that year would be zero. Consult with legal counsel to 
ensure appropriate calculation of the unused increment rate.

For each tax year before 2020, the difference between the adopted tax rate and voter-approval rate is considered zero, therefore the unused
increment rate for 2020 is zero.[40]

This section should only be completed by a taxing unit that is a municipality of less than 30,000 or a taxing unit that does not meet the 
definition of a special taxing unit. [41]

[37]Tex. Tax Code Section [38]Tex. Tax Code Section 



Page 8 1001.1.6

STEP 8: Taxing Unit Representative Name and Signature

print here
Printed Name of Taxing Unit Representative

sign here
Taxing Unit Representative Date

STEP 7: Total Tax Rate

Indicate the applicable total tax rates as calculated above.

No-new-revenue tax rate

Voter-Approval Tax Rate

De minimis rate

 

0.361026 

 

0.715150 

Line  Activity Amount/Rate
66.

67.

68.

69.

70.

Adjusted 2020 NNR M&O tax rate.  Enter the rate from Line 38 of the Voter-Approval Tax Rate 
Worksheet
2020 total taxable value Enter the amount on Line 21 of the No-New-Revenue Tax Rate Worksheet

Rate necessary to impose $500,000 in taxes. Divide $500,000 by Line 67 and multiply by $100.

2020 debt rate  Enter the rate from Line 46 of the Voter- Approval Tax Rate Worksheet

De minimis rate Add Lines 66, 68 and 69.

0.361495 

141,380,421 

0.353655 

0.000000 

0.715150 

STEP 6: De Minimis Rate

The de minimis rate is the rate equal to the sum of the no=new-revenue maintenance and operations rate, the rate that will raise $500,000, 
and the current debt rate for a taxing unit.[42]

This section should only be completed by a taxing unit that is a municipality of less than 30,000 or a taxing unit that does not meet the 
definition of a special taxing unit. [41]


	August 3, 2020 Agenda
	8.3.20-agenda-packet
	AG07132020EWCVFDContract
	Layout (17x22) - East Wise Fire _ Rescue Service Area
	Layout (17x22) - Justin Volunteer Fire Dept Service Area
	AG07132020IBC2015
	2009 to 2015 IBC Significant Changes Summary
	Employee Handbook
	Electronic Records
	Streets Maintenance Program
	devon contract
	Code Enforcement
	Denton County -- NNR New Fairview
	Denton County Appraisal -- New Fairview
	Wise County -- CNF 2020 CERT
	Wise County -- NNR City of New Fairview 2020
	Blank Page



