
PRICE PER   PRICE PER LOADING SPREADING

YARD YARD PRICE PRICE

(REGULAR) (FROST) (PER YD) (PER HOUR)

***FUEL SURCHARGE WILL BE ADDED***

4.73 7.84
5.35 8.48
7.33 10.00
8.87 10.64

7.38 NO BID
8.25 NO BID
9.82 NO BID

11.20 NO BID

8.80 NO BID

10.05 NO BID

11.55 NO BID

13.05 NO BID

10 MILES

15 MILES

20 MILES

10 MILES
2.50

2024 SUNDRE SAND & GRAVEL

5 MILES

3.00

175.00

20 MILES

5 MILES

15 MILES
20 MILES

0.50

245.00

BID TABULATIONS 2024

BIDS DUE 11:00AM,  MARCH 12, 2024
COMMISSION MEETING MARCH 19, 2024

GRAVEL HAULING

10 MILES
NO BID

5 MILES

15 MILES

2024 HORAB TRANSPORT COMPANY

COMPANY

2024 GETZLAFF TRUCKING, LLC


