
          W/MULCHER
          W/PACKER
          W/MOWER

$150.00

N/A

N/A

N/A

DUMP TRUCKS

WILLIAMS COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
BID TABS FOR HOURLY CONTRACT EQUIPMENT

BIDS DUE 3/12/2024   11:00AM (CST)
COMMISSION MEETING     MARCH 19, 2024

N/A N/A N/A

VPLOW&WING HOUR

N/A

N/AN/A N/A

N/A

HYSTER C340B
$150.00

($225-MOBILIZATION)

N/A

N/A

DR 350

$395.00
($225-MOBILIZATION)

$150.00/$165.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A$125.00/$140.00

HANSON'S EXCAVATING WHITE'S GRADING SERVICE SUNDRE SAND & GRAVEL

PRICE PER SNOW PLOW, PRICE PER SNOW PLOW, PRICE PER SNOW PLOW,
PRICE PER HRMODEL - PRICE PER HR MODEL - PRICE PER HR MODEL - 

HOUR

N/A

N/A

VPLOW&WING

MOTOR GRADER
JD 772GP JD 772GP 772G 772G

EQUIPMENT

$150.00 $175.00 $200.00 $250.00 NO BID N/A

VPLOW&WING HOUR

N/A N/A $225.00 N/A NO BID N/A
N/A N/A $250.00 N/A NO BID N/A

CAT 

$210.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID N/A

N/A
CAT

$250.00
NO BID

N/A N/A

PACKER

SNOW CAT N/A N/A

PNEUMATIC ROLLER
N/A

JD 120C-$155.00 JD 120C-$185.00
JD 165CLC-$165.00 JD 160CLC-$195.00
JD 210G-$185.00 JD210G-$210.00

JD 544J-$150.00 JD 544J-$175.00
JD 624J-$150.00 JD 624J-$175.00
JD 624K-$150.00 JD 624k-175.00
JD 644K-$160.00 JD 644k-$185.00

PULVERIZER

WATER TRUCK

PACKER
SELF PROPELLED

2,500 GAL
N/A N/A N/A

RECLAIMER/ROCK
N/A N/A N/A

$140.00

N/A

N/A

DOZER

BACKHOE

SKIDSTEER
CAT 272D;289D

$135.00
CAT 272D;289D

$150.00/$185.00

SCRAPER
627F;627E
$240.00

N/A N/A

N/A

N/A N/A

N/A

N/A

N/AN/A N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

$245.00

LOADER

TRACKHOE
KOMATSU PC 350

($225-MOBILIZATION)

N/A

KENWORTH
$185.00

N/A N/A

N/A N/A

N/A


