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Advanced 1- How to foster true diversity and inclusion at work (and in your 
community) 
 
Class objective: I will be able to understand the concept and learn new 
vocabulary and answer related questions. 
 
Concept A: Audio for the ted talk: 
 
How to foster true diversity and inclusion at work (and in your community) 
 
Listen Till 10:59 
 
Concept B: Transcript: 
Students will read the paragraphs and understand it.  
 
00:04 
Whitney Pennington Rodgers: Hi, Roz Brewer. Thanks so much for being with us 
today.  
 
00:08 
Rosalind Brewer: Thank you for having me.  
 
00:10 
WPR: We can just dive right in. We're right now in the last quarter of 2020, and I 
think that a lot of people would agree that we're in the midst of what's probably one 
of the largest reckonings around racial equity that we've had in this country in 
decades. And it's something that you've been such a vocal advocate for, both 
through your role at Starbucks and throughout your career of diversity and inclusion 
in the workplace. And so I'm curious just to hear from you to start off the 
conversation, what this moment means for DEI efforts, not just in corporate America 
but in business in general.  
 
00:45 
RB: You are right that this has made many of us that are in the corporate setting and 
beyond to rethink the position on diversity and inclusion in the workplace. You know, 
let me start the conversation about where we are actually in diversity and inclusion in 
the corporate setting, and I will tell you that this is actually putting a spotlight on the 
weaknesses and maybe the lack of forethought and intensity that we should have 
always maintained on this subject all along. One of the things that I think it's been 
highlighting for most of us is that our biggest opportunity is inclusion. Because, you 
know, I have heard the stories so many times about how there's no Black talent out 
there, no Latinx talent for these particular roles. The talent is out there. I will tell you 
that it's underdeveloped, because I think we have spent more time trying to reach 
numbers than we have changed our environment where people feel safe, where they 
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