
  
Dear Youth Leader & Pastor, 

I am thrilled to announce our Engage the School Regional Training Conferences coming this Fall.  
Georgia Youth Alive is hosting 1 Campus Ministry Training Conference in 4 regional locations.  You 
choose the area or date most convenient for your group and come expecting God to move in the lives 
of your students in a powerful way.   

Engage the School is a one day conference that will equip and empower your students in 6th – 12th 
grade to reach their campus through evangelism and outreach.  We want students to know how to 
share their faith with their friends.  The heartbeat of Youth Alive is getting students to see their school 
as their mission field and reaching out to the lost and hurting students. 

Every student and leader who attends will receive lunch on site and a new Gospel pack.  The Gospel 
pack includes: the new Gospel resource booklets, a t-shirt, a pen, and a booklet for notes.  Life in 6 
Words Books and Book of Hopes will be available for students as well.  Additionally, New Campus 
Missionaries who did not receive a Fire Bible last year will receive one this year, on a first come first 
serve basis.  Leaders do pay at this conference because you are receiving the same Gospel pack as the 
students in your youth ministry.  The cost is $25.00 per person for the early registration and $35.00 at 
the door.   

The conference includes a concert with Christian Hip-Hop/Rap Artist – Jordan Rousey, worship, opening 
service, and 6-7 choices for breakout sessions for new and returning campus missionaries for campus 
ministry.  This year we are also adding a brand new element where we will be taking all the students 
out to witness in local parks and various areas with our host churches, so be ready to take your group 
along with one of our team members.  You do not want your students to miss this training.  What they 
learn here will help them more effectively reach their campuses.  Mark your calendars now to attend.  
We are believing that God will move powerfully in the life of every student and leader who attends.  It 
is time for Every Student in Every School to hear the gospel of Jesus Christ.   

Enclosed with this packet you will find a cover letter, a poster to promote the event, a schedule for 
the conference activities, the registration form, and the location addresses for each conference. 

If you have any questions please call Jessica Riner at 478-290-7096 or email at 
Jessica.riner77@gmail.com.   

I look forward to seeing you this Fall. 

Until every student is reached, 

Jessica Riner 
Georgia Youth Alive Missionary

Equipping a generation of students to reach the lost and hurting in their schools. 
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